
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T500.827 Letting Date: 05/20/2025

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $54,500.00 $54,500.00 $525,000.00 $525,000.00

3 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $12,300.00 $12,300.00

4 108-0001 2,300.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $2,300.00 $1.00 $2,300.00 $1.00 $2,300.00

5 108-N0004 300.00 USD Steel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $300.00 $1.00 $300.00 $1.00 $300.00

6 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $81,000.00 $81,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00

7 202-0001 3,629.00 L.S. Roadway Excavation, Earth $45.00 $163,305.00 $38.00 $137,902.00 $30.00 $108,870.00

8 202-0007 461.00 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $45.00 $20,745.00 $55.00 $25,355.00 $21.50 $9,911.50

9 202-0009 15,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00

10 203-0001 224.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $45.00 $10,080.00 $105.00 $23,520.00 $6.00 $1,344.00

11 203-0002 1,141.00 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $50.00 $57,050.00 $105.00 $119,805.00 $70.00 $79,870.00

12 205-0001 868.00 C.Y. Foundation Excavation $65.00 $56,420.00 $81.00 $70,308.00 $90.00 $78,120.00

13 205-0002 123.00 C.Y. Coarse Aggregate Layer $160.00 $19,680.00 $139.00 $17,097.00 $130.00 $15,990.00

14 207-N0006 7.00 Ton Riprap Stone Scour Hole, 12in Thick (D50-6in) $180.00 $1,260.00 $125.00 $875.00 $225.00 $1,575.00

15 208-0006 46.00 C.Y. Hay Bales $40.00 $1,840.00 $12.00 $552.00 $160.00 $7,360.00

16 208-0008 2,300.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence $15.00 $34,500.00 $12.00 $27,600.00 $8.50 $19,550.00

17 208-0022 14.00 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $500.00 $7,000.00 $125.00 $1,750.00 $325.00 $4,550.00

18 208-0024 50.00 Ton Construction Driveway $100.00 $5,000.00 $77.00 $3,850.00 $75.00 $3,750.00

19 208-N0001 1.00 Each Concrete Washout Facility $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

20 213-0002 4,100.00 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $85.00 $348,500.00 $85.00 $348,500.00 $67.00 $274,700.00

21 301-0002 460.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6in Thick $30.00 $13,800.00 $24.00 $11,040.00 $22.00 $10,120.00

22 301-N0002 5,135.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 8 in Thick $35.00 $179,725.00 $26.60 $136,591.00 $15.00 $77,025.00

23 302-0002 2,312.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course $160.00 $369,920.00 $146.00 $337,552.00 $160.00 $369,920.00

24 302-0004 1,837.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course $140.00 $257,180.00 $125.00 $229,625.00 $145.00 $266,365.00

25 302-0071 4,330.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $5.00 $21,650.00 $4.00 $17,320.00 $1.90 $8,227.00

26 302-N0007 842.00 GAL Trackless Tack Coat $10.00 $8,420.00 $6.00 $5,052.00 $14.00 $11,788.00

27 303-0001 260.00 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick $65.00 $16,900.00 $58.00 $15,080.00 $40.00 $10,400.00

28 303-N0004 256.00 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, Crushed Stone, 4In Thick $65.00 $16,640.00 $55.00 $14,080.00 $24.00 $6,144.00

29 304-0001 460.00 S.Y. Portland Cement Concrete Pavement $180.00 $82,800.00 $165.00 $75,900.00 $125.00 $57,500.00

30 305-0003 11,698.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2 1/2in Depth $11.00 $128,678.00 $9.00 $105,282.00 $11.00 $128,678.00

31 401-0003 29.00 C.Y. Concrete in Retaining Wall $900.00 $26,100.00 $2,150.00 $62,350.00 $2,250.00 $65,250.00

32 401-0032 33.00 C.Y. Concrete In Footings $900.00 $29,700.00 $2,110.00 $69,630.00 $1,350.00 $44,550.00

33 401-0067 3,800.00 LB Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated $8.00 $30,400.00 $7.00 $26,600.00 $2.50 $9,500.00

34 502-0005 202.00 L.F. 15 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class III $140.00 $28,280.00 $115.00 $23,230.00 $95.00 $19,190.00

35 502-0010 76.00 L.F. 24 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class III $240.00 $18,240.00 $260.00 $19,760.00 $145.00 $11,020.00

36 502-0015 21.00 L.F. 24 In Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class V $360.00 $7,560.00 $310.00 $6,510.00 $270.00 $5,670.00

37 502-0019 17.00 L.F. 6 In PVC Pipe, Schedule 80 $140.00 $2,380.00 $95.00 $1,615.00 $125.00 $2,125.00

38 502-0021 1.00 Each 24-inch Reinforced Concrete Flared End Section $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $3,350.00 $3,350.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00

39 502-0054 31.00 L.F. 2 in PVC Pipe, Schedule 80 $110.00 $3,410.00 $91.00 $2,821.00 $45.00 $1,395.00

40 502-0251 1,600.00 L.F. Cleaning Existing Storm Drains $25.00 $40,000.00 $18.00 $28,800.00 $13.25 $21,200.00

41 502-0046 466.00 L.F. 8 in PVC Pipe, Schedule 80 $160.00 $74,560.00 $105.00 $48,930.00 $75.00 $34,950.00

42 503-0001 1.00 Each Inlet, Type D3 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $5,625.00 $5,625.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00

43 503-0011 4.00 Each Manhole, Type P-1 $7,000.00 $28,000.00 $6,000.00 $24,000.00 $6,500.00 $26,000.00

44 503-0046 1.00 Each Inlet, Double Type D3 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $9,800.00 $9,800.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00

45 503-0049 1.00 Each Inlet, Double Type D2 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $9,850.00 $9,850.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

46 503-0293 1.00 Each Reset Frames $950.00 $950.00 $750.00 $750.00 $750.00 $750.00

47 503-N0003 8.00 Each Cleaning Existing Drainage Structures $700.00 $5,600.00 $375.00 $3,000.00 $660.00 $5,280.00

48 503-N0012 70.00 L.F. 10 in Trench Drain $600.00 $42,000.00 $450.00 $31,500.00 $525.00 $36,750.00

49 505-0001 40.00 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $35.00 $1,400.00 $24.00 $960.00 $30.00 $1,200.00

50 506-0003 576.00 L.F. 9in X 18in Concrete Vertical Curb $50.00 $28,800.00 $43.50 $25,056.00 $52.00 $29,952.00

51 509-0001 71.00 S.F. Sign Panels $20.00 $1,420.00 $24.00 $1,704.00 $60.00 $4,260.00

52 509-0002 140.00 L.F. U-channel Post $30.00 $4,200.00 $15.00 $2,100.00 $22.00 $3,080.00

53 510-0001 713.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $125.00 $89,125.00 $33.00 $23,529.00 $39.00 $27,807.00

54 510-0011 2.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,900.00 $3,800.00 $1,375.00 $2,750.00

55 510-0015 1.00 Each Parapet Connection, Type B $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $450.00 $450.00

56 510-0018 2.00 Each Tangent Guide Rail Terminal $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $3,900.00 $7,800.00 $4,150.00 $8,300.00

57 510-0031 740.00 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide Rail $20.00 $14,800.00 $5.00 $3,700.00 $1.10 $814.00

58 511-0011 100.00 L.F. Median Fencing $150.00 $15,000.00 $135.00 $13,500.00 $150.00 $15,000.00

59 511-0012 3.00 Each Vehicular Gate, Type II, 84 in High, 20 ft Wide $20,000.00 $60,000.00 $2,600.00 $7,800.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00

60 511-0032 1,553.00 L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type II, 84in High $125.00 $194,125.00 $60.00 $93,180.00 $66.00 $102,498.00

BaseLine Item Detail Alna Construction Corp. Union Paving & Construction Co., Inc.APS Contracting, Inc.
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T500.827 Letting Date: 05/20/2025

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

BaseLine Item Detail Alna Construction Corp. Union Paving & Construction Co., Inc.APS Contracting, Inc.

61 511-0052 1.00 Each Vehicular Gate, Type II, 84in High, 12in Wide $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $2,350.00 $2,350.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00

62 511-N0011 485.00 L.F. Temporary Fencing, 96In High $20.00 $9,700.00 $21.00 $10,185.00 $23.00 $11,155.00

63 514-0005 63.00 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, Reinforced, 4in Thick $150.00 $9,450.00 $115.00 $7,245.00 $140.00 $8,820.00

64 516-0009 1,330.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $2.00 $2,660.00 $1.00 $1,330.00 $1.80 $2,394.00

65 516-0011 1,608.00 L.F. Traffic Markings, Lines, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $2.00 $3,216.00 $1.00 $1,608.00 $1.80 $2,894.40

66 516-0013 40.00 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $10.00 $400.00 $6.00 $240.00 $11.00 $440.00

67 517-0003 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type C $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

68 517-0009 18.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $3,000.00 $54,000.00 $2,000.00 $36,000.00 $3,250.00 $58,500.00

69 517-0013 10,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00

70 522-0001 10.00 Each Test Pits $800.00 $8,000.00 $600.00 $6,000.00 $975.00 $9,750.00

71 599-N0003 150,000.00 USD Project Allowances (No-Bid) $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00

72 599-N0018 118.00 L.F. 2in Plastic Gas Main $110.00 $12,980.00 $150.00 $17,700.00 $75.00 $8,850.00

73 599-N0022 49.00 Each Bollards $1,500.00 $73,500.00 $1,650.00 $80,850.00 $1,400.00 $68,600.00

74 599-N0023 216.00 L.F. 2in Copper Water Pipe, Type K $180.00 $38,880.00 $150.00 $32,400.00 $105.00 $22,680.00

75 599-N0024 2.00 Each 2in Water Valve $1,100.00 $2,200.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00

76 599-N0035 1.00 Each Yard Hydrant $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $3,750.00 $3,750.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00

77 599-N0066 1.00 Each Manhole, Sanitary Sewer $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00

78 599-N0091 1.00 L.S. Site Electrical Work, Building No. 1 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

79 599-N0209 1.00 Each Oil Water Separator $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

80 599-N0224 8.00 Each Cleanout $900.00 $7,200.00 $700.00 $5,600.00 $4,800.00 $38,400.00

81 599-N0263 10.00 Each Monitoring Well at Location No. 1 $2,500.00 $25,000.00 $10,000.00 $100,000.00 $1,100.00 $11,000.00

82 599-N0264 29.00 Each Sealing of Abandoned Well at Location No. 1 $2,000.00 $58,000.00 $1,500.00 $43,500.00 $600.00 $17,400.00

83 599-N0266 1.00 L.S. Truck Scale $230,000.00 $230,000.00 $167,000.00 $167,000.00 $375,000.00 $375,000.00

84 601-0011 3.00 Each Lighting Manhole $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $7,000.00 $21,000.00

85 601-0016 1.00 Each Junction Box, Type PS $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,800.61 $2,800.61

86 601-0031 1,550.00 L.F. Multi-Mode Fiber Optic Cable, 12- Fibers $50.00 $77,500.00 $13.00 $20,150.00 $11.00 $17,050.00

87 601-N0109 388.00 L.F. 2in HDPE Conduit with Pull Cords $80.00 $31,040.00 $64.00 $24,832.00 $40.00 $15,520.00

88 703-0001 2,462.00 S.Y. Topsoil $10.00 $24,620.00 $6.00 $14,772.00 $5.00 $12,310.00

89 704-0003 2,272.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type C $4.00 $9,088.00 $2.00 $4,544.00 $1.70 $3,862.40

90 704-0004 190.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type L $4.00 $760.00 $5.00 $950.00 $5.50 $1,045.00

91 710-0001 181.00 S.F. Block Wall $80.00 $14,480.00 $100.00 $18,100.00 $115.00 $20,815.00

92 801-N0004 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00

93 2000-N009 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $520,000.00 $520,000.00 $667,000.00 $667,000.00 $550,000.00 $550,000.00

94 2000-N015 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $630,000.00 $630,000.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00 $919,423.44 $919,423.44

95 2000-N025 1.00 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1 $2,770,000.00 $2,770,000.00 $3,314,808.00 $3,314,808.00 $1,750,000.00 $1,750,000.00

96 2000-N026 1.00 L.S. Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 1 $165,000.00 $165,000.00 $216,000.00 $216,000.00 $325,000.00 $325,000.00

97 2000-N030 25,000.00 USD NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (No-Bid) $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00

98 2000-N047 1.00 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 1 $360,000.00 $360,000.00 $695,000.00 $695,000.00 $1,800,000.00 $1,800,000.00

99 2000-N085 30,000.00 USD Building Furniture Allowance (No-Bid) $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00

$8,720,717.00 $9,139,000.00 $9,313,608.35 
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