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SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY
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INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
2552 July 1,2025 QUOTATION FORM
ITEM NUMBER OF UNIT OF PRICE BID PER
NO. ARTICLES FOR SALE UNITS MEASURE UNIT TOTAL PRICE BID
2014 FORD F150
- 3,510.00
T | VIN# 1FTNF1CF7EKE48015 Mileage: 86,625 1-2925 ¥3
RONALD COOK
2014 FORD F150
- 1,678.00
2 | VIN# 1FTNF1CF2EKE48021 Mileage: 155,524 -2927 ¥
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2014 FORD F150
a 1,153.00
3 | VIN# 1FTNF1CF4EKE48019 Mileage: 260,467 -2921 ¥
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
, | 2017 FORD F250 W/8.5' BOSS PLOW T-3429 MINBID | o oo
VIN# 1FTBF2B62HEE22337 Mileage: 221,086 R-10431 $6,500.00 | ° %%
ECONOMY AUTO
2013 FORD F150
~ 3,050.00
5 | VIN# 1FTNF1CF3DKF38762 Mileage: 72,261 1-2806 ¥3
HARRY STEWART
s | 2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 048 mINBID | oo
VIN# 1GCRYAEFALZ332509 Mileage: 135,341 $8,500.00 '
NO BID
2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 MIN.BID
| VIN# 1GCRYAEFXLZ334913 Mileage: 159,967 1-3959 $8,500.00 | ¥8620-00
ECONOMY AUTO
2017 FORD F150
~ ,911.
8 | VIN# 1FTEX1EFXHKDO7866 Mileage: 144,434 1-3465 $3.9011.00
LAFERRARA CONSTRUCTION
o | 2019 FORD F250 W/8.5' BOSS PLOW T-3620 $12.000.00
VIN# 1FTBF2B64KEC37262 Mileage: 149,491 R-9995 000
MARLIN CONSTRUCTION
2019 CHEVROLET IMPALA MIN.BID
10 viN# 2G11X5S32K9101692 Mileage: 132,828 A-3388 $7,500.00 | 000
NO BID
2019 DODGE CHARGER
_ 1,779.00
1 VIN# 2C3CDXKT4KHB93188 Mileage: 164,908 A-3416 ¥
LIBERTY MOTORS
2016 FORD F150
~ 2,383.00
121 VIN# 1FTMF1CF1GKD66232 Mileage: 150,672 1-3082 ¥
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2014 FORD F150
~ 1,079.
13 | VIN# 1FTNF1CFOEKE48016 Mileage: 104,624 1-2919 $1,079.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2014 FORD F150
~ 4,511.00
141 VIN# 1FTNF1CFOEKE48017 Mileage: 199,275 1-2922 ¥4
LAFERRARA CONSTRUCTION
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INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
25-5-2 July 1,2025 QUOTATION FORM
ITEM NUMBER OF UNIT OF PRICE BID PER
NO. ARTICLES FOR SALE UNITS MEASURE UNIT TOTAL PRICE BID
2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500
~ 3,078.00
15 | VIN# 1GCNCNEC8JZ334254 Mileage: 162,582 1-3613 ¥3
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500
16 | VIN# 1GCNCNEC8JZ135611 Mileage: 181,714 T-3451 $3434.00
KEVIN URBAN
2018 FORD F150
17" VIN# 1FTEX1EBBJKE96284 Mileage: 176,156 1-3582 $5300.00
FERAS ALMASI
2017 FORD F150
~ 2, .
18 | VIN# 1FTEX1E86HKD77115 Mileage: 241,302 T-3417 $2868.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2015 FORD F150
- 3,911.00
19 | VIN# 1FTEX1E8OFFB71133 Mileage: 176,653 1-3052 ¥
LAFERRARA CONSTRUCTION
2017 DODGE CHARGER
20 | \IN# 2C3CDXKTEHHB21403 Mileage: 162,031 A-3334 $2131.00
LIBERTY MOTORS
,{ | 2017 FORD F250 W/8.5° BOSS PLOW T-3431 MINBID | (oo
VIN# 1FTBF2B6XHEE22344 Mileage: 162,704 R-9682 $6,500.00 | * 7%
MARLIN CONSTRUCTION
2017 FORD F150
~ 2,862.
22 | VIN# 1FTEX1EF5HKD97872 Mileage: 174,581 T-3462 $2862.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2017 FORD F150
- ,801.
23 | VIN# 1FTEX1EF1HKD97867 Mileage: 165,334 1-3463 $5801.00
DISCOUNT AUTO CENTER
2016 FORD F150
~ 6,200.00
24 | VIN# 1FTMF1CFOGKDB6237 Mileage: 83,519 1-3075 ¥,
MARLIN CONSTRUCTION
2017 FORD F150
- 6,527.00
25 | VIN# 1FTEX1E80HKD77109 Mileage: 142,548 1-3418 ¥,
FRANK LOSACCO
2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 MIN.BID
26 | VIN# 1GCRYAEF71.2334688 Mileage: 214,059 1-3955 $6,500.00 | 851190
LAFERRARA CONSTRUCTION
2016 FORD F150
~ 4,777.
27 | VIN# 1FTEX1EF2GKD66240 Mileage: 153,920 1-3058 $4777.00
BARREN BALDWIN
b | 2015 FORD F150 3045 62.469.00

VIN# 1FTEX1E86FFB71136 Mileage: 169,370

GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
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INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
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ITEM NUMBER OF UNIT OF PRICE BID PER
NO. ARTICLES FOR SALE UNITS MEASURE UNIT TOTAL PRICE BID
2019 FORD F250
~ 4,010.00
29 | VIN# 1FTBF2B63KEC37267 Mileage: 130,609 1-3621 $4,
RONALD COOK
2019 CHEVROLET IMPALA MIN.BID
30 | VIN# 2G11X5537K9101154 Mileage: 127,315 A-3389 $7,500.00 | %00
NO BID
2017 DODGE CHARGER
_ 2,332.
31 | VIN# 2C3CDXKTEHH621417 Mileage: 156,460 A-3329 $2,332.00
LIBERTY MOTORS
2018 DODGE CHARGER
- 2 .
32 | VIN# 2C3CDXKTOJH323886 Mileage: 146,351 A-3349 $2,838.00
LIBERTY MOTORS
2017 DODGE CHARGER
_ 2,383.00
33 | VIN# 2C3CDXKTXHHE21419 Mileage: 149,372 A-3338 $2,
LIBERTY MOTORS
2017 DODGE CHARGER
_ 2,359.00
34 | VIN# 2C3CDXKT5HHB21408 Mileage: 127,216 A-3332 52
ECONOMY AUTO
2017 DODGE CHARGER
35 | VIN# 2C3CDXKT2HH621415 Mileage: A-3337 $2,331.00
LIBERTY MOTORS
2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE
- 2,577.
36 | VIN# 1GNSKDEC2JR364810 Mileage: 205,771 1-3662 $2,577.00
JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
2016 DODGE CHARGER
_ 1,818.
87 | VIN# 2C3CDXKT8GH268211 Mileage: 178,886 A-3303 $1,818.00
LIBERTY MOTORS
2013 CHEVROLET IMPALA
_ 1,668.00
38 | VIN# 2G1WF5E39D1259422 Mileage: 101,775 A-3190 $L
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2014 CHEVROLET IMPALA
- 2,855.50
39 | VIN# 2G1WASE38E1178654 Mileage: 84,291 A-3235 52
DSR AUTO SALES
2014 CHEVROLET IMPALA
- ,200.
40 | VIN# 2G1WASE31E1177734 Mileage: 106,515 A-3237 $3.200.00
PATRICK ROSS
2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE
~ 219.
41 | VIN# 1GNSKDEC5LR228144 Mileage: 119,104 1-3856 $5.219.00
ECONOMY AUTO
4p | 2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE ass1 6 5.055.00

VIN# 1GNSKDEC8LR228932 Mileage: 132,153

JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES




91-PC-32 (REV.2T) Page 4 of 12
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INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
2552 July 1,2025 QUOTATION FORM
ITEM NUMBER OF UNIT OF PRICE BID PER
NO. ARTICLES FOR SALE UNITS MEASURE UNIT TOTAL PRICE BID
2021 DODGE CHARGER
- 2,050.00
43 | VIN# 2C3CDXATXMHE62922 Mileage: 112,916 A-4014 2
PARK AUTO & PERFORMANCE
2017 DODGE CHARGER
44 | VIN# 2C3CDXKT8HHB21418 Mileage: 122,114 A-3330 $2:250.00
JACHIN DECK
2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE
45 | VIN# 1GNSKDEC1HR318320 Mileage: 109,963 1-3509 $3,669.00
ECONOMY AUTO
2016 CHEVROLET TAHOE
~ 139.
46 | \/IN# 1GNSKDEC5GR409136 Mileage: 125,651 1-3293 $3.139.00
ECONOMY AUTO
2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE
- 4,789.00
47 | VIN# 1GNSKDECS5LR228984 Mileage: 157,589 1-3850 ¥4
ECONOMY AUTO
2013 FORD EXPLORER
~ 3,321.00
48 | VIN# 1FM5K8BBIDGCIB467 Mileage: 134,729 T-2724 ¥3
ERIN TAMBURINI
2014 FORD FOCUS MIN.BID
49 | VIN# 1FADP3K29EL332799 Mileage: 47,803 A-3199 $3,500.00 | * 400000
RICARDO LOPEZ
2014 FORD FOCUS
. 2, .
50 | ViN# 1FADP3E21EL336969 Mileage: 71,109 A-3195 $2:500.00
PATRICK ROSS
2014 CHEVROLET IMPALA
- 2 .
5T | VIN# 2G1WASE34E1178053 Mileage: 114,819 A-3236 $2:800.00
PATRICK ROSS
2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE
~ 3,660.00
52 | VIN# 1GNSKDEC9JR361132 Mileage: 177,594 1-3655 ¥3
ECONOMY AUTO
2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE
53 | VIN# 1GNSKDEC3LR188677 Mileage: 148,962 1-3845 $4.739.00
ECONOMY AUTO
2013 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500
- ,051.
54 | VIN# 1GCZGTCG4D1100910 Mileage: 112,179 -2710 $6,051.00
DISCOUNT AUTO CENTER
55 | 2016 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 W/8.5' PLOW T-3237 MINBID | (0
VIN# 1GCOKUEG8GZ269327 Mileage: 94,782 R-9454 $6,500.00 | ° "7
RONALD COOK
5 | 2016 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 W/8.5' PLOW T-3238 MINBID | (oo o
VIN# 1GCOKUEG1GZ269587 Mileage: 48,152 R-9452 $7,500.00 | *77%

PLEIDAS AUTO SALES
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INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
2552 July 1, 2025 QUOTATION FORM
ITEM NUMBEROF |  UNIT OF PRICE BID PER
NO. ARTICLES FOR SALE UNITS MEASURE ONIT TOTAL PRICE BID
57 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 W/8.5° PLOW T-2963 MIN.BID $7.800.00
VIN# 1GCOKUEGXFZ138267 Mileage: 126,051 R-8613 $6,500.00 T
PLEIDAS AUTO SALES
58 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 W/8.5° PLOW T-3087 MIN.BID $8.400.00
VIN# 1GCOKUEG9FZ546415 Mileage: 106,507 R-9084 $6,500.00 o

PLEIDAS AUTO SALES

2019 FORD F150
- 2,778.00
59 VIN# 1FTEX1ES56KKE25175 Mileage: 191,200 T-3735 $

GUARANTEED AUTO MALL

2010 INT’L 7400 7-YD DUMP
- 7,000.00
60 | VIN# 1HTWDAZR1AJ278510 Mileage: 149,693 Hrs: 13,269 12210 $

NEW PRINCE CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION CO.

61 2016 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 W/8.5° PLOW T-3236 MIN.BID $ 11.500.00
VIN# 1GCOKUEG4GZ270667 Mileage: 54,138 R-9453 $6,500.00 T
MARLIN CONSTRUCTION
62 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 W/8.5° PLOW T-2965 MIN.BID $7.900.00
VIN# 1GCOKUEG1FZ138268 Mileage: 112,328 R-8615 $6,500.00 T
PLEIDAS AUTO SALES
63 2017 FORD F250 W/8.5" PLOW T-3432 MIN.BID $8911.00
VIN# 1FTBF2B68HEE22343 Mileage: 159,836 R-9683 $6,500.00 T
LAFERRARA CONSTRUCTION
2010 INT’L 7400 7-YD DUMP W/11’ PLOW & TAILGATE T-2195 $ 8,000.00
64 | SPREADER (R-7266) R-7320
VIN# 1THTWDAZR5AJ278493 Mileage: 119,622 Hrs: 11,345
NEW PRINCE CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION CO.
65 2010 INT’L 7400 7-YD DUMP W/TAILGATE SPREADER T-2215 $2.000.00
VIN# 1THTWDAZR7AJ278513 Mileage: 160,044 Hrs: 14,765 R-7286 T

HARBOR TRUCKING

2004 INT’L 7400 6-YD DUMP
- 2,000.00
®6 | VIN# 1HTWDADR94J085792 Mileage: 93,733 Hrs: 7,843 1793 $2,

HARBOR TRUCKING
2005 INT’L 7400 7-YD W/11’ PLOW & TAILGATE $3,308.00

67 | SPREADER (R-6356) ;:;25?

VIN# 1THTWDAZR05J010618 Mileage: 35,154 Hrs: 4,546

GURAL FARMS

og | 2010 INT'L 7400 7-YD DUMP W/11' PLOW T-2232 $ 1.531.00

VIN# 1THTWDAZR2AJ278483 Mileage: 999,999 R-7357 U

JOSEPH DEFINO TRUCKING

2010 INT’L 7400 7-YD DUMP W/11’ PLOW & TAILGATE 79196 $2,000.00

69 | SPREADER (R-7267) R.7301

VIN# THTWDAZR1AJ278488 Mileage: 999,999
HARBOR TRUCKING
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SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY
INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
25-5-2 July 1,2025 QUOTATION FORM
ITEM NUMBER OF UNIT OF PRICE BID PER
NO. ARTICLES FOR SALE UNITS MEASURE UNIT TOTAL PRICE BID
2010 INT'L 7400 7-YD DUMP W/10’ PLOW & TAILGATE 2008 $10,000.00
70 | SPREADER (R-7299) oo
VIN# 1HTWDAZR1AJ278460 Mileage: 35,028 Hrs: 3,431
NEW PRINCE CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION CO.
4 | 2012 INT'L 7500 W/16-YD \V-BOX SPREADER T-2330 5 7500.00
VIN# 1HTWPAZTXCJ440124 Mileage: 28,773 Hrs: 4,375 R-7539 =0
HARBOR TRUCKING
2018 FORD F150
~ ,162.
72 | VIN# 1FTEX1 EBAJKE96282 Mileage: 218,396 1-3593 $3.162.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2016 FORD F150
~ $5,801.00
73 | VIN# 1FTEX1 EF6GKD66242 Mileage: 145,535 1-3067
DISCOUNT AUTO CENTER
2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO MIN.BID
74 | VIN# 1GCRYAEF5L2332907 Mileage: 173,292 T-3945 $8,500.00 | %
NO BID
2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500
7S | VIN# 1GCNCNEC9JZ135777 Mileage: 120,972 T-3444 $6,000.00
MARLIN CONSTRUCTION
2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500
76 | VIN# 1GC1KUEG2JF239172 Mileage: 349,320 1-3568 $1668.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500
~ 1,242.
7 | VIN# 1GCNCNEC6JZ334723 Mileage: 115,340 -3612 $1242.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2010 INT’'L 7400 7-YD DUMP W/11’ PLOW & TAILGATE Co0a7 $3,000.00
78 | SPREADER (R-7318) noos
VIN# 1HTWDAZR4AJ278484 Mileage: 48,128 Hrs: 5,511
TERCO ENTERPRISES
7q. | 2008 FORD E-350 PASSENGER VAN 1960 $ 852,00
VIN# 1FBNE31L36HA45899 Mileage: 163,252
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2018 FORD F150
- 3,068.00
80 | VIN# 1FTEX1E50JKE40527 Mileage: 187,377 1-3596 ¥3
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2016 FORD F150
81 | VIN# 1FTEX1E81GFC16257 Mileage: 190,230 1-3209 $3650.00
HARRY STEWART
5, | 2016 FORD F150 173203 $2,669.00

VIN# 1FTEX1E88GFC16255 Mileage: 152,485

GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
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INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
26.5-2 July1,2025 QUOTATION FORM
ITEM NUMBER OF UNIT OF PRICE BID PER
NO. ARTICLES FOR SALE UNITS MEASURE UNIT TOTAL PRICE BID
2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE
- 3,434.00
83 | VIN# 1GNSKDEC6HR316837 Mileage: 146,279 T-3491 $
ECONOMY AUTO
2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE
~ 2,789.00
84 | VIN# 1GNSKDEC3LR229809 Mileage: 999,999 T-3877 $
ECONOMY AUTO
g | 2010 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 1500 2180 6.4.300.00

VIN# 1GCUGAD46A1117318 Mileage: 73,784

ADD ON POOLS

5 | 2019 FORD F250 W/8.5' BOSS PLOW T-3618 MINBID | oo oo
VIN# 1FTBF2B68KEC37264 Mileage: 193,643 R-9993 $6,500.00 | * %
LAFERRARA CONSTRUCTION
2011 INT’L 7400 7-YD DUMP W/11’ PLOW & TAILGATE o034 MINEBID | §10125.00
87 | SPREADER (R-7305) A $5.500.00
VIN# 1HTWDAZR4AJ278467 Mileage: 23,397 Hrs: 3,037 500
ADD ON POOLS
2011 INT'L 7400 7-YD DUMP W/11’ PLOW & TAILGATE . MINEID | §6238.00
88 | SPREADER (R-7567) oo $2.500.00
VIN# 1HTWDAZR7bj436933 Mileage: 32,982 Hrs: 3,112 500
JOSEPH DEFINO TRUCKING
2011 INT'L 7400 7-YD DUMP W/11’ PLOW & TAILGATE 2338 MINEID | §6238.00
89 | SPREADER (R-7568) oo $2.500.00
VIN# 1HTWDAZR1BJ391732 Mileage: 27,291 Hrs: 2,583 900
JOSEPH DEFINO TRUCKING
2011 INT'L 7400 7-YD DUMP W/11’ PLOW & TAILGATE 0333 MINEID | §592180
90 | SPREADER (R-7563) A $2.500.00
VIN# 1HTWDAZR3BJ436928 Mileage: 25,878 Hrs: 2,594 500
ALPINE DEERE LANDSCAPING
2012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 1500
91 | VIN# 1GCSGAFX0C1121155 Mileage: 47,722 T-2552 $4,900.00
PLEIDAS AUTO SALES
2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 (WRECK) ] L087.00
92 | VIN# 3GCNWAEF5LG383778 Mileage: 97,600 T-3962 % 1.987.
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
o5 | 2017 FORD F150 T-3419 $6,500.00

VIN# 1FTEX1E86FFB71136 Mileage: 169,370

NEW PRINCE CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION CO.

2018 FORD F150 XTRA CAB
- 5,000.00
9% | VIN# 1FTEX1EB2JKE96281 Mileage: 178,664 T-3592 $

NEW PRINCE CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION CO.

2016 FORD F150 XTRA CAB
- 1,787.00
9 | VIN# 1FTEX1E82GFC16252 Mileage: 228,486 T1-3205 $

GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
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INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
25-S-2 July 1, 2025 QUOTATION FORM
lL%M ARTICLES FOR SALE NU'L\I}I?IFTZOF MUE'\i\l;UOF’:E PRICILEJS:.II:.) FER TOTAL PRICE BID
2012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500
% | VIN# 1GCZGTCGBC1111681 1-2535 $3,300.00
PLEIADES AUTO SALES
2016 FORD F150
97 | VIN# 1FTEX1E84GFC16253 Mileage: 167,981 1-3213 $14,050.00
PLEIADES AUTO SALES
2018 FORD F150
- 4,900.
98 | VIN# 1FTEX1EB4JKE96279 Mileage: 157,069 T-3580 $4.900.00
PLEIADES AUTO SALES
2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 (WRECK) ] Lear
99 | VIN# 1GCNCNEC2JZ135443 Mileage: 142,548 T-3447 $1,837.00
JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
2012 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500
- 564.00
100 | \/N# 1GCNCPEX9CZ165136 Mileage: 218,344 T-2515 $
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2018 FORD F150
- 4,500.00
101 1 \/IN# 1FTES1EB3JKE96287 Mileage: 174,246 1-3588 4
PLEIDAS AUTO SALES
2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE
102 1 \/IN# 1GNSKDEC4LR229771 Mileage: 140,883 1-3865 $3.777.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE
103 | viN# 1GNSKDEC3JR366407 Mileage: 134,987 1-3665 $3,369.00
ECONOMY AUTO
2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE
104 | v/IN# 1GNSKDEC3JR359084 Mileage: 142,425 T-3647 $3.858.00
JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE
105 | \/IN# 1GNSKDECOHR319149 Mileage: 143,912 1-3521 $3,558.00
JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
2019 DODGE CARAVAN
~ 2,657.
106 | iN# 2CARDGBGEKR762501 Mileage: 116,381 1-3839 $2,657.00
JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
2012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 1500
- 4 .
107 1 VIN# 1GCSGAFXXC1121132 Mileage: 86,656 1-2560 $4,500.00
PLEIDAS AUTO SALES
2015 FORD F150
- 5,110.00
108 | \/N# 1FTEX1E82FFB71120 Mileage: 210,394 1-3049 $
RONALD COOK
2015 FORD F150
- 6,110.00
109 1 \/IN# 1FTEX1E81FFB71125 Mileage: 141,617 T-3041 $6
RONALD COOK
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INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
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NO. ARTICLES FOR SALE UNITS MEASURE UNIT TOTAL PRICE BID
2017 DODGE CHARGER
- 2,218.00
1101 \/IN# 2C3CDXKTOHHB21413 Mileage: 189,334 A-3341 2
LIBERTY MOTORS
2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE MIN.BID
1111 VIN# 1GNSKDKC7JR363658 Mileage: 142,189 T-3674 $7,500.00 | 1300000
TOI PITTMAN
2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE
: 479.
1121 V/IN# 1GNSKDEC5LR229813 Mileage: 999,999 1-3863 $3479.00
ECONOMY AUTO
2012 CHEVROLET TAHOE
~ 1,351.
113 1 V/IN# 1GNSKAEOOCR139507 Mileage: 999,999 T-2571 $1351.00
MARK PAJOR
2014 FORD F150
- 5,355.50
1141 VIN# 1FTEX1EMOEFBA48656 Mileage: 123,385 1-2898 ¥
DSR AUTO SALES
2017 DODGE CHARGER
- 815.00
115 V/IN# 2C3CDXKT5HHB21411 Mileage: 999,999 A-3331 ¥
LIBERTY MOTORS
2016 FORD F150
116 | \/IN# 1FTEX1EF8GKDE6243 Mileage: 147,779 T-3057 $2:565.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500
~ 2,139.
171 VIN# 1GCNCNEC3JZ136035 Mileage: 231,278 -3448 $2139.00
LIBERTY MOTORS
2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE
118 | \/IN# 1GNSKDEC1HR319693 Mileage: 147,008 1-3483 $1,789.00
ECONOMY AUTO
2004 JOHN DEERE 315SD 4WD BACKHOE LOADER MIN.BID
119 VIN# T03155G939838 Hrs: 2,225 71282 $12,500.00 | * 140000
HAROLD CROWTHER
2000 JOHN DEERE 410E 4WD BACKHOE LOADER MIN.BID
120 | \\N# T0410EX892103 Hrs: 1,686 R-5622 $11,500.00 | ¥ 13:000-00
NEW PRINCE CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION CO.
2000 CASE C80 2WD TRACTOR
- 2,649.00
1211 \/IN# COBORNBJJE1014832 Hrs: 99,999 R-5573 2
GURAL FARMS
2017 TORO 4000D 11’ MOWER MIN.BID
_ 11,225.00
122 1 \/IN# 400957633 Hrs: 1,056 R-9600 $9,500.00 | *
CATALANO EQUIPMENT
2009 INGERSOLL XP185 COMPRESSOR
123 | \/IN# 4FVCBBAAGAV410356 Hrs: 167 R-7415 $3.125.00
APLINE DEERE LANDSCAPING
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SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY
INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
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ITEM NUMBER OF UNIT OF PRICE BID PER
NO. ARTICLES FOR SALE UNITS MEASURE UNIT TOTAL PRICE BID
2012 VERMEER BC1200XL CHIPPER MIN.BID
1241 \/IN# 1VR7141Y6C1001028 Hrs: 1,000 R-8136 $10,500.00 $11,500.00
MARLIN CONSTRUCTION
2014 BARBER ROAD RAKE 200T
1251 \iNg 2151 R-8873 $1,218.00
LIBERTY MOTORS
2012 WOODS BW1800X TAG MOWER MIN.BID
126 | \iN# 1221899 R-8178 $5,500.00 | ° 61000
GURAL FARMS
2012 VER-MAC VM-4815 SOLAR ARROWBOARD $26.00
127 | TRAILER R-8085
VIN# 2S9US2119CS132344
ALPINE DEERE LANDSCAPING
1980 ESSICK W30WR WALK-BEHIND ROLLER
- 0.00
128 | \iN# 82006873 R-2732 ¥
NO BID
1999 LANDPRIDE 0S1572 GROUND SEEDER
- 1,820.00
129 1 yiN# 272071 R-5425 -
CATALANO EQUIPMENT
130 | 2009 VALK RV1142-88PRL 11’ PLOW R-7337 $ 1,000.00
HARBOR TRUCKING
131 | 2009 VALK RV1142-88PRL 11’ PLOW R-7340 $ 1,000.00
HARBOR TRUCKING
2009 GLEDHILL 11HSJPCL-LL 11’ PLOW
- 800.00
132 | \1N# 79312 R-7194 $
TERCO ENTERPRISES
2004 GLEDHILL 10HSJ-PCL 10’ PLOW
- 800.00
133 vIN# 75857 R-6155 ¥
TERCO ENTERPRISES
2009 VALK RV1142-88PRL 11’ PLOW
- 1,000.00
134 |\ iN# 33890 R-7330 $1,
HARBOR TRUCKING
1999 VALK RVS-1042 10’ PLOW
135 VIN# 24116 R-5497 $ 800.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
2015 VALK RV113-116PR 11’ PLOW
- 1, .
136 | \iNg 37850 R-8861 $ 1,000.00
HARBOR TRUCKING
1999 VALK RVS-1042 10’ PLOW
- 800.00
1371 ViNg 24119 R-5489 ¥
TERCO ENTERPRISES
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INVITATION NO: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
- oms | QUOTATION FORM
lL%M ARTICLES FOR SALE NU'L\/}EFI.'ZOF MUE'\i\l;UOF’:E PRICILEJS:.II:.) PER TOTAL PRICE BID
2009 GLEDHILL 11HSJPCL-LL 11’ PLOW
_ 800.00
138 2000 oD R-7193 $
TERCO ENTERPRISES
ONE LOT OF (5) WHELEN LIBERTY Il AMBER LED
139 1 | \GHTBARS $255.05
VINCENT MARTINI
1999 VALK RVS-1042 10’ PLOW
140 v/ iN# 24117 R-5494 $800.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
2012 CIMLINE 230 GAL. ROADWAY CRACK SEALER
_ 256.
141 1 VIN# 1C92M1522CN119110 Hrs: 649 R-8209 $256.00
ALPINE DEERE LANDSCAPING
2016 CIMLINE 230 GAL. ROADWAY CRACK SEALER
- 550.00
142 1\ IN# 1G9241526GM119094 R-9445 $
PARK AUTO & PERFORMANCE
COATS 6065EX RIM CLAMP TIRE MACHINE
- 501.05
143 1V IN# 601104729 G-20174 $
VINCENT MARTINI
SNAP-ON EEWB205A WHEEL BALANCER
144V IN# G51AX005 G-16152 $150.00
TRACY SALVENSEN
145  BRANICK WALL MOUNT STRUT COMPRESSOR G-12355 $0.00
NO BID
2008 TORO 22163 21” PUSH MOWER
_ 10.00
146 |/ IN# 270000692 R-7111 $
FRANK BOWMAN
2008 TORO 22163 21” PUSH MOWER
- 26.00
1471 \/IN# 270000691 R-7112 $
SHIVAM CHHABRA
2008 TORO 22163 21” PUSH MOWER
_ 53.00
148 |/ IN# 270000693 R-7113 $
BARREN BALDWIN
2003 TENNANT 5700-800D FLOOR SCRUBBER
149 | 2008 20N R-6001 $0.00
NO BID
1977 HYDROMITE DG3-1 3" PUMP
- 17.00
150 v/ \N# 77013 G-5295 $
ERIN TAMBURINI
151 | 2002 HONDA 3500W PORTABLE GENERATOR 70862 $ 155.00
MARK REDDICK
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SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY
INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
25-S-2 July 1,2025 QUOTATION FORM
lL%M ARTICLES FOR SALE NUISEE’ZOF MUE'\i\l;l?F’l:E PRICES:.? PER TOTAL PRICE BID
152 | ONE LOT OF (3) 16.9-28 CASE LOADER TIRES $0.00
NO BID

153 '?ILQ\ILIJE(;_}?-PFAOREF(SQ) PALLETS MISC. AUTO AND INT’L $351.00
GURAL FARMS

154 S/INOI\ENIIE%TT?;E(? PALLETS MISC. AUTO, TRUCK & $20.00
FRANK BOWMAN

155 8;15;{_'8; |C:>)AFR(j|-)SPALLET OF MISC. CHEVROLET $ 288.00
MARK REDDICK

156 \?Iléﬁ_ld(;;%;g_l)_gALLET OF MISC. FORD CROWN $ 137.50

ALPINE DEERE LANDSCAPING
157 | ONE LOT OF (1) PALLET OF MISC. DODGE AUTO PARTS $ 150.00
JACHIN DECK
158 | ONE LOT OF (4) CHEVROLET FRONT JUMP SEATS $ 652.00
MARK PAJOR

159 | ONE LOT OF (2) FORD FRONT JUMP SEATS $18.00
ERIN TAMBURINI

160 | ONE LOT OF (1) PALLET OF MISC. MOWER PTO SHAFTS $18.00
ERIN TAMBURINI

161 ONE LOT OF (6) WHELEN DELTA INDEPENDENCE $ 305.05

AMBER HALOGEN LIGHTBARS

VINCENT MARTINI




	NAME OF BIDDER: 
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF7EKE48015 Mileage 86625 T2925: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF7EKE48015 Mileage 86625 T2925: 3510
	2014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF7EKE48015 Mileage 86625 T2925Row1: RONALD COOK
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF2EKE48021 Mileage 155524 T2927: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF2EKE48021 Mileage 155524 T2927: 1678
	2014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF2EKE48021 Mileage 155524 T2927Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF4EKE48019 Mileage 260467 T2921: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF4EKE48019 Mileage 260467 T2921: 1153
	2014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF4EKE48019 Mileage 260467 T2921Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 650000: 6630
	2017 FORD F250 W85 BOSS PLOW VIN 1FTBF2B62HEE22337 Mileage 221086 T3429 R10431Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	MINBID 6500002013 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF3DKF38762 Mileage 72261 T2806: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2013 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF3DKF38762 Mileage 72261 T2806: 3050
	2013 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF3DKF38762 Mileage 72261 T2806Row1: HARRY STEWART
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 850000: 0.00
	2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCRYAEF4LZ332509 Mileage 135341 T3948Row1: NO BID
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 850000_2: 8620
	2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCRYAEFXLZ334913 Mileage 159967 T3959Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	MINBID 8500002017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EFXHKD97866 Mileage 144434 T3465: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EFXHKD97866 Mileage 144434 T3465: 3911
	2017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EFXHKD97866 Mileage 144434 T3465Row1: LAFERRARA CONSTRUCTION
	MINBID 8500002019 FORD F250 W85 BOSS PLOW VIN 1FTBF2B64KEC37262 Mileage 149491 T3620 R9995: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2019 FORD F250 W85 BOSS PLOW VIN 1FTBF2B64KEC37262 Mileage 149491 T3620 R9995: 12000
	2019 FORD F250 W85 BOSS PLOW VIN 1FTBF2B64KEC37262 Mileage 149491 T3620 R9995Row1: MARLIN CONSTRUCTION
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 750000: 0.00
	2019 CHEVROLET IMPALA VIN 2G11X5S32K9101692 Mileage 132828 A3388Row1: NO BID
	MINBID 7500002019 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT4KH693188 Mileage 164908 A3416: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2019 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT4KH693188 Mileage 164908 A3416: 1779
	2019 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT4KH693188 Mileage 164908 A3416Row1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	MINBID 7500002016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTMF1CF1GKD66232 Mileage 150672 T3082: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTMF1CF1GKD66232 Mileage 150672 T3082: 2383
	2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTMF1CF1GKD66232 Mileage 150672 T3082Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	MINBID 7500002014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF9EKE48016 Mileage 104624 T2919: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF9EKE48016 Mileage 104624 T2919: 1079
	2014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF9EKE48016 Mileage 104624 T2919Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	MINBID 7500002014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF0EKE48017 Mileage 199275 T2922: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF0EKE48017 Mileage 199275 T2922: 4511
	2014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTNF1CF0EKE48017 Mileage 199275 T2922Row1: LAFERRARA CONSTRUCTION
	NAME OF BIDDER_2: 
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCNEC8JZ334254 Mileage 162582 T3613: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCNEC8JZ334254 Mileage 162582 T3613: 3078
	2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCNEC8JZ334254 Mileage 162582 T3613Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL 
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCNEC8JZ135611 Mileage 181714 T3451: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCNEC8JZ135611 Mileage 181714 T3451: 3434
	2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCNEC8JZ135611 Mileage 181714 T3451Row1: KEVIN URBAN
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2018 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EB8JKE96284 Mileage 176156 T3582: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EB8JKE96284 Mileage 176156 T3582: 5300
	2018 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EB8JKE96284 Mileage 176156 T3582Row1: FERAS ALMASI
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E86HKD77115 Mileage 241302 T3417: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E86HKD77115 Mileage 241302 T3417: 2868
	2017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E86HKD77115 Mileage 241302 T3417Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2015 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E80FFB71133 Mileage 176653 T3052: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2015 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E80FFB71133 Mileage 176653 T3052: 3911
	2015 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E80FFB71133 Mileage 176653 T3052Row1: LAFERRARA CONSTRUCTION
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT6HH621403 Mileage 162031 A3334: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT6HH621403 Mileage 162031 A3334: 2131
	2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT6HH621403 Mileage 162031 A3334Row1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 650000_2: 9500
	2017 FORD F250 W85 BOSS PLOW VIN 1FTBF2B6XHEE22344 Mileage 162704 T3431 R9682Row1: MARLIN CONSTRUCTION
	MINBID 6500002017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EF5HKD97872 Mileage 174581 T3462: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EF5HKD97872 Mileage 174581 T3462: 2862
	2017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EF5HKD97872 Mileage 174581 T3462Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	MINBID 6500002017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EF1HKD97867 Mileage 165334 T3463: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EF1HKD97867 Mileage 165334 T3463: 5801
	2017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EF1HKD97867 Mileage 165334 T3463Row1: DISCOUNT AUTO CENTER
	MINBID 6500002016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTMF1CF0GKD66237 Mileage 83519 T3075: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTMF1CF0GKD66237 Mileage 83519 T3075: 6200
	2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTMF1CF0GKD66237 Mileage 83519 T3075Row1: MARLIN CONSTRUCTION
	MINBID 6500002017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E80HKD77109 Mileage 142548 T3418: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E80HKD77109 Mileage 142548 T3418: 6527
	2017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E80HKD77109 Mileage 142548 T3418Row1: FRANK LOSACCO
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 650000_3: 8511
	2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCRYAEF7LZ334688 Mileage 214059 T3955Row1: LAFERRARA CONSTRUCTION
	MINBID 6500002016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EF2GKD66240 Mileage 153920 T3058: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EF2GKD66240 Mileage 153920 T3058: 4777
	2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EF2GKD66240 Mileage 153920 T3058Row1: BARREN BALDWIN
	MINBID 6500002015 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E86FFB71136 Mileage 169370 T3045: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2015 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E86FFB71136 Mileage 169370 T3045: 2469
	2015 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E86FFB71136 Mileage 169370 T3045Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	NAME OF BIDDER_3: 
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2019 FORD F250 VIN 1FTBF2B63KEC37267 Mileage 130609 T3621: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2019 FORD F250 VIN 1FTBF2B63KEC37267 Mileage 130609 T3621: 4010
	2019 FORD F250 VIN 1FTBF2B63KEC37267 Mileage 130609 T3621Row1: RONALD COOK
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 750000_2: 0.00
	2019 CHEVROLET IMPALA VIN 2G11X5S37K9101154 Mileage 127315 A3389Row1: NO BID
	MINBID 7500002017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT6HH621417 Mileage 156460 A3329: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT6HH621417 Mileage 156460 A3329: 2332
	2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT6HH621417 Mileage 156460 A3329Row1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	MINBID 7500002018 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT0JH323886 Mileage 146351 A3349: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT0JH323886 Mileage 146351 A3349: 2838
	2018 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT0JH323886 Mileage 146351 A3349Row1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	MINBID 7500002017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKTXHH621419 Mileage 149372 A3338: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKTXHH621419 Mileage 149372 A3338: 2383
	2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKTXHH621419 Mileage 149372 A3338Row1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	MINBID 7500002017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT5HH621408 Mileage 127216 A3332: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT5HH621408 Mileage 127216 A3332: 2359
	2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT5HH621408 Mileage 127216 A3332Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	MINBID 7500002017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT2HH621415 Mileage A3337: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT2HH621415 Mileage A3337: 2331
	2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT2HH621415 Mileage A3337Row1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	MINBID 7500002018 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC9JR364810 Mileage 205771 T3662: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC9JR364810 Mileage 205771 T3662: 2577
	2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC9JR364810 Mileage 205771 T3662Row1: JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
	MINBID 7500002016 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT8GH268211 Mileage 178886 A3303: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2016 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT8GH268211 Mileage 178886 A3303: 1818
	2016 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT8GH268211 Mileage 178886 A3303Row1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	MINBID 7500002013 CHEVROLET IMPALA VIN 2G1WF5E39D1259422 Mileage 101775 A3190: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2013 CHEVROLET IMPALA VIN 2G1WF5E39D1259422 Mileage 101775 A3190: 1668
	2013 CHEVROLET IMPALA VIN 2G1WF5E39D1259422 Mileage 101775 A3190Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	MINBID 7500002014 CHEVROLET IMPALA VIN 2G1WA5E38E1178654 Mileage 84291 A3235: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2014 CHEVROLET IMPALA VIN 2G1WA5E38E1178654 Mileage 84291 A3235: 2855.50
	2014 CHEVROLET IMPALA VIN 2G1WA5E38E1178654 Mileage 84291 A3235Row1: DSR AUTO SALES
	MINBID 7500002014 CHEVROLET IMPALA VIN 2G1WA5E31E1177734 Mileage 106515 A3237: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2014 CHEVROLET IMPALA VIN 2G1WA5E31E1177734 Mileage 106515 A3237: 3200
	2014 CHEVROLET IMPALA VIN 2G1WA5E31E1177734 Mileage 106515 A3237Row1: PATRICK ROSS
	MINBID 7500002020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC5LR228144 Mileage 119104 T3856: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC5LR228144 Mileage 119104 T3856: 5219
	2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC5LR228144 Mileage 119104 T3856Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	MINBID 7500002020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC8LR228932 Mileage 132153 T3881: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC8LR228932 Mileage 132153 T3881: 5055
	2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC8LR228932 Mileage 132153 T3881Row1: JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
	NAME OF BIDDER_4: 
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2021 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXATXMH662922 Mileage 112916 A4014: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2021 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXATXMH662922 Mileage 112916 A4014: 2050
	2021 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXATXMH662922 Mileage 112916 A4014Row1: PARK AUTO & PERFORMANCE
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT8HH621418 Mileage 122114 A3330: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT8HH621418 Mileage 122114 A3330: 2250
	2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT8HH621418 Mileage 122114 A3330Row1: JACHIN DECK
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC1HR318320 Mileage 109963 T3509: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC1HR318320 Mileage 109963 T3509: 3669
	2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC1HR318320 Mileage 109963 T3509Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2016 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC5GR409136 Mileage 125651 T3293: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2016 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC5GR409136 Mileage 125651 T3293: 3139
	2016 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC5GR409136 Mileage 125651 T3293Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC5LR228984 Mileage 157589 T3850: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC5LR228984 Mileage 157589 T3850: 4789
	2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC5LR228984 Mileage 157589 T3850Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2013 FORD EXPLORER VIN 1FM5K8B89DGC96467 Mileage 134729 T2724: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2013 FORD EXPLORER VIN 1FM5K8B89DGC96467 Mileage 134729 T2724: 3321
	2013 FORD EXPLORER VIN 1FM5K8B89DGC96467 Mileage 134729 T2724Row1: ERIN TAMBURINI
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 350000: 4000
	2014 FORD FOCUS VIN 1FADP3K29EL332799 Mileage 47803 A3199Row1: RICARDO LOPEZ
	MINBID 3500002014 FORD FOCUS VIN 1FADP3E21EL336969 Mileage 71109 A3195: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2014 FORD FOCUS VIN 1FADP3E21EL336969 Mileage 71109 A3195: 2500
	2014 FORD FOCUS VIN 1FADP3E21EL336969 Mileage 71109 A3195Row1: PATRICK ROSS
	MINBID 3500002014 CHEVROLET IMPALA VIN 2G1WA5E34E1178053 Mileage 114819 A3236: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2014 CHEVROLET IMPALA VIN 2G1WA5E34E1178053 Mileage 114819 A3236: 2800
	2014 CHEVROLET IMPALA VIN 2G1WA5E34E1178053 Mileage 114819 A3236Row1: PATRICK ROSS
	MINBID 3500002018 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC9JR361132 Mileage 177594 T3655: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC9JR361132 Mileage 177594 T3655: 3660
	2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC9JR361132 Mileage 177594 T3655Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	MINBID 3500002020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC3LR188677 Mileage 148962 T3845: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC3LR188677 Mileage 148962 T3845: 4739
	2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC3LR188677 Mileage 148962 T3845Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	MINBID 3500002013 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 VIN 1GCZGTCG4D1100910 Mileage 112179 T2710: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2013 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 VIN 1GCZGTCG4D1100910 Mileage 112179 T2710: 6051
	2013 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 VIN 1GCZGTCG4D1100910 Mileage 112179 T2710Row1: DISCOUNT AUTO CENTER
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 650000_4: 7110
	2016 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 W85 PLOW VIN 1GC0KUEG8GZ269327 Mileage 94782 T3237 R9454Row1: RONALD COOK
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 750000_3: 9960
	2016 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 W85 PLOW VIN 1GC0KUEG1GZ269587 Mileage 48152 T3238 R9452Row1: PLEIDAS AUTO SALES
	NAME OF BIDDER_5: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 650000_5: 7800
	2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 W85 PLOW VIN 1GCOKUEGXFZ138267 Mileage 126051 T2963 R8613Row1: PLEIDAS AUTO SALES
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 650000_6: 8400
	2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 W85 PLOW VIN 1GC0KUEG9FZ546415 Mileage 106507 T3087 R9084Row1: PLEIDAS AUTO SALES
	MINBID 6500002019 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E56KKE25175 Mileage 191200 T3735: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2019 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E56KKE25175 Mileage 191200 T3735: 2778
	2019 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E56KKE25175 Mileage 191200 T3735Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	MINBID 6500002010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP VIN 1HTWDAZR1AJ278510 Mileage 149693 Hrs 13269 T2210: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP VIN 1HTWDAZR1AJ278510 Mileage 149693 Hrs 13269 T2210: 7000
	2010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP VIN 1HTWDAZR1AJ278510 Mileage 149693 Hrs 13269 T2210Row1: NEW PRINCE CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION CO.
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 650000_7: 11500
	2016 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 W85 PLOW VIN 1GC0KUEG4GZ270667 Mileage 54138 T3236 R9453Row1: MARLIN CONSTRUCTION
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 650000_8: 7900
	2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 W85 PLOW VIN 1GC0KUEG1FZ138268 Mileage 112328 T2965 R8615Row1: PLEIDAS AUTO SALES
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 650000_9: 8911
	2017 FORD F250 W85 PLOW VIN 1FTBF2B68HEE22343 Mileage 159836 T3432 R9683Row1: LAFERRARA CONSTRUCTION
	MINBID 6500002010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W11 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R7266 VIN 1HTWDAZR5AJ278493 Mileage 119622 Hrs 11345 T2195 R7320: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W11 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R7266 VIN 1HTWDAZR5AJ278493 Mileage 119622 Hrs 11345 T2195 R7320: 8000
	2010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W11 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R7266 VIN 1HTWDAZR5AJ278493 Mileage 119622 Hrs 11345 T2195 R7320Row1: NEW PRINCE CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION CO.
	MINBID 6500002010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP WTAILGATE SPREADER VIN 1HTWDAZR7AJ278513 Mileage 160044 Hrs 14765 T2215 R7286: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP WTAILGATE SPREADER VIN 1HTWDAZR7AJ278513 Mileage 160044 Hrs 14765 T2215 R7286: 2000
	2010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP WTAILGATE SPREADER VIN 1HTWDAZR7AJ278513 Mileage 160044 Hrs 14765 T2215 R7286Row1: HARBOR TRUCKING
	MINBID 6500002004 INTL 7400 6YD DUMP VIN 1HTWDADR94J085792 Mileage 93733 Hrs 7843 T1793: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2004 INTL 7400 6YD DUMP VIN 1HTWDADR94J085792 Mileage 93733 Hrs 7843 T1793: 2000
	2004 INTL 7400 6YD DUMP VIN 1HTWDADR94J085792 Mileage 93733 Hrs 7843 T1793Row1: HARBOR TRUCKING
	MINBID 6500002005 INTL 7400 7YD W11 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R6356 VIN 1HTWDAZR05J010618 Mileage 35154 Hrs 4546 T1923 R6301: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2005 INTL 7400 7YD W11 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R6356 VIN 1HTWDAZR05J010618 Mileage 35154 Hrs 4546 T1923 R6301: 3308
	2005 INTL 7400 7YD W11 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R6356 VIN 1HTWDAZR05J010618 Mileage 35154 Hrs 4546 T1923 R6301Row1: GURAL FARMS
	MINBID 6500002010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W11 PLOW VIN 1HTWDAZR2AJ278483 Mileage 999999 T2232 R7357: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W11 PLOW VIN 1HTWDAZR2AJ278483 Mileage 999999 T2232 R7357: 1531
	2010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W11 PLOW VIN 1HTWDAZR2AJ278483 Mileage 999999 T2232 R7357Row1: JOSEPH DEFINO TRUCKING
	MINBID 6500002010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W11 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R7267 VIN 1HTWDAZR1AJ278488 Mileage 999999 T2196 R7321: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W11 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R7267 VIN 1HTWDAZR1AJ278488 Mileage 999999 T2196 R7321: 2000
	2010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W11 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R7267 VIN 1HTWDAZR1AJ278488 Mileage 999999 T2196 R7321Row1: HARBOR TRUCKING
	NAME OF BIDDER_6: 
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W10 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R7299 VIN 1HTWDAZR1AJ278460 Mileage 35028 Hrs 3431 T2228 R7353: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W10 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R7299 VIN 1HTWDAZR1AJ278460 Mileage 35028 Hrs 3431 T2228 R7353: 10000
	2010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W10 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R7299 VIN 1HTWDAZR1AJ278460 Mileage 35028 Hrs 3431 T2228 R7353Row1: NEW PRINCE CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION CO.
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2012 INTL 7500 W16YD VBOX SPREADER VIN 1HTWPAZTXCJ440124 Mileage 28773 Hrs 4375 T2330 R7539: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2012 INTL 7500 W16YD VBOX SPREADER VIN 1HTWPAZTXCJ440124 Mileage 28773 Hrs 4375 T2330 R7539: 7500
	2012 INTL 7500 W16YD VBOX SPREADER VIN 1HTWPAZTXCJ440124 Mileage 28773 Hrs 4375 T2330 R7539Row1: HARBOR TRUCKING
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2018 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EB4JKE96282 Mileage 218396 T3593: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EB4JKE96282 Mileage 218396 T3593: 3162
	2018 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EB4JKE96282 Mileage 218396 T3593Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EF6GKD66242 Mileage 145535 T3067: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EF6GKD66242 Mileage 145535 T3067: 5801
	2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EF6GKD66242 Mileage 145535 T3067Row1: DISCOUNT AUTO CENTER
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 850000_3: 0.00
	2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO VIN 1GCRYAEF5LZ332907 Mileage 173292 T3945Row1: NO BID
	MINBID 8500002018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCNEC9JZ135777 Mileage 120972 T3444: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCNEC9JZ135777 Mileage 120972 T3444: 6000
	2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCNEC9JZ135777 Mileage 120972 T3444Row1: MARLIN CONSTRUCTION
	MINBID 8500002018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 VIN 1GC1KUEG2JF239172 Mileage 349320 T3568: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 VIN 1GC1KUEG2JF239172 Mileage 349320 T3568: 1668
	2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 VIN 1GC1KUEG2JF239172 Mileage 349320 T3568Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	MINBID 8500002018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCNEC6JZ334723 Mileage 115340 T3612: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCNEC6JZ334723 Mileage 115340 T3612: 1242
	2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCNEC6JZ334723 Mileage 115340 T3612Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	MINBID 8500002010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W11 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R7318 VIN 1HTWDAZR4AJ278484 Mileage 48128 Hrs 5511 T2247 R7372: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W11 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R7318 VIN 1HTWDAZR4AJ278484 Mileage 48128 Hrs 5511 T2247 R7372: 3000
	2010 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W11 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R7318 VIN 1HTWDAZR4AJ278484 Mileage 48128 Hrs 5511 T2247 R7372Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	MINBID 8500002006 FORD E350 PASSENGER VAN VIN 1FBNE31L36HA45899 Mileage 163252 T1960: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2006 FORD E350 PASSENGER VAN VIN 1FBNE31L36HA45899 Mileage 163252 T1960: 852
	2006 FORD E350 PASSENGER VAN VIN 1FBNE31L36HA45899 Mileage 163252 T1960Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	MINBID 8500002018 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E50JKE40527 Mileage 187377 T3596: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E50JKE40527 Mileage 187377 T3596: 3068
	2018 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E50JKE40527 Mileage 187377 T3596Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	MINBID 8500002016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E81GFC16257 Mileage 190230 T3209: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E81GFC16257 Mileage 190230 T3209: 3650
	2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E81GFC16257 Mileage 190230 T3209Row1: HARRY STEWART
	MINBID 8500002016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E88GFC16255 Mileage 152485 T3203: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E88GFC16255 Mileage 152485 T3203: 2669
	2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E88GFC16255 Mileage 152485 T3203Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	NAME OF BIDDER_7: 
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC6HR316837 Mileage 146279 T3491: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC6HR316837 Mileage 146279 T3491: 3434
	2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC6HR316837 Mileage 146279 T3491Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC3LR229809 Mileage 999999 T3877: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC3LR229809 Mileage 999999 T3877: 2789
	2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC3LR229809 Mileage 999999 T3877Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2010 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 1500 VIN 1GCUGAD46A1117318 Mileage 73784 T2180: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2010 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 1500 VIN 1GCUGAD46A1117318 Mileage 73784 T2180: 4300
	2010 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 1500 VIN 1GCUGAD46A1117318 Mileage 73784 T2180Row1: ADD ON POOLS
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 650000_10: 8911
	2019 FORD F250 W85 BOSS PLOW VIN 1FTBF2B68KEC37264 Mileage 193643 T3618 R9993Row1: LAFERRARA CONSTRUCTION
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 550000: 10125
	2011 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W11 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R7305 VIN 1HTWDAZR4AJ278467 Mileage 23397 Hrs 3037 T2234 R7359Row1: ADD ON POOLS
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 550000_2: 6238
	2011 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W11 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R7567 VIN 1HTWDAZR7bj436933 Mileage 32982 Hrs 3112 T2337 R7597Row1: JOSEPH DEFINO TRUCKING
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 550000_3: 6238
	2011 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W11 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R7568 VIN 1HTWDAZR1BJ391732 Mileage 27291 Hrs 2583 T2338 R7568Row1: JOSEPH DEFINO TRUCKING
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 550000_4: 5921.80
	2011 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP W11 PLOW  TAILGATE SPREADER R7563 VIN 1HTWDAZR3BJ436928 Mileage 25878 Hrs 2594 T2333 R7593Row1: ALPINE DEERE LANDSCAPING
	MINBID 5500002012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 1500 VIN 1GCSGAFX0C1121155 Mileage 47722 T2552: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 1500 VIN 1GCSGAFX0C1121155 Mileage 47722 T2552: 4900
	2012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 1500 VIN 1GCSGAFX0C1121155 Mileage 47722 T2552Row1: PLEIDAS AUTO SALES
	MINBID 5500002020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 WRECK VIN 3GCNWAEF5LG383778 Mileage 97600 T3962: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 WRECK VIN 3GCNWAEF5LG383778 Mileage 97600 T3962: 1987
	2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 WRECK VIN 3GCNWAEF5LG383778 Mileage 97600 T3962Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	MINBID 5500002017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E86FFB71136 Mileage 169370 T3419: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E86FFB71136 Mileage 169370 T3419: 6500
	2017 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E86FFB71136 Mileage 169370 T3419Row1: NEW PRINCE CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION CO.
	MINBID 5500002018 FORD F150 XTRA CAB VIN 1FTEX1EB2JKE96281 Mileage 178664 T3592: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 FORD F150 XTRA CAB VIN 1FTEX1EB2JKE96281 Mileage 178664 T3592: 5000
	2018 FORD F150 XTRA CAB VIN 1FTEX1EB2JKE96281 Mileage 178664 T3592Row1: NEW PRINCE CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION CO.
	MINBID 5500002016 FORD F150 XTRA CAB VIN 1FTEX1E82GFC16252 Mileage 228486 T3205: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2016 FORD F150 XTRA CAB VIN 1FTEX1E82GFC16252 Mileage 228486 T3205: 1787
	2016 FORD F150 XTRA CAB VIN 1FTEX1E82GFC16252 Mileage 228486 T3205Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	NAME OF BIDDER_8: 
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 VIN 1GCZGTCG6C1111681 T2535: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 VIN 1GCZGTCG6C1111681 T2535: 3300
	2012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 VIN 1GCZGTCG6C1111681 T2535Row1: PLEIADES AUTO SALES
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E84GFC16253 Mileage 167981 T3213: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E84GFC16253 Mileage 167981 T3213: 4050
	2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E84GFC16253 Mileage 167981 T3213Row1: PLEIADES AUTO SALES
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2018 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EB4JKE96279 Mileage 157069 T3580: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EB4JKE96279 Mileage 157069 T3580: 4900
	2018 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EB4JKE96279 Mileage 157069 T3580Row1: PLEIADES AUTO SALES
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 WRECK VIN 1GCNCNEC2JZ135443 Mileage 142548 T3447: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 WRECK VIN 1GCNCNEC2JZ135443 Mileage 142548 T3447: 1537
	2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 WRECK VIN 1GCNCNEC2JZ135443 Mileage 142548 T3447Row1: JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2012 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCPEX9CZ165136 Mileage 218344 T2515: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2012 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCPEX9CZ165136 Mileage 218344 T2515: 564
	2012 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCPEX9CZ165136 Mileage 218344 T2515Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2018 FORD F150 VIN 1FTES1EB3JKE96287 Mileage 174246 T3588: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 FORD F150 VIN 1FTES1EB3JKE96287 Mileage 174246 T3588: 4500
	2018 FORD F150 VIN 1FTES1EB3JKE96287 Mileage 174246 T3588Row1: PLEIDAS AUTO SALES
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC4LR229771 Mileage 140883 T3865: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC4LR229771 Mileage 140883 T3865: 3777
	2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC4LR229771 Mileage 140883 T3865Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC3JR366407 Mileage 134987 T3665: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC3JR366407 Mileage 134987 T3665: 3369
	2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC3JR366407 Mileage 134987 T3665Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC3JR359084 Mileage 142425 T3647: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC3JR359084 Mileage 142425 T3647: 3858
	2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC3JR359084 Mileage 142425 T3647Row1: JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC0HR319149 Mileage 143912 T3521: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC0HR319149 Mileage 143912 T3521: 3558
	2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC0HR319149 Mileage 143912 T3521Row1: JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2019 DODGE CARAVAN VIN 2C4RDGBG6KR762501 Mileage 116381 T3839: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2019 DODGE CARAVAN VIN 2C4RDGBG6KR762501 Mileage 116381 T3839: 2657
	2019 DODGE CARAVAN VIN 2C4RDGBG6KR762501 Mileage 116381 T3839Row1: JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 1500 VIN 1GCSGAFXXC1121132 Mileage 86656 T2560: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 1500 VIN 1GCSGAFXXC1121132 Mileage 86656 T2560: 4500
	2012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 1500 VIN 1GCSGAFXXC1121132 Mileage 86656 T2560Row1: PLEIDAS AUTO SALES
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2015 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E82FFB71120 Mileage 210394 T3049: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2015 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E82FFB71120 Mileage 210394 T3049: 5110
	2015 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E82FFB71120 Mileage 210394 T3049Row1: RONALD COOK
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2015 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E81FFB71125 Mileage 141617 T3041: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2015 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E81FFB71125 Mileage 141617 T3041: 6110
	2015 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1E81FFB71125 Mileage 141617 T3041Row1: RONALD COOK
	NAME OF BIDDER_9: 
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT9HH621413 Mileage 189334 A3341: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT9HH621413 Mileage 189334 A3341: 2218
	2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT9HH621413 Mileage 189334 A3341Row1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 750000_4: 15000
	2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDKC7JR363658 Mileage 142189 T3674Row1: TOI PITTMAN
	MINBID 7500002020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC5LR229813 Mileage 999999 T3863: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC5LR229813 Mileage 999999 T3863: 3479
	2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC5LR229813 Mileage 999999 T3863Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	MINBID 7500002012 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSK4E00CR139507 Mileage 999999 T2571: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2012 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSK4E00CR139507 Mileage 999999 T2571: 1351
	2012 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSK4E00CR139507 Mileage 999999 T2571Row1: MARK PAJOR
	MINBID 7500002014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EM0EFB48656 Mileage 123385 T2898: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EM0EFB48656 Mileage 123385 T2898: 5355.50
	2014 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EM0EFB48656 Mileage 123385 T2898Row1: DSR AUTO SALES
	MINBID 7500002017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT5HH621411 Mileage 999999 A3331: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT5HH621411 Mileage 999999 A3331: 815
	2017 DODGE CHARGER VIN 2C3CDXKT5HH621411 Mileage 999999 A3331Row1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	MINBID 7500002016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EF8GKD66243 Mileage 147779 T3057: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EF8GKD66243 Mileage 147779 T3057: 2565
	2016 FORD F150 VIN 1FTEX1EF8GKD66243 Mileage 147779 T3057Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	MINBID 7500002018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCNEC3JZ136035 Mileage 231278 T3448: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCNEC3JZ136035 Mileage 231278 T3448: 2139
	2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 VIN 1GCNCNEC3JZ136035 Mileage 231278 T3448Row1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	MINBID 7500002017 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC1HR319693 Mileage 147008 T3483: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC1HR319693 Mileage 147008 T3483: 1789
	2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE VIN 1GNSKDEC1HR319693 Mileage 147008 T3483Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 1250000: 14000
	2004 JOHN DEERE 315SD 4WD BACKHOE LOADER VIN T0315SG939838 Hrs 2225 71282Row1: HAROLD CROWTHER
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 1150000: 13000
	2000 JOHN DEERE 410E 4WD BACKHOE LOADER VIN T0410EX892103 Hrs 1686 R5622Row1: NEW PRINCE CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION CO.
	MINBID 11500002000 CASE C80 2WD TRACTOR VIN C080RN3JJE1014832 Hrs 99999 R5573: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2000 CASE C80 2WD TRACTOR VIN C080RN3JJE1014832 Hrs 99999 R5573: 2649
	2000 CASE C80 2WD TRACTOR VIN C080RN3JJE1014832 Hrs 99999 R5573Row1: GURAL FARMS
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 950000: 11225
	2017 TORO 4000D 11 MOWER VIN 400957633 Hrs 1056 R9600Row1: CATALANO EQUIPMENT
	MINBID 9500002009 INGERSOLL XP185 COMPRESSOR VIN 4FVCBBAA6AV410356 Hrs 167 R7415: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2009 INGERSOLL XP185 COMPRESSOR VIN 4FVCBBAA6AV410356 Hrs 167 R7415: 3125
	2009 INGERSOLL XP185 COMPRESSOR VIN 4FVCBBAA6AV410356 Hrs 167 R7415Row1: APLINE DEERE LANDSCAPING
	NAME OF BIDDER_10: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 1050000: 11500
	2012 VERMEER BC1200XL CHIPPER VIN 1VR7141Y6C1001028 Hrs 1000 R8136Row1: MARLIN CONSTRUCTION
	MINBID 10500002014 BARBER ROAD RAKE 200T VIN 2151 R8873: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2014 BARBER ROAD RAKE 200T VIN 2151 R8873: 1218
	2014 BARBER ROAD RAKE 200T VIN 2151 R8873Row1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	TOTAL PRICE BIDMINBID 550000_5: 5610
	2012 WOODS BW1800X TAG MOWER VIN 1221899 R8178Row1: GURAL FARMS
	MINBID 5500002012 VERMAC VM4815 SOLAR ARROWBOARD TRAILER VIN 2S9US2119CS132344 R8085: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2012 VERMAC VM4815 SOLAR ARROWBOARD TRAILER VIN 2S9US2119CS132344 R8085: 26
	2012 VERMAC VM4815 SOLAR ARROWBOARD TRAILER VIN 2S9US2119CS132344 R8085Row1: ALPINE DEERE LANDSCAPING
	MINBID 5500001980 ESSICK W30WR WALKBEHIND ROLLER VIN 82006873 R2732: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID1980 ESSICK W30WR WALKBEHIND ROLLER VIN 82006873 R2732: 0.00
	1980 ESSICK W30WR WALKBEHIND ROLLER VIN 82006873 R2732Row1: NO BID
	MINBID 5500001999 LANDPRIDE OS1572 GROUND SEEDER VIN 272071 R5425: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID1999 LANDPRIDE OS1572 GROUND SEEDER VIN 272071 R5425: 1820
	1999 LANDPRIDE OS1572 GROUND SEEDER VIN 272071 R5425Row1: CATALANO EQUIPMENT
	MINBID 5500002009 VALK RV114288PRL 11 PLOW R7337: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2009 VALK RV114288PRL 11 PLOW R7337: 1000
	2009 VALK RV114288PRL 11 PLOW R7337Row1: HARBOR TRUCKING
	MINBID 5500002009 VALK RV114288PRL 11 PLOW R7340: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2009 VALK RV114288PRL 11 PLOW R7340: 1000
	2009 VALK RV114288PRL 11 PLOW R7340Row1: HARBOR TRUCKING
	MINBID 5500002009 GLEDHILL 11HSJPCLLL 11 PLOW VIN 79312 R7194: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2009 GLEDHILL 11HSJPCLLL 11 PLOW VIN 79312 R7194: 800
	2009 GLEDHILL 11HSJPCLLL 11 PLOW VIN 79312 R7194Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	MINBID 5500002004 GLEDHILL 10HSJPCL 10 PLOW VIN 75857 R6155: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2004 GLEDHILL 10HSJPCL 10 PLOW VIN 75857 R6155: 800
	2004 GLEDHILL 10HSJPCL 10 PLOW VIN 75857 R6155Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	MINBID 5500002009 VALK RV114288PRL 11 PLOW VIN 33890 R7330: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2009 VALK RV114288PRL 11 PLOW VIN 33890 R7330: 1000
	2009 VALK RV114288PRL 11 PLOW VIN 33890 R7330Row1: HARBOR TRUCKING
	MINBID 5500001999 VALK RVS1042 10 PLOW VIN 24116 R5497: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID1999 VALK RVS1042 10 PLOW VIN 24116 R5497: 800
	1999 VALK RVS1042 10 PLOW VIN 24116 R5497Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	MINBID 5500002015 VALK RV113116PR 11 PLOW VIN 37850 R8861: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2015 VALK RV113116PR 11 PLOW VIN 37850 R8861: 1000
	2015 VALK RV113116PR 11 PLOW VIN 37850 R8861Row1: HARBOR TRUCKING
	MINBID 5500001999 VALK RVS1042 10 PLOW VIN 24119 R5489: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID1999 VALK RVS1042 10 PLOW VIN 24119 R5489: 800
	1999 VALK RVS1042 10 PLOW VIN 24119 R5489Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	NAME OF BIDDER_11: 
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2009 GLEDHILL 11HSJPCLLL 11 PLOW VIN 79311 R7193: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2009 GLEDHILL 11HSJPCLLL 11 PLOW VIN 79311 R7193: 800
	2009 GLEDHILL 11HSJPCLLL 11 PLOW VIN 79311 R7193Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	PRICE BID PER UNITONE LOT OF 5 WHELEN LIBERTY II AMBER LED LIGHTBARS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDONE LOT OF 5 WHELEN LIBERTY II AMBER LED LIGHTBARS: 255.05
	ONE LOT OF 5 WHELEN LIBERTY II AMBER LED LIGHTBARSRow1: VINCENT MARTINI
	PRICE BID PER UNIT1999 VALK RVS1042 10 PLOW VIN 24117 R5494: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID1999 VALK RVS1042 10 PLOW VIN 24117 R5494: 800
	1999 VALK RVS1042 10 PLOW VIN 24117 R5494Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2012 CIMLINE 230 GAL ROADWAY CRACK SEALER VIN 1C92M1522CN119110 Hrs 649 R8209: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2012 CIMLINE 230 GAL ROADWAY CRACK SEALER VIN 1C92M1522CN119110 Hrs 649 R8209: 256
	2012 CIMLINE 230 GAL ROADWAY CRACK SEALER VIN 1C92M1522CN119110 Hrs 649 R8209Row1: ALPINE DEERE LANDSCAPING
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2016 CIMLINE 230 GAL ROADWAY CRACK SEALER VIN 1G9241526GM119094 R9445: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2016 CIMLINE 230 GAL ROADWAY CRACK SEALER VIN 1G9241526GM119094 R9445: 550
	2016 CIMLINE 230 GAL ROADWAY CRACK SEALER VIN 1G9241526GM119094 R9445Row1: PARK AUTO & PERFORMANCE
	PRICE BID PER UNITCOATS 6065EX RIM CLAMP TIRE MACHINE VIN 601104729 G20174: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDCOATS 6065EX RIM CLAMP TIRE MACHINE VIN 601104729 G20174: 501.05
	COATS 6065EX RIM CLAMP TIRE MACHINE VIN 601104729 G20174Row1: VINCENT MARTINI
	PRICE BID PER UNITSNAPON EEWB205A WHEEL BALANCER VIN G51AX005 G16152: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDSNAPON EEWB205A WHEEL BALANCER VIN G51AX005 G16152: 150
	SNAPON EEWB205A WHEEL BALANCER VIN G51AX005 G16152Row1: TRACY SALVENSEN
	PRICE BID PER UNITBRANICK WALL MOUNT STRUT COMPRESSOR G12355: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDBRANICK WALL MOUNT STRUT COMPRESSOR G12355: 0.00
	BRANICK WALL MOUNT STRUT COMPRESSOR G12355Row1: NO BID
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2008 TORO 22163 21 PUSH MOWER VIN 270000692 R7111: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2008 TORO 22163 21 PUSH MOWER VIN 270000692 R7111: 10
	2008 TORO 22163 21 PUSH MOWER VIN 270000692 R7111Row1: FRANK BOWMAN
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2008 TORO 22163 21 PUSH MOWER VIN 270000691 R7112: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2008 TORO 22163 21 PUSH MOWER VIN 270000691 R7112: 26
	2008 TORO 22163 21 PUSH MOWER VIN 270000691 R7112Row1: SHIVAM CHHABRA
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2008 TORO 22163 21 PUSH MOWER VIN 270000693 R7113: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2008 TORO 22163 21 PUSH MOWER VIN 270000693 R7113: 53
	2008 TORO 22163 21 PUSH MOWER VIN 270000693 R7113Row1: BARREN BALDWIN
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2003 TENNANT 5700800D FLOOR SCRUBBER VIN 22077 R6001: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2003 TENNANT 5700800D FLOOR SCRUBBER VIN 22077 R6001: 0.00
	2003 TENNANT 5700800D FLOOR SCRUBBER VIN 22077 R6001Row1: NO BID
	PRICE BID PER UNIT1977 HYDROMITE DG31 3 PUMP VIN 77013 G5295: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID1977 HYDROMITE DG31 3 PUMP VIN 77013 G5295: 17
	1977 HYDROMITE DG31 3 PUMP VIN 77013 G5295Row1: ERIN TAMBURINI
	PRICE BID PER UNIT2002 HONDA 3500W PORTABLE GENERATOR 70862: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID2002 HONDA 3500W PORTABLE GENERATOR 70862: 155
	2002 HONDA 3500W PORTABLE GENERATOR 70862Row1: MARK REDDICK
	NAME OF BIDDER_12: 
	PRICE BID PER UNITONE LOT OF 3 16928 CASE LOADER TIRES: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDONE LOT OF 3 16928 CASE LOADER TIRES: 0.00
	ONE LOT OF 3 16928 CASE LOADER TIRESRow1: NO BID
	PRICE BID PER UNITONE LOT OF 2 PALLETS MISC AUTO AND INTL TRUCK PARTS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDONE LOT OF 2 PALLETS MISC AUTO AND INTL TRUCK PARTS: 351
	ONE LOT OF 2 PALLETS MISC AUTO AND INTL TRUCK PARTSRow1: GURAL FARMS
	PRICE BID PER UNITONE LOT OF 2 PALLETS MISC AUTO TRUCK  MOWER TIRES: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDONE LOT OF 2 PALLETS MISC AUTO TRUCK  MOWER TIRES: 20.00
	ONE LOT OF 2 PALLETS MISC AUTO TRUCK  MOWER TIRESRow1: FRANK BOWMAN
	PRICE BID PER UNITONE LOT OF 1 PALLET OF MISC CHEVROLET CAPRICE PARTS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDONE LOT OF 1 PALLET OF MISC CHEVROLET CAPRICE PARTS: 288
	ONE LOT OF 1 PALLET OF MISC CHEVROLET CAPRICE PARTSRow1: MARK REDDICK
	PRICE BID PER UNITONE LOT OF 1 PALLET OF MISC FORD CROWN VICTORIA PARTS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDONE LOT OF 1 PALLET OF MISC FORD CROWN VICTORIA PARTS: 137.50
	ONE LOT OF 1 PALLET OF MISC FORD CROWN VICTORIA PARTSRow1: ALPINE DEERE LANDSCAPING
	PRICE BID PER UNITONE LOT OF 1 PALLET OF MISC DODGE AUTO PARTS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDONE LOT OF 1 PALLET OF MISC DODGE AUTO PARTS: 150
	ONE LOT OF 1 PALLET OF MISC DODGE AUTO PARTSRow1: JACHIN DECK
	PRICE BID PER UNITONE LOT OF 4 CHEVROLET FRONT JUMP SEATS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDONE LOT OF 4 CHEVROLET FRONT JUMP SEATS: 652
	ONE LOT OF 4 CHEVROLET FRONT JUMP SEATSRow1: MARK PAJOR
	PRICE BID PER UNITONE LOT OF 2 FORD FRONT JUMP SEATS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDONE LOT OF 2 FORD FRONT JUMP SEATS: 18
	ONE LOT OF 2 FORD FRONT JUMP SEATSRow1: ERIN TAMBURINI
	PRICE BID PER UNITONE LOT OF 1 PALLET OF MISC MOWER PTO SHAFTS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDONE LOT OF 1 PALLET OF MISC MOWER PTO SHAFTS: 18
	ONE LOT OF 1 PALLET OF MISC MOWER PTO SHAFTSRow1: ERIN TAMBURINI
	PRICE BID PER UNITONE LOT OF 6 WHELEN DELTA INDEPENDENCE AMBER HALOGEN LIGHTBARS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDONE LOT OF 6 WHELEN DELTA INDEPENDENCE AMBER HALOGEN LIGHTBARS: 305.05
	ONE LOT OF 6 WHELEN DELTA INDEPENDENCE AMBER HALOGEN LIGHTBARSRow1: VINCENT MARTINI


