
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P500.787 Letting Date: 4/3/2025

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00

3 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

4 108-0001 1,100.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $1,100.00 $1.00 $1,100.00

5 108-N0004 100.00 USD Steel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $100.00 $1.00 $100.00

6 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $415,000.00 $415,000.00

7 202-0002 1,086.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $65.00 $70,590.00 $75.00 $81,450.00

8 202-0007 191.00 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $80.00 $15,280.00 $50.00 $9,550.00

9 202-0009 30,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00

10 203-0001 282.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $90.00 $25,380.00 $45.00 $12,690.00

11 203-0002 375.00 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $120.00 $45,000.00 $75.00 $28,125.00

12 205-0001 2,671.00 C.Y. Foundation Excavation $60.00 $160,260.00 $75.00 $200,325.00

13 205-0002 583.00 C.Y. Coarse Aggregate Layer $130.00 $75,790.00 $95.00 $55,385.00

14 208-0006 47.00 C.Y. Hay Bales $100.00 $4,700.00 $150.00 $7,050.00

15 208-0008 1,070.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence $15.00 $16,050.00 $15.00 $16,050.00

16 208-0022 14.00 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $300.00 $4,200.00 $100.00 $1,400.00

17 208-0024 129.00 Ton Construction Driveway $90.00 $11,610.00 $90.00 $11,610.00

18 208-N0001 2.00 Each Concrete Washout Facility $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $8,000.00 $16,000.00

19 213-0002 1,060.00 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $90.00 $95,400.00 $140.00 $148,400.00

20 301-0002 2,572.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6in Thick $22.00 $56,584.00 $26.00 $66,872.00

21 302-0002 852.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course $185.00 $157,620.00 $165.00 $140,580.00

22 302-0004 536.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course $180.00 $96,480.00 $175.00 $93,800.00

23 302-0071 4,700.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $3.50 $16,450.00 $4.00 $18,800.00

24 302-N0007 330.00 GAL Trackless Tack Coat $8.00 $2,640.00 $6.00 $1,980.00

25 303-N0004 209.00 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, Crushed Stone, 4In Thick $36.00 $7,524.00 $45.00 $9,405.00

26 304-0001 329.00 S.Y. Portland Cement Concrete Pavement $190.00 $62,510.00 $190.00 $62,510.00

27 305-0003 4,015.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2 1/2in Depth $17.00 $68,255.00 $8.00 $32,120.00

28 502-0006 170.00 L.F. 18 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class III $130.00 $22,100.00 $140.00 $23,800.00

29 502-0251 800.00 L.F. Cleaning Existing Storm Drains $25.00 $20,000.00 $15.00 $12,000.00

30 503-0001 2.00 Each Inlet, Type D3 $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $11,000.00 $22,000.00

31 503-0003 2.00 Each Inlet, Type D2 $6,500.00 $13,000.00 $12,000.00 $24,000.00

32 503-0005 1.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D2, Using Existing Grate and Frame $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00

33 503-0023 1.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D3, Using Existing Grate And Frame $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00

34 503-0293 4.00 Each Reset Frames $1,200.00 $4,800.00 $900.00 $3,600.00

35 503-N0003 4.00 Each Cleaning Existing Drainage Structures $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00

36 506-0003 537.00 L.F. 9in X 18in Concrete Vertical Curb $45.00 $24,165.00 $38.00 $20,406.00

37 510-0001 100.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $120.00 $12,000.00 $50.00 $5,000.00

38 510-0011 2.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $500.00 $1,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00

39 510-0031 188.00 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide Rail $12.00 $2,256.00 $30.00 $5,640.00

40 511-0006 215.00 L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type II, 72in High $100.00 $21,500.00 $68.00 $14,620.00

41 511-N0011 1,400.00 L.F. Temporary Fencing, 96In High $15.00 $21,000.00 $40.00 $56,000.00

42 514-0001 14.00 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4in Thick $260.00 $3,640.00 $110.00 $1,540.00

43 516-0009 812.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $6.00 $4,872.00 $2.00 $1,624.00

44 516-0013 100.00 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $10.00 $1,000.00 $12.00 $1,200.00

45 517-0003 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type C $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

46 517-0009 14.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $3,000.00 $42,000.00 $2,500.00 $35,000.00

47 517-0013 20,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00

48 522-0001 10.00 Each Test Pits $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00

49 599-N0003 300,000.00 USD Project Allowances (No-Bid) $1.00 $300,000.00 $1.00 $300,000.00

50 599-N0022 75.00 Each Bollards $1,700.00 $127,500.00 $1,450.00 $108,750.00

51 599-N0032 1.00 L.S. Demolition of Buildings (1) $53,000.00 $53,000.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00

52 599-N0033 1.00 L.S. Demolition of Buildings (2) $90,000.00 $90,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00

53 599-N0091 1.00 L.S. Site Electrical Work, Building No. 1 $105,000.00 $105,000.00 $195,000.00 $195,000.00

54 599-N0092 1.00 L.S. Site Electrical Work, Building No. 2 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $215,000.00 $215,000.00

55 599-N0263 1.00 Each Monitoring Well at Location No. 1 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00

56 599-N0264 1.00 Each Sealing of Abandoned Well at Location No. 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00

57 703-0001 191.00 S.Y. Topsoil $20.00 $3,820.00 $10.00 $1,910.00

58 704-0003 191.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type C $2.00 $382.00 $3.50 $668.50

59 801-N0004 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

60 2000-N009 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $180,000.00 $180,000.00 $325,000.00 $325,000.00

BaseLine Item Detail Dobco Inc.APS Contracting, Inc.
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P500.787 Letting Date: 4/3/2025

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

BaseLine Item Detail Dobco Inc.APS Contracting, Inc.

61 2000-N010 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 2 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $415,000.00 $415,000.00

62 2000-N015 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $95,000.00 $95,000.00

63 2000-N016 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 2 $275,000.00 $275,000.00 $165,000.00 $165,000.00

64 2000-N025 1.00 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1 $920,000.00 $920,000.00 $1,150,000.00 $1,150,000.00

65 2000-N030 20,000.00 USD NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (No-Bid) $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00

66 2000-N047 1.00 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 1 $1,127,000.00 $1,127,000.00 $2,500,000.00 $2,500,000.00

67 2000-N053 1.00 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 2 $1,100,000.00 $1,100,000.00 $1,325,000.00 $1,325,000.00

68 2000-N054 1.00 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 2 $1,400,000.00 $1,400,000.00 $3,100,000.00 $3,100,000.00

69 2000-N069 100,000.00 USD Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report, Removal and Monitoring (NO-BID) $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00

$7,762,558.00 $12,520,060.50
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