New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P100.833 Letting Date: 04/17/2025

BaseLine Item Detail PKF-Mark IIl, Inc. Daidone Electric, Inc. HBC Company Inc

$8,271,600.00
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$8,388,000.00

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $401,082.00 $401,082.00 $419,009.00 $419,009.00 $805,000.00 $805,000.00

3 106-N0001 8,000.00 USD  Permit Fees (NO-BID) $1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00

4 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00

5 108-0001 100.00 USD  Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $100.00 $1.00 $100.00 $1.00 $100.00

6 108-N0002 1,038,270.00 USD  Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid) $1.00  $1,038,270.00 $1.00 $1,038,270.00 $1.00 $1,038,270.00

7 109-N0002 1.00 L.S. EGIS Survey $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00

8 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $44,000.00 $44,000.00 $145,000.00 $145,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

9 202-0009 5,000.00 USD  Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00
10 208-0007 700.00 L.F. Silt Fence $17.44 $12,208.00 $9.00 $6,300.00 $5.00 $3,500.00
11 213-0002 90.00 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $29.33 $2,639.70 $25.00 $2,250.00 $50.00 $4,500.00
12 511-0006 230.00 L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type Il, 72in High $140.10 $32,223.00 $81.00 $18,630.00 $90.00 $20,700.00
13 517-0002 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type B $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00
14 517-0008 21.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $5,700.00 $119,700.00 $2,500.00 $52,500.00 $3,000.00 $63,000.00
15 517-0013 10,000.00 USD  Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00
16 522-0001 2.00 Each Test Pits $737.40 $1,474.80 $100.00 $200.00 $1,100.00 $2,200.00
17 531-0001 75,000.00 USD  Force Account for Snow Removal (No-Bid) $1.00 $75,000.00 $1.00 $75,000.00 $1.00 $75,000.00
18 601-0003 15,100.00 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $13.15 $198,565.00 $6.20 $93,620.00 $7.00 $105,700.00
19 601-0009 700.00 L.F. 3in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40) $47.82 $33,474.00 $29.00 $20,300.00 $45.00 $31,500.00
20 601-0021 200.00 L.F. #10 A.W.G. Ground Wire $1.98 $396.00 $2.60 $520.00 $3.00 $600.00
21 601-0030 1,400.00 L.F. 4in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-Schedule 40 $92.23 $129,122.00 $28.00 $39,200.00 $50.00 $70,000.00
22 601-0050 1,200.00 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Ground Wire $3.98 $4,776.00 $5.50 $6,600.00 $7.00 $8,400.00
23 601-0058 25.00 L.F. 4in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-Schedule 80 $403.62 $10,090.50 $24.00 $600.00 $75.00 $1,875.00
24 601-0084 1.00 Each Foundation, Type MC $13,566.90 $13,566.90 $6,400.00 $6,400.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
25 601-0087 1.00 Each Foundation, Type LC $19,387.91 $19,387.91 $7,700.00 $7,700.00 $13,500.00 $13,500.00
26 601-N0002 2,000.00 L.F. #10 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $4.46 $8,920.00 $2.80 $5,600.00 $3.00 $6,000.00
27 601-N0029 900.00 L.F. 500 MCM Power Cable $26.73 $24,057.00 $28.40 $25,560.00 $30.00 $27,000.00
28 601-N0055 1.00 Each Roadway Lighting Manhole $22,766.93 $22,766.93 $19,100.00 $19,100.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
29 601-NO104 1.00 L.S. Electrical Studies $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00
30 602-0005 1.00 Each Meter Cabinet, Type F, Voltage 277/480V $29,105.03 $29,105.03 $37,000.00 $37,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00
31 602-0091 1.00 Each Load Center Cabinet, Type F Modified, Voltage 277/480V $94,161.07 $94,161.07 $47,000.00 $47,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00
32 602-N0019 1.00 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 1 $125.00 $125.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00
33 602-N0055 1.00 Each  MANUAL TRANSFER SWITCH, 400A (480Y/277V, 3-PHASE, 4-WIRE) $45,776.25 $45,776.25 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
34 603-0058 1.00 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 1 $3,225,006.43 $3,225,006.43 $3,709,000.00 $3,709,000.00 $3,450,780.00 $3,450,780.00
35 603-N0016 1.00 L.S. Temporary Lighting Systems, Location No. 1 $512,412.78 $512,412.78 $349,000.00 $349,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00
36 703-0001 200.00 S.Y. Topsoil $20.00 $4,000.00 $5.00 $1,000.00 $35.00 $7,000.00
37 704-0001 200.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $7.50 $1,500.00 $2.00 $400.00 $10.00 $2,000.00
38 706-0002 140.00 S.Y. Temporary Soil Stabilization Matting $7.50 $1,050.00 $1.00 $140.00 $25.00 $3,500.00
39 801-0001 1.00 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $30,934.46 $30,934.46 $41,000.00 $41,000.00 $25,450.00 $25,450.00
40 801-N0001 164.00 Each Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing $11,040.91  $1,810,709.24 $11,500.00 $1,886,000.00 $15,500.00 $2,542,000.00
41 602-N0103 200,000.00 USD  Smart Panel with Integration and Commissioning (No-Bid) $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00

$8,888,375.00
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