
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. A500.788 Letting Date: 3/14/2025

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $11,338.00 $11,338.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $185,000.00 $185,000.00 $330,000.00 $330,000.00 $550,000.00 $550,000.00

3 106-N0001 50,000.00 USD Permit Fees (NO-BID) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

4 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $1.00 $1.00 $32,750.00 $32,750.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00

5 108-N0002 250,000.00 USD Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid) $1.00 $250,000.00 $1.00 $250,000.00 $1.00 $250,000.00 $1.00 $250,000.00

6 109-N0002 1.00 L.S. EGIS Survey $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $14,280.00 $14,280.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00

7 202-0009 15,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00

8 213-0004 1.00 L.S. Asbestos Survey $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

9 213-N0005 50,000.00 USD Disposal of Regulated Material, Hazardous, Asbestos (NO-BID) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

10 517-0001 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type A $39,132.00 $39,132.00 $18,500.00 $18,500.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00

11 517-0007 20.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type A $3,000.00 $60,000.00 $2,270.00 $45,400.00 $910.00 $18,200.00 $2,500.00 $50,000.00

12 517-0013 5,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00

13 601-0001 1.00 L.S. Remove and Salvage Existing Facilities $91,939.00 $91,939.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $145,000.00 $145,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00

14 601-N0104 1.00 L.S. Electrical Studies $73,080.00 $73,080.00 $86,600.00 $86,600.00 $19,750.00 $19,750.00 $70,100.00 $70,100.00

15 602-N0019 1.00 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 1 $173,548.00 $173,548.00 $173,280.00 $173,280.00 $286,000.00 $286,000.00 $89,100.00 $89,100.00

16 602-N0020 1.00 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 2 $129,035.00 $129,035.00 $88,507.00 $88,507.00 $192,000.00 $192,000.00 $45,100.00 $45,100.00

17 602-N0030 1.00 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 3 $136,229.00 $136,229.00 $40,157.00 $40,157.00 $127,000.00 $127,000.00 $49,800.00 $49,800.00

18 602-N0031 1.00 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 4 $180,219.00 $180,219.00 $172,558.00 $172,558.00 $271,000.00 $271,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00

19 602-N0035 1.00 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 5 $120,071.00 $120,071.00 $40,157.00 $40,157.00 $104,670.00 $104,670.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

20 602-N0084 1.00 L.S. Electrical Work At Location No. 6 $290,665.00 $290,665.00 $258,026.00 $258,026.00 $405,000.00 $405,000.00 $708,000.00 $708,000.00

21 602-N0079 1.00 L.S. Generator at Location No. 1 $528,675.00 $528,675.00 $626,505.00 $626,505.00 $551,000.00 $551,000.00 $702,000.00 $702,000.00

22 602-N0080 1.00 L.S. Generator at Location No. 2 $413,963.00 $413,963.00 $535,305.00 $535,305.00 $443,000.00 $443,000.00 $565,000.00 $565,000.00

23 602-N0081 1.00 L.S. Generator at Location No. 3 $413,963.00 $413,963.00 $533,985.00 $533,985.00 $436,000.00 $436,000.00 $532,000.00 $532,000.00

24 602-N0099 1.00 L.S. Generator at Location No. 4 $518,700.00 $518,700.00 $613,185.00 $613,185.00 $544,000.00 $544,000.00 $648,500.00 $648,500.00

25 602-N0100 1.00 L.S. Generator at Location No. 5 $479,948.00 $479,948.00 $615,225.00 $615,225.00 $501,150.00 $501,150.00 $614,100.00 $614,100.00

26 602-N0101 1.00 L.S. Generator at Location No. 6 $125,538.00 $125,538.00 $193,471.00 $193,471.00 $132,000.00 $132,000.00 $195,000.00 $195,000.00

27 604-N0008 200,000.00 USD Generator BMS Integration (NO-BID) $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00

28 801-0001 1.00 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $47,000.00 $47,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00

29 601-N0122 125,000.00 USD Utility Relocation, Electric (Bassett Building) (No-Bid) $1.00 $125,000.00 $1.00 $125,000.00 $1.00 $125,000.00 $1.00 $125,000.00

$4,625,205.00 $5,066,700.00 $5,322,000.00 $5,811,200.00

BaseLine Item Detail PKF-Mark III, Inc. Bryan Electric Inc.Travis Inc. HBC Company Inc

Page 1 of 1

https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d
https://capex.njta.com/strategicsourcing/secured/CTSourcingController?action=BidAnalysisAction&mids=%5b3337,3354%5d

