New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaseLine Item Detail

Contract No. P200.838

Earle Asphalt Company

C.J. Hesse, Inc.

Schifano Construction Corp.

Black Rock Enterprises

Letting Date: 1/7/2025

Green Construction, Inc.

Item No. Unit Code

1 104-0001
2 104-0002
3 108-0001
4 108-N0002
5 201-0002
6 202-0002
7 202-0009
8 208-0008
9 208-0022
10 208-N0001
11 211-0001
12 213-0002
13 301-0002
14 302-0063
15 302-0071
16 302-N0003
17 302-N0007
18 305-0003
19 503-0021
20 503-0026
21 503-0293
22 503-0297
23 503-N0038
24 506-0001
25 509-0001
26 509-0002
27 514-0001
28 514-N0001
29 516-0009
30 516-0011
31 516-0013
32 517-0002
33 517-0008
34 517-0013
35 522-0001
36 599-N0255
37 703-0001
38 704-0003
39 801-0001
40 801-0009
41 801-N0004
42 601-0008
43 601-0010
44 601-0015
45 601-0018
46 601-N0O001
47 602-N0004
48 603-0041
49 603-0121

Qty uoMm

1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
3,200.00 USD
100,000.00 USD
1.00 L.S.
410.00 C.Y.
5,000.00 USD
1,070.00 L.F.
55.00 Each
1.00 Each
500.00 L.F.
115.00 Ton
760.00 S.Y.
6,500.00 USD
110,000.00 L.F.
13,770.00 Ton
11,700.00 GAL
92,400.00 S.Y.
6.00 Each
10.00 Each
17.00 Each
5.00 Each
42.00 Each
180.00 L.F.
100.00 S.F.
250.00 L.F.
130.00 S.Y.
17.00 S.Y.
60,000.00 L.F.
8,000.00 L.F.
1,700.00 S.F.
1.00 L.S.
13.00 Mnth
10,000.00 USD
5.00 Each
20.00 Each
70.00 S.Y.
70.00 S.V.
1.00 L.S.
2.00 Each
1.00 L.S.
251.00 L.F.
291.00 L.F.
2.00 Each
1.00 Each
1,162.00 L.F.
1.00 L.S.
2.00 Each
1.00 Each

Description

Construction Layout

Mobilization

Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid)
Clearing and Grubbing

Roadway Excavation, Earth

Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid)
Heavy Duty Silt Fence

Inlet Filter, Type 2

Concrete Washout Facility

Temporary Orange Plastic Fence

Disposal of Regulated Material

Aggregate Base Course, 6in Thick

Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

Polymerized Joint Adhesive

Warm Mix Asphalt 12.5L76 Surface Course
Trackless Tack Coat

Pavement Removal, 2 1/2in Depth

New Inlet Frame & Grate, Type G3

New Inlet Frame & Grate, Type G2

Reset Frames

Reconstructed Inlet, Type G2, Using New Grate and Frame
New Inlet Grate, Using Existing Frame

Concrete Curb, Type A

Sign Panels

U-channel Post

Concrete Sidewalk, 4in Thick

Detectable Warning Surface

Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic

Traffic Markings, Lines, Long-Life, Thermoplastic
Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long-Life, Thermoplastic
Furnish Field Office, Type B

Maintain Field Office, Type B

Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid)

Test Pits

Rubber Wheel Stop

Topsoil

Seeding, Type C

Furnishing Traffic Control Devices

Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign
Maintenance and Protection of Traffic

2in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 80)
#8 A.W.G. Ground Wire

Junction Box, Type C

Concrete Base, Type M

#4 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable

Power Distribution Cabinet Modification

Type LP8 Luminaire

Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-25-NS4

Unit Price Line Total
$5,000.00 $5,000.00
$140,079.08 $140,079.08
$1.00 $3,200.00
$1.00 $100,000.00
$75,000.00 $75,000.00
$0.01 $4.10
$1.00 $5,000.00
$0.01 $10.70
$0.01 $0.55
$1,000.00 $1,000.00
$0.01 $5.00
$0.01 $1.15
$5.25 $3,990.00
$1.00 $6,500.00
$0.01 $1,100.00
$106.50  $1,466,505.00
$0.01 $117.00
$3.13 $289,212.00
$1,200.00 $7,200.00
$1,200.00 $12,000.00
$50.00 $850.00
$50.00 $250.00
$50.00 $2,100.00
$50.00 $9,000.00
$20.00 $2,000.00
$15.00 $3,750.00
$135.00 $17,550.00
$150.00 $2,550.00
$0.75 $45,000.00
$0.75 $6,000.00
$13.50 $22,950.00
$5,000.00 $5,000.00
$2,500.00 $32,500.00
$1.00 $10,000.00
$0.01 $0.05
$130.00 $2,600.00
$20.00 $1,400.00
$0.25 $17.50
$2,500.00 $2,500.00
$1,500.00 $3,000.00
$35,000.00 $35,000.00
$50.00 $12,550.00
$3.00 $873.00
$2,500.00 $5,000.00
$3,000.00 $3,000.00
$4.00 $4,648.00
$1,500.00 $1,500.00
$3,500.00 $7,000.00
$6,000.00 $6,000.00

$2,360,513.13
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Unit Price

$10,000.00
$39,541.07
$1.00
$1.00
$25,000.00
$60.00
$1.00
$6.70
$170.00
$1,200.00
$3.65
$75.00
$18.00
$1.00
$0.55
$102.00
$4.40
$3.55
$2,400.00
$2,400.00
$760.00
$3,600.00
$470.00
$78.50
$21.00
$21.00
$90.00
$315.00
$0.90
$0.90
$20.50
$17,000.00
$2,000.00
$1.00
$350.00
$135.00
$25.00
$3.50
$6,100.00
$4,000.00
$55,000.00
$52.50
$3.15
$2,625.00
$3,150.00
$4.20
$1,575.00
$3,675.00
$6,300.00

Line Total

$10,000.00
$39,541.07
$3,200.00
$100,000.00
$25,000.00
$24,600.00
$5,000.00
$7,169.00
$9,350.00
$1,200.00
$1,825.00
$8,625.00
$13,680.00
$6,500.00
$60,500.00
$1,404,540.00
$51,480.00
$328,020.00
$14,400.00
$24,000.00
$12,920.00
$18,000.00
$19,740.00
$14,130.00
$2,100.00
$5,250.00
$11,700.00
$5,355.00
$54,000.00
$7,200.00
$34,850.00
$17,000.00
$26,000.00
$10,000.00
$1,750.00
$2,700.00
$1,750.00
$245.00
$6,100.00
$8,000.00
$55,000.00
$13,177.50
$916.65
$5,250.00
$3,150.00
$4,880.40
$1,575.00
$7,350.00
$6,300.00
$2,495,019.62

Unit Price

$22,000.00
$75,000.00
$1.00
$1.00
$15,000.00
$110.00
$1.00
$7.50
$100.00
$1,200.00
$3.00
$100.00
$90.00
$1.00
$0.01
$106.58
$0.01
$3.00
$2,560.00
$2,450.00
$750.00
$2,850.00
$540.00
$65.90
$26.25
$21.00
$147.00
$305.00
$0.90
$0.90
$16.65
$35,000.00
$4,500.00
$1.00
$500.00
$325.00
$10.00
$3.00
$15,000.00
$3,500.00
$7,500.00
$42.00
$4.20
$3,150.00
$4,200.00
$5.25
$3,150.00
$2,442.00
$7,640.00

Line Total

$22,000.00
$75,000.00
$3,200.00
$100,000.00
$15,000.00
$45,100.00
$5,000.00
$8,025.00
$5,500.00
$1,200.00
$1,500.00
$11,500.00
$68,400.00
$6,500.00
$1,100.00
$1,467,606.60
$117.00
$277,200.00
$15,360.00
$24,500.00
$12,750.00
$14,250.00
$22,680.00
$11,862.00
$2,625.00
$5,250.00
$19,110.00
$5,185.00
$54,000.00
$7,200.00
$28,305.00
$35,000.00
$58,500.00
$10,000.00
$2,500.00
$6,500.00
$700.00
$210.00
$15,000.00
$7,000.00
$7,500.00
$10,542.00
$1,222.20
$6,300.00
$4,200.00
$6,100.50
$3,150.00
$4,884.00
$7,640.00
$2,523,974.30

Unit Price

$30,000.00
$65,000.00
$1.00
$1.00
$65,000.00
$50.00
$1.00
$5.00
$100.00
$7,500.00
$2.00
$125.00
$20.00
$1.00
$0.50
$118.75
$0.01
$3.85
$2,700.00
$2,200.00
$390.00
$3,000.00
$400.00
$65.00
$17.05
$20.35
$150.00
$1,000.00
$1.16
$0.88
$22.00
$40,000.00
$2,500.00
$1.00
$500.00
$148.50
$25.00
$25.00
$58,000.00
$5,000.00
$30,000.00
$44.00
$4.40
$4,125.00
$4,400.00
$5.50
$3,300.00
$2,557.50
$6,314.00

Line Total
30,000.00
65,000.00

3,200.00
100,000.00
65,000.00
20,500.00
5,000.00
5,350.00
5,500.00
7,500.00
1,000.00
14,375.00
15,200.00
6,500.00
55,000.00
1,635,187.50
117.00
355,740.00
16,200.00
22,000.00
6,630.00
15,000.00
16,800.00
11,700.00
1,705.00
5,087.50
19,500.00
17,000.00
69,600.00
7,040.00
37,400.00
40,000.00
32,500.00
10,000.00
2,500.00
2,970.00
1,750.00
1,750.00
58,000.00
10,000.00
30,000.00
11,044.00
1,280.40
8,250.00
4,400.00
6,391.00
3,300.00
5,115.00
6,314.00
2,871,396.40

Unit Price
$23,327.30
$106,889.93
$1.00
$1.00
$43,066.23
$58.26
$1.00
$8.94
$223.45
$1,396.59
$11.17
$0.01
$25.40
$1.00
$0.39
$116.50
$4.75
$3.78
$1,783.26
$1,783.26
$1,280.51
$2,395.96
$655.00
$129.08
$17.32
$20.67
$145.50
$279.32
$0.95
$0.95
$17.71
$27,931.78
$3,910.45
$1.00
$639.34
$150.83
$16.76
$16.76
$27,931.78
$19,552.25
$85,000.00
$44.69
$4.47
$3,351.82
$4,469.08
$5.59
$5,027.72
$2,597.66
$6,413.14

Line Total
$23,327.30
$106,889.93
$3,200.00
$100,000.00
$43,066.23
$23,886.60
$5,000.00
$9,565.80
$12,289.75
$1,396.59
$5,585.00
$1.15
$19,304.00
$6,500.00
$42,900.00
$1,604,205.00
$55,575.00
$349,272.00
$10,699.56
$17,832.60
$21,768.67
$11,979.80
$27,510.00
$23,234.40
$1,732.00
$5,167.50
$18,915.00
$4,748.44
$57,000.00
$7,600.00
$30,107.00
$27,931.78
$50,835.85
$10,000.00
$3,196.70
$3,016.60
$1,173.20
$1,173.20
$27,931.78
$39,104.50
$85,000.00
$11,217.19
$1,300.77
$6,703.64
$4,469.08
$6,495.58
$5,027.72
$5,195.32
$6,413.14
$2,946,445.37
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaseLine Item Detail

Contract No. P200.838

New Prince Concrete Construction Co., Inc.

Crisdel Group, Inc.

Item No. Unit Code

1 104-0001
2 104-0002
3 108-0001
4 108-N0002
5 201-0002
6 202-0002
7 202-0009
8 208-0008
9 208-0022
10 208-N0001
11 211-0001
12 213-0002
13 301-0002
14 302-0063
15 302-0071
16 302-N0003
17 302-N0007
18 305-0003
19 503-0021
20 503-0026
21 503-0293
22 503-0297
23 503-N0038
24 506-0001
25 509-0001
26 509-0002
27 514-0001
28 514-N0001
29 516-0009
30 516-0011
31 516-0013
32 517-0002
33 517-0008
34 517-0013
35 522-0001
36 599-N0255
37 703-0001
38 704-0003
39 801-0001
40 801-0009
41 801-N0004
42 601-0008
43 601-0010
44 601-0015
45 601-0018
46 601-N0O001
47 602-N0004
48 603-0041
49 603-0121

Qty uoMm

1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
3,200.00 USD
100,000.00 USD
1.00 L.S.
410.00 C.Y.
5,000.00 USD
1,070.00 L.F.
55.00 Each
1.00 Each
500.00 L.F.
115.00 Ton
760.00 S.Y.
6,500.00 USD
110,000.00 L.F.
13,770.00 Ton
11,700.00 GAL
92,400.00 S.Y.
6.00 Each
10.00 Each
17.00 Each
5.00 Each
42.00 Each
180.00 L.F.
100.00 S.F.
250.00 L.F.
130.00 S.Y.
17.00 S.Y.
60,000.00 L.F.
8,000.00 L.F.
1,700.00 S.F.
1.00 L.S.
13.00 Mnth
10,000.00 USD
5.00 Each
20.00 Each
70.00 S.Y.
70.00 S.V.
1.00 L.S.
2.00 Each
1.00 L.S.
251.00 L.F.
291.00 L.F.
2.00 Each
1.00 Each
1,162.00 L.F.
1.00 L.S.
2.00 Each
1.00 Each

Description

Construction Layout

Mobilization

Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid)
Clearing and Grubbing

Roadway Excavation, Earth

Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid)
Heavy Duty Silt Fence

Inlet Filter, Type 2

Concrete Washout Facility

Temporary Orange Plastic Fence

Disposal of Regulated Material

Aggregate Base Course, 6in Thick

Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

Polymerized Joint Adhesive

Warm Mix Asphalt 12.5L76 Surface Course
Trackless Tack Coat

Pavement Removal, 2 1/2in Depth

New Inlet Frame & Grate, Type G3

New Inlet Frame & Grate, Type G2

Reset Frames

Reconstructed Inlet, Type G2, Using New Grate and Frame
New Inlet Grate, Using Existing Frame

Concrete Curb, Type A

Sign Panels

U-channel Post

Concrete Sidewalk, 4in Thick

Detectable Warning Surface

Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic

Traffic Markings, Lines, Long-Life, Thermoplastic
Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long-Life, Thermoplastic
Furnish Field Office, Type B

Maintain Field Office, Type B

Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid)

Test Pits

Rubber Wheel Stop

Topsoil

Seeding, Type C

Furnishing Traffic Control Devices

Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign
Maintenance and Protection of Traffic

2in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 80)
#8 A.W.G. Ground Wire

Junction Box, Type C

Concrete Base, Type M

#4 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable

Power Distribution Cabinet Modification

Type LP8 Luminaire

Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-25-NS4

Unit Price
$30,000.00
$250,000.00
$1.00
$1.00
$40,000.00
$50.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1,000.00
$5.00
$110.00
$15.00
$1.00
$0.60
$118.00
$7.00
$4.50
$2,000.00
$2,000.00
$300.00
$3,000.00
$450.00
$125.00
$20.00
$20.00
$180.00
$350.00
$1.00
$1.00
$23.00
$25,000.00
$2,500.00
$1.00
$500.00
$150.00
$10.00
$1.00
$20,000.00
$10,000.00
$20,000.00
$60.00
$4.00
$3,000.00
$3,500.00
$5.00
$2,000.00
$4,000.00
$7,000.00

Line Total
$30,000.00
$250,000.00
$3,200.00
$100,000.00
$40,000.00
$20,500.00
$5,000.00
$1,070.00
$55.00
$1,000.00
$2,500.00
$12,650.00
$11,400.00
$6,500.00
$66,000.00
$1,624,860.00
$81,900.00
$415,800.00
$12,000.00
$20,000.00
$5,100.00
$15,000.00
$18,900.00
$22,500.00
$2,000.00
$5,000.00
$23,400.00
$5,950.00
$60,000.00
$8,000.00
$39,100.00
$25,000.00
$32,500.00
$10,000.00
$2,500.00
$3,000.00
$700.00
$70.00
$20,000.00
$20,000.00
$20,000.00
$15,060.00
$1,164.00
$6,000.00
$3,500.00
$5,810.00
$2,000.00
$8,000.00
$7,000.00
$3,091,689.00

Page 2 of 2

Unit Price
$43,000.00
$187,100.00
$1.00
$1.00
$50,000.00
$195.00
$1.00
$11.80
$215.60
$2,900.00
$11.85
$16.11
$22.05
$1.00
$0.55
$125.95
$5.40
$5.75
$2,091.00
$1,225.00
$1,245.00
$2,670.00
$336.50
$60.00
$16.65
$19.90
$214.00
$279.50
$1.10
$0.85
$21.50
$13,700.00
$2,250.00
$1.00
$965.25
$145.10
$32.65
$28.70
$9,840.00
$3,025.00
$16,240.00
$43.00
$4.30
$3,225.00
$4,300.00
$5.35
$3,225.00
$2,500.00
$6,170.00

Line Total
$43,000.00
$187,100.00
$3,200.00
$100,000.00
$50,000.00
$79,950.00
$5,000.00
$12,626.00
$11,858.00
$2,900.00
$5,925.00
$1,852.65
$16,758.00
$6,500.00
$60,500.00
$1,734,331.50
$63,180.00
$531,300.00
$12,546.00
$12,250.00
$21,165.00
$13,350.00
$14,133.00
$10,800.00
$1,665.00
$4,975.00
$27,820.00
$4,751.50
$66,000.00
$6,800.00
$36,550.00
$13,700.00
$29,250.00
$10,000.00
$4,826.25
$2,902.00
$2,285.50
$2,009.00
$9,840.00
$6,050.00
$16,240.00
$10,793.00
$1,251.30
$6,450.00
$4,300.00
$6,216.70
$3,225.00
$5,000.00
$6,170.00
$3,289,295.40

Letting Date: 1/7/2025
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