New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P200.683 Letting Date: 11/7/2024

BaseLine Item Detail Stavola Contracting Company, LLC Crisdel Group, Inc. D'Annunzio & Sons, Inc. C.J. Hesse, Inc.
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Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $694,791.30 $694,791.30 $1,099,481.00 $1,099,481.00 $1,210,000.00 $1,210,000.00 $2,699,616.62 $2,699,616.62
2 108-0001 310,000.00 USD  Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $310,000.00 $1.00 $310,000.00 $1.00 $310,000.00 $1.00 $310,000.00
3 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $14,400.00 $14,400.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
4 302-0063 550,000.00 USD  Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $550,000.00 $1.00 $550,000.00 $1.00 $550,000.00 $1.00 $550,000.00
5 302-0071 327,000.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $0.30 $98,100.00 $0.57 $186,390.00 $0.45 $147,150.00 $1.25 $408,750.00
6 302-0072 100.00 Each Bituminous Core Samples $90.00 $9,000.00 $85.00 $8,500.00 $110.00 $11,000.00 $400.00 $40,000.00
7 302-N0003 106,000.00 Ton  Warm Mix Asphalt 12.5L76 Surface Course $103.42 $10,962,520.00 $96.83 $10,263,980.00 $105.00 $11,130,000.00 $132.00 $13,992,000.00
8 302-N0007 72,000.00 GAL  Trackless Tack Coat $3.00 $216,000.00 $3.51 $252,720.00 $4.00 $288,000.00 $5.00 $360,000.00
9 302-N0013 1,000,000.00 USD  Unanticipated Roadway Resurfacing (No Bid) $1.00 $1,000,000.00 $1.00 $1,000,000.00 $1.00 $1,000,000.00 $1.00 $1,000,000.00
10 305-0005 27,000.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Fine, 2 Inch Depth $3.19 $86,130.00 $4.88 $131,760.00 $4.00 $108,000.00 $4.25 $114,750.00
11 305-0015 721,000.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Fine, 2 1/2in Depth $3.21 $2,314,410.00 $5.47 $3,943,870.00 $6.00 $4,326,000.00 $8.00 $5,768,000.00
12 306-0001 140,000.00 L.F. Milled Rumble Strip $0.26 $36,400.00 $0.41 $57,400.00 $0.35 $49,000.00 $1.50 $210,000.00
13 309-N0001 2,700.00 Ton  Asphalt Rubber Open-Graded Friction Course $146.19 $394,713.00 $189.34 $511,218.00 $210.00 $567,000.00 $230.00 $621,000.00
14 503-0002 5.00 Each Reset Frame, Various Types with Extensions $250.00 $1,250.00 $600.00 $3,000.00 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $100.00 $500.00
15 503-0009 10.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D1, Using Existing Grate and Frame $700.00 $7,000.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $2,500.00 $25,000.00 $100.00 $1,000.00
16 503-0293 5.00 Each Reset Frames $550.00 $2,750.00 $850.00 $4,250.00 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $100.00 $500.00
17 505-0001 5,000.00 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $9.72 $48,600.00 $0.01 $50.00 $3.50 $17,500.00 $25.00 $125,000.00
18 516-0002 418,000.00 L.F. Diamond Grinding $2.15 $898,700.00 $1.15 $480,700.00 $1.65 $689,700.00 $3.00 $1,254,000.00
19 516-0008 20,000.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Epoxy Resin $1.50 $30,000.00 $0.85 $17,000.00 $1.10 $22,000.00 $1.90 $38,000.00
20 516-0009 376,000.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $2.05 $770,800.00 $1.05 $394,800.00 $1.55 $582,800.00 $2.40 $902,400.00
21 516-0011 76,000.00 L.F. Traffic Markings, Lines, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $1.65 $125,400.00 $1.05 $79,800.00 $1.20 $91,200.00 $2.00 $152,000.00
22 516-0013 2,000.00 S.F.  Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $8.50 $17,000.00 $7.15 $14,300.00 $8.00 $16,000.00 $10.25 $20,500.00
23 516-N0020 137,000.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long Life, Permanent Tape $6.65 $911,050.00 $5.50 $753,500.00 $6.35 $869,950.00 $8.00 $1,096,000.00
24 517-0002 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type B $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00
25 517-0008 18.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $4,000.00 $72,000.00 $2,200.00 $39,600.00 $3,600.00 $64,800.00 $6,000.00 $108,000.00
26 517-0013 15,000.00 USD  Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00
27 709-N0002 37,000.00 S.Y. Berm Repair Strip $3.66 $135,420.00 $0.01 $370.00 $6.50 $240,500.00 $5.00 $185,000.00
28 801-0001 1.00 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $1,542,965.39 $1,542,965.39 $1,271,700.00 $1,271,700.00 $1,025,100.00 $1,025,100.00 $1,800,000.00 $1,800,000.00
29 801-0007 1,000.00 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol, Part-Time $1.00 $1,000.00 $0.01 $10.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $160.00 $160,000.00
30 801-0008 300.00 M.H. Flaggers $1.00 $300.00 $0.01 $3.00 $1.00 $300.00 $0.01 $3.00
31 801-0009 10.00 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $7,488.00 $74,880.00 $4,000.00 $40,000.00 $52,000.00 $520,000.00
$21,295,699.69 $21,513,282.00 $23,457,000.00 $32,493,019.62
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