New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T200.728 Letting Date: 11/14/2024

BaseLine Item Detail Creamer Ruberton, A Joint Venture

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1 LS. Construction Layout $175,000.00 $175,000.00

2 104-0002 1 LS. Mobilization $1,842,733.00  $1,842,733.00

3 107-0001 1 LS. Progress Schedule $5,000.00 $5,000.00

4 108-0001 3,000.00 USD  Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $3,000.00

5 108-N0002 200,000.00 USD  Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid) $1.00 $200,000.00

6 108-N0004 50,000.00 USD  Steel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00

7 201-0002 1 LS. Clearing and Grubbing $200,000.00 $200,000.00

8 202-0002 6,098.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $225.00 $1,372,050.00

9 202-0007 63 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $100.00 $6,300.00
10 202-0009 50,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00
11 203-0001 30 C.Y. Embankment, Common $58.00 $1,740.00
12 203-0002 1,379.00 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $95.00 $131,005.00
13 207-0004 10 Ton  RipRap Stone Aprons, 12in Thick(D50=6in) $375.00 $3,750.00
14 208-0008 159,744.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence $4.00 $638,976.00
15 208-0021 6,512.00 S.F. Inlet Filter, Type 1 $23.00 $149,776.00
16 208-0024 40 Ton  Construction Driveway $250.00 $10,000.00
17 208-N0001 4 Each Concrete Washout Facility $2,500.00 $10,000.00
18 213-0002 3,049.00 Ton  Disposal of Regulated Material $80.00 $243,920.00
19 213-0003 1,016.00 Ton  Disposal of Regulated Material, Hazardous $360.00 $365,760.00
20 301-0001 2,415.00 S.Y.  Aggregate Base Course, 6.5in Thick $40.00 $96,600.00
21 301-N0002 170 S.Y.  Aggregate Base Course, 8 in Thick $80.00 $13,600.00
22 302-0001 450 Ton  Hot Mix Asphalt 19M 76 Intermediate Course $350.00 $157,500.00
23 302-0002 4,139.00 Ton  Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course $350.00  $1,448,650.00
24 302-0004 1,143.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course $250.00 $285,750.00
25 302-0063 7,100.00 USD  Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $7,100.00
26 302-0071 24,428.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $2.00 $48,856.00
27 302-N0007 3,283.00 GAL  Trackless Tack Coat $10.00 $32,830.00
28 303-0001 46,219.00 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick $55.00 $2,542,045.00
29 305-0002 34,330.00 S.Y.  Surface Milling, 2in Average Depth $25.00 $858,250.00
30 305-0008 2,415.00 S.Y.  Pavement Removal, Variable Depth $175.00 $422,625.00
31 306-0001 4,510.00 L.F.  Milled Rumble Strip $20.00 $90,200.00
32 401-0004 30,000.00 LB Reinforcement Steel, Galvanized $4.00 $120,000.00
33 401-0067 164,000.00 LB Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated $3.00 $492,000.00
34 401-0070 672 S.F. Concrete Penetrating Sealer Treatment $10.00 $6,720.00
35 401-N0017 86 C.Y.  Concrete in Moment Slab $1,500.00 $129,000.00
36 406-0002 52 C.Y. Concrete Foundations for Ground Mounted Signs $4,000.00 $208,000.00
37 412-N0003 3 Each Weld Existing Inlet Grate $800.00 $2,400.00
38 415-0002 1,300.00 S.F.  Temporary Sheeting to Remain in Place $260.00 $338,000.00
39 417-0084 15 L.F.  Parapet Reconstruction Location No. 1 $2,500.00 $37,500.00
40 429-0007 64 L.F. 30in Diameter Drilled Shaft $1,500.00 $96,000.00
41 503-0048 94 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type G3, Using New Grate and Frame $3,500.00 $329,000.00
42 503-N0048 6 Each Reconstruct Inlet at Median Barrier $4,000.00 $24,000.00
43 504-0011 8 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $1,000.00 $8,000.00
44 505-0001 42,286.00 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $15.00 $634,290.00
45 505-0002 15 Each Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb Inlet $2,100.00 $31,500.00
46 506-0001 1,268.00 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $100.00 $126,800.00
47 506-0012 1,853.00 L.F.  Drop Curb $120.00 $222,360.00
48 506-N0009 3,771.00 L.F. Sawcut Existing Concrete Curb, 2 Inch $75.00 $282,825.00
49 506-N0010 37,459.00 L.F. Sawecut Existing Concrete Curb, 4 Inch $75.00 $2,809,425.00
50 508-0001 4,472.00 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Roadway. $425.00 $1,900,600.00
51 508-0003 371 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Protection $400.00 $148,400.00
52 508-0007 441 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier Removal, Roadway $175.00 $77,175.00
53 508-N0016 339 L.F. Modified Concrete Median Barrier, Protection $675.00 $228,825.00
54 508-N0017 144 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Half Shape $950.00 $136,800.00
55 508-N0023 69 L.F. Modified Concrete Median Barrier, Roadway $850.00 $58,650.00
56 509-0002 266 L.F. U-channel Post $50.00 $13,300.00
57 509-N0004 1,862.00 L.F.  Timber Post, 6x6 $35.00 $65,170.00
58 509-N0008 35 Each Relocate Sign Panels (Ground Mounted) $900.00 $31,500.00
59 510-0001 136,020.00 L.F.  Beam Guide Rail $35.00  $4,760,700.00
60 510-0002 5,487.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail, Dual-Faced $40.00 $219,480.00
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61 510-0005 625 L.F. Beam Guide Rail Element $10.00 $6,250.00
62 510-0010 100 Each Beam Guide Rail Blockout $10.00 $1,000.00
63 510-0011 85 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $1,500.00 $127,500.00
64 510-0014 34 Each Parapet Connection, Type A $4,700.00 $159,800.00
65 510-0015 30 Each Parapet Connection, Type B $750.00 $22,500.00
66 510-0018 46 Each Tangent Guide Rail Terminal $3,900.00 $179,400.00
67 510-0019 100 Each Beam Guide Rail Post $125.00 $12,500.00
68 510-0031 146,246.00 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide Rail $5.00 $731,230.00
69 510-N0076 32 Each Beam Guide Rail Post, 9 FT Long $125.00 $4,000.00
70 510-N0O139 2,613.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail, Quarter Post Spacing $55.00 $143,715.00
71 514-0031 27 S.Y. Concrete Island, 4in Thick $100.00 $2,700.00
72 515-0002 8 Each Delineator, Type CA-Y $125.00 $1,000.00
73 515-0004 38 Each Delineator, Type CA-W $125.00 $4,750.00
74 515-0005 115 Each Delineator, Type GA-Y $125.00 $14,375.00
75 515-0007 613 Each Delineator, Type GA-W $125.00 $76,625.00
76 516-0005 172,034.00 L.F.  Striping and Marking Removal, Hydromilling $1.00 $172,034.00
77 516-0007 92,652.00 L.F. Temporary Pavement Striping $0.50 $46,326.00
78 516-0008 300 L.F.  Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Epoxy Resin $1.50 $450.00
79 516-0009 69,552.00 L.F.  Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $2.00 $139,104.00
80 516-0011 2,195.00 L.F.  Traffic Markings, Lines, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $2.00 $4,390.00
81 516-0013 100 S.F.  Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $25.00 $2,500.00
82 517-0003 1LS. Furnish Field Office, Type C $50,000.00 $50,000.00
83 517-0009 24 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $5,000.00 $120,000.00
84 517-0013 30,000.00 USD  Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $30,000.00
85 522-0001 15 Each Test Pits $800.00 $12,000.00
86 524-N0068 25 Each Impact Attenuator (Cartridge), TL-3, Narrow $65,000.00 $1,625,000.00
87 524-N0069 6 Each Impact Attenuator (Cartridge), TL-3, Wide $79,000.00 $474,000.00
88 525-0001 2 Each Mile Marker, Type MC $185.00 $370.00
89 525-0004 21 Each Mile Marker, Type RG $185.00 $3,885.00
90 525-0005 126 Each Mile Marker, Type RP $185.00 $23,310.00
91 530-0001 20 Each Raised Pavement Markers $185.00 $3,700.00
92 531-0001 50,000.00 USD  Force Account for Snow Removal (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00
93 532-0001 150,000.00 USD  Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid) $1.00 $150,000.00
94 599-N0103 870 L.F. Transite Duct Removal $50.00 $43,500.00
95 601-0001 1LS. Remove and Salvage Existing Facilities $498,000.00 $498,000.00
96 601-0005 18,109.00 L.F. 3in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40) $40.00 $724,360.00
97 601-0013 6,512.00 L.F.  #2/0 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $9.00 $58,608.00
98 601-0014 110 Each Junction Box Foundation, Type 1 $5,900.00 $649,000.00
99 601-0015 11 Each Junction Box, Type C $4,500.00 $49,500.00
100 601-0019 5,652.00 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Ground Wire $5.00 $28,260.00
101 601-0020 12,777.00 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Ground Wire $4.00 $51,108.00
102 601-0022 6 Each Junction Box, Type D $3,500.00 $21,000.00
103 601-0149 111 Each Concrete Base, Type LP $6,000.00 $666,000.00
104 601-0050 11,934.00 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Ground Wire $6.00 $71,604.00
105 601-0056 1,509.00 L.F.  #6 AW.G. Ground Wire $5.00 $7,545.00
106 601-0074 128,721.00 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Power Cable $6.00 $772,326.00
107 601-0135 1,694.00 L.F.  #2/0 A.W.G. Ground Wire $9.00 $15,246.00
108 601-N0O001 19,878.00 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $5.00 $99,390.00
109 601-N0004 10,623.00 L.F.  #6 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $4.00 $42,492.00
110 601-N0022 6,743.00 L.F. #1/0 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $8.00 $53,944.00
111 601-N0035 62,214.00 L.F.  #4/0 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $11.50 $715,461.00
112 601-N0O050 3,670.00 L.F.  3in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit on Structures, PVC-(Schedule 80) $50.00 $183,500.00
113 601-N0O111 2,585.00 L.F. Abandonment Of Transite Duct $12.00 $31,020.00
116 603-0025 217 Each Relocate Light Pole and Luminaire $3,500.00 $759,500.00
117 605-N0023 1 Each CCTV Camera Relocation $8,000.00 $8,000.00
118 703-0001 43,506.00 S.Y. Topsoil $15.00 $652,590.00
119 704-0001 43,506.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $3.00 $130,518.00
120 704-0004 35 8S.Y. Seeding, Type L $7.00 $245.00
121 706-0001 35 S.Y.  Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting $40.00 $1,400.00
122 801-0001 1L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $807,000.00 $807,000.00
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123 801-0002 9,040.00 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $65.00 $587,600.00
124 801-0003 31,060.00 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $35.00 $1,087,100.00
125 801-0004 6,560.00 L.F. Resetting Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $2.00 $13,120.00
126 801-0007 11,520.00 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol, Part-Time $20.00 $230,400.00
127 801-0008 4,800.00 M.H. Flaggers $10.00 $48,000.00
128 801-0009 13 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $5,000.00 $65,000.00
129 801-0011 46 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator $7,500.00 $345,000.00
130 801-0013 14 Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $5,000.00 $70,000.00
131 801-0014 576 M.H. Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use $125.00 $72,000.00
132 801-0015 7 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $1,500.00 $10,500.00
133 801-0017 92 Barr  Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators $350.00 $32,200.00
134 801-0023 15 Each Repair and Reset Temporary Impact Attenuator (Cartridge) $1,500.00 $22,500.00
135 801-0038 9 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator, Narrow $15,000.00 $135,000.00
136 801-0039 4 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator, Wide $15,000.00 $60,000.00
137 801-0040 7 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Cartridge), Narrow $25,000.00 $175,000.00
138 801-0041 2 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Cartridge), Wide $25,000.00 $50,000.00
139 801-N0001 603 Each Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing $3,100.00 $1,869,300.00
140 801-N0016 15 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Cartridge) $7,500.00 $112,500.00
141 803-0001 1L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 1 $75,000.00 $75,000.00
142 803-0002 1LS. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 2 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
143 803-0003 1L.sS. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 3 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
144 803-0004 1LS. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 4 $500.00 $500.00
145 804-N0001 50,000.00 USD Railroad Reimbursement Costs (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00

$41,747,687.00
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