New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P100.644 Letting Date: 7/12/2024
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BaseLine Item Detail Ferreira Construction Co. Inc. Midlantic Construction LLC Rencor, Inc. PKF-Mark I, Inc. Green Construction, Inc.
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 LS.  Construction Layout $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00
2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $67,000.00 $67,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $96,100.00 $96,100.00 $90,000.00 $90,000.00
3 107-0001 1.00 LS.  Progress Schedule $5,024.00 $5,024.00 $0.01 $0.01 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $8,758.99 $8,758.99
4 108-0001 100.00 USD  Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $100.00 $1.00 $100.00 $1.00 $100.00 $1.00 $100.00 $1.00 $100.00
5 108-N0002 50,000.00 USD  Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00
6 201-N0O001 1.00 L.S. Clearing Site $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00
7 202-0004 154.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation and Embankment $57.00 $8,778.00 $35.00 $5,390.00 $30.00 $4,620.00 $90.00 $13,860.00 $88.31 $13,599.74
8 207-0046 9.00 Ton Riprap Stone Slope Protection, 24in Thick (D50=6in) $580.00 $5,220.00 $100.00 $900.00 $1,000.00 $9,000.00 $600.00 $5,400.00 $383.04 $3,447.36
9 207-0061 4.00 Ton  Filter Blanket $640.00 $2,560.00 $25.00 $100.00 $75.00 $300.00 $260.00 $1,040.00 $430.92 $1,723.68
10 208-0007 1,027.00 L.F. Silt Fence $9.00 $9,243.00 $9.00 $9,243.00 $10.00 $10,270.00 $6.00 $6,162.00 $10.51 $10,793.77
11 208-0024 181.00 Ton  Construction Driveway $150.00 $27,150.00 $40.00 $7,240.00 $140.00 $25,340.00 $125.00 $22,625.00 $166.90 $30,208.90
12 208-N0001 1.00 Each Concrete Washout Facility $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $100.00 $100.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
13 210-0002 1.00 LS.  Demolition Of Existing Structures No. 1 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $94,900.00 $94,900.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $17,164.75 $17,164.75 $87,878.14 $87,878.14
14 213-0002 47.00 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $105.00 $4,935.00 $0.01 $0.47 $85.00 $3,995.00 $70.00 $3,290.00 $81.75 $3,842.25
15 213-N0006 5,000.00 USD  Testing of Soils for Waste Classification (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00
16 214-0001 1.00 L.S. Vibration and Displacement Monitoring $34,000.00 $34,000.00 $64,400.00 $64,400.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $68,350.00 $68,350.00 $87,589.89 $87,589.89
17 299-N0009 420.00 S.Y.  Geogrid, Biaxial $24.00 $10,080.00 $7.00 $2,940.00 $20.00 $8,400.00 $8.00 $3,360.00 $8.78 $3,687.60
18 299-N0010 420.00 S.V. Geotextile $6.25 $2,625.00 $6.00 $2,520.00 $1.20 $504.00 $9.25 $3,885.00 $9.38 $3,939.60
19 301-0003 26.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 12 in Thick $86.00 $2,236.00 $0.01 $0.26 $250.00 $6,500.00 $220.00 $5,720.00 $66.30 $1,723.80
20 302-N0001 360.00 L.F.  Sealing Cracks in Bituminous Surface $12.00 $4,320.00 $10.00 $3,600.00 $25.00 $9,000.00 $23.00 $8,280.00 $5.71 $2,055.60
21 412-N0002 282.00 L.F. Clean Bridge Drainage System $50.00 $14,100.00 $12.00 $3,384.00 $1.10 $310.20 $32.00 $9,024.00 $9.34 $2,633.88
22 412-N0009 2.00 Each Clean Scuppers $800.00 $1,600.00 $10.00 $20.00 $200.00 $400.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $1,167.87 $2,335.74
23 413-0002 124.00 S.Y. Concrete Slope Protection $330.00 $40,920.00 $231.00 $28,644.00 $400.00 $49,600.00 $870.00 $107,880.00 $116.06 $14,391.44
24 417-0067 25.00 L.F.  Silicone Joint Seal $115.00 $2,875.00 $9.00 $225.00 $20.00 $500.00 $300.00 $7,500.00 $68.95 $1,723.75
25 417-0083 3.00 L.F. Concrete Parapet Repair $1,450.00 $4,350.00 $2,200.00 $6,600.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $4,575.00 $13,725.00 $2,951.08 $8,853.24
26 418-0001 3.00 S.F.  Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 1 - Abutment $1,100.00 $3,300.00 $1,900.00 $5,700.00 $2,600.00 $7,800.00 $1,485.00 $4,455.00 $574.56 $1,723.68
27 418-0002 11.00 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 2 - Abutment $1,300.00 $14,300.00 $735.00 $8,085.00 $1,750.00 $19,250.00 $1,000.00 $11,000.00 $654.15 $7,195.65
28 418-0025 3,724.00 S.F.  Substructure Membrane Waterproofing $13.00 $48,412.00 $12.50 $46,550.00 $30.00 $111,720.00 $18.00 $67,032.00 $23.36 $86,992.64
29 418-N0101 25.00 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 1 - Retaining Wall $750.00 $18,750.00 $560.00 $14,000.00 $1,100.00 $27,500.00 $1,500.00 $37,500.00 $689.46 $17,236.50
30 499-N0169 400.00 S.Y.  Low Density Cellular Concrete $775.00 $310,000.00 $450.00 $180,000.00 $800.00 $320,000.00 $645.00 $258,000.00 $344.52 $137,808.00
31 499-N0178 160.00 Each Concrete Core Repair $84.00 $13,440.00 $160.00 $25,600.00 $148.08 $23,692.80 $220.00 $35,200.00 $117.95 $18,872.00
32 499-N0179 10.00 C.Y.  Additional Low Density Cellular Concrete $800.00 $8,000.00 $2,100.00 $21,000.00 $3,000.00 $30,000.00 $955.00 $9,550.00 $1,751.80 $17,518.00
33 499-N0180 1.00 L.S. LDCC Trial Placement Mock-Up $17,500.00 $17,500.00 $9,700.00 $9,700.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $45,750.00 $45,750.00 $11,678.65 $11,678.65
34 504-0011 1.00 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $850.00 $850.00 $16,250.00 $16,250.00 $600.00 $600.00 $5,427.00 $5,427.00 $2,382.82 $2,382.82
35 517-0003 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type C $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $5,300.00 $5,300.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $36,500.00 $36,500.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00
36 517-0009 11.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $2,500.00 $27,500.00 $3,900.00 $42,900.00 $1,000.00 $11,000.00 $2,500.00 $27,500.00 $6,000.00 $66,000.00
37 517-0013 10,000.00 USD  Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00
38 703-0001 1,303.00 S.Y. Topsoil $12.50 $16,287.50 $7.00 $9,121.00 $15.00 $19,545.00 $14.00 $18,242.00 $11.68 $15,219.04
39 704-0010 1,303.00 S.V. Seeding, Type Wildflower for Steep Slopes $6.50 $8,469.50 $1.00 $1,303.00 $7.00 $9,121.00 $6.50 $8,469.50 $4.67 $6,085.01
40 706-0001 89.00 S.Y.  Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting $7.00 $623.00 $24.00 $2,136.00 $10.00 $890.00 $8.75 $778.75 $14.01 $1,246.89
41 801-0007 64.00 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol, Part-Time $1.00 $64.00 $0.01 $0.64 $140.00 $8,960.00 $150.00 $9,600.00 $144.76 $9,264.64
42 801-0013 3.00 Each  Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $735.00 $2,205.00 $0.01 $0.03 $12,000.00 $36,000.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $17,517.98 $52,553.94
43 801-0015 1.00 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $225.00 $225.00 $0.01 $0.01 $1.00 $1.00 $46,625.00 $46,625.00 $0.01 $0.01
44 801-N0001 15.00 Each Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing $100.00 $1,500.00 $4,430.00 $66,450.00 $8,000.00 $120,000.00 $3,175.00 $47,625.00 $7,413.50 $111,202.50
45 801-N0002 1.00 Each Installation, Maintenance and Removal of Shoulder Closing $100.00 $100.00 $4,430.00 $4,430.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $3,075.00 $3,075.00 $2,780.08 $2,780.08
46 803-0032 4,000.00 USD  Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid) $1.00 $4,000.00 $1.00 $4,000.00 $1.00 $4,000.00 $1.00 $4,000.00 $1.00 $4,000.00
47 803-N0001 1.00 LS.  Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways $21,730.00 $21,730.00 $62,000.00 $62,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $90,500.00 $90,500.00 $130,785.27 $130,785.27
48 203-0002 25.00 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $200.00 $5,000.00 $175.00 $4,375.00 $560.00 $14,000.00 $820.00 $20,500.00 $112.78 $2,819.50
49 208-0022 2.00 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $82.00 $164.00 $300.00 $600.00 $330.00 $660.00 $262.77 $525.54
$895,472.00 $917,871.42 $1,339,019.00 $1,341,755.00 $1,365,677.73
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaseLine Item Detail

Contract No. P100.644

Railroad Construction Co., Inc.

Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc.

Colonnelli Brothers, Inc.

D'Annunzio & Sons, Inc.

Letting Date: 7/12/2024

IEW Construction Group Inc.

Item No.

Unit Code
1 104-0001
2 104-0002
3 107-0001
4 108-0001
5 108-N0002
6 201-N0O001
7 202-0004
8 207-0046
9 207-0061
10 208-0007
11 208-0024
12 208-N0001
13 210-0002
14 213-0002
15 213-N0006
16 214-0001
17 299-N0009
18 299-N0010
19 301-0003
20 302-N0001
21 412-N0002
22 412-N0009
23 413-0002
24 417-0067
25 417-0083
26 418-0001
27 418-0002
28 418-0025
29 418-N0101
30 499-N0169
31 499-N0178
32 499-N0179
33 499-N0180
34 504-0011
35 517-0003
36 517-0009
37 517-0013
38 703-0001
39 704-0010
40 706-0001
41 801-0007
42 801-0013
43 801-0015
44 801-N0001
45 801-N0002
46 803-0032
47 803-N0001
48 203-0002
49 208-0022

Qty

uoMm
1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
100.00 USD
50,000.00 USD
1.00 L.S.
154.00 C.Y.
9.00 Ton
4.00 Ton
1,027.00 L.F.
181.00 Ton
1.00 Each
1.00 L.S.
47.00 Ton
5,000.00 USD
1.00 L.S.
420.00 S.Y.
420.00 S.Y.
26.00 S.Y.
360.00 L.F.
282.00 L.F.
2.00 Each
124.00 S.Y.
25.00 L.F.
3.00 L.F.
3.00 S.F.
11.00 S.F.
3,724.00 S.F.
25.00 S.F.
400.00 S.Y.
160.00 Each
10.00 C.Y.
1.00 L.S.
1.00 C.Y.
1.00 L.S.
11.00 Mnth
10,000.00 USD
1,303.00 S.Y.
1,303.00 S.Y.
89.00 S.Y.
64.00 M.H.
3.00 Each
1.00 Each
15.00 Each
1.00 Each
4,000.00 USD
1.00 L.S.
25.00 C.Y.
2.00 Each

Description

Construction Layout

Mobilization

Progress Schedule

Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid)
Clearing Site

Roadway Excavation and Embankment
Riprap Stone Slope Protection, 24in Thick (D50=6in)
Filter Blanket

Silt Fence

Construction Driveway

Concrete Washout Facility

Demolition Of Existing Structures No. 1
Disposal of Regulated Material

Testing of Soils for Waste Classification (No-Bid)
Vibration and Displacement Monitoring
Geogrid, Biaxial

Geotextile

Aggregate Base Course, 12 in Thick

Sealing Cracks in Bituminous Surface

Clean Bridge Drainage System

Clean Scuppers

Concrete Slope Protection

Silicone Joint Seal

Concrete Parapet Repair

Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 1 - Abutment
Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 2 - Abutment
Substructure Membrane Waterproofing
Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 1 - Retaining Wall
Low Density Cellular Concrete

Concrete Core Repair

Additional Low Density Cellular Concrete
LDCC Trial Placement Mock-Up

Incidental Concrete

Furnish Field Office, Type C

Maintain Field Office, Type C

Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid)

Topsoil

Seeding, Type Wildflower for Steep Slopes
Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting
Traffic Protection Patrol, Part-Time
Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator
Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators

Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing
Installation, Maintenance and Removal of Shoulder Closing

Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid)

Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways

Embankment, Grade A
Inlet Filter, Type 2

Unit Price Line Total
$28,000.00 $28,000.00
$95,000.00 $95,000.00
$17,474.90 $17,474.90

$1.00 $100.00
$1.00 $50,000.00
$140,000.00 $140,000.00
$97.00 $14,938.00
$500.00 $4,500.00
$175.00 $700.00
$10.00 $10,270.00
$125.00 $22,625.00
$12,000.00 $12,000.00
$90,000.00 $90,000.00
$167.00 $7,849.00
$1.00 $5,000.00
$80,000.00 $80,000.00
$10.00 $4,200.00
$4.00 $1,680.00
$100.00 $2,600.00
$13.00 $4,680.00
$250.00 $70,500.00
$600.00 $1,200.00
$340.00 $42,160.00
$250.00 $6,250.00
$3,450.00 $10,350.00
$500.00 $1,500.00
$550.00 $6,050.00
$20.00 $74,480.00
$500.00 $12,500.00
$455.00 $182,000.00
$325.00 $52,000.00
$450.00 $4,500.00
$40,000.00 $40,000.00
$10,800.00 $10,800.00
$5,000.00 $5,000.00
$2,600.00 $28,600.00
$1.00 $10,000.00
$17.00 $22,151.00
$3.70 $4,821.10
$36.00 $3,204.00
$173.00 $11,072.00
$1,000.00 $3,000.00
$100.00 $100.00
$6,400.00 $96,000.00
$6,000.00 $6,000.00
$1.00 $4,000.00
$80,000.00 $80,000.00
$153.00 $3,825.00
$400.00 $800.00

$1,384,480.00

Page 2 of 2

Unit Price
$30,000.00
$65,000.00
$20,000.00

$1.00
$1.00
$30,000.00
$34.00
$150.00
$470.00
$10.00
$130.00
$1,500.00
$40,000.00
$80.00
$1.00
$70,000.00
$18.00
$6.00
$23.00
$10.00
$50.00
$1,710.00
$300.00
$50.00
$2,860.00
$950.00
$668.00
$15.00
$300.00
$1,170.00
$129.00
$8,500.00
$30,000.00
$4,000.00
$25,000.00
$3,500.00
$1.00
$12.00
$2.00
$32.00
$100.00
$12,000.00
$25,000.00
$3,000.00
$3,620.00
$1.00
$67,086.00
$70.00
$450.00

Line Total
$30,000.00
$65,000.00
$20,000.00

$100.00
$50,000.00
$30,000.00
$5,236.00
$1,350.00
$1,880.00
$10,270.00
$23,530.00
$1,500.00
$40,000.00
$3,760.00
$5,000.00
$70,000.00
$7,560.00
$2,520.00
$598.00
$3,600.00
$14,100.00
$3,420.00
$37,200.00
$1,250.00
$8,580.00
$2,850.00
$7,348.00
$55,860.00
$7,500.00
$468,000.00
$20,640.00
$85,000.00
$30,000.00
$4,000.00
$25,000.00
$38,500.00
$10,000.00
$15,636.00
$2,606.00
$2,848.00
$6,400.00
$36,000.00
$25,000.00
$45,000.00
$3,620.00
$4,000.00
$67,086.00
$1,750.00
$900.00
$1,401,998.00

Unit Price
$15,000.00
$120,000.00
$3,500.00
$1.00
$1.00
$154,128.00
$45.00
$250.00
$100.00
$7.00
$40.00
$3,500.00
$50,000.00
$50.00
$1.00
$30,000.00
$15.00
$10.00
$50.00
$20.00
$75.00
$500.00
$300.00
$50.00
$1,000.00
$800.00
$800.00
$10.00
$800.00
$650.00
$500.00
$1,500.00
$10,000.00
$1,000.00
$7,500.00
$2,500.00
$1.00
$7.00
$4.00
$10.00
$100.00
$25,000.00
$7,500.00
$10,000.00
$10,000.00
$1.00
$146,600.00
$50.00
$250.00

Line Total
$15,000.00
$120,000.00
$3,500.00
$100.00
$50,000.00
$154,128.00
$6,930.00
$2,250.00
$400.00
$7,189.00
$7,240.00
$3,500.00
$50,000.00
$2,350.00
$5,000.00
$30,000.00
$6,300.00
$4,200.00
$1,300.00
$7,200.00
$21,150.00
$1,000.00
$37,200.00
$1,250.00
$3,000.00
$2,400.00
$8,800.00
$37,240.00
$20,000.00
$260,000.00
$80,000.00
$15,000.00
$10,000.00
$1,000.00
$7,500.00
$27,500.00
$10,000.00
$9,121.00
$5,212.00
$890.00
$6,400.00
$75,000.00
$7,500.00
$150,000.00
$10,000.00
$4,000.00
$146,600.00
$1,250.00
$500.00
$1,436,100.00

Unit Price
$18,901.00
$100,000.00
$5,000.00
$1.00
$1.00
$70,000.00
$100.00
$1,200.00
$100.00
$8.00
$65.00
$5,000.00
$150,000.00
$60.00
$1.00
$85,000.00
$15.00
$5.00
$60.00
$15.00
$35.00
$4,000.00
$450.00
$200.00
$8,000.00
$1,500.00
$1,000.00
$20.00
$650.00
$750.00
$60.00
$350.00
$15,000.00
$10,000.00
$35,000.00
$3,700.00
$1.00
$15.00
$6.00
$15.00
$160.00
$10,000.00
$7,500.00
$3,500.00
$25,000.00
$1.00
$100,000.00
$80.00
$300.00

Line Total
$18,901.00
$100,000.00
$5,000.00
$100.00
$50,000.00
$70,000.00
$15,400.00
$10,800.00
$400.00
$8,216.00
$11,765.00
$5,000.00
$150,000.00
$2,820.00
$5,000.00
$85,000.00
$6,300.00
$2,100.00
$1,560.00
$5,400.00
$9,870.00
$8,000.00
$55,800.00
$5,000.00
$24,000.00
$4,500.00
$11,000.00
$74,480.00
$16,250.00
$300,000.00
$9,600.00
$3,500.00
$15,000.00
$10,000.00
$35,000.00
$40,700.00
$10,000.00
$19,545.00
$7,818.00
$1,335.00
$10,240.00
$30,000.00
$7,500.00
$52,500.00
$25,000.00
$4,000.00
$100,000.00
$2,000.00
$600.00
$1,447,000.00

Unit Price
$33,000.00
$177,000.00
$10,000.00
$1.00
$1.00
$150,000.00
$110.00
$2,000.00
$2,100.00
$20.00
$306.00
$60,000.00
$150,000.00
$65.00
$1.00
$200,000.00
$27.00
$23.00
$224.00
$60.00
$238.00
$4,203.00
$1,500.00
$264.00
$8,800.00
$2,000.00
$2,000.00
$30.00
$2,000.00
$2,500.00
$1,300.00
$4,000.00
$100,000.00
$80,000.00
$60,000.00
$7,200.00
$1.00
$23.00
$13.00
$40.00
$100.00
$15,000.00
$1.00
$8,400.00
$8,400.00
$1.00
$220,000.00
$468.00
$700.00

Line Total
$33,000.00
$177,000.00
$10,000.00
$100.00
$50,000.00
$150,000.00
$16,940.00
$18,000.00
$8,400.00
$20,540.00
$55,386.00
$60,000.00
$150,000.00
$3,055.00
$5,000.00
$200,000.00
$11,340.00
$9,660.00
$5,824.00
$21,600.00
$67,116.00
$8,406.00
$186,000.00
$6,600.00
$26,400.00
$6,000.00
$22,000.00
$111,720.00
$50,000.00
$1,000,000.00
$208,000.00
$40,000.00
$100,000.00
$80,000.00
$60,000.00
$79,200.00
$10,000.00
$29,969.00
$16,939.00
$3,560.00
$6,400.00
$45,000.00
$1.00
$126,000.00
$8,400.00
$4,000.00
$220,000.00
$11,700.00
$1,400.00
$3,540,656.00
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