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SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY
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INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
24-5-2 July 31,2024 QUOTATION FORM
Tem ARTICLES FOR SALE NUMBEROF | UNTOF | PRICEBIDPER | 1o1aL pRICE BID
2016 Dodge Charger Sedan, VIN# 2C3CDXKT3GH268214 A-3300 Minimum Bid
1| Mileage: 146,388 1 A |'s7.50000 | 90.00
NO BID
2017 Dodge Charger Sedan, VIN# 2C3CDXKT8HH621404 A-3327 Minimum Bid
2 | Mileage: 158,125 1 EA |'s7.50000 | 90-00
NO BID
2015 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV SUV 2WD, T-3099 9
3 | VIN# 1GNLC2ECOFR685471 Mileage: 214,371 ! EA $4,152.00
MARK PAJOR
2015 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV SUV 4WD, T-3122 Minimum Bid
4 | VIN# 1GNSK2ECBFR678835 Mileage: 165,684 1 EA | g4,500.00 |$4:835.00
ECONOMY AUTO
2016 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV SUV 4WD, T-3278 Minimum Bid
5 | VIN# 1GNSKDEC1GR405102 Mileage: 185,351 1 EA | g4,500.00 | $4:770.00
ECONOMY AUTO
2017 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV SUV 4WD, T-3506 Mintmum Bid
6 | viN# 1GNSKDEC4HR319770 Mileage: 114,825 1 EA | $4,500.00 |$5:210.00
ECONOMY AUTO
2017 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV SUV 4WD, T-3497 Minimum Bid
7 | VIN# 1GNSKDEC4HR321924 Mileage: 137,681 1 EA | $4,500.00 |$4.685.00
ECONOMY AUTO
2013 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV SUV 2WD, T-2765
8 | VIN# 1GNLC2E07DR285703 Mileage: 143,000 1 EA $2,828.00
LIBERTY MOTORS
2017 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD, T-3416 Minimum Bid
9 | VIN# 1FTEX1EB1HKD77118 Mileage: 186,397 1 EA | '$4,500.00 | $4:747.00
LIBERTY MOTORS
2014 Ford Focus Sedan, VIN# 1FADP3E25EL 112863 A-3185 Minimum Bid
10| Mileage: 62,494 1 EA | $1,500.00 |$2:999.00
PLEIADES AUTO SALES LLC
2016 Chevrolet Colorado Crew Cab Pickup 4WD, T-3137 Minimum Bid
11 | VIN# 1GCGTBE39G1108321 Mileage: 140,965 1 EA |'ses00.00 |$7:495.00
(#11 - Engine Overheat - TOW OUT) T
CHARLES ALBA
2017 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV SUV 4WD, T-3474 Minimum Bid
12 | VIN# 1GNSKDEC1HR321086 Mileage: 113,190 1 EA  |'84s00.00 |$4.877.00
(#12 - Bad Transmission - TOW OUT) T
ECONOMY AUTO
2016 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV SUV 4WD, T-3316 Minimum Bid
13 | VIN# 1GNSKDKCOGR428567 Mileage: 122,774 1 EA | "$4s00.00 | $8.000.00
(#13 - Bad Transmission - TOW OUT) U
ALISA WHITE
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14

2016 Chevrolet Caprice PPV Sedan,
VIN# 6G3NS5R22GL236372 Mileage: 109,288

A-3305

1

EA

$2,321.00

ECONOMY AUTO

15

2016 Chevrolet Caprice PPV Sedan,
VIN# 6G3NS5R24GL236342 Mileage: 122,774
(#15 - Bad Transmission - TOW OUT)

A-3310

$1,026.00

JERSEY ONE AUTO

16

2016 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1FTEX1E80GFC16248 Mileage: 155,559

T-3204

Minimum Bid
$5,500.00

$7,300.00

HARRY STEWART

17

2014 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1FTEX1EM6EFB48659 Mileage: 112,890

T-2895

Minimum Bid
$5,500.00

$6,675.00

BEST BUY AUCTIONEERS

18

2015 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1FTEX1E87FFB71131 Mileage: 166,864

T-3044

Minimum Bid
$4,500.00

$5,800.00

TRAVIS ROBINSON

19

2013 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1FTEX1EM7DKF06230 Mileage: 110,013

T-2734

Minimum Bid
$4,500.00

$5,320.00

PLEIADES AUTO SALES LLC

20

2015 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1FTEX1EB5FFB71130 Mileage: 142,034

T-3047

Minimum Bid
$6,500.00

$6,665.00

BEST BUY AUCTIONEERS

21

2013 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1FTEX1EM4DKF06234 Mileage: 98,563

T-2737

Minimum Bid
$5,500.00

$5,999.00

PLEIADES AUTO SALES LLC

22

2012 GMC Canyon Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1GTJ6LFE1C8152009 Mileage: 130,862

T-2642

$3,071.00

JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES

23

2012 Chevrolet Colorado Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1GCJTBFE6C8122961 Mileage: 169,247

T-2475

$2,111.11

ROBERT PINSKY

24

2014 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1FTEX1EM3EFB48649 Mileage: 97,792

T-2890

Minimum Bid
$5,500.00

$6,500.00

PLEIADES AUTO SALES LLC

25

2013 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1FTEX1EMODKF06229 Mileage: 56,078

T-2731

Minimum Bid
$6,500.00

$7,440.00

PLEIADES AUTO SALES LLC

26

2010 Chevrolet Tahoe SSV SUV 4WD,
VIN# 1GNUKAEO3AR267132 Mileage: 159,387

T-2313

$2,000.00

PATRICK ROSS
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2013 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV SUV 2WD, T-2756
27" | VIN# 1GNLC2E09DR284584 Mileage: 98,406 1 EA $2,129.00
ECONOMY AUTO
2013 Ford F150 Reg. Cab Pickup 2WD, T-2799
28 | VIN #1FTNF1CF2DKF38753 Mileage: 123,063 1 EA $888.00
(#28 - Bad Alternator, No Belt - TOW OUT)
JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
2015 Chevrolet Silverado 2500 Reg. Cab Pickup 4WD T-2964 Minimum Bid
29 | VIN# 1GCOKUEGOFZ138228 Mileage: 131,240 1 EA  |'¢5,500.00 |$5:765-00
BEST BUY AUCTIONEERS
2017 Ford F250 Pickup 4WD w/8’ plow T-3433 Minimum Bid
30 | VIN #1FTBF2B64HEE22338 Mileage: 188,889 R-0684 | | EA |'se50000 | 90-00
NO BID
2014 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD, T-2894 Minimum Bid
31 | VIN# 1FTEX1EMSEFB48655 Mileage: 119,605 1 EA  ['¢4,500.00 |$5:165.00
BEST BUY AUCTIONEERS
2016 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD, T-3222 53.88
32 | VIN# 1FTEX1EF3GKE27126 Mileage: 213,280 1 EA $3,353.
ROBERT PINSKY
2012 Ford Focus Sedan, VIN# 1FAHP3E20CL430694 A-3175 Minimum Bid
33 Mileage: 92,214 1 EA | $1,500.00 $3,155.50
DSR AUTO
2012 Ford Focus Sedan, VIN# 1FADP3E23EL112862 A-3184 Minimum Bid
34 Mileage: 84.488 1 EA $1 ’500_00 $3,1 55.50
DSR AUTO
2012 Ford Focus Sedan, VIN# 1FAHP3E24CL430696 A-3177 Minimum Bid
35 | Mileage: 95,391 1 EA | $1,500.00 |$2:855.50
DSR AUTO
2018 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV SUV 4WD, T-3638 Minimum Bid
36 | VIN# 1GNSKDEC4JR363578 Mileage: 176,037 1 EA | '¢5.500.00 | $5:810:00
(#36 - Engine Misfire - Engine Smokes - TOW OUT) mm
ECONOMY AUTO
a7 2016 Dodge Charger Sedan, VIN# 2C3CDXKT8GH268208 A-3301 1 EA Minimum Bid $0 0 O
Mileage: 147,936 (#37 - No power steering - TOW OUT) $6,500.00 .
NO BID
2017 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD, T-3420 Minimum Bid
38 | VIN# 1FTEX1EB3HKD77119 Mileage: 187,361 1 EA | $4,500.00 |$4:710.00
ECONOMY AUTO
2012 Ford Focus Sedan, VIN# 1FAHP3E22CL430695 A-3173 Minimum Bid
39 | Mileage: 115,144 1 EA | $1,500.00 |$3:211.00
WILLIAM KIMBALL
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40

2012 Ford Focus Sedan, VIN# 1FAHP3E27CL291146
Mileage: 49,137

A-3163

1 EA

Minimum Bid
$2,500.00

$3,700.00

JESSICA MCBRIDE

41

2013 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1FTFX1EF8DKF28176 Mileage: 126,482

T-2831

$5,275.00

BEST BUY AUCTIONEERS

42

2016 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1FTEX1EFXGKD66244 Mileage: 169,852
{(#42 - Bad Transmission - TOW OUT)

T-3069

$2,263.63

ROBERT PINSKY

43

2014 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1FTFX1EFXEKE48038 Mileage: 190,099
(#43 - Frame Rot - TOW OUT)

T-2915

$4,251.01

VINCENT MARTINI

44

2016 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1FTEX1EF8GKE27123 Mileage: 277,926
(#44 - Inoperable - TOW OUT)

T-3229

$1,765.50

ROBERT PINSKY

45

2016 Chevrolet Silverado 2500 Reg. Cab 4WD w/8’ plow
VIN# 1GCOKUEG3GZ270384 Mileage: 105,000
(#45 - Missing Bed - TOW OUT)

T-3234
R-9450

$6,262.62

ROBERT PINSKY

46

2015 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD, VIN#
1FTEX1E84FFB71135 Mileage: 194,073

T-3039

$5,750.00

HARRY STEWART

47

2014 Chevrolet Silverado 2500 Reg. Cab Pickup 4WD w/8’
plow VIN #1GCOKVCG6EF106540 Mileage: 77,828
(#47 - Transmission Slips - TOW OUT)

T-2848
R-8338

Minimum Bid
$7,500.00

$0.00

NO BID

48

2014 Chevrolet Express 3500 Van,
VIN# 1GCZGTCG3E1125394 Mileage: 127,955
{#48 - Missing Body & Interior Parts - TOW OUT)

T-2868

$2,356.00

JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES

49

2012 Silverado 1500 Reg. Cab Pickup 2WD,

VIN# 1GCNCPEX6CZ164008 Mileage: 86,228 :

(#49 - Engine Misfire - Check Engine Light Flashing - Lights
on Dash - TOW OUT)

T-2507

$777.00

MARK PAJOR

50

2016 Ford F150 Reg. Cab Pickup 2WD,
VIN# 1FTMF1CF3GKE27113 Mileage: 128,538
(#50 - Body Damage)

T-3214

$1,677.11

ROBERT PINSKY
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51

2012 Chevrolet Express 3500 Van, VIN# 1GCZTCG0C1122434

Mileage: 129,199 (#51 - Bad Transmission - TOW OUT)

T-2588

1

EA

$1,869.00

ECONOMY AUTO

52

2015 Chevrolet Silverado 2500 Reg. Cab Pickup 4WD
VIN #1GCOKUEG4FZ138281 Mileage: 81,017

T-2966

Minimum Bid
$5,500.00

$6,609.00

PLEIADES AUTO SALES LLC

53

2015 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1FTEX1E86FFB71122 Mileage: 146,715
(#53 - Bad Brakes - TOW OUT)

T-3046

$4,666.66

ROBERT PINSKY

54

2018 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1FTEX1E5XJKE40518 Mileage: 109,369
{(#54 - Inoperable - Collision Damage - TOW OUT)

T-3594

$3,881.11

ROBERT PINSKY

55

2015 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD,
VIN# 1FTEX1E89FFB71129 Mileage: 125,364
(#55 - Inoperable - No Start - TOW OUT)

T-3042

$2,666.66

ROBERT PINSKY

56

2020 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV SUV 4WD,
VIN# 1GNSKDEC8LR229143 Mileage: 145,504

T-3871

$5,055.00

JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES

57

2018 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV SUV 4WD,
VIN# 1GNSKDEC1JR364929 Mileage: 144,970

T-3648

$4,651.00

MARK PAJOR

58

2004 International 7400 6yd. Dump Truck,
VIN# 1THTWDADRX4J085798 Mileage: 999,999
(#58 - Inoperable - TOW OUT)

T-1798

$1,671.00

ALPINE DEERE

59

2005 international 7400 6yd. Dump Truck w/11’ plow
VIN# 1HTWDADR45J036047 Mileage: 999,999
(#59 - Inoperable - TOW OUT)

T-1837
R-8857

$1,877.00

DEVINO TRUCKS & PARTS

60

2004 International 7400 6yd. Dump Truck w/10’ plow
VIN# THTWDADR54J085780 Mileage: 99,951
(#60 - Inoperable - TOW OUT)

T-1791
R-6148

$3,666.72

MICHAEL FRATESI

61

2005 International 7400 6yd. Dump Truck w/11’ plow
VIN# 1HTWDADRG65J036051 Mileage: 72,214
(#61 - Inoperable - TOW OUT)

T-1841
R-8838

$3,777.89

MICHAEL FRATESI

62

2012 Ford Focus Sedan, VIN# 1FAHP3E25CL291145
Mileage: 82,762

A-3164

Minimum Bid
$1,500.00

$2,650.00

HARRY STEWART
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2015 Ford Explorer SUV 4WD, VIN# 1FM5K8B88GGA47369 T-3140
63 | Mileage: 135,821 1 EA $3,019.00
(#63 - Engine Overheats - TOW OUT)
ECONOMY AUTO
2017 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV SUV 4WD, T-3485
64 | VIN# 1GNSKDECOHR317711 Mileage: 148,134 1 EA $3,359.00
(#64 - No Brakes - Missing Engine Parts - TOW OUT)
ECONOMY AUTO
2020 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV SUV 4WD, T-3861
65 | VIN# 1GNSKDEC3LR228112 Mileage: 115,564 1 EA $851.00
(#65 - No Drivetrain - Salvage Title - TOW OUT)
MARK PAJOR
2020 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV SUV 4WD, T-3873
66 | VIN# 1GNSKDEC4LR229768 Mileage: 999,999 1 EA $551.00
(#66 - Collision - Missing Parts - Salvage Title - TOW OUT)
MARK PAJOR
2017 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV SUV 4WD, T-3496
VIN# 1GNSKDEC3HR315029 Mileage: 94,799
67 (#67 - Missing Transmission & Transfer Case - Body 1 EA $2,339.00
Damage - TOW OUT)
ECONOMY AUTO
2010 International 7400 7yd. Dump Truck w/tailgate spreader T-2200
68 | VIN# 1THTWDAZR6AJ278499 Mileage: 999,999 R-7271 1 EA $1,677.00
(#68 - Inoperable - TOW OUT)
DEVINO TRUCKS & PARTS
2005 International 7400 3yd. Dump Truck w/tailgate spreader T-1909
69 | VIN# 1THTWDAZR05J010599 Mileage: 999,999 R-6342 1 EA $3,200.00
(#69 - Inoperable - TOW OUT)
JOSEPH DEFINO TRUCKING
2005 International 7400 6yd. Dump Truck w/11' plow VIN# T-1832
70 | 1THTWDADRS5J036042 Mileage: 999,999 R-7542 1 EA $1,877.00
(#70 - Inoperable - TOW OUT)
DEVINO TRUCKS & PARTS
2007 International 7400 7yd. Dump Truck T-2004
71| VIN# BHTWDAZRO7N461001 Mileage: 31,919 ! EA $8,850.00
SHAUN GURAL
2005 International 7400 3yd. Dump Truck w/9' plow & tailgate T-1905
72 | spreader VIN# 1HTWDAZR55J010601 Mileage: 47,188 R-6525 | 1 EA $0.00
R-6338
REMOVED FROM SALE
2005 International 7400 Crew Cab 3yd. Dump Truck w/9’ plow  T-1885
73 | VIN# 1HTWDAZR85.185358 Mileage: 64,553 R6293 | | EA $3,955.00
SHAUN GURAL
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74 2005 International 7400 Crew Cab 3yd. Dymp Truck wrtailgate  T-1883 1 EA $3,955.00
spreader VIN# 1HTWDAZR45J185356 Mileage: 61,457 R-6323
SHAUN GURAL
2007 International 7400 7yd. Dump Truck w/tailgate spreader T-2003 7.160.00
7S | VIN# 3HTWDAZRI7N461000 Mileage: 52,789 R-6824 | EA $7,160.
SHAUN GURAL
2015 Dodge Charger Sedan, VIN# 2C3CDXKTOFH853069 A-3279
76 | Mileage: 134,146 1 EA $889.00
(#76 - Missing body & Interior parts - TOW OUT)
LIBERTY MOTORS
2012 Ford F150 Reg. Cab Pickup 2WD, T-2685
77 | VIN# 1FTNF1CF8CKE25601 Mileage: 131,873 1 EA $1,011.11
(#77 - Bad Transmission & Frame Rot - TOW OUT)
ROBERT PINSKY
2016 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD, . T-3064
78 | VIN# 1FTEX1EFOGKDS66252 Mileage: 208,883 1 EA $1,027.00
{(#78 - Bad Transmission - Bad Rear - TOW OUT)
JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
2016 Chevrolet Silverado 2500 Reg. Cab 4WD w/8’ plow T-3241 Mini Bid
79 | VIN# 1GCOKUEG1GZ269752 Mileage: 88,597 R-9457 1 EA | '$7.500.00 $0 .00
(#79 - Bad Transmission - TOW OUT) ’
NO BID
2013 Chevrolet Express 3500 Van, T-2694
80 | VIN# 1GCZGTCG2D1101943 Mileage: 93,835 1 EA $888.00
(#80 - Incomplete - Inoperable - TOW OUT)
JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
2006 Chevrolet Impala Sedan, VIN# 2G1WB58KX69380950 A-2792
81 Mileage: 113,873 (#81 - Inoperable - TOW OUT) 1 EA $651 .00
JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
2012 Chevrolet Silverado Reg. Cab 2WD, T-2504
82 | VIN#1GCNCPEX4CZ163794 Mileage: 169,207 1 EA $821.00
(#82 - Inoperable - TOW OUT)
JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
2014 Chevrolet Express 3500 Van, VIN#1GCZGTFG3E1210327 T-2959
83 | Mileage: 94,443 (#83 - Inoperable - TOW OUT) 1 EA $1,051.00
JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
2005 International 7400 Syd. Dump Truck w/tailgate spreader T-1949
84 VIN# 1HTWDAZR05J151463 Mileage: 86,135 R-6414 1 EA $4,500.00
PLEIADES AUTO SALES LLC
2005 International 7400 3yd. Dump Truck w/9’ plow T-1907
85 | yiN# 1HTWDAZRX5J010609 Mileage: 20,868 R-6528 | | EA $5,500.00
PLEIADES AUTO SALES LLC
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86 2015 Chevrolet Silverado 2500 Reg. Qab Pickup 4WD w/8’ T-3085 1 EA Minimum Bid $12,550.00
plow VIN# 1GCOKUEG3FZ545976 Mileage: 78,336 R-8336 $9,500.00 ’
NJ JUNIOR TITANS HOCKEY CLUB
87 2012 John Deere 624K Wheel Loader w/3.5yd. bucket & forks R-8218 1 EA Minimum Bid $56.791.00
VIN# 1DW624KHJCE648128 Hours: 2,218 R-8222 $25,000.00 ’
HAZLETON EQUIPMENT
Bl I N - Ot
HAZLETON EQUIPMENT
oo [picm oo s hos omtews sy oot R0 |y | o | ssn00900
ALPINE DEERE
90 | Ve IDWE24KHOADB33267 Hours: 3008 RTe ] 1 | B | somonn00 |$38,085.00
ALPINE DEERE
2000 John Deere 270 Skid Steer w/bucket, forks, cold R-5611 Minimum Bid
91 | planer & excavator attachments SER# KV0270E270880, R-5801 1 EA $15,000.00 $16,500.00
KV900X4001755, KVCP24X100131 Hours: R-5641
ROBERT IMBRUGIA
92 2H%?‘0rng;3 ,ggg Tractor 4WD SER# CO80RN3JJE1014815 R-5576 1 EA $2,660.00
JAMES CATALANO
93 ;%'g#'?é?g zéggasg:;:lﬂl'f: 8M60del #4FG15C24 17653 1 EA $900 00
ALISA WHITE
94 1S QE?RS#I\&,ISI\% f(;l)%?(l)'ﬁl:g:ﬂ:':;hg%jﬂ #CUMO1L15S w/charger G-24790 1 EA $700 00
PLEIADES AUTO SALES LLC
95 \1/ ?ﬁg gt&pzhfzngg{_?ai g—s'l;c;gaTranler Model# SG8-185-6 R-4785 1 EA $2 50.00
NJ JUNIOR TITANS HOCKEY CLUB
96 2 #ang -H;;s;:ngg?: ;r;g:t‘lges';'railer VIN# 10HHTR183H1000167 R-3700 1 EA $ 0 . OO
NO BID
97 | 2000 Elliot Magnetek 100kw Generator Model #BU03J164 G-14619 1 EA $2,677.00
DEVINO TRUCKS & PARTS
98 |2011 Stone 955M Concrete Mixer SER# 402011150 R-7942 1 EA $250.00
ROBERT IMBRUGIA
99 | 2012 Woods 15' Tag Mower Model# BW1800X SER# 1221507  R-8175 1 EA $1,225.00
SHAUN GURAL




91-PC-32 (REV.2T) Page 9 of 9
SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY
INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
2452 July 31, 2024 QUOTATION FORM
e ARTICLES FOR SALE NUMBEROF | WMTOF | PRICEBIDPER | total pRicE BID
100 | 2013 Woods 7' Tag Mower Model# BB840XP SER# 1250879 R-8382 1 EA $1,060.00
SHAUN GURAL
2013 Woods 7' Tag Mower Model# BB840XP R-8389
107 | SER# 1250890 (#101 - Inoperable) ! EA $230.00
SHAUN GURAL
2000 John Deere CP24 Roadway Planer Attachment R-5598
102 | SER# KVCP24X100131 1 EA $627.50
ALPINE DEERE
2005 Valk 9’ Power Reversing Plow RVS9803-104PR R-6527
103 | grey w0670 1 EA $100.00
JAMES CATALANO
2005 Valk 10’ Power Reversing Plow RV103-104PR R-6245
104 | Sere 20718 1 EA $100.00
JAMES CATALANO
2005 Valk 9’ Power Reversing Plow RvV903-104PR R-6523
105 | SFuadaes 1 EA $100.00
JAMES CATALANO




