
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T200.617 Letting Date: 5/9/2024

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1 L.S. Construction Layout $85,000.00 $85,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $34,000.00 $34,000.00 $210,000.00 $210,000.00

2 104-0002 1 L.S. Mobilization $925,000.00 $925,000.00 $1,080,000.00 $1,080,000.00 $1,215,000.00 $1,215,000.00 $1,318,000.00 $1,318,000.00

3 106-N0001 700000 USD Permit Fees (NO-BID) $1.00 $700,000.00 $1.00 $700,000.00 $1.00 $700,000.00 $1.00 $700,000.00

4 107-0001 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $1.00

5 108-0001 1000 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00

6 108-N0002 700000 USD Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid) $1.00 $700,000.00 $1.00 $700,000.00 $1.00 $700,000.00 $1.00 $700,000.00

7 108-N0004 1000 USD Steel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00

8 201-0002 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $77,100.00 $77,100.00 $575,000.00 $575,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $175,600.00 $175,600.00

9 202-0009 6000 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $6,000.00 $1.00 $6,000.00 $1.00 $6,000.00 $1.00 $6,000.00

10 208-0007 21185 L.F. Silt Fence $5.00 $105,925.00 $10.25 $217,146.25 $4.00 $84,740.00 $8.50 $180,072.50

11 208-0022 42 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $125.00 $5,250.00 $195.00 $8,190.00 $193.00 $8,106.00 $275.00 $11,550.00

12 208-0024 89 Ton Construction Driveway $55.00 $4,895.00 $185.00 $16,465.00 $1.00 $89.00 $240.00 $21,360.00

13 211-0001 10175 L.F. Temporary Orange Plastic Fence $5.00 $50,875.00 $12.00 $122,100.00 $2.00 $20,350.00 $3.95 $40,191.25

14 213-0002 695 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $75.00 $52,125.00 $42.00 $29,190.00 $10.00 $6,950.00 $120.00 $83,400.00

15 213-0003 695 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material, Hazardous $125.00 $86,875.00 $120.00 $83,400.00 $20.00 $13,900.00 $330.00 $229,350.00

16 303-0001 230 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick $52.00 $11,960.00 $89.00 $20,470.00 $75.00 $17,250.00 $75.00 $17,250.00

17 417-0083 100 L.F. Concrete Parapet Repair $1,650.00 $165,000.00 $900.00 $90,000.00 $2,300.00 $230,000.00 $890.00 $89,000.00

18 417-N0001 400 L.F. Furnishing, Installation and Removal of Temporary Shielding $195.00 $78,000.00 $96.00 $38,400.00 $250.00 $100,000.00 $215.00 $86,000.00

19 510-0001 500 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $105.00 $52,500.00 $120.00 $60,000.00 $50.00 $25,000.00 $78.20 $39,100.00

20 517-0002 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type B $45,700.00 $45,700.00 $56,000.00 $56,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00

21 517-0008 20 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $3,900.00 $78,000.00 $4,800.00 $96,000.00 $2,500.00 $50,000.00 $2,825.00 $56,500.00

22 517-0013 5000 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00

23 522-0001 20 Each Test Pits $725.00 $14,500.00 $1,250.00 $25,000.00 $100.00 $2,000.00 $1,050.00 $21,000.00

24 528-0001 5 Each Reset Junction Box $1,200.00 $6,000.00 $4,345.00 $21,725.00 $3,800.00 $19,000.00 $5,900.00 $29,500.00

25 531-0001 5000 USD Force Account for Snow Removal (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00

26 599-N0103 9550 L.F. Transite Duct Removal $65.00 $620,750.00 $18.00 $171,900.00 $20.00 $191,000.00 $65.00 $620,750.00

27 599-N0207 20000 USD Utility Relocation, Electrical (PSE&G) (No-Bid) $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00

28 601-0001 1 L.S. Remove and Salvage Existing Facilities $875,000.00 $875,000.00 $930,000.00 $930,000.00 $1,315,018.00 $1,315,018.00 $1,390,000.00 $1,390,000.00

29 601-0009 59710 L.F. 3in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40) $28.00 $1,671,880.00 $27.50 $1,642,025.00 $35.00 $2,089,850.00 $27.50 $1,642,025.00

30 601-0011 1 Each Lighting Manhole $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $31,200.00 $31,200.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

31 601-0012 550 L.F. 3in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 80) $75.00 $41,250.00 $45.25 $24,887.50 $102.00 $56,100.00 $125.00 $68,750.00

32 601-0014 144 Each Junction Box Foundation, Type 1 $5,100.00 $734,400.00 $5,365.00 $772,560.00 $6,500.00 $936,000.00 $7,650.00 $1,101,600.00

33 601-0015 88 Each Junction Box, Type C $4,500.00 $396,000.00 $4,345.00 $382,360.00 $6,000.00 $528,000.00 $7,810.00 $687,280.00

34 601-0019 31623 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Ground Wire $5.50 $173,926.50 $4.50 $142,303.50 $6.00 $189,738.00 $4.05 $128,073.15

35 601-0020 23656 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Ground Wire $3.00 $70,968.00 $3.50 $82,796.00 $4.90 $115,914.40 $3.00 $70,968.00

36 601-0021 12160 L.F. #10 A.W.G. Ground Wire $2.00 $24,320.00 $3.25 $39,520.00 $4.50 $54,720.00 $2.45 $29,792.00

37 601-0038 44970 L.F. #10 A.W.G. Power Cable $2.00 $89,940.00 $4.00 $179,880.00 $4.80 $215,856.00 $3.50 $157,395.00

38 601-0050 11484 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Ground Wire $6.20 $71,200.80 $5.40 $62,013.60 $7.20 $82,684.80 $5.30 $60,865.20

39 601-0055 72277 L.F. #2/0 A.W.G. Power Cable $11.00 $795,047.00 $11.40 $823,957.80 $11.40 $823,957.80 $9.00 $650,493.00

40 601-0056 3170 L.F. #6 A.W.G. Ground Wire $3.70 $11,729.00 $4.00 $12,680.00 $5.40 $17,118.00 $3.55 $11,253.50

41 601-0067 258998 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Power Cable $5.90 $1,528,088.20 $6.00 $1,553,988.00 $6.70 $1,735,286.60 $4.30 $1,113,691.40

42 601-0074 62798 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Power Cable $6.20 $389,347.60 $7.20 $452,145.60 $7.90 $496,104.20 $5.75 $361,088.50

43 601-0077 350 L.F. 2-Way Duct Bank, 4" HDPE Conduits Directional Drilled $275.00 $96,250.00 $450.00 $157,500.00 $150.00 $52,500.00 $290.00 $101,500.00

44 601-0078 325 L.F. 4-Way Duct Bank, 4" HDPE Conduits Directional Drilled $279.00 $90,675.00 $540.00 $175,500.00 $200.00 $65,000.00 $310.00 $100,750.00

45 601-0148 6610 L.F. #6 A.W.G. Power Cable $4.00 $26,440.00 $5.00 $33,050.00 $6.00 $39,660.00 $5.75 $38,007.50

46 601-0149 11 Each Concrete Base, Type LP $2,500.00 $27,500.00 $3,725.00 $40,975.00 $5,100.00 $56,100.00 $4,460.00 $49,060.00

47 601-N0061 3025 L.F. 3in Rigid Metallic Conduit, PVC Coated, Exposed $110.00 $332,750.00 $155.00 $468,875.00 $275.00 $831,875.00 $185.00 $559,625.00

48 601-N0104 2 L.S. Electrical Studies $15,000.00 $30,000.00 $36,000.00 $72,000.00 $9,000.00 $18,000.00 $30,000.00 $60,000.00

49 601-0248 47 Each Concrete Base, Type LP-Mod $7,900.00 $371,300.00 $11,200.00 $526,400.00 $45,000.00 $2,115,000.00 $20,500.00 $963,500.00

50 601-N0111 21530 L.F. Abandonment Of Transite Duct $2.00 $43,060.00 $2.25 $48,442.50 $0.40 $8,612.00 $10.00 $215,300.00

51 601-N0112 7960 L.F. Conduit, Inspection And Cleaning $10.00 $79,600.00 $6.50 $51,740.00 $10.00 $79,600.00 $16.50 $131,340.00

52 601-N0113 550 L.F. Conduit, Parapet Safety Walk Repair $275.00 $151,250.00 $4,345.00 $2,389,750.00 $1,400.00 $770,000.00 $700.00 $385,000.00

53 601-N0114 25 Each Conduit, Bridge/Transition Repair $2,350.00 $58,750.00 $8,595.00 $214,875.00 $11,000.00 $275,000.00 $16,000.00 $400,000.00

54 601-N0115 1 L.S. Spare Parts, Electrical $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

55 602-0091 1 Each Load Center Cabinet, Type F Modified, Voltage 277/480V $89,000.00 $89,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $172,000.00 $172,000.00 $131,000.00 $131,000.00

56 602-N0019 1 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 1 $15,800.00 $15,800.00 $18,200.00 $18,200.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $44,000.00 $44,000.00

57 602-N0020 1 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 2 $49,800.00 $49,800.00 $95,600.00 $95,600.00 $257,000.00 $257,000.00 $76,500.00 $76,500.00

58 602-N0030 1 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 3 $55,890.00 $55,890.00 $57,900.00 $57,900.00 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $160,300.00 $160,300.00

59 602-N0031 1 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 4 $15,800.00 $15,800.00 $154,500.00 $154,500.00 $240,000.00 $240,000.00 $64,250.00 $64,250.00

60 603-0006 87 Each Type LP4 Luminaire $2,200.00 $191,400.00 $2,095.00 $182,265.00 $4,000.00 $348,000.00 $3,400.00 $295,800.00

BaseLine Item Detail Orchard Holdings, LLC Daidone Electric, Inc.HBC Company Inc PKF-Mark III, Inc.
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T200.617 Letting Date: 5/9/2024

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

BaseLine Item Detail Orchard Holdings, LLC Daidone Electric, Inc.HBC Company Inc PKF-Mark III, Inc.

61 603-0007 31 Each Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-40 $4,400.00 $136,400.00 $4,980.00 $154,380.00 $7,000.00 $217,000.00 $5,390.00 $167,090.00

62 603-0008 175 Each Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-26 $3,150.00 $551,250.00 $4,170.00 $729,750.00 $5,600.00 $980,000.00 $4,175.00 $730,625.00

63 603-0012 2 Each Lighting Standard, Type L-MG2-40 $6,300.00 $12,600.00 $6,600.00 $13,200.00 $7,100.00 $14,200.00 $5,420.00 $10,840.00

64 603-0014 1 L.S. Temporary Lighting Systems $110,520.00 $110,520.00 $133,000.00 $133,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $1,750,000.00 $1,750,000.00

65 603-N0026 1 Each Type LP2 Luminaire $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $4,300.00 $4,300.00 $3,400.00 $3,400.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00

66 603-0041 1 Each Type LP8 Luminaire $2,780.00 $2,780.00 $4,900.00 $4,900.00 $4,100.00 $4,100.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00

67 603-0042 114 Each Type LP9 Luminaire $2,580.00 $294,120.00 $2,570.00 $292,980.00 $4,500.00 $513,000.00 $3,590.00 $409,260.00

68 603-0058 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 1 $135,000.00 $135,000.00 $360,500.00 $360,500.00 $329,000.00 $329,000.00 $295,000.00 $295,000.00

69 603-0062 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation Str. No. 2 $49,800.00 $49,800.00 $107,400.00 $107,400.00 $112,000.00 $112,000.00 $83,000.00 $83,000.00

70 603-0063 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 3 $75,800.00 $75,800.00 $117,000.00 $117,000.00 $111,000.00 $111,000.00 $135,000.00 $135,000.00

71 603-0064 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation Str. No. 3 $85,900.00 $85,900.00 $182,700.00 $182,700.00 $182,000.00 $182,000.00 $93,000.00 $93,000.00

72 603-0078 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 5 $84,000.00 $84,000.00 $192,300.00 $192,300.00 $202,000.00 $202,000.00 $124,500.00 $124,500.00

73 603-0080 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 6 $26,580.00 $26,580.00 $18,700.00 $18,700.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $24,750.00 $24,750.00

74 603-0081 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 7 $26,800.00 $26,800.00 $18,700.00 $18,700.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $24,500.00 $24,500.00

75 603-0082 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 8 $13,100.00 $13,100.00 $39,900.00 $39,900.00 $79,000.00 $79,000.00 $60,250.00 $60,250.00

76 603-0090 51 Each Type LP3 Luminaire $2,150.00 $109,650.00 $2,095.00 $106,845.00 $3,600.00 $183,600.00 $3,740.00 $190,740.00

77 603-N0049 11 Each Metal Pull Box, S.S. $2,800.00 $30,800.00 $4,000.00 $44,000.00 $3,100.00 $34,100.00 $3,350.00 $36,850.00

78 603-N0071 1 Each Highmast Lighting Standard, Type L-HR10-100 $167,000.00 $167,000.00 $159,000.00 $159,000.00 $242,000.00 $242,000.00 $176,750.00 $176,750.00

79 603-0118 84 Each Type LP10 Luminare $1,900.00 $159,600.00 $2,095.00 $175,980.00 $3,600.00 $302,400.00 $2,570.00 $215,880.00

80 603-0119 89 Each Type LH1 High Mast Luminaire $3,500.00 $311,500.00 $2,800.00 $249,200.00 $6,900.00 $614,100.00 $3,590.00 $319,510.00

81 603-0120 5 Each Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-30-SB $2,900.00 $14,500.00 $8,765.00 $43,825.00 $8,000.00 $40,000.00 $4,850.00 $24,250.00

82 603-N0068 1 L.S. Lighting Controls at Location No. 1 $8,400.00 $8,400.00 $13,700.00 $13,700.00 $26,000.00 $26,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00

83 603-N0069 1 L.S. Lighting Controls at Location No. 2 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $13,700.00 $13,700.00 $26,000.00 $26,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00

84 603-N0072 52 Each Parapet Bracket Set $7,200.00 $374,400.00 $5,400.00 $280,800.00 $7,900.00 $410,800.00 $11,500.00 $598,000.00

85 603-N0073 25 Each Parapet Bracket Anchor Bolts And Plate $7,500.00 $187,500.00 $5,800.00 $145,000.00 $11,500.00 $287,500.00 $3,500.00 $87,500.00

86 603-N0074 1 L.S. Spare Parts, Lighting $51,000.00 $51,000.00 $16,200.00 $16,200.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

87 603-N0076 10 Each Relocate Mounting Bracket Set $8,900.00 $89,000.00 $7,315.00 $73,150.00 $13,400.00 $134,000.00 $4,500.00 $45,000.00

88 801-0001 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $25,500.00 $25,500.00 $3,775,000.00 $3,775,000.00

89 801-0009 8 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $14,200.00 $113,600.00 $18,000.00 $144,000.00 $1,020.00 $8,160.00 $4,000.00 $32,000.00

90 801-0013 5 Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $35,000.00 $175,000.00 $70,000.00 $350,000.00 $1,020.00 $5,100.00 $160.00 $800.00

91 801-0014 320 M.H. Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use $275.00 $88,000.00 $156.00 $49,920.00 $103.00 $32,960.00 $175.00 $56,000.00

92 801-0015 20 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $500.00 $10,000.00 $300.00 $6,000.00 $0.01 $0.20 $4,000.00 $80,000.00

93 803-N0001 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $42,000.00 $42,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

94 804-N0001 74000 USD Railroad Reimbursement Costs (No-Bid) $1.00 $74,000.00 $1.00 $74,000.00 $1.00 $74,000.00 $1.00 $74,000.00

95 417-0082 100 S.F. Vertical Spall Repair $115.00 $11,500.00 $96.00 $9,600.00 $200.00 $20,000.00 $425.00 $42,500.00

96 601-N0116 45 Each Conduit Expansion/Deflection coupler, PVC Coated $4,800.00 $216,000.00 $5,305.00 $238,725.00 $5,000.00 $225,000.00 $6,000.00 $270,000.00

97 603-N0067 300000 USD Custom Lighting Control Interface (No Bid) $1.00 $300,000.00 $1.00 $300,000.00 $1.00 $300,000.00 $1.00 $300,000.00

$17,947,517.10 $21,295,230.75 $23,792,000.00 $26,360,427.00 
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