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1 2015 CHEVROLET CAPRICE 4-DOOR SEDAN 
VIN #6G3NS5R29FL128572 Mileage: 145,769

A-3274 1 EA
Minimum Bid 
$4,500.00 $5,000.00

Tristan Roldan

2 2015 DODGE CHARGER 4-DOOR SEDAN AWD 
VIN #2C3CDXKT9FH853071 Mileage: 123,306

A-3280 1 EA
Minimum Bid 
$7,500.00 $7,800.00

Darrell Glover

3 2012 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV 4WD
VIN #1GNSK2E00CR156005 Mileage: 134,685

T-2363 1 EA
Minimum Bid
$7,500.00 $8,335.07

____________________Luckana Stone

4 2016 FORD EXPLORER SUV VIN #1FM5K8B88GGA47369
Mileage: 135,821 (#4 - ENGINE OVERHEATS - TOW OUT)

T-3140 1 EA $6,509.00

Chagga Americano, LLC.

5 2016 DODGE CARAVAN MINIVAN
VIN #2C4RDGBGXGR378664 Mileage: 111,103

T-3321 1 EA
Minimum Bid
$4,500.00 $5,221.86

Zoom Auto Group

6 2017 DODGE CHARGER 4-DOOR SEDAN AWD 
VIN #2C3CDXKT7HH621412 Mileage: 150,513

A-3335 1 EA
Minimum Bid
$6,500.00 $8,599.00

Pilar Vergara

7 2015 CHEVROLET CAPRICE 4-DOOR SEDAN 
VIN #6G3NS5R27FL128604 Mileage: 151,362

A-3276 1 EA
Minimum Bid 
$4,500.00 $4,800.00

Darrell Glover

8 2015 CHEVROLET CAPRICE 4-DOOR SEDAN 
VIN #6G3NS5R22FL128624 Mileage: 141,357

A-3277 1 EA
Minimum Bid
$3,500.00 $4,620.00

Ethan Dean

9 2016 DODGE CHARGER 4-DOOR SEDAN AWD 
VIN #2C3CDXKT2GH273145 Mileage: 143,493

A-3302 1 EA
Minimum Bid 
$7,500.00 $9,769.07

____________________Luckana Stone

10 2012 FORD ESCAPE SUV VIN #1FMCU9DG4CKC70186
Mileage: 97,095 (#10 - BAD ALTERNATOR - TOW OUT)

T-2603 1 EA $2,766.88

Robert Pinksy

11
2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD 
VIN #1GNSKDEC6JR360052 Mileage: 143,251
(#11 - MINOR BODY DAMAGE)

T-3659
1 EA

Minimum Bid 
$6,500.00 $7,375.00

Economy Auto

12
2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD
VIN #1GNSKDECXHR321152 Mileage: 180,144
(#12 - ENGINE MISFIRE - TOW OUT)

T-3500
1 EA

Minimum Bid
$5,500.00 $6,210.00

Economy Auto

13
2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD 
VIN #1GNSKDEC9JR361552 Mileage: 132,949
(#13 - ENGINE MISFIRE - TOW OUT)

T-3663
1 EA

Minimum Bid
$5,500.00 $6,310.00

Economy Auto
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14
2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV 4WD T-3651
VIN #1GNSKDEC2JR362901 Mileage: 126,129
(#14 - BAD ENGINE - TOW OUT)

1 EA $6,621.88

Zoom Auto Group

15
2016 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3288
VIN #1GNSKDEC5GR407287 Mileage: 134,784
(#15 - MISSING EXHAUST)

1 EA
Minimum Bid
$4,500.00 $5,280.00

Economy Auto

16
2015 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 2WD T-3090
VIN #1GNLC2EC7FR686715 Mileage: 121,134
(#16 - MISFIRE - MISSING BODY PARTS - TOW OUT)

1 EA $3,275.00

Economy Auto

17
2015 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3132
VIN #1GNSK2EC9FR681787 Mileage: 124,486
(#17 - BROKEN REAR WINDOW)

1 EA
Minimum Bid
$4,500.00 $5,175.00

Economy Auto

18 2016 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3275
VIN #1GNSKDEC9GR405655 Mileage: 194,091 1 EA

Minimum Bid
$5,500.00 $0.00

No Bid

19 2013 FORD EXPLORER SUV 4WD T-2723
VIN #1FM5K8B85DGC96465 Mileage: 145,504 1 EA

Minimum Bid
$4,500.00 $5,599.25

Nelson Vergara

20
2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3505
VIN #1GNSKDEC0HR321418 Mileage: 177,269
(#20 - ENGINE MISFIRE - TOW OUT)

1 EA $4,775.00

Economy Auto

21
2016 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3283
VIN #1GNSKDEC7GR406481 Mileage: 193,617
(#21 - MINOR BODY DAMAGE L/R)

1 EA $3,636.00

Liberty Motors

22 2001 CHEVROLET IMPALA 4-DOOR SEDAN TP-
VIN #2G1WF52EX19281075 Mileage: 160,670 103553 1 EA $1,205.00

Vincent Martini

23 2013 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 2WD T-2765
VIN #1GNLC2E07DR285703 Mileage: 143,000 1 EA

Minimum Bid
$4,500.00 $0.00

No Bid

24

2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 3 YD. DUMP TRUCK W/R-6283 T-1899
PLOW & R-6818 SPREADER VIN #1HTWDAZR35J010595 
Mileage: 57,508 4,705 HOURS
(#24 - FRAME ROT - TOW OUT)

1 EA $3,888.00

Joseph DeFino Trucking

25 1996 FORD F-800 BOOM CRANE TRUCK W/UTILITY BODY TP-
VIN #1FDYF80E4TVA15678 Mileage: 37,888 4,135 HOURS 103225 1 EA $3,255.00

Jersey One Auto Sales
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26

2016 CHEVROLET CAPRICE 4-DOOR SEDAN
VIN #6G3NS5R25GL236351 Mileage: 119,364
(#26 - INCOMPLETE - MISSING DRIVETRAIN & BODY 
PARTS)

A-3309

1 EA $300.00

Alexis Moody

27
2012 CHEVROLET COLORADO EXTRA CAB P/U 4WD 
VIN #1GCJTBFEXC8123028 Mileage: 112,391
(#27 - INOPERABLE - NO START - TOW OUT)

T-2585
1 EA $2,587.00

_____________________ Ethan Dean

28 2012 FORD ESCAPE SUV VIN #1FMCU9DGXCKC70189 
Mileage: 123,501

T-2602 1 EA $629.00

____________________Economy Auto

29 2012 FORD ESCAPE SUV VIN #1FMCU9DG2CKC70185 
Mileage: 141,283

T-2601 1 EA $777.00

Barren Baldwin

30 2010 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 1500 VAN 
VIN #1GCUGAD49A1118530 Mileage: 113,229

T-2188 1 EA $2,855.00

Jersey One Auto Sales

31
2016 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 VAN
VIN #1GCZGGFGXG1326411 Mileage: 109,964
(#31 - BODY DAMAGE - TOW OUT)

T-3262
1 EA $6,321.80

__________________ Zoom Auto Group

32
2016 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 VAN 
VIN #1GCZGGFGXG1116858 Mileage: 160,496
(#32 - BODY DAMAGE)

T-3030
1 EA $4,610.00

____________________Economy Auto

33 2014 FORD Fl 50 EXTRA CAB PICKUP 4WD 
VIN #1FTEX1EM2EFB48660 Mileage: 132,598

T-2899 1 EA $7,760.00

John Henry

34 2012 CHEVROLET IMPALA 4-DOOR SEDAN 
VIN #2G1WD5E39C1183561 Mileage: 120,748

A-3169 1 EA $1,175.00

___________________ Barren Baldwin

35 2012 GMC CANYON EXTRA CAB PICKUP 4WD 
VIN #1GTJ6LFE3C8151900 Mileage: 146,793

T-2639 1 EA $3,055.00

Jersey One Auto Sales

36 2016 DODGE CHARGER 4-DOOR SEDAN AWD 
VIN #2C3CDXKTXGH268209 Mileage: 137,378

A-3298 1 EA
Minimum Bid
$5,500.00 $7,100.00

Andrey Kapranov

37
2012 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 REG. CAB 4WD W/R-
8077 BOSS 8’ PLOW VIN #1GT02ZCG7CF228876
Mileage: 109,805 (#37 - MISFIRE - TOW OUT)

T-2654
1 EA

Minimum Bid
$4,500.00 $6,037.00

Scotchwood Disposal
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38 2016 FORD F150 EXTRA CAB PICKUP 4WD T-3210
VIN #1FTEX1E85GFC16259 Mileage: 223,035 1 EA

Minimum Bid
$4,500.00 $5,950.00

Pilar Vergara

39 2016 FORD F150 EXTRA CAB PICKUP 4WD T-3200
VIN #1FTEX1E82GFC16249 Mileage: 180,156 1 EA

Minimum Bid
$6,500.00 $9,578.80

Justin Castles

40 2014 FORD F150 EXTRA CAB PICKUP 4WD T-2886
VIN #1FTEX1EM1EFB48648 Mileage: 195,649 1 EA

Minimum Bid
$4,500.00 $4,850.00

Economy Auto

41 2015 FORD Fl 50 EXTRA CAB PICKUP 4WD T-3039
VIN #1FTEX1E84FFB71135 Mileage: 194,073 1 EA

Minimum Bid
$5,500.00 $0.00

No Bid

42 2012 FORD ESCAPE SUV VIN #1FMCU9DG6CKC70187 T-2604
Mileage: 114,992 (#42 - BAD ALTERNATOR - TOW OUT) 1 EA $425.00

Jersey One Auto Sales

43 2012 FORD ESCAPE SUV VIN #1FMCU9DG7CKA45115 T-2565
Mileage: 119,716 1 EA $425.00

Jersey One Auto Sales

44
2014 FORD F350 EXTRA CAB 4WD W/ENCLOSED T-2878
LO-UTILITY SERVICE BODY & 2000LB. CRANE
VIN #1FT8X3B65EEA55183 Mileage: 169,280

1 EA
Minimum Bid
$14,500.00 $0.00

No Bid

45 2016 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 CREW CAB 2WD T-3230
VIN #1GC1CUEG6GF189737 Mileage: 276,754 1 EA $4,243.00

Liberty Motors

46
2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3494
VIN #1GNSKDEC3HR317668 Mileage: 182,480
(#46 - MAJOR FUEL LEAK - TOW OUT)

1 EA $5,880.00

Economy Auto

47
2011 INTERNATIONAL 4400 W/SCHWARZE M6000TE T-2267
SWEEPER VIN #1HTMMAAR8BH337113 Mileage: 45,608
MILES 4,890 HRS.

1 EA $3,601.00

Chagga Americano, LLC.

48
2016 CHEVROLET SILVERADO CREW CAB 2WD T-3231
VIN #1GC1CUEG9GF192440 Mileage: 264,784
(#48 - BAD TRANSMISSION - TOW OUT)

1 EA $2,627.00

Liberty Motors

49

2016 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 VAN T-3032
VIN #1GCZGGFG5G1118713 Mileage: 163,398
(#49 - MILEAGE APPROXIMATE - TOTAL WRECK - NO KEY
- SALVAGE TITLE - TOW OUT)

1 EA $1,291.00

Hazelton Equipment
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50
2014 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 REG. CAB 4WD T-2844
VIN #1GC0KVCG0EF106548 Mileage: 999,999
(#50 - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)

1 EA $525.00

Jersey One Auto Sales

51
2012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 VAN T-2539
VIN #1GCZGTCG2C1112343 Mileage: 118,760
(#51 - BAD TRANSMISSION - TOW-OUT)

1 EA $2,891.00

Hazelton Equipment

52
2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3656
VIN #1GNSKDEC9JR364841 Mileage: 151,395
(#52 - BAD ENGINE - TOW OUT)

1 EA $5,359.00

Economy Auto

53 2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3653
VIN #1GNSKDEC3JR365287 Mileage: 145,706 1 EA $5,659.00

Economy Auto

54
2016 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3309
VIN #1GNSKDEC8GR408756 Mileage: 185,226
(#54 - BAD TRANSMISSION - TOW OUT)

1 EA $3,569.00

Economy Auto

55
2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3490
VIN #1GNSKDEC2HR319850 Mileage: 150,102
(#55- INOPERABLE - NO START - TOW OUT)

1 EA $3,569.00

Economy Auto

56
2013 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV SSV 4WD T-2719
VIN #1GNSK2E02DR185636 Mileage: 148,823
(#56 - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)

1 EA $2,255.00

Jersey One Auto Sales

57
2013 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 2WD T-2764
VIN #1GNLC2E03DR285696 Mileage: 128,847
(#57 - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)

1 EA $1,316.00

Liberty Motors

58
2021 DODGE DURANGO SUV SSV 4WD T-50010
VIN #1C4SDJFT8MC764302 Mileage: 17,941
(#58 - TOTAL WRECK - SALVAGE TITLE - TOW OUT)

1 EA $2,500.00

Mallory Kenney

59
2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3469
VIN #1GNSKDEC8HR321778 Mileage: 129,635
(#59 - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)

1 EA $4,449.00

Economy Auto

60
2015 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3116
VIN #1GNSK2EC9FR680509 Mileage: 145,744
(#60 - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)

1 EA $2,569.00

Economy Auto
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61

2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3874
VIN #1GNSKDEC3LR229793 Mileage: 64,373
(#61 - TOTAL WRECK - SALVAGE TITLE - MISSING ENGINE
& TRANSMISSION - TOW OUT)

1 EA $2,676.00

Mark Pajor

62
2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3516
VIN #1GNSKDECXHR317456 Mileage: 122,445
(#62 - MISSING BODY & ENGINE PARTS - TOW OUT)

1 EA $3,752.00

Mark Pajor

63
2013 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 2WD T-2768
VIN #1GNLC2E05DR285764 Mileage: 124,171
(#63 - BAD FRONT END - TOW OUT)

1 EA $1,555.00

Jersey One Auto Sales

64
2012 GMC CANYON EXTRA CAB PICKUP 4WD T-2636
VIN #1GTJ6LFE6C8151857 Mileage: 103,489
(#64 - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)

1 EA $1,555.55

Robert Pinksy

65
2012 CHEVROLET SILVERADO REG. CAB 2WD T-2529
VIN #1GCNCPEX2CZ165267 Mileage: 81,460
(#65 - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)

1 EA $777.00

Mark Pajor

66

2021 DODGE DURANGO SUV SSV 4WD T-50007
VIN #1C4SDJFT1MC764299 Mileage: UNK
(#66 - SALVAGE TITLE - MISSING DRIVETRAIN & MANY 
BODY PANELS - TOW-OUT)

1 EA $314.00

Liberty Motors

67
2016 DODGE CHARGER 4-DOOR SEDAN AWD A-3304
VIN #2C3CDXKT1GH268213 Mileage: 143,901
(#67 - MISSING TRANSMISSION - TOW OUT)

1 EA $1,418.00

Liberty Motors

68

2018 DODGE CHARGER 4-DOOR SEDAN AWD A-3348
VIN #2C3CDXKT9JH323885 Mileage: 70,375
(#68 - SALVAGE TITLE - COLLISION DAMAGE W/AIRBAG 
DEPLOYMENT - TOW OUT)

1 EA $4,100.00

Julian Torres

69

2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3484
VIN #1GNSKDEC3HR315564 Mileage: 210,926
(#69 - BAD STARTER, MISSING TRANSMISSION - TOW 
OUT)

1 EA $1,755.00

Jersey One Auto Sales

70
2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3658
VIN #1GNSKDEC4JR361653 Mileage: 124,289
(#70 - MISSING REAR BUMPER)

1 EA $8,421.50

Zoom Auto Group
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71
2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3639
VIN #1GNSKDEC1 JR362162 Mileage: 122,684
(#71 - INOPERABLE - MISSING FRONT DOORS - TOW OUT)

1 EA $5,699.00

Mark Reddick

72
2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3479
VIN #1GNSKDEC9HR317528 Mileage: 124,125
(#72 - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)

1 EA $3,789.00

Economy Auto

73
2016 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 CREW CAB 2WD T-3233
VIN #1GC1CUEG4GF189736 Mileage: 36,821
(#73 - EXTENSIVE COLLISION DAMAGE - TOW OUT)

1 EA $4,761.11

Robert Pinksy

74 2004 INTL7400 SYD SIDE DUMP VIN #1HTWDAZR55J151457 T-1955
Mileage: 24,023 (#74 - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT) 1 EA $2,779.00

A & A Truck Parts

75

2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 4WD T-3487
VIN #1GNSKDEC7HR318967 Mileage: 160,709
(#75 - INOPERABLE - MISSING BODY & ENGINE PARTS, 
MISSING TRANSMISSION - TOW OUT)

1 EA $2,269.00

Economy Auto

76

2015 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV PPV 2WD T-3101
VIN #1GNLC2EC2FR687366 Mileage: 122,265
(#76 - MISSING FRONT BUMPER, GRILLE & LIGHTS - TOW 
OUT)

1 EA $1,255.00

Jersey One Auto Sales

77
2018 FORD Fl 50 EXTRA CAB PICKUP 4WD T-3605
VIN #1FTEX1E58JKE40517 Mileage: 298,303
(#77 - MISFIRE - BODY DAMAGE)

1 EA $1,755.00

Jersey One Auto Sales

78 2010 JOHN DEERE 624K LOADER R-7658
VIN #1DW624KHKA0633301 3,958 HRS. 1 EA Minimum Bid

$25,500.00 $42,555.00

Alpine Deere

79 2001 JOHN DEERE 486E 4WD 3-TON FORKLIFT R-5635
SER #T0486EX891928 1382 HRS. 1 EA Minimum Bid

$8,000.00 $10,900.00

Township of Lawrence

80
1993 VERMEER V-450 TRENCHER R-4630
VIN #2D4RN4DEXAR318966 73 HRS.
(#80 - INOPERABLE)

1 EA $3,100.00

James Catalano

81 2009 BRUSH BANDIT 250 XP CHIPPER R-7411
VIN #4FMUS16148R023247 1,022 HRS. 1 EA $13,548.22

Alpine Deere



91-PC-32 (REV.2T)
SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY

Page 8 of 12

INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE:

24-S-1 March 27,2024 QUOTATION FORM
NAME OF BIDDER:

ITEM 
NO. ARTICLES FOR SALE NUMBER OF 

UNITS
UNIT OF 

MEASURE
PRICE BID PER 

UNIT TOTAL PRICE BID

82 2004 VERMEER BC-1800XL CHIPPER R-6160
VIN #1VRY131Z051000614 3,164 HRS 1 EA $6,659.00

Alpine Deere

83 2010 WANCO WTSP SOLAR ARROW BOARD R-7505
VIN #5F11S101XA1002846 1 EA $591.00

Hazelton Equipment

84 2017 NO-RAMP U-19 7-TON TRAILER R-9726
VIN #1K9BD2022H1332366 (#84 - COLLISION DAMAGE) 1 EA $1,725.00

Shaun Gural

85 1991 CENTREVILLE TA0817-6M 3-TON TRAILER R-4198
VIN #1C9ST2221M1193084 1 EA $525.00

Shaun Gural

86 1991 CENTREVILLE TA0817-6M 3-TON TRAILER R-4196
VIN #1C9ST2225M1193072 1 EA $300.00

Scenic Land Design
87 2013 WOODS BB840XP T ROTARY MOWER SER #1250881 R-8381 1 EA $1,050.00

Shaun Gural
88 2013 WOODS BB840XP T ROTARY MOWER SER #1250883 R-8378 1 EA $1,125.00

Shaun Gural
89 2013 WOODS BB840XP T ROTARY MOWER SER #1250882 R-8388 1 EA $2,668.79

Mike Mulrain
90 2013 WOODS BB840XP T ROTARY MOWER SER #1250885 R-8387 1 EA $1,005.00

Battiato Farms
91 2013 WOODS BB840XP T ROTARY MOWER SER #1250888 R-8376 1 EA $2,668.79

Mike Mulrain
92 2013 WOODS BB840XP 7’ ROTARY MOWER SER #1250884 R-8384 1 EA $725.00

Shaun Gural

93 2012 WOODS BW1800X 15’ BAT WING MOWER R-8176
SER #1221892 1 EA $1,509.00

Allen Raimi

94 2012 WOODS BW1800X 15’ BAT WING MOWER R-8174
SER #1222909 1 EA $3,025.00

Shaun Gural

95 2012 WOODS BW1800X 15’ BAT WING MOWER R-8182
SER #1221898 1 EA $3,100.00

Shaun Gural

96 2012 WOODS BW1800X 15’ BAT WING MOWER R-8180
SER #1221897 1 EA $1,825.00

Shaun Gural
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97 2012 WOODS BW1800X 15’ BAT WING MOWER R-8181
SER #1221896 1 EA $1,509.00

Allen Raimi

98 2012 WOODS BW1800X 15’ BAT WING MOWER R-8179
SER #1221894 1 EA $1,525.00

Shaun Gural

99 2012 WOODS BW1800X 15’ BAT WING MOWER R-8173
SER #1221895 1 EA $3,505.00

James Catalano
100 2005 VALK RV-903-104PR 9’ SNOW PLOW SER #30175 R-6282 1 EA $788.00

Joseph DeFino Trucking
101 2006 VALK RVS-1142 11 ’ SNOW PLOW SER #31607 R-6851 1 EA $104.00

Alpine Deere
102 1996 VALK RVS-1142 11 ’ SNOW PLOW SER #19666 R-4940 1 EA $788.00

Joseph DeFino Trucking

103 1978 LINCOLN SA-200 TRAILER MOUNT WELDER G-5326
SER #846469 1 EA $111.00

John VanNess
104 1987 AUTO-QUIP PDQ-60 PORTABLE DOCK LIFT G-9646 1 EA $26.00

A & A Truck Parts
105 2017 TRAXX 04773110 51” ROTOR HEAD SER #0917050412 R-9828 1 EA $78.00

A & A Truck Parts
106 2006 STORCH ST-96 MAGNETIC SWEEPER SER #S005ST096 R-6762 1 EA $200.00

Brandywine Jersey
107 1982 FERMONT 96KW GENERATOR UNK HRS. GN-0039 1 EA $200.00

Brandywine Jersey
108 1986 O’BRIEN 44KW GENERATOR SER #G3169 UNK HRS. GN-0042 1 EA $200.00

Brandywine Jersey

109 1969 INT’L ELECTRIC 125KW GENERATOR SER #73120 GN-0049
UNK HRS. 1 EA $159.00

A & A Truck Parts

110 2018 TORO 4000D 11 ’ MOWER 4WD SER #402959107 R-9970
713 HRS. 1 EA

Minimum Bid
$9,500.00 $0.00

No Bid

111 2016 TORO 4000D 11 ’ MOWER 4WD SER #316000615 R-9438
1,070 HRS. 1 EA Minimum Bid

$9,500.00 $0.00

No Bid
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112 2016 TORO 4000D 11 ’ MOWER 4WD SER #316000611 R-9440
1,077 HRS. 1 EA

Minimum Bid
$9,500.00 $0.00

No Bid

113 2018 TORO 4000D 11 ’ MOWER 4WD SER #402959131 R-9973
832 HRS. 1 EA Minimum Bid

$9,500.00 $10,675.00

John Catalano

114 2019 TORO 4000D 11 ’ MOWER 4WD SER #405433871 R-10458
337 HRS. 1 EA

Minimum Bid
$9,500.00 $11,767.00

John Catalano

115 2016 TORO 4000D 11 ’ MOWER 4WD SER #316000510 R-9437
1,106 HRS. 1 EA

Minimum Bid
$9,500.00 $10,676.00

John Catalano

116 2014 KUBOTA F2690 72” MOWER 4WD SER #10157 R-8650
1,121 HRS. 1 EA $1,555.00

Jersey One Auto Sales

117 2014 KUBOTA F2690 72” MOWER 4WD SER #10020 R-8646
1,940 HRS. 1 EA $1,949.79

Mike Mulrain

118 2013 KUBOTA F3080 72” MOWER 4WD SER #11537 R-8302
UNK HRS. 1 EA $1,055.00

Jersey One Auto Sales

119 2013 KUBOTA F3080 72” MOWER 4WD SER #11539 R-8300
UNK HRS. (#119 - INCOMPLETE - INOPERABLE) 1 EA $555.00

Jersey One Auto Sales

120 2012 KUBOTA F3080 72” MOWER 4WD SER #11158 R-8114
UNK HRS. (#120 - INOPERABLE) 1 EA $655.00

Jersey One Auto Sales

121 2014 KUBOTA F2690 72” MOWER 4WD SER #10011 R-8645
UNK HRS. (#121 - INOPERABLE) 1 EA $755.00

Jersey One Auto Sales

122
MISO. KUBOTA F3080 PARTS R-8116, R-8108 & R-7544 
SER #11132, 11153,10697
(#122 - LOT OF (3) KUBOTA FRAMES & MISC. PARTS)

1 EA $25.00

Mark Pajor

123 2007 YALE MPB040 4,000# ELEC. PALLET JACK G-12882
SER #A827NO6985S 1 EA $27.00

John VanNess

124 2007 YALE MPB040 4,000# ELEC. PALLET JACK G-21366
SER #MPB04EN24T1842 1 EA $27.00

John VanNess
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125 2003 HONDA HS724WA 24” SNOW BLOWER 71060
SER #SZBE1031025 1 EA $125.75

Alpine Deere
126 2002 GRAVELY 985117 30” BRUSH CUTTER SER #000858 R-5878 1 EA $858.79

Mike Mulrain

127 2005 HONDA EB5000XK2A 5000W GENERATOR G-18673
SER #EAKC1020906 1 EA $359.79

Mike Mulrain

128 1997 HONDA EB5000XK1 5000W GENERATOR G-13442
SER #EA73121790 1 EA $11.00

Donald Price
129 2017 STIHL HL94K 20” HEDGE TRIMMER SER #511822216 R-9586 1 EA $125.00

Yehuda Glassman
130 2019 STIHL HT103 12” POLE SAW SER #518413182 R-10328 1 EA $125.00

Yehuda Glassman
131 2018 STIHL HT103 12” POLE SAW SER #514879254 R-10048 1 EA $125.00

Yehuda Glassman
132 2015 STIHL HT101 12” POLE SAW SER #505377413 R-9246 1 EA $61.00

Rare Metal Auto
133 2011 TANAKA 14” CHAIN SAW SER #3100064 R-7978 1 EA $37.00

Rare Metal Auto
134 2015 STIHL MS391 20” CHAIN SAW SER #501992271 R-8892 1 EA $172.00

John Catalano
135 2014 STIHL MS261 16” CHAIN SAW SER #298615115 R-8582 1 EA $125.00

Yehuda Glassman
136 2018 STIHL MS261 CM 16” CHAIN SAW SER #515013364 R-10060 1 EA $125.00

Yehuda Glassman
137 2008 STIHL BR550 BACKPACK BLOWER SER #275203290 R-7090 1 EA $71.00

Rare Metal Auto
138 2005 STIHL BR420C BACKPACK BLOWER SER #265853045 R-6426 1 EA $51.00

Rare Metal Auto
139 2015 STIHL BG86 HAND HELD BLOWER SER #505265767 R-9267 1 EA $69.79

Mike Mulrain
140 2008 STIHL BG85 HAND HELD BLOWER SER #275919553 R-7136 1 EA $59.79

Mike Mulrain
141 2005 STIHL BG85 HAND HELD BLOWER SER #264589201 R-6430 1 EA $0.00

No Bid
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142 2005 STIHL BG65 HAND BLOWER SER #264743129 R-6541 1 EA $26.00
Rare Metal Auto

143 2017 STIHL FS240 TRIMMER SER #181184120 R-9693 1 EA $31.00
Rare Metal Auto

144 2013 STIHL FS250 TRIMMER SER #291686881 R-8430 1 EA $31.00

Rare Metal Auto
145 2019 STIHL FS240R TRIMMER SER #185643048 R-10350 1 EA $31.00

Rare Metal Auto
146 2017 STIHL FS240 TRIMMER SER #181910448 R-9690 1 EA $26.00

Rare Metal Auto
147 2010 STIHL FS250R TRIMMER SER #283293416 R-7478 1 EA $26.00

Rare Metal Auto
148 2008 STIHL FS250R TRIMMER SER #275704918 R-7074 1 EA $35.00

Donald Price
149 2013 STIHL FS250 TRIMMER SER #291686905 R-8437 1 EA $100.00

Tristan Roldan
150 2013 STIHL FS250 TRIMMER SER #291686623 R-8429 1 EA $26.00

Rare Metal Auto
151 2017 STIHL FS240R TRIMMER SER #182269681 R-9706 1 EA $42.00

Donald Price
152 2009 STIHL FS250 TRIMMER SER #278123712 R-7180 1 EA $42.00

Donald Price
153 2010 STIHL FS250R TRIMMER SER #284664258 R-7773 1 EA $26.00

Rare Metal Auto

154 (1) PALLET MISO. UNDERGOUND UTILITY LOCATING 
INSTRUMENTS

1 EA $2,500.00

Frank Malletto
155 (1) PALLET MISC. FORD & DODGE AUTO PARTS 1 EA $117.00

Rare Metal Auto
156 (1) PALLET MISC. 2014-2016 CHEVROLET CAPRICE PARTS 1 EA $275.00

Mark Reddick


