
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T500.719 Letting Date: 12/19/2023

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $31,250.00 $31,250.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $187,500.00 $187,500.00

3 106-N0001 50,000.00 USD Permit Fees (NO-BID) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

4 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

5 108-0001 1,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00

6 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $62,500.00 $62,500.00

7 202-0002 2,600.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $135.00 $351,000.00 $100.00 $260,000.00

8 202-0009 15,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00

9 203-0002 350.00 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $150.00 $52,500.00 $106.25 $37,187.50

10 206-0003 103.00 C.Y. Trench Excavation, Earth $150.00 $15,450.00 $112.50 $11,587.50

11 207-0001 809.00 Ton Riprap Stone Slope Protection, 12in Thick, (D50=6in) $350.00 $283,150.00 $162.50 $131,462.50

12 207-0004 12.00 Ton RipRap Stone Aprons, 12in Thick(D50=6in) $350.00 $4,200.00 $162.50 $1,950.00

13 207-N0006 21.00 Ton Riprap Stone Scour Hole, 12in Thick (D50-6in) $350.00 $7,350.00 $162.50 $3,412.50

14 208-0006 6.00 C.Y. Hay Bales $25.00 $150.00 $12.50 $75.00

15 208-0008 832.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence $5.00 $4,160.00 $15.00 $12,480.00

16 208-0013 148.00 L.F. Floating Turbidity Barriers $55.00 $8,140.00 $31.25 $4,625.00

17 208-0024 32.00 Ton Construction Driveway $150.00 $4,800.00 $125.00 $4,000.00

18 208-N0001 1.00 Each Concrete Washout Facility $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,250.00 $6,250.00

19 213-0002 43.00 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $100.00 $4,300.00 $75.00 $3,225.00

20 299-N0001 1.00 L.S. Dewatering $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $156,250.00 $156,250.00

21 301-0002 15.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6in Thick $50.00 $750.00 $62.50 $937.50

22 302-0002 40.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course $300.00 $12,000.00 $343.75 $13,750.00

23 302-0004 5.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course $300.00 $1,500.00 $343.75 $1,718.75

24 302-N0007 41.00 GAL Trackless Tack Coat $50.00 $2,050.00 $1.25 $51.25

25 305-0006 252.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2in Depth $50.00 $12,600.00 $12.50 $3,150.00

26 305-0008 22.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Variable Depth $50.00 $1,100.00 $12.50 $275.00

27 502-0001 71.00 L.F. 12 Inch HDPE Pipe, Drainage $100.00 $7,100.00 $100.00 $7,100.00

28 502-0010 95.00 L.F. 24 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class III $200.00 $19,000.00 $300.00 $28,500.00

29 502-0021 2.00 Each 24-inch Reinforced Concrete Flared End Section $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,375.00 $8,750.00

30 502-0201 4.00 Each 12 Inch HDPE Flared End Section $1,500.00 $6,000.00 $625.00 $2,500.00

31 502-0251 810.00 L.F. Cleaning Existing Storm Drains $75.00 $60,750.00 $162.50 $131,625.00

32 503-N0003 3.00 Each Cleaning Existing Drainage Structures $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $1,875.00 $5,625.00

33 504-N0004 154.00 S.Y. Concrete Gutter, 6 Inches Thick $350.00 $53,900.00 $1,562.50 $240,625.00

34 510-0008 50.00 L.F. Reset Beam Guide Rail $100.00 $5,000.00 $37.50 $1,875.00

35 510-0031 15.00 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide Rail $100.00 $1,500.00 $12.50 $187.50

36 514-0001 20.00 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4in Thick $200.00 $4,000.00 $187.50 $3,750.00

37 516-0011 150.00 L.F. Traffic Markings, Lines, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $5.00 $750.00 $12.50 $1,875.00

38 517-0001 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type A $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $27,000.00 $27,000.00

39 517-0007 20.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type A $1,500.00 $30,000.00 $500.00 $10,000.00

40 517-0013 8,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00

41 522-0001 10.00 Each Test Pits $500.00 $5,000.00 $125.00 $1,250.00

42 599-N0003 100,000.00 USD Project Allowances (No-Bid) $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00

43 599-N0022 13.00 Each Bollards $1,000.00 $13,000.00 $1,875.00 $24,375.00

44 601-N0107 68.00 L.F. 8 Inch Steel Casing Pipe $250.00 $17,000.00 $250.00 $17,000.00

45 601-0006 785.00 L.F. 2in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40) $50.00 $39,250.00 $150.00 $117,750.00

46 601-0015 3.00 Each Junction Box, Type C $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $4,375.00 $13,125.00

47 703-0001 2,080.00 S.Y. Topsoil $30.00 $62,400.00 $6.38 $13,270.40

48 704-0001 1,578.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $15.00 $23,670.00 $3.68 $5,807.04

49 704-0013 502.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type P $15.00 $7,530.00 $5.31 $2,665.62

50 706-0001 2,043.00 S.Y. Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting $20.00 $40,860.00 $8.69 $17,753.67

51 801-0001 1.00 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $31,250.00 $31,250.00

52 2000-N009 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $937,000.00 $937,000.00

53 2000-N015 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $450,000.00 $450,000.00 $1,428,756.00 $1,428,756.00

54 2000-N023 150,000.00 USD Force Account for Building Mechanical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00

55 2000-N025 1.00 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $885,928.00 $885,928.00

56 2000-N030 50,000.00 USD NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

57 2000-N047 1.00 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 1 $450,000.00 $450,000.00 $640,780.00 $640,780.00

58 2000-N069 40,000.00 USD Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report, Removal and Monitoring (NO-BID) $1.00 $40,000.00 $1.00 $40,000.00

$3,892,910.00 $5,978,760.73

BaseLine Item Detail ACP Contracting Inc.RML Construction, Inc.
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