New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaseLine Item Detail

Contract No. A200.784

J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Inc.

Item No. Unit Code

1 104-0001
2 104-0002
3 108-0001
4 108-N0002
5 108-N0004
6 201-0002
7 202-0002
8 202-0007
9 202-0009
10 203-0001
11 207-0041
12 207-N0004
13 208-0008
14 208-0024
15 213-0002
16 301-0002
17 302-0002
18 302-0004
19 302-0063
20 302-0071
21 303-0001
22 303-0002
23 303-N0001
24 303-N0002
25 306-0001
26 499-N0073
27 502-N0032
28 503-N0046
29 504-0011
30 506-0001
31 506-0005
32 506-N0006
33 509-0001
34 509-0006
35 510-0001
36 510-0011
37 510-0014
38 510-0018
39 510-0031
40 510-N0008
41 510-N0009
42 510-N0080
43 510-N0083
44 510-N0088
45 514-0001
46 514-N0003
47 516-0007
48 516-0009
49 517-0001
50 517-0007
51 517-0013
52 522-0001
53 532-0001
54 599-N0207
55 603-0025
56 703-0001
57 704-0001
58 704-0003
59 704-0004
60 706-0001

Qty uoM

1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
1,000.00 USD
200,000.00 USD
2,000.00 USD
1.00 L.S.
766.00 C.Y.
168.00 C.Y.
5,000.00 USD
154.00 C.Y.
52.00 Ton
250.00 Ton
128.00 L.F.
112.00 Ton
60.00 Ton
207.00 S.Y.
18.00 Ton
51.00 Ton
1,000.00 USD
92.00 L.F.
991.00 S.Y.
28.00 S.Y.
97.00 S.Y.
398.00 S.Y.
65.00 L.F.
104.00 Each
165.00 L.F.
3.00 Each
4.00 C..
132.00 L.F.
566.00 L.F.
704.00 L.F.
3.00 S.F.
3.00 Each
1,901.00 L.F.
13.00 Each
11.00 Each
9.00 Each
2,117.00 L.F.
3.00 L.F.
3.00 Each
50.00 L.F.
1.00 Each
1.00 Each
41.00 S.Y.
26.00 S.Y.
65.00 L.F.
65.00 L.F.
1.00 L.S.
8.00 Mnth
15,000.00 USD
29.00 Each
250,000.00 USD
20,000.00 USD
1.00 Each
622.00 S.Y.
453.00 S.Y.
159.00 S.Y.
10.00 S.Y.
10.00 S.Y.

Description

Construction Layout

Mobilization

Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid)
Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid)
Steel Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

Clearing and Grubbing

Roadway Excavation, Earth

Stripping Topsoil

Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid)
Embankment, Common

Riprap Stone Ditch Protection, 12in Thick (D50=6in)
Rock Backfill

Heavy Duty Silt Fence

Construction Driveway

Disposal of Regulated Material

Aggregate Base Course, 6in Thick

Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course
Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course
Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid)
Polymerized Joint Adhesive

Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick

Berm Surfacing, 6 Inches Thick

Shoulder Reconstruction

Berm Surfacing, Crushed Stone, 6 in Thick
Milled Rumble Strip

Concrete Pylon

19 In X 30 In Reinforced Concrete Elliptical Pipe, Class HE-IV
New Inlet Frame and Grate, Type Driveway Access Plate
Incidental Concrete

Concrete Curb, Type A

9in x 16in Concrete Vertical Curb

Curb Removal

Sign Panels

Relocate Sign Panels

Beam Guide Rail

Beam Guide Rail Anchorage

Parapet Connection, Type A

Tangent Guide Rail Terminal

Removal of Beam Guide Rail

Controlled Release Terminals

Controlled Release Terminal Anchorages
Beam Guide Rail, Pre-Stained

Parapet Connection, Type A, Pre-Stained
Tangent Guide Rail Terminal, Pre-Stained
Concrete Sidewalk, 4in Thick

Removal of Sidewalk

Temporary Pavement Striping

Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic
Furnish Field Office, Type A

Maintain Field Office, Type A

Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid)

Test Pits

Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid)
Utility Relocation, Electrical (PSE&G) (No-Bid)
Relocate Light Pole and Luminaire
Topsoil

Seeding, Type A

Seeding, Type C

Seeding, Type L

Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting

Unit Price
$25,000.00
$272,000.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00
$50,000.00
$125.00
$135.00
$1.00
$185.00
$275.00
$180.00
$12.00
$164.00
$75.00
$60.00
$250.00
$250.00
$1.00
$89.00
$58.00
$149.00
$425.00
$91.00
$55.00
$4,000.00
$399.00
$2,500.00
$4,000.00
$125.00
$125.00
$25.00
$100.00
$500.00
$45.00
$2,100.00
$3,900.00
$3,900.00
$5.00
$2,700.00
$3,700.00
$75.00
$7,500.00
$5,000.00
$300.00
$65.00
$27.00
$34.00
$20,000.00
$3,800.00
$1.00
$500.00
$1.00
$1.00
$25,000.00
$25.00
$5.00
$5.00
$25.00
$25.00

Line Total
$25,000.00
$272,000.00
$1,000.00
$200,000.00
$2,000.00
$50,000.00
$95,750.00
$22,680.00
$5,000.00
$28,490.00
$14,300.00
$45,000.00
$1,536.00
$18,368.00
$4,500.00
$12,420.00
$4,500.00
$12,750.00
$1,000.00
$8,188.00
$57,478.00
$4,172.00
$41,225.00
$36,218.00
$3,575.00
$416,000.00
$65,835.00
$7,500.00
$16,000.00
$16,500.00
$70,750.00
$17,600.00
$300.00
$1,500.00
$85,545.00
$27,300.00
$42,900.00
$35,100.00
$10,585.00
$8,100.00
$11,100.00
$3,750.00
$7,500.00
$5,000.00
$12,300.00
$1,690.00
$1,755.00
$2,210.00
$20,000.00
$30,400.00
$15,000.00
$14,500.00
$250,000.00
$20,000.00
$25,000.00
$15,550.00
$2,265.00
$795.00
$250.00
$250.00
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaseLine Item Detail

Contract No. A200.784

J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Inc.

Item No. Unit Code

61 801-0001
62 801-0002
63 801-0003
64 801-0018
65 801-0019
66 801-0020
67 801-NO001
68 803-0001
69 803-0002
70 803-0003
71 803-0004

Qty

uom
1.00 L.S.
260.00 L.F.
260.00 L.F.
1.00 Each
1.00 Each
5.00 Each
19.00 Each
1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.

Description

Furnishing Traffic Control Devices

Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier

Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier
Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array), 70 MPH
Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array), 70 MPH
Repair and Reset Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array) Module
Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing
Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 1
Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 2
Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 3
Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 4

Unit Price
$225,000.00
$50.00
$100.00
$10,000.00
$4,000.00
$250.00
$100.00
$30,000.00
$125,000.00
$35,000.00
$75,000.00

Line Total
$225,000.00
$13,000.00
$26,000.00
$10,000.00
$4,000.00
$1,250.00
$1,900.00
$30,000.00
$125,000.00
$35,000.00
$75,000.00
$2,774,130.00
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