
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T200.619 Letting Date: 08/24/2023

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $238,000.00 $238,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $1,085,701.80 $1,085,701.80 $2,172,000.00 $2,172,000.00 $1,346,681.20 $1,346,681.20

3 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $23,000.00 $23,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

4 108-N0002 1,000,000.00 USD Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid) $1.00 $1,000,000.00 $1.00 $1,000,000.00 $1.00 $1,000,000.00

5 109-N0002 1.00 L.S. EGIS Survey $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $18,500.00 $18,500.00 $47,000.00 $47,000.00

6 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $994,000.00 $994,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

7 202-0009 50,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

8 208-0007 17,174.00 L.F. Silt Fence $6.50 $111,631.00 $5.50 $94,457.00 $5.00 $85,870.00

9 208-0008 11,017.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence $10.00 $110,170.00 $6.00 $66,102.00 $6.00 $66,102.00

10 208-0022 66.00 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $350.00 $23,100.00 $150.00 $9,900.00 $243.00 $16,038.00

11 213-0002 4,300.00 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $20.00 $86,000.00 $65.00 $279,500.00 $30.00 $129,000.00

12 417-0084 30.00 L.F. Parapet Reconstruction Location No. 1 $5,000.00 $150,000.00 $950.00 $28,500.00 $3,200.00 $96,000.00

13 417-0089 110.00 L.F. Parapet Reconstruction, Location No. 2 $4,700.00 $517,000.00 $950.00 $104,500.00 $3,200.00 $352,000.00

14 417-0104 112.00 S.Y. Catches $550.00 $61,600.00 $200.00 $22,400.00 $1,400.00 $156,800.00

15 510-0008 5,375.00 L.F. Reset Beam Guide Rail $29.00 $155,875.00 $30.00 $161,250.00 $16.00 $86,000.00

16 516-0007 1,035.00 L.F. Temporary Pavement Striping $4.00 $4,140.00 $5.00 $5,175.00 $3.00 $3,105.00

17 517-0002 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type B $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $45,100.00 $45,100.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

18 517-0008 29.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $3,000.00 $87,000.00 $2,150.00 $62,350.00 $2,500.00 $72,500.00

19 517-0013 8,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00

20 522-0001 10.00 Each Test Pits $525.00 $5,250.00 $750.00 $7,500.00 $100.00 $1,000.00

21 524-0008 1 Each Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators (Cartridge) $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00

22 524-0044 3 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Cartridge) $7,500.00 $22,500.00 $6,500.00 $19,500.00 $7,200.00 $21,600.00

23 524-N0058 1 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Cartridge), 5 Bays, 24 in Wide $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $12,100.00 $12,100.00 $29,300.00 $29,300.00

24 531-0001 100,000.00 USD Force Account for Snow Removal (No-Bid) $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00

25 599-N0103 7,500.00 L.F. Transite Duct Removal $22.00 $165,000.00 $45.00 $337,500.00 $39.00 $292,500.00

26 601-0003 336,944.00 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $1.50 $505,416.00 $7.00 $2,358,608.00 $6.60 $2,223,830.40

27 601-0007 18,618.00 L.F. #1/0 A.W.G. Ground Wire $1.50 $27,927.00 $8.00 $148,944.00 $6.30 $117,293.40

28 601-0009 111,696.00 L.F. 3in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40) $17.00 $1,898,832.00 $25.00 $2,792,400.00 $27.00 $3,015,792.00

29 601-0011 2 Each Lighting Manhole $15,000.00 $30,000.00 $15,000.00 $30,000.00 $28,800.00 $57,600.00

30 601-0012 3,858.00 L.F. 3in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 80) $38.00 $146,604.00 $70.00 $270,060.00 $90.00 $347,220.00

31 601-0014 290 Each Junction Box Foundation, Type 1 $5,150.00 $1,493,500.00 $4,300.00 $1,247,000.00 $7,300.00 $2,117,000.00

32 601-0015 63.00 Each Junction Box, Type C $4,950.00 $311,850.00 $3,600.00 $226,800.00 $7,100.00 $447,300.00

33 601-0019 1,548.00 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Ground Wire $1.85 $2,863.80 $4.20 $6,501.60 $4.60 $7,120.80

34 601-0020 252 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Ground Wire $1.75 $441.00 $3.20 $806.40 $3.70 $932.40

35 601-0021 1,490.00 L.F. #10 A.W.G. Ground Wire $1.65 $2,458.50 $3.00 $4,470.00 $3.30 $4,917.00

36 601-0050 63,129.00 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Ground Wire $2.00 $126,258.00 $6.20 $391,399.80 $5.40 $340,896.60

37 601-0056 2,123.00 L.F. #6 A.W.G. Ground Wire $1.80 $3,821.40 $3.50 $7,430.50 $4.00 $8,492.00

38 601-0069 326 L.F. 2-Way Duct Bank, 3in HDPE Conduits Directional Drilled $600.00 $195,600.00 $250.00 $81,500.00 $900.00 $293,400.00

39 601-0103 160 L.F. 3in Rigid Metallic Conduit, Underground $125.00 $20,000.00 $75.00 $12,000.00 $116.00 $18,560.00

40 601-0146 706.00 L.F. #4/0 A.W.G. Power Cable $16.00 $11,296.00 $13.00 $9,178.00 $14.70 $10,378.20

41 601-N0002 3,388.00 L.F. #10 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $2.00 $6,776.00 $3.50 $11,858.00 $3.80 $12,874.40

42 601-N0004 4,882.00 L.F. #6 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $2.25 $10,984.50 $3.60 $17,575.20 $4.80 $23,433.60

43 601-N0010 2.00 Each Load Center Cabinet, Type F, Voltage 277/480V $62,000.00 $124,000.00 $45,000.00 $90,000.00 $63,000.00 $126,000.00

44 601-N0022 103,550.00 L.F. #1/0 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable $4.00 $414,200.00 $9.50 $983,725.00 $8.50 $880,175.00

45 601-N0061 652.00 L.F. 3in Rigid Metallic Conduit, PVC Coated, Exposed $180.00 $117,360.00 $100.00 $65,200.00 $240.00 $156,480.00

46 601-N0104 1 L.S. Electrical Studies $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00

47 602-0005 2 Each Meter Cabinet, Type F, Voltage 277/480V $23,800.00 $47,600.00 $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $27,000.00 $54,000.00

48 602-N0004 1 L.S. Power Distribution Cabinet Modification $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,900.00 $2,900.00

49 602-N0050 3 Each Manual Transfer Switch $40,000.00 $120,000.00 $25,000.00 $75,000.00 $21,000.00 $63,000.00

50 602-N0083 1 L.S. Power Distribution Panel Modification $5,700.00 $5,700.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $2,900.00 $2,900.00

51 603-0006 37.00 Each Type LP4 Luminaire $1,475.00 $54,575.00 $2,150.00 $79,550.00 $3,700.00 $136,900.00

52 603-0007 133 Each Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-40 $6,900.00 $917,700.00 $4,325.00 $575,225.00 $6,800.00 $904,400.00

53 603-0008 137 Each Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-26 $4,800.00 $657,600.00 $3,700.00 $506,900.00 $5,200.00 $712,400.00

54 603-0009 44 Each Type LP5 Luminaire $4,500.00 $198,000.00 $2,150.00 $94,600.00 $3,900.00 $171,600.00

55 603-0012 21 Each Lighting Standard, Type L-MG2-40 $7,600.00 $159,600.00 $5,800.00 $121,800.00 $7,600.00 $159,600.00

56 603-0017 24 Each Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-40-SB $15,700.00 $376,800.00 $6,600.00 $158,400.00 $14,500.00 $348,000.00

57 603-0022 50 Each Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-26-SB $15,200.00 $760,000.00 $6,400.00 $320,000.00 $14,000.00 $700,000.00

58 603-0041 44.00 Each Type LP8 Luminaire $4,900.00 $215,600.00 $2,200.00 $96,800.00 $4,300.00 $189,200.00

59 603-0042 133.00 Each Type LP9 Luminaire $4,585.00 $609,805.00 $2,100.00 $279,300.00 $3,900.00 $518,700.00

60 603-0043 16 Each Type LP1 Luminaire $4,600.00 $73,600.00 $1,760.00 $28,160.00 $4,300.00 $68,800.00

BaseLine Item Detail HBC Company Inc Daidone Electric, Inc.PKF-Mark III, Inc.
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61 603-0058 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 1 $53,000.00 $53,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00

62 603-0062 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation Str. No. 2 $46,000.00 $46,000.00 $16,500.00 $16,500.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00

63 603-0063 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 3 $42,000.00 $42,000.00 $39,500.00 $39,500.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00

64 603-0064 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 4 $255,000.00 $255,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $293,000.00 $293,000.00

65 603-0078 1.00 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 5 $465,000.00 $465,000.00 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $586,000.00 $586,000.00

66 603-0080 1.00 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 6 $267,000.00 $267,000.00 $195,000.00 $195,000.00 $293,000.00 $293,000.00

67 603-0081 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 7 $38,000.00 $38,000.00 $28,500.00 $28,500.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

68 603-0082 1.00 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 8 $53,000.00 $53,000.00 $38,500.00 $38,500.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00

69 603-0090 21.00 Each Type LP3 Luminaire $4,400.00 $92,400.00 $2,100.00 $44,100.00 $3,700.00 $77,700.00

70 603-0105 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 9 $105,000.00 $105,000.00 $49,000.00 $49,000.00 $90,000.00 $90,000.00

71 603-0106 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 10 $23,000.00 $23,000.00 $15,800.00 $15,800.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

72 603-0107 1 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 11 $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

73 603-0114 1.00 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 12 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $18,900.00 $18,900.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

74 603-0115 1.00 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 13 $73,000.00 $73,000.00 $30,100.00 $30,100.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00

75 603-0116 1.00 L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 14 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

76 603-0117 1.00 Each Lighting Standard, Type L-15-NS4 $5,350.00 $5,350.00 $3,400.00 $3,400.00 $5,800.00 $5,800.00

77 603-N0016 1 L.S. Temporary Lighting Systems, Location No. 1 $483,000.00 $483,000.00 $490,000.00 $490,000.00 $352,000.00 $352,000.00

78 603-N0017 1 L.S. Temporary Lighting Systems, Location No. 2 $1,528,000.00 $1,528,000.00 $1,480,000.00 $1,480,000.00 $1,650,000.00 $1,650,000.00

79 603-N0026 161.00 Each Type LP2 Luminaire $4,300.00 $692,300.00 $1,900.00 $305,900.00 $3,500.00 $563,500.00

80 603-N0064 2 Each Aviation Beacon (IWD) $5,900.00 $11,800.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $3,100.00 $6,200.00

81 603-N0065 55 Each FAA Luminaire, 25W $2,650.00 $145,750.00 $1,600.00 $88,000.00 $3,300.00 $181,500.00

82 603-N0066 5 Each Lighting Standard, Type L-15-NS1 $5,075.00 $25,375.00 $3,200.00 $16,000.00 $5,800.00 $29,000.00

83 603-N0067 300,000.00 USD Custom Lighting Control Interface (No Bid) $1.00 $300,000.00 $1.00 $300,000.00 $1.00 $300,000.00

84 603-N0068 1 L.S. Lighting Controls at Location No. 1 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $35,100.00 $35,100.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

85 603-N0069 1 L.S. Lighting Controls at Location No. 2 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $26,000.00 $26,000.00

86 703-0001 606 S.Y. Topsoil $18.00 $10,908.00 $15.00 $9,090.00 $6.00 $3,636.00

87 704-0001 606.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $4.50 $2,727.00 $4.00 $2,424.00 $2.00 $1,212.00

88 801-0001 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $23,000.00 $23,000.00 $610,000.00 $610,000.00 $550,000.00 $550,000.00

89 801-0002 10,720.00 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $35.00 $375,200.00 $50.00 $536,000.00 $76.00 $814,720.00

90 801-0003 48,380.00 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $19.00 $919,220.00 $37.00 $1,790,060.00 $38.00 $1,838,440.00 

91 801-0009 2 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $17,000.00 $34,000.00 $16,000.00 $32,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 

92 801-0020 3 Each Repair and Reset Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array) Module $7,500.00 $22,500.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $1,300.00 $3,900.00 

93 801-0027 2 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array), 45 MPH $4,500.00 $9,000.00 $3,800.00 $7,600.00 $3,400.00 $6,800.00 

94 801-0029 4 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array), 60 MPH $5,200.00 $20,800.00 $5,500.00 $22,000.00 $4,700.00 $18,800.00 

95 801-0030 8 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array), 45 MPH $5,000.00 $40,000.00 $2,600.00 $20,800.00 $4,700.00 $37,600.00 

96 801-0033 15 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array), 60 MPH $5,000.00 $75,000.00 $3,500.00 $52,500.00 $4,700.00 $70,500.00 

97 801-N0001 25 Each Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing $4,100.00 $102,500.00 $9,500.00 $237,500.00 $4,000.00 $100,000.00 

98 801-N0002 119 Each Installation, Maintenance and Removal of Shoulder Closing $2,200.00 $261,800.00 $3,500.00 $416,500.00 $2,300.00 $273,700.00 

99 801-N0003 1 Day Placing and Removing Portable Variable Message Sign $1,825.00 $1,825.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 

100 803-0032 1 USD Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid) $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 

101 803-N0001 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways $84,000.00 $84,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 

$21,517,691.00 $23,999,199.50 $26,960,000.00
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