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INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
23-S-2 september 19,2023 QUOTATION FORM
ITEM ARTICLES FOR SALE NU'\(;IFBER USIFIT PR'PCIERBlD L%Tléé
NO. UNITS MEAS. UNIT BID
1.|2015 Chevrolet Caprice 4-Door Sedan, VIN #6G3NS5R26FL128593  A-32661 EA. $2,789.00
Mileage: 178,155  (#1 ENGINE MISFIRE - TOW OUT)
ECONOMY AUTO
2.| 2016 Chevrolet Caprice 4 Door Sedan, VIN #6G3NS5R24GL236339  A-3307 | 1 EA. $3,265.00
Mileage: 153,635
ECONOMY AUTO
3. 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 2WD VIN #1GNLC2EC7FR686701 T-3094 | 1 EA. $4,611.00
Mileage: 161,253
ECONOMY AUTO
4.]2011 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 2WD VIN #1GNLC2E06BR382663 T-2380 | 1 EA. $2,360.00

Mileage: 106,158

JERSEY ONE AUTO

5.]/2016 Chevrolet Caprice 4 Door Sedan, VIN #6G3NS5R25GL237466  A-3316| 1 EA. $2,631.00

Mileage: 114,002 (#5 INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)

LIBERTY MOTORS

6.|2016 Chevrolet Caprice 4 Door Sedan, VIN #6G3NS5R23GL235442  A-3308 | 1 EA. $2,288.00

Mileage: 151,668 (#6 INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)

MARK REDDICK

7.12017 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 4WD VIN #1GNSKDEC2HR316043 T-3476 1 EA. $4,780.00

Mileage: 163,575

(#7 MISSING CATALYTIC CONVERTERS - MISSING BODY PARTS - TOW OUT)

ECONOMY AUTO

8.12017 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 4WD VIN #1GNSKDEC6HR320435 T-3518 | 1 EA. $4,730.00

Mileage: 125,989

(#8 MISSING BODY PARTS - BAD TRANSMISSION - TOW OUT)

ECONOMY AUTO
9. 12015 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 2WD VIN #1GNLC2EC9FR682519 T-3098 1 EA. $3,811.00
Mileage: 133,746 (#9 BAD TRANSMISSION - BODY DAMAGE - TOW OUT)
ECONOMY AUTO
10. | 2013 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 2WD VIN #1GNLC2E03DR285696 T-2764 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
. . $5,500.00 NO BID
Mileage: 128,847
NO BID

11.12014 Chevrolet Caprice 4 Door Sedan, VIN #6G3NS5R24EL983971 A-3205 1 EA. | Minimum Bid

$4,727.00
Mileage: 144,628 $4,500.00

PETER WHITE
12.|2016 Ford Explorer SUV, 4WD VIN #1FM5K8B88GGA47369 T-3140 1 EA. | Minimum Bid

NO BID
Mileage: 135,821  (#12 INOPERABLE - BAD ENGINE - TOW ouT) NO BID $5,500.00
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13.

2018 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 4WD VIN #1GNSKDEC1JR363280

T-3660

1 EA.

$6,380.00

Mileage: 142,836 (#13 BAD HEAD GASKETS - BODY DAMAGE - TOW OUT)

ECONOMY AUTO

14.

2016 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 4WD VIN #1GNSKDEC7GR409221

T-3304

$4,175.00

Mileage: 150,034 (#14 BAD ENGINE - TOW OUT)

ECONOMY AUTO

15.

2015 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup, 4WD VIN #1FTEX1E89FFB71132

T-3040

Mileage: 152,231

Minimum Bid
$7,500.00

$8,321.00

Z0O0OM AUTO GROUP LLC

16.

2015 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup, 4WD VIN #1FTEX1E84FFB71121

T-3043

Mileage: 194,632

Minimum Bid
$7,500.00

$8,778.00

KAYLYNN FLORES

17.

2016 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 4WD VIN #1GNSKDEC3GR408728

T-3292

Mileage: 129,733

Minimum Bid
$8,500.00

$10,055.00

CARLOS VERGARA

18.

2018 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 4WD VIN #1GNSKDECXJR363777

T-3666

$6,280.00

Mileage: 158,312 (#18 BAD ENGINE - TOW OUT)

ECONOMY AUTO

19.

2012 GMC Sierra 2500HD Crew Cab Pickup, 2WD

T-2427

$2,916.00

VIN #1GT11ZCG4CF113630 Mileage: 105,987

(#19 BODY DAMAGE)

LIBERTY MOTORS

20.

2012 GMC Sierra 2500HD Crew Cab Pickup, 2WD

T-2429

$5,288.00

VIN #1GT11ZCG1CF113620 Mileage: 72,554

(#20 BAD TRANSMISSION, NO SEATS, TOW OUT)

BEAVER CONCRETE

21.

2015 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD Pickup, 2WD

T-2970

$2,780.00

VIN #1GC1CUEG4FF141300 Mileage: 99,984

(#21 BODY DAMAGE - BAD TRANSMISSION - TOW OUT)

ECONOMY AUTO

22.

2012 GMC Canyon Extra Cab Pickup, 4WD

T-2644

VIN #1GTJ6LFEOC8153331 Mileage: 118,444

Minimum Bid
$3,000.00

$5,001.00

A BETTER DEAL INC.

23.

2012 Chevrolet Colorado Extra Cab Pickup, 4WD

T-2578

VIN #1GCJTBFE5C8122708 Mileage: 123,716

Minimum Bid
$4,000.00

$7,250.00

RICHARD LOVERO

24.

2012 GMC Canyon Extra Cab Pickup, 4WD

T-2639

VIN #1GTJ6LFE3C8151900 Mileage: 146,793

Minimum Bid
$5,500.00

NO BID
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25.

2016 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup, 4WD VIN #1FTEX1EF3GKD66246  T-3061

1 EA.

$3,810.03

Mileage: 248,861 (#25 BAD FRAME - TOW OUT)

VINCENT MARTINI

26.

2017 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 4WD VIN #1GNSKDEC2HR320626 T-3502

$5,869.00

Mileage: 92,587

(#26 BAD ENGINE & TRANSMISSION - MISSING BODY PARTS - TOW OUT)

ED RIBOT

27.

2015 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 4WD VIN #1GNSK2EC3FR683311 T-3131

$4,675.00

Mileage: 141,183 (#27 BODY DAMAGE)

ECONOMY AUTO

28.

2016 Chevrolet Caprice 4-Door Sedan, VIN #6G3NS5R24GL235451 A-3314

$2,500.00

Mileage: 124,898 (#28 BAD TRANSMISSION - TOW OUT)

PARK AUTO AND PERFORMANCE

29.

2012 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 4WD VIN #1GNSK2E00CR156005 T-2363

Mileage: 134,685

Minimum Bid
$7,500.00

NO BID

NO BID

30.

2012 Chevrolet Silverado Reg. Cab Pickup, 2WD T-2489

$2,121.00

VIN #1GCNCPEX2CZ164670 Mileage: 180,779

Z0O0OM AUTO GROUP LLC

31.

2017 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, VIN #1GNSKDEC2HR316849 T-3507

$5,780.00

Mileage: 134,692 (#31 MISSING BODY PARTS - TOW OUT)

ECONOMY AUTO

32.

2015 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 4WD VIN #1GNSK2ECXFR683354 T-3130

Mileage: 177,552

Minimum Bid
$6,500.00

$6,667.00

ED RIBOT

33.

2018 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 4WD VIN #1GNSKDEC4JR363290 T-3667

$7,780.00

Mileage: 132,067 (#33 MISSING BODY PARTS - BAD ENGINE)

ECONOMY AUTO

34.

2016 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 4WD VIN #1GNSKDEC0GR407312 T-3291

$5,858.00

Mileage: 178,380

LIBERTY MOTORS

35.

2020 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 4WD VIN #1GNSKDEC6LR228976 T-3849

Mileage: 147,931 (#35 BODY DAMAGE)

Minimum Bid
$8,500.00

$10,300.00

ECONOMY AUTO

36.

2012 Chevrolet Colorado Extra Cab Pickup, 4WD T-2584

$3,500.00

VIN #1GCJTBFE9C8122727 Mileage: 111,439

(#36 BAD TRANSMISSION, TOW OUT) HILLSIDE ESTATES
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37.| 2004 International 7400 6 YD. Dump Truck, T-1787 | 1 EA. $2,287.00
VIN #1HTWDADR34J085786 Mileage: UNK
(#37 INOPERABLE - NO KEY- TOW OUT)
DEVINO TRUCKS AND PARTS
38.| 1996 FORD F-800 Boom Crane Truck, VIN #1FDYF80E4TVA15678 TP-103225| 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
Mileage: 37,888 Hours:4,135 $11,500.00 |NO BID
NO BID
39.| 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 4WD VIN #1GNSK2EC6FR685005 T-3133 | 1 EA. Mié‘é"’é‘& %g $11.100.00
Mileage: 139,319 s
JIMMY SOLOVEY
40.| 2013 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD, VIN #1FTEX1EMODKF06232 T-2735| 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
Mileage: 134,758 $6,500.00 [$6:821.00
ZOOM AUTO GROUP LLC
41./ 2014 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD, VIN #1FTEX1EM4EFB48658 T-2896 | 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
Mileage: 120,914 §7,500.00 [$7,821.00
ZOOM AUTO GROUP LLC
42.| 2014 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD, VIN #1FTFX1EF3EKE48026  T-2913 | 1 EA. $3,109.10
Mileage: 127,585 (#42 BAD FRAME - BODY DAMAGE - TOW OUT)
VINCENT MARTINI
43.|2017 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD, VIN #1FTEX1EFOHKD97874  T-3461 | 1 EA. $1,333.00
Mileage: 239,476 (#43 BAD REAR - MISSING BED - TOW OUT)
LIBERTY MOTORS
44.|2013 Ford F150 Ext. Cab Pickup, 4WD VIN #1FTFX1EF2DKF28173  T-2823 | 1 EA. $2,900.00
Mileage: 198,520 (#44 BAD FRAME - TOW OUT)
BARREN BALDWIN
45.| 2017 Ford Fusion 4 Door Sedan, VIN #3FA6P0G7XHR382760 A-3323| 1 EA. $1,364.00
Mileage: 58,032 (#45 TOTAL WRECK - TOW OUT)
AUTO SPORT USA
46.| 2014 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD Reg. Cab Pickup, 4WD T-2846 | 1 EA. $5,436.00
VIN #1GCOKVCG7EF106546 Mileage: N/A - Missing Instrument Cluster
(#46 INOPERABLE - MISSING INTERIOR & BODY PARTS - TOW OUT)
CHRISTOPHER MASUCCI
47.| 2016 Dodge Charger 4 Door Sedan, AWD A-3299 | 1 EA. $411.00
VIN #2C3CDXKTXGH268212 Mileage: 115,525
(#47 MISSING BODY PARTS & PANELS - NO START - TOW OUT)
LIBERTY MOTORS
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48.| 2012 Ford F-150, Ext. Cab Pickup, VIN #1FTNF1CF1CKE25603 T-2684 | 1 EA. $557.00

Mileage: 174,084 (#48 INOPERABLE - BODY DAMAGE - TOW OUT)

JERSEY ONE AUTO

49.| 2019 Dodge Charger 4 Door Sedan, AWD A-3423 | 1 EA. $4,620.00

VIN #2C3CDXKT7KH689202 Mileage: 46,158

(#49 COLLISION DAMAGE L/F - TOW OUT)

ECONOMY AUTO
50. 2018 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 4WD VIN #1GNSKDEC7JR359038 T-3652 | 1 EA. $5,880.00
Mileage: 134,134 (#50 INOPERABLE - MISSING TRANSMISSION - TOW OUT)
ECONOMY AUTO
51.]12012 GMC Sierra 2500HD Reg. Cab Pickup, 4WD w/plow T-2655 1 EA.
Minimum Bidj
VIN #1GT02ZCG4CF228866 Mileage: 97,721 $9,500.00 $11,567.00
8' Boss Snow Plow SER # BC083290 R-8078
SCOTCHWOOD DISPOSAL
52./ 2018 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, VIN #1GNSKDEC9JR362958 T-3646 1 EA. |Minimum Bid
Mileage: 160,974 (#52 BODY DAMAGE) ’
ECONOMY AUTO
53.| 2017 Chevrolet Tahoe SUV, 4WD VIN #1GNSKDECXHR321152 T-3500 1 EA. [Minimum Bid NO BID
. $8,500.00
Mileage: 180,144
NO BID
54.| 2012 Ford Escape SUV, VIN #1FMCU9DGXCKC70189 T-2602 1 EA. |Minimum Bid
. s3,50000 [NO BID
Mileage: 123,501
NO BID
55.|2012 Ford Escape SUV, VIN #1FMCU9DG8CKC70188 T-2600 1 EA. [Minimum Bid

$4,000.00
Mileage: 144,425 $3,500.00

RICARDO LOPEZ
56.] 2012 Ford Escape SUV, VIN #1FMCU9DG4CKC70186 T-2603 1 EA. |Minimum Bid NO BID

Mileage: 97,095 $4,500.00

NO BID

57.1 2016 Dodge Caravan Minivan, VIN #2C4RDGBG2GR383020 T-3324 | 1 EA. $2,067.00

Mileage: 157,102

(#57 MISSING BODY PARTS - BAD TRANSMISSION - TOW OUT)

JERSEY ONE AUTO
58. 2013 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup 4WD, VIN #1FTFX1EFXDKF28180 T-2828 | 1 EA. Minimum Bid

$7,138.00
Mileage: 119,050 $6,500.00

BEAVER CONCRETE
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59.| 2014 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD Crew Cab 2WD, T-2971 1 EA. $3,131.00
VIN #1GC1CUEG4FF141295 Mileage: 96,449
(#59 BAD ENGINE & TRANSMISSION - BODY DAMAGE - TOW OUT)
LIBERTY MOTORS
60. | 2016 Chevrolet Express 3500 Van, VIN #1GCZGGFG5G1327580 T-3259 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
Mileage: 121,442 §7,500.00 [$9:200.00
HILLSIDE ESTATES
61.| 2014 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup, 4WD VIN #1FTEX1EMXEFB48647 T-2883 1 EA. $1,219.00
Mileage : 185,060 (#61 BAD MOTOR & TRANSMISSION - TOW OUT)
LIBERTY MOTORS
62.|2014 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD Crew Cab Pickup, 2WD T-2841 1 EA $5,621.00
VIN #1GC1CVCGXEF106543 Mileage: 131,010
ZOOM AUTO GROUP LLC
63.|2012 GMC Canyon Extra Cab Pickup, 4WD T-2633 | 1 EA $3,721.00
VIN #1GTJ6LFE6C8152782 Mileage: 132,109
ZOOM AUTO GROUP LLC
64.|2016 Chevrolet Express 3500 Van, VIN #1GCZGGFG8G1326097 T-3264 | 1 EA $4,775.00
Mileage: 152,664 (#64 BAD TRANSMISSION - TOW OUT)
ECONOMY AUTO
65. | 2012 Chevrolet Express 1500 Van, VIN #1GCSGAFX1C1121715 T-2558 1 EA $4,555.00
Mileage: 117,018
(#65 INOPERABLE - NO START - FRONT END PROBLEM - TOW OUT)
AKINS AUTO SALES
66.| 2011 International 4400 w/Schwarze Model M6000TE Sweeper T1-2267 | 1 EA 1 Minimum Bid
Mileage: 45,608 Hours: 4890 Sweeper Hours: 3557 $29,500.00 [NO BID
NO BID
67.| 2013 Ford F150 Extra Cab Pickup, 4WD VIN #1FTEX1EM1DKF06238 T-2733 1 EA $1,818.00
Mileage: 183574 (#67 INOPERABLE - NO START - FRAME ROT - TOW OUT)
LIBERTY MOTORS
68.| 2001 Deere 486E A/T 4WD Forklift SER # T0485EX891930 R-5633 | 1 EA | Minimum Bid
Hours: 3,190 $7,000.00 [¥8/855.00
AKINS AUTO SALES
69. 2018 Toro 4000D 11' Mower SER #402959110 R-9968 | 1 EA | winmum Bd [\ o BID
Hours: 861 $25,000.00
NO BID
70.| 2018 Toro 4000-D 11' Mower SER # 402959119 R-9981 1 EA | Minimum Bid
Hours: UNK NO BID $25,000.00 [\© BIO
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71.12017 Toro 4000-D 11' Mower SER # 400957649 R-9604 1 EA Minimum Bid NO BI D
$25,000.00
Hours: UNK
NO BID
72.12016 Toro 4000-D 11' Mower SER # 316000513 R-9444 1 EA Minimum Bid NO BI D
$25,000.00
Hours: 708
NO BID
73.12019 Toro 400-D 11" Mower SER # 405433849 R-10459 1 EA | Minimum Bid NO BI D
$25,000.00
Hours: UNK
NO BID
74.12018 Toro 400-D 11' Mower SER # 402959112 R-9980 1 EA | Minimum Bid NO BI D
Hours: 325 $25,000.00
NO BID
75.12018 Toro 4000D 11' Mower SER # 402959113 R-9969 1 EA | Minimum Bid NO BI D
. $25,000.00
Hours: 508
NO BID
76.| 2014 Kubota F2690 72" Mower 4WD SER #10157 R-8650 1 EA. | Minimum Bid NO B| D
Hours: 1121 $25,000.00
NO BID
77.12017 Toro 4000D 11' Mower SER # 400957651 R-9595 | 1 EA._ | inimum Bid [N BID
Hours: 1,210 $9,500.00
NO BID
78.| 2016 Toro 4000D 11' Mower Ser #316000587 R-9439 | 1 EA. || Minimum Bid NO BID
Hours: 857 $25,000.00
NO BID
79. 2017 Toro 4000D 11' Mower SER # 400957638 R-9597 | 1 EA. | winimum B [\ ) B1D
Hours: 1,007 $25,000.00
NO BID
80. | 2016 Toro 4000D 11' Mower SER # 316000517 R-9436 | 1 EA._ | minimum Bid [\ BID
Hours: 863 $25,000.00
NO BID
81.| 2016 Toro 4000D 11' Mower SER # 316000625 R-9438 | 1 EA. | inimum Bid |\ B1D
Hours: 1,071 $25,000.00
NO BID
82.| 2018 Toro 4000D 11' Mower SER # 402959107 R-9970 | 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
$25,000.00 NO BI D

Hours: 713

NO BID
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83.| Onan 100KW Generator 4 cyl. Cummins SER #G870910781 G-9310| 1 EA. $2,287.00
MOD #100DGDB-L  Hours: 350
DEVINO TRUCKS AND PARTS
84. 2017 Stepp Roadway Reclaimer VIN # 4S9PH30Y9HS127057 R-9645 1 EA. $4,002.00
Hours: 1,731
ED RIBOT
85.  Eager Beaver 12 Ton Trailer, VIN #112HDB236HT120005 018709 | 1 EA. $1,000.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
86. | 1987 Hudson 4-Ton Trailer, VIN #10HHSE143H1000579 R-3698 | 1 EA. $786.00
ALPINE DEERE
87.] 2005 Cam Superline 3.5-Ton Trailer, VIN #5JPPBU202X5P010730  R-6227 | 1 EA. $600.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
88.| 2014 Woods 7' Rotary Cutter, MOD #BB840XP R-8565 | 1 EA. $100.00
GARDEN STATE IRON
89. | Wanco Solar Arrowboard, VIN # 5F11S1016A1003756 R-7702 1 EA. $500.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
90.| Wanco Solar Arrowboard, VIN #5F11S1016A1003747 R-7707 | 1 EA. $500.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
91.| Wanco 30 ft. Light Tower, VIN # 5F13D1417D1002773 R-8394 | 1 EA. $1,212.00
Hours: 1,849
LIBERTY MOTORS
92. | Wanco Solar Arrowboard, VIN #5F11S1016A1003754 R-7709 | 1 EA. $500.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
93.| Wanco Solar Arrowboard, VIN # 5F11S1019A1002840 R-7502 | 1 EA. $500.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
94. Wanco Solar Arrowboard, VIN # 5F11S1016A1003746 R-7708 1 | EA. $500.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
95.| Wanco Solar Arrowboard, VIN #5F11S1015A1002849 R-7503 | 1 EA. $500.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
96. | 2002 Valk RVS-1142 11' Manual Snow Plow SER #26672 70878 | 1 EA. $1,100.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
97./ 1991 Valk RVS-1142 11' Manual Snow Plow SER #UNK 19758 | 1 EA. $1,100.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
98.| 1994 Valk RVS-1142 11' Manual Snow Plow SER #16686 70319 | 1 EA. $1,100.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
99.| 1996 Valk RVS-1142 11' Manual Snow Plow SER #19686 R-4955 | 1 EA. $1,100.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
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100.| 1996 Valk RVS-1142 11' Manual Snow Plow SER #19089 R-4907 1 EA. $1,100.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES

101.| 1996 Valk RVS-1142 11' Manual Snow Plow SER #19672 R-4951 1 EA. $1,100.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES

102.| 1996 Valk RVS-1142 11' Manual Snow Plow SER #19679 R-4945 1 EA. $1,100.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES

1083.| 1996 Valk RVS-1142 11' Manual Snow Plow SER #19685 R-4942 1 EA. $1,100.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES

104.| 1995 Valk RVS-1142 11' Manual Snow Plow SER #17214 R-4836 1 EA. $1,100.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES

105.| 1995 Valk RVS-1142 11' Manual Snow Plow SER #17580 R-4849 1 EA. $1,100.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES

106, 1035 Gal Poly Tank SER # NONE R-5001 1 EA. $200.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES

107.| 1992 Katolight 135kw Trailer Mounted Generator G-10875 | 1 EA. $2,000.00

SER #AD202362SNH

TERCO ENTERPRISES

108. | Blue Point Oil Filter Crusher SER # 010034 G-14292 | 1 EA. $57.00
JOHN VAN NESS
109. | Toro 22160 Push Mower SER # 9900347 R-5455 1 EA. $2.00
PETER WHITE
110.| Coats Rim Clamp Tire Changer SER # 0301105367 G-15638 | 1 EA. $679.00
KEITH GADDECK
111.| Delta 20" Drill Press W/Vise SER # 9900347 (G-14888 1 EA. $209.00
ALLEN RAIMI
112.| Snap-on Parts Washer SER # 035405 G-11596 | 1 EA. $150.00
DEB HAND
113. | Miller Plasma Cutter SER # LA128808 G-14734 | 1 EA. $429.00
BEAVER CONCRETE
114.| Gas Powered Lawn Edger SER # B81899 R-6571 1 EA. $65.00
ROBERT FIORE
115.| Giant Vac Wheeled Blower SER # 071702053 R-5894 | 1 EA. NO BID
NO BID
116.| 1.5 Ton Snap-on Utility Stand SER # LA128808 G-10994 | 1 EA. $100.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
117.| Snap-on Truck Wheel Balancer SER # G41HT004 G-14874 | 1 EA. $175.00

AKINS AUTO SALES
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118.| 4 Ton Hyd. Plow Blade Jack SER # None G-20282 | 1 EA. $300.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
119.| Snap-on 2.5 Ton Hyd. End Lift Jack SER # N696W19256 G-12395| 1 EA. $109.00
ALLEN RAIMI
120.| Snap-on 1/2 Ton Engine Stand SER # NONE G-13365 | 1 EA. $153.00
JERSEY ONE AUTO
121.| Lincoln 250 AMP. Welder SER # 608255 G-8198 1 EA. $155.00
AKINS AUTO SALES
122.| John Bean Tire Changer 7600 SER # L11BQ220 G-13169 1 EA. $200.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
123.| Safety Storage Cabinet MOD # 25302 G-15273 | 1 EA. $153.00
JERSEY ONE AUTO
124.| Snap-on 25-Ton Hydraulic Press SER # 234969 G-13201 | 1 EA. $200.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
125.| Delta 20" Drill Press 70-200 SER # A9951 G-14661 1 EA. $209.00
ALLEN RAIMI
126. | Snap-on Diesel Fuel Sys Cleaner SER # B973100545 G-13571| 1 EA. $100.00
TERCO ENTERPRISES
127.| Coats Rim Clamp Tire Changer SER # 0708104616 G-21262 | 1 EA. $679.00
KEITH GADDECK
128.| Snap-on 8" Bench Grinder MOD # BG750G SER # W5-03 G-15783 | 1 EA. $109.00
ALLEN RAIMI
129. | Snap-on Wheel Balancer MOD # WB410 SER # G41FU013 G-15521 1 EA. $175.00
AKINS AUTO SALES
130. | Miller Plasma Cutter MOD # 701 W/950-468 SER # KH408623 G-13443 1 EA. $527.00
BEAVER CONCRETE
131.| Snap-on Battery Charger MOD # BC5500 SER # Q5953522 G-12652 | 1 EA. $50.00
ROBERT FIORE
132.| Rena XPS ProMail, ProFeed, ProTab Mailing System N/A| 1 EA. $251.00
JOHN DROP
133. | (5) Pallets Miscellaneous Auto Parts N/A| 1 EA. $431.00
(#133 LUMP SUM BID ONLY)
ED RIBOT




	NAME OF BIDDER: 
	Mileage 178155 1 ENGINE MISFIRE  TOW OUTRow1: ECONOMY AUTO
	Mileage 153635Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	Mileage 161253Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	Mileage 106158Row1: JERSEY ONE AUTO
	Mileage 114002 5 INOPERABLE  TOW OUTRow1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	Mileage 151668 6 INOPERABLE  TOW OUTRow1: MARK REDDICK
	Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	8 MISSING BODY PARTS  BAD TRANSMISSION  TOW OUTRow1: ECONOMY AUTO
	Mileage 133746 9 BAD TRANSMISSION  BODY DAMAGE  TOW OUTRow1: ECONOMY AUTO
	Minimum Bid: NO BID
	Mileage 128847Row1: NO BID
	Minimum Bid_2: $4,727.00
	Mileage 144628Row1: PETER WHITE
	Minimum Bid_3: NO BID
	NAME OF BIDDER_2: 
	Mileage 142836 13 BAD HEAD GASKETS  BODY DAMAGE  TOW OUTRow1: ECONOMY AUTO
	Mileage 150034 14 BAD ENGINE  TOW OUTRow1: ECONOMY AUTO
	Minimum Bid_4: $8,321.00
	Mileage 152231Row1: ZOOM AUTO GROUP LLC
	Minimum Bid_5: $8,778.00
	Mileage 194632Row1: KAYLYNN FLORES
	Minimum Bid_6: $10,055.00
	Mileage 129733Row1: CARLOS VERGARA
	Mileage 158312 18 BAD ENGINE  TOW OUTRow1: ECONOMY AUTO
	VIN 1GT11ZCG4CF113630 Mileage 105987 19 BODY DAMAGERow1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	20 BAD TRANSMISSION NO SEATS TOW OUTRow1: BEAVER CONCRETE
	21 BODY DAMAGE  BAD TRANSMISSION  TOW OUTRow1: ECONOMY AUTO
	Minimum Bid_7: $5,001.00
	VIN 1GTJ6LFE0C8153331 Mileage 118444Row1: A BETTER DEAL INC.
	VIN 1GCJTBFE5C8122708 Mileage 123716Row1: RICHARD LOVERO
	NAME OF BIDDER_3: 
	Mileage 248861 25 BAD FRAME  TOW OUTRow1: VINCENT MARTINI
	26 BAD ENGINE  TRANSMISSION  MISSING BODY PARTS  TOW OUTRow1: ED RIBOT
	Mileage 141183 27 BODY DAMAGERow1: ECONOMY AUTO
	Mileage 124898 28 BAD TRANSMISSION  TOW OUTRow1: PARK AUTO AND PERFORMANCE
	Minimum Bid_10: NO BID
	Mileage 134685Row1: NO BID
	VIN 1GCNCPEX2CZ164670 Mileage 180779Row1: ZOOM AUTO GROUP LLC
	Mileage 134692 31 MISSING BODY PARTS  TOW OUTRow1: ECONOMY AUTO
	Minimum Bid_11: $6,667.00
	Mileage 177552Row1: ED RIBOT
	Mileage 132067  33 MISSING BODY PARTS  BAD ENGINERow1: ECONOMY AUTO
	Mileage 178380Row1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	Minimum Bid_12: $10,300.00
	Mileage 147931 35 BODY DAMAGERow1: ECONOMY AUTO
	NAME OF BIDDER_4: 
	37 INOPERABLE  NO KEY TOW OUTRow1: DEVINO TRUCKS AND PARTS
	Minimum Bid_13: NO BID
	Mileage 37888 Hours4135Row1: NO BID
	Minimum Bid_14: $11,100.00
	Mileage 139319Row1: JIMMY SOLOVEY
	Minimum Bid_15: $6,821.00
	Mileage 134758Row1: ZOOM AUTO GROUP LLC
	Minimum Bid_16: $7,821.00
	Mileage 120914Row1: ZOOM AUTO GROUP LLC
	Mileage 127585 42 BAD FRAME  BODY DAMAGE  TOW OUTRow1: VINCENT MARTINI
	Mileage 239476 43 BAD REAR  MISSING BED  TOW OUTRow1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	Mileage 198520 44 BAD FRAME  TOW OUTRow1: BARREN BALDWIN
	Mileage 58032 45 TOTAL WRECK  TOW OUTRow1: AUTO SPORT USA
	46 INOPERABLE  MISSING INTERIOR  BODY PARTS  TOW OUTRow1: CHRISTOPHER MASUCCI
	47 MISSING BODY PARTS  PANELS  NO START  TOW OUTRow1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	NAME OF BIDDER_5: 
	Mileage 174084 48 INOPERABLE  BODY DAMAGE  TOW OUTRow1: JERSEY ONE AUTO
	49 COLLISION DAMAGE LF  TOW OUTRow1: ECONOMY AUTO
	Row1_3: ECONOMY AUTO
	Minimum Bid 950000: $11,567.00
	8 Boss Snow Plow SER  BC083290 R8078Row1: SCOTCHWOOD DISPOSAL
	Minimum Bid_17: $7,680.00
	Mileage 160974 52 BODY DAMAGERow1: ECONOMY AUTO
	Minimum Bid_18: NO BID
	Mileage 180144Row1: NO BID
	Minimum Bid_19: NO BID
	Mileage 123501Row1: NO BID
	Minimum Bid_20: $4,000.00
	Mileage 144425Row1: RICARDO LOPEZ
	Minimum Bid_21: NO BID
	Mileage 97095Row1: NO BID
	57 MISSING BODY PARTS  BAD TRANSMISSION  TOW OUTRow1: JERSEY ONE AUTO
	Minimum Bid_22: $7,138.00
	Mileage 119050Row1: BEAVER CONCRETE
	NAME OF BIDDER_6: 
	59 BAD ENGINE  TRANSMISSION  BODY DAMAGE  TOW OUTRow1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	Minimum Bid_23: $9,200.00
	Mileage 121442Row1: HILLSIDE ESTATES
	Mileage  185060 61 BAD MOTOR  TRANSMISSION  TOW OUTRow1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	VIN 1GC1CVCGXEF106543 Mileage 131010Row1: ZOOM AUTO GROUP LLC
	VIN 1GTJ6LFE6C8152782 Mileage 132109Row1: ZOOM AUTO GROUP LLC
	Mileage 152664 64 BAD TRANSMISSION  TOW OUTRow1: ECONOMY AUTO
	65 INOPERABLE  NO START  FRONT END PROBLEM  TOW OUTRow1: AKINS AUTO SALES
	Minimum Bid_24: NO BID
	Mileage 45608 Hours 4890 Sweeper Hours 3557Row1: NO BID
	Mileage 183574 67 INOPERABLE  NO START  FRAME ROT  TOW OUTRow1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	Minimum Bid_25: $8,855.00
	Hours 3190Row1: AKINS AUTO SALES
	Minimum Bid_26: NO BID
	Hours 861Row1: NO BID
	NUMBER: 
	2500000_2: NO BID
	Hours UNKRow1: NO BID
	2500000_3: NO BID
	Hours 708Row1: NO BID
	Minimum Bid_27: NO BID
	Hours UNKRow1_2: NO BID
	Minimum Bid_28: NO BID
	Hours 325Row1: NO BID
	Minimum Bid_29: NO BID
	Hours 508Row1: NO BID
	Minimum Bid_30: NO BID
	Hours 1121Row1: NO BID
	Minimum Bid_31: NO BID
	Hours 1210Row1: NO BID
	Minimum Bid_32: NO BID
	Hours 857Row1: NO BID
	2500000_9: NO BID
	Hours 1007Row1: NO BID
	2500000_10: NO BID
	Hours 863Row1: NO BID
	2500000_11: NO BID
	Hours 1071Row1: NO BID
	2500000_12: NO BID
	Hours 713Row1: NO BID
	NAME OF BIDDER_7: 
	MOD 100DGDBL Hours 350Row1: DEVINO TRUCKS AND PARTS
	Hours 1731Row1: ED RIBOT
	Eager Beaver 12 Ton Trailer VIN 112HDB236HT120005 018709Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	1987 Hudson 4Ton Trailer VIN 10HHSE143H1000579 R3698Row1: ALPINE DEERE
	2005 Cam Superline 35Ton Trailer VIN 5JPPBU202X5P010730 R6227Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	2014 Woods 7 Rotary Cutter MOD BB840XP R8565Row1: GARDEN STATE IRON 
	Wanco Solar Arrowboard VIN  5F11S1016A1003756 R7702Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	Wanco Solar Arrowboard VIN 5F11S1016A1003747 R7707Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	Hours 1849Row1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	Wanco Solar Arrowboard VIN 5F11S1016A1003754 R7709Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	Wanco Solar Arrowboard VIN  5F11S1019A1002840 R7502Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	Wanco Solar Arrowboard VIN  5F11S1016A1003746 R7708Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	Wanco Solar Arrowboard VIN 5F11S1015A1002849 R7503Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	2002 Valk RVS1142 11 Manual Snow Plow SER 26672 70878Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	1991 Valk RVS1142 11 Manual Snow Plow SER UNK 19758Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	1994 Valk RVS1142 11 Manual Snow Plow SER 16686 70319Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	1996 Valk RVS1142 11 Manual Snow Plow SER 19686 R4955Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	NAME OF BIDDER_8: 
	1996 Valk RVS1142 11 Manual Snow Plow SER 19089 R4907Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	1996 Valk RVS1142 11 Manual Snow Plow SER 19672 R4951Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	1996 Valk RVS1142 11 Manual Snow Plow SER 19679 R4945Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	1996 Valk RVS1142 11 Manual Snow Plow SER 19685 R4942Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	1995 Valk RVS1142 11 Manual Snow Plow SER 17214 R4836Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	1995 Valk RVS1142 11 Manual Snow Plow SER 17580 R4849Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	R5001Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	SER AD202362SNHRow1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	Blue Point Oil Filter Crusher SER  010034 G14292Row1: JOHN VAN NESS
	Toro 22160 Push Mower SER  9900347 R5455Row1: PETER WHITE
	Coats Rim Clamp Tire Changer SER  0301105367 G15638Row1: KEITH GADDECK
	Delta 20 Drill Press WVise SER  9900347 G14888Row1: ALLEN RAIMI
	Snapon Parts Washer SER  035405 G11596Row1: DEB HAND
	Miller Plasma Cutter SER  LA128808 G14734Row1: BEAVER CONCRETE
	Gas Powered Lawn Edger SER  B81899 R6571Row1: ROBERT FIORE
	Giant Vac Wheeled Blower SER  071702053 R5894Row1: NO BID
	15 Ton Snapon Utility Stand SER  LA128808 G10994Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	Snapon Truck Wheel Balancer SER  G41HT004 G14874Row1: AKINS AUTO SALES
	NAME OF BIDDER_9: 
	4 Ton Hyd Plow Blade Jack SER  None G20282Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	Snapon 25 Ton Hyd End Lift Jack SER  N696W19256 G12395Row1: ALLEN RAIMI
	Snapon 12 Ton Engine Stand SER  NONE G13365Row1: JERSEY ONE AUTO
	Lincoln 250 AMP Welder SER  608255 G8198Row1: AKINS AUTO SALES
	John Bean Tire Changer 7600 SER  L11BQ220 G13169Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	Safety Storage Cabinet MOD  25302 G15273Row1: JERSEY ONE AUTO
	Snapon 25Ton Hydraulic Press SER  234969 G13201Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	Delta 20 Drill Press 70200 SER  A9951 G14661Row1: ALLEN RAIMI
	Snapon Diesel Fuel Sys Cleaner SER  B973100545 G13571Row1: TERCO ENTERPRISES
	Coats Rim Clamp Tire Changer SER  0708104616 G21262Row1: KEITH GADDECK
	Snapon 8 Bench Grinder MOD  BG750G SER  W503 G15783Row1: ALLEN RAIMI
	Snapon Wheel Balancer MOD  WB410 SER  G41FU013 G15521Row1: AKINS AUTO SALES
	Miller Plasma Cutter MOD  701 W950468 SER  KH408623 G13443Row1: BEAVER CONCRETE
	Snapon Battery Charger MOD  BC5500 SER  Q5953522 G12652Row1: ROBERT FIORE
	Rena XPS ProMail ProFeed ProTab Mailing System NARow1: JOHN DROP
	133 LUMP SUM BID ONLYRow1: ED RIBOT
	bidder: NO BID
	Minimum Bid_8: $7,250.00
	Minimum Bid_9: NO BID
	Text13: 
	Text14: $3,265.00
	Text15: 
	Text16: 
	Text17: $4,611.00
	Text18: 
	Text19: 
	Text20: $2,360.00
	Text21: 
	Text22: 
	Text23: $2,631.00
	Text24: 
	Text25: 
	Text26: $2,288.00
	Text27: 
	Text28: 
	Text29: $4,780.00
	Text30: 
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	Text32: $4,730.00
	Text33: 
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	Text35: $3,811.00
	Text36: 
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	Text10: 
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	Text12: 
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	Text39: 
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	Text41: $4,175.00
	Text42: 
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	Text45: 
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	Text48: 
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	Text51: 
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	Text63: 
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	Text70: 
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	Text84: 
	Text85: 
	Text86: $3,109.10
	Text87: 
	Text88: 
	Text89: $1,333.00
	Text90: 
	Text91: 
	Text92: $2,900.00
	Text93: 
	Text94: 
	Text95: $1,364.00
	Text96: 
	Text97: 
	Text98: $5,436.00
	Text99: 
	Text100: 
	Text101: $411.00
	Text102: 
	Text103: 
	Text104: $557.00
	Text105: 
	Text106: 
	Text107: $4,620.00
	Text108: 
	Text109: 
	Text110: $5,880.00
	Text111: 
	Text112: 
	Text113: $2,067.00
	Text114: 
	Text115: 
	Text116: $3,131.00
	Text117: 
	Text118: 
	Text119: $1,219.00
	Text120: 
	Text121: 
	Text122: $5,621.00
	Text123: 
	Text124: 
	Text125: $3,721.00
	Text126: 
	Text127: 
	Text128: $4,775.00
	Text129: 
	Text130: 
	Text131: $4,555.00
	Text132: 
	Text133: 
	Text134: $1,818.00
	Text135: 
	min bid 6: NO BID
	bidder 6:                              NO BID
	Text136: 
	Text137: $2,287.00
	Text138: 
	Text139: 
	Text140: $4,002.00
	Text141: 
	Text142: 
	Text143: $1,000.00
	Text144: 
	Text145: 
	Text146: $786.00
	Text147: 
	Text148: 
	Text149: $600.00
	Text150: 
	Text151: 
	Text152: $100.00
	Text153: 
	Text154: 
	Text155: $500.00
	Text156: 
	Text157: 
	Text158: $500.00
	Text159: 
	Text160: 
	Text161: $1,212.00
	Text162: 
	Text163: 
	Text164: $500.00
	Text165: 
	Text166: 
	Text167: $500.00
	Text168: 
	Text169: 
	Text170: $500.00
	Text171: 
	Text172: 
	Text173: $500.00
	Text174: 
	Text175: 
	Text176: $1,100.00
	Text177: 
	Text178: 
	Text179: $1,100.00
	Text180: 
	Text181: 
	Text182: $1,100.00
	Text183: 
	Text184: 
	Text185: $1,100.00
	Text186: 
	Text187: 
	Text188: $1,100.00
	Text189: 
	Text190: 
	Text191: $1,100.00
	Text192: 
	Text193: 
	Text194: $1,100.00
	Text195: 
	Text196: 
	Text197: $1,100.00
	Text198: 
	Text199: 
	Text200: $1,100.00
	Text201: 
	Text202: 
	Text203: $1,100.00
	Text204: 
	Text205: 
	Text206: $200.00
	Text207: 
	Text208: 
	Text209: $2,000.00
	Text210: 
	Text211: 
	Text212: $57.00
	Text213: 
	Text214: 
	Text215: $2.00
	Text216: 
	Text217: 
	Text218: $679.00
	Text219: 
	Text220: 
	Text221: $209.00
	Text222: 
	Text223: 
	Text224: $150.00
	Text225: 
	Text226: 
	Text227: $429.00
	Text228: 
	Text229: 
	Text230: $65.00
	Text231: 
	Text232: 
	Text233: NO BID
	Text234: 
	Text235: 
	Text236: $100.00
	Text237: 
	Text238: 
	Text239: $175.00
	Text240: 
	Text241: 
	Text242: $300.00
	Text243: 
	Text244: 
	Text245: $109.00
	Text246: 
	Text247: 
	Text248: $153.00
	Text249: 
	Text250: 
	Text251: $155.00
	Text252: 
	Text253: 
	Text254: $200.00
	Text255: 
	Text256: 
	Text257: $153.00
	Text258: 
	Text259: 
	Text260: $200.00
	Text261: 
	Text262: 
	Text263: $209.00
	Text264: 
	Text265: 
	Text266: $100.00
	Text267: 
	Text268: 
	Text269: $679.00
	Text270: 
	Text271: 
	Text272: $109.00
	Text273: 
	Text274: 
	Text275: $175.00
	Text276: 
	Text277: 
	Text278: $527.00
	Text279: 
	Text280: 
	Text281: $50.00
	Text282: 
	Text283: 
	Text284: $251.00
	Text285: 
	Text286: 
	Text287: $431.00
	Text288: 


