
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T200.627 Letting Date: 05/19/2023

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1 L.S. Construction Layout $289,699.45 $289,699.45 $121,000.00 $121,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00

2 104-0002 1 L.S. Mobilization $330,000.00 $330,000.00 $766,900.00 $766,900.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00

3 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $3,400.00 $3,400.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $68,000.00 $68,000.00

4 202-0009 150000 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00

5 213-0002 2700 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $100.00 $270,000.00 $100.00 $270,000.00 $175.00 $472,500.00

6 517-0002 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type B $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $5.00 $5.00

7 517-0008 16 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $3,500.00 $56,000.00 $2,500.00 $40,000.00 $5,000.00 $80,000.00

8 517-0013 40000 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $40,000.00 $1.00 $40,000.00 $1.00 $40,000.00

9 523-0002 54,765.00 L.F. Clean Existing Storm Drain, 24 in. to 48 in. Diameter $12.00 $657,180.00 $27.00 $1,478,655.00 $35.00 $1,916,775.00

10 523-0003 176855 L.F. Clean Existing Storm Drain, 12 in. to 24 in. Diameter $8.50 $1,503,267.50 $26.00 $4,598,230.00 $25.00 $4,421,375.00

11 523-0006 8310 L.F. Clean Existing Storm Drain, 48 In. To 60 In. Diameter $18.00 $149,580.00 $43.00 $357,330.00 $200.00 $1,662,000.00

12 523-0021 4565 L.F. Clean Existing Ditch $30.00 $136,950.00 $46.00 $209,990.00 $300.00 $1,369,500.00

13 523-N0001 239930 L.F. Video Inspection of Pipes $7.00 $1,679,510.00 $4.90 $1,175,657.00 $12.40 $2,975,132.00

14 531-0001 50000 USD Force Account for Snow Removal (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

15 532-0001 400,000.00 USD Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid) $1.00 $400,000.00 $1.00 $400,000.00 $1.00 $400,000.00

16 801-0001 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $620,000.00 $620,000.00 $320,000.00 $320,000.00 $3.00 $3.00

17 801-0009 5 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $500.00 $2,500.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $1.00 $5.00

18 801-0013 6 Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $2,000.00 $12,000.00 $4,000.00 $24,000.00 $5.00 $30.00

19 801-0014 240 M.H. Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use $100.00 $24,000.00 $175.00 $42,000.00 $250.00 $60,000.00

20 801-0015 15 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $1,722.87 $25,843.05 $100.00 $1,500.00 $5.00 $75.00

21 803-0032 58,500.00 USD Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid) $1.00 $58,500.00 $1.00 $58,500.00 $1.00 $58,500.00

22 803-N0001 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways $1.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $5.00 $5.00

$6,488,431.00 $10,186,262.00 $13,989,905.00

BaseLine Item Detail Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. National Water Main Cleaning CompanyMount Construction Co., Inc.
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