New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T500.641 Letting Date: 04/25/2023

BaseLine Item Detail Hall Building Corp.

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total
1 104-0001 1 LS.  Construction Layout $40,000.00 $40,000.00
2 104-0002 1LS. Mobilization $260,000.00 $260,000.00
3 108-0001 1000 USD  Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $1,000.00
4 202-0002 80.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $85.00 $6,800.00
5 301-0002 530 S.Y.  Aggregate Base Course, 6in Thick $25.00 $13,250.00
6 304-0001 120 S.Y. Portland Cement Concrete Pavement $175.00 $21,000.00
7 305-0006 92 S.Y.  Pavement Removal, 2in Depth $75.00 $6,900.00
8 511-N0028 1LS. Motorized Gate Repairs $82,000.00 $82,000.00
9 531-N0002 1 LS. Building Structural Work, Location No. 1 $95,000.00 $95,000.00
10 599-N0003 150000 USD  Project Allowances (No-Bid) $1.00 $150,000.00
11 2000-N00O6 135000 USD  Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report and Monitoring (NO-BID) $1.00 $135,000.00
12 2000-N0O09 1LS. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $130,000.00 $130,000.00
13 2000-N0O10 1LS. Building Electric Work - Location No. 2 $667,000.00 $667,000.00
14 2000-NO15 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $53,000.00 $53,000.00
15 2000-NO16 1 LS. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 2 $97,000.00 $97,000.00
16 2000-N025 1LS. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1 $87,000.00 $87,000.00
17 2000-N0O53 1LS. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 2 $1,091,000.00 $1,091,000.00
18 2000-NO55 1LS. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 3 $276,000.00 $276,000.00
19 2000-N0O26 1LS. Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
20 2000-N058 1LS. Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 2 $120,000.00 $120,000.00
21 2000-N0O30 25000 USD  NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (No-Bid) $1.00 $25,000.00

$3,366,950.00
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