
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T200.605 Letting Date: 03/28/2023

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $99,601.60 $99,601.60 $195,000.00 $195,000.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $265,000.00 $265,000.00 $280,000.00 $280,000.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $330,000.00 $330,000.00 $360,000.00 $360,000.00

3 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $39,212.16 $39,212.16 $27,000.00 $27,000.00

4 108-0001 1,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00

5 108-N0004 1,000.00 USD Steel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00

6 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $240,000.00 $240,000.00

7 202-0002 116.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $70.00 $8,120.00 $45.00 $5,220.00 $220.00 $25,520.00 $49.28 $5,716.48 $250.00 $29,000.00

8 202-0007 83.00 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $50.00 $4,150.00 $45.00 $3,735.00 $80.00 $6,640.00 $187.65 $15,574.95 $90.00 $7,470.00

9 202-0009 35,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $35,000.00 $1.00 $35,000.00 $1.00 $35,000.00 $1.00 $35,000.00 $1.00 $35,000.00

10 203-0001 253.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $60.00 $15,180.00 $85.00 $21,505.00 $100.00 $25,300.00 $279.91 $70,817.23 $150.00 $37,950.00

11 203-N0002 140.00 C.Y. Controlled Low Strength Material $390.00 $54,600.00 $225.00 $31,500.00 $420.00 $58,800.00 $538.86 $75,440.40 $600.00 $84,000.00

12 207-0003 710.00 Ton Riprap Stone Slope Protection, 24in Thick, D50=12in $130.00 $92,300.00 $85.00 $60,350.00 $150.00 $106,500.00 $81.13 $57,602.30 $165.00 $117,150.00

13 207-N0008 113.00 Ton Riprap Stone Scour Hole, 24in Thick (D50=12in) $125.00 $14,125.00 $95.00 $10,735.00 $180.00 $20,340.00 $80.82 $9,132.66 $205.00 $23,165.00

14 207-N0010 250.00 S.Y. Articulated Concrete Block Matting, Closed Cell $500.00 $125,000.00 $400.00 $100,000.00 $370.00 $92,500.00 $176.17 $44,042.50 $1,900.00 $475,000.00

15 208-0006 50 C.Y. Hay Bales $90.00 $4,500.00 $80.00 $4,000.00 $140.00 $7,000.00 $1,050.04 $52,502.00 $100.00 $5,000.00

16 208-0008 510.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence $7.00 $3,570.00 $10.00 $5,100.00 $25.00 $12,750.00 $147.44 $75,194.40 $15.00 $7,650.00

17 208-0013 200 L.F. Floating Turbidity Barriers $58.00 $11,600.00 $20.00 $4,000.00 $50.00 $10,000.00 $124.21 $24,842.00 $65.00 $13,000.00

18 208-0022 5.00 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $500.00 $2,500.00 $200.00 $1,000.00 $300.00 $1,500.00 $1,974.36 $9,871.80 $300.00 $1,500.00

19 208-0024 500.00 Ton Construction Driveway $60.00 $30,000.00 $85.00 $42,500.00 $120.00 $60,000.00 $156.92 $78,460.00 $160.00 $80,000.00

20 208-N0001 2.00 Each Concrete Washout Facility $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $9,853.65 $19,707.30 $7,500.00 $15,000.00

21 208-N0002 20 Each Sediment Control Bags $220.00 $4,400.00 $250.00 $5,000.00 $350.00 $7,000.00 $1,195.32 $23,906.40 $500.00 $10,000.00

22 208-N0008 1 L.S. Stream Diversion $547,972.00 $547,972.00 $394,328.00 $394,328.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $350,614.13 $350,614.13 $225,000.00 $225,000.00

23 208-N0009 2 Each Oil-Only Emergency Spill Kit, Type 1 $550.00 $1,100.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,295.05 $2,590.10 $2,100.00 $4,200.00

24 213-0002 231 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $155.00 $35,805.00 $68.00 $15,708.00 $120.00 $27,720.00 $104.37 $24,109.47 $95.00 $21,945.00

25 301-0001 150.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6.5in Thick $44.00 $6,600.00 $30.00 $4,500.00 $40.00 $6,000.00 $50.55 $7,582.50 $80.00 $12,000.00

26 302-0002 19 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course $380.00 $7,220.00 $400.00 $7,600.00 $550.00 $10,450.00 $453.87 $8,623.53 $650.00 $12,350.00

27 302-0003 27 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 19M64 Intermediate Course $300.00 $8,100.00 $350.00 $9,450.00 $350.00 $9,450.00 $529.52 $14,297.04 $610.00 $16,470.00

28 302-0004 102 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course $200.00 $20,400.00 $300.00 $30,600.00 $250.00 $25,500.00 $605.16 $61,726.32 $530.00 $54,060.00

29 302-0071 517 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $5.00 $2,585.00 $5.00 $2,585.00 $5.00 $2,585.00 $37.82 $19,552.94 $4.00 $2,068.00

30 303-0001 115 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick $75.00 $8,625.00 $95.00 $10,925.00 $80.00 $9,200.00 $110.44 $12,700.60 $115.00 $13,225.00

31 501-0001 30 L.F. 8-Inch Pipe Underdrain $175.00 $5,250.00 $45.00 $1,350.00 $90.00 $2,700.00 $172.83 $5,184.90 $145.00 $4,350.00

32 502-0017 1.00 Each 18-inch Reinforced Concrete Flared End Section $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $6,412.13 $6,412.13 $6,250.00 $6,250.00

33 502-0024 36 L.F. 18in Ductile Iron Pipe $295.00 $10,620.00 $180.00 $6,480.00 $500.00 $18,000.00 $516.17 $18,582.12 $400.00 $14,400.00

34 503-0252 1 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D1, Using New Grate and Frame $4,200.00 $4,200.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $4,560.11 $4,560.11 $6,000.00 $6,000.00

35 506-0001 665 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $44.00 $29,260.00 $35.00 $23,275.00 $60.00 $39,900.00 $117.60 $78,204.00 $60.00 $39,900.00

36 510-0001 515.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $45.00 $23,175.00 $65.00 $33,475.00 $45.00 $23,175.00 $65.05 $33,500.75 $53.00 $27,295.00

37 510-0011 1.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $4,750.00 $4,750.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $3,479.68 $3,479.68 $2,900.00 $2,900.00

38 510-0031 430 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide Rail $5.00 $2,150.00 $1.00 $430.00 $15.00 $6,450.00 $21.37 $9,189.10 $10.00 $4,300.00

39 517-0001 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type A $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $10,500.00 $10,500.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $51,972.32 $51,972.32 $85,000.00 $85,000.00

40 517-0007 18.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type A $2,700.00 $48,600.00 $1,250.00 $22,500.00 $5,000.00 $90,000.00 $6,683.27 $120,298.86 $1,500.00 $27,000.00

41 517-0013 20,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00

42 522-0001 10.00 Each Test Pits $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $2,043.30 $20,433.00 $850.00 $8,500.00

43 523-0007 205.00 L.F. Clean Existing Storm Drain, 60in to 72in Diameter $30.00 $6,150.00 $125.00 $25,625.00 $30.00 $6,150.00 $162.28 $33,267.40 $230.00 $47,150.00

44 532-0001 400,000.00 USD Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid) $1.00 $400,000.00 $1.00 $400,000.00 $1.00 $400,000.00 $1.00 $400,000.00 $1.00 $400,000.00

45 534-0010 235.00 L.F. 60 inch Trenchless Installation $6,600.00 $1,551,000.00 $8,500.00 $1,997,500.00 $10,400.00 $2,444,000.00 $7,779.27 $1,828,128.45 $10,775.00 $2,532,125.00

46 599-N0173 300,000.00 USD Polyurethane Grout for Roadway Stabilization (No-Bid) $1.00 $300,000.00 $1.00 $300,000.00 $1.00 $300,000.00 $1.00 $300,000.00 $1.00 $300,000.00

47 599-N0174 700,000.00 USD Polyurethane Grout for Ground Improvements (No-Bid) $1.00 $700,000.00 $1.00 $700,000.00 $1.00 $700,000.00 $1.00 $700,000.00 $1.00 $700,000.00

48 703-0001 891 S.Y. Topsoil $5.00 $4,455.00 $5.00 $4,455.00 $8.00 $7,128.00 $14.00 $12,474.00 $16.00 $14,256.00

49 704-0003 83 S.Y. Seeding, Type C $10.00 $830.00 $10.00 $830.00 $4.00 $332.00 $85.96 $7,134.68 $5.00 $415.00

50 704-0005 619 S.Y. Seeding, Type W $5.00 $3,095.00 $5.00 $3,095.00 $5.00 $3,095.00 $39.97 $24,741.43 $5.00 $3,095.00

51 704-0007 377.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type Wildflower $7.00 $2,639.00 $7.00 $2,639.00 $6.00 $2,262.00 $46.09 $17,375.93 $5.00 $1,885.00

52 706-0001 891 S.Y. Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting $5.00 $4,455.00 $5.00 $4,455.00 $8.00 $7,128.00 $27.76 $24,734.16 $9.00 $8,019.00

53 801-0001 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $440,000.00 $440,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00

54 801-0002 1,160.00 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $50.00 $58,000.00 $45.00 $52,200.00 $100.00 $116,000.00 $100.90 $117,044.00 $50.00 $58,000.00

55 801-0003 1,160.00 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $60.00 $69,600.00 $35.00 $40,600.00 $100.00 $116,000.00 $29.35 $34,046.00 $40.00 $46,400.00

56 801-0009 7 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $1,000.00 $7,000.00 $1,500.00 $10,500.00 $10,000.00 $70,000.00 $14,115.99 $98,811.93 $2,000.00 $14,000.00

57 801-0020 2 Each Repair and Reset Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array) Module $450.00 $900.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $21,548.00 $43,096.00 $650.00 $1,300.00

58 801-0021 1.00 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Cartridge), 8 Bays, 24 Inch Wide $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $36,000.00 $36,000.00 $12,526.83 $12,526.83 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

59 801-0022 1.00 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Cartridge) $800.00 $800.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $23,292.27 $23,292.27 $8,500.00 $8,500.00

60 801-0023 2 Each Repair and Reset Temporary Impact Attenuator (Cartridge) $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $6,500.00 $13,000.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $24,192.70 $48,385.40 $2,000.00 $4,000.00

BaseLine Item Detail Ritacco Construction, Inc. CRS Contractors IncMount Construction Co., Inc. Walsh Construction Company II, LLC George Harms Construction Co., Inc.
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T200.605 Letting Date: 03/28/2023

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

BaseLine Item Detail Ritacco Construction, Inc. CRS Contractors IncMount Construction Co., Inc. Walsh Construction Company II, LLC George Harms Construction Co., Inc.

61 801-N0014 1 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array), 50 MPH $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,921.38 $6,921.38 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

62 801-N0015 1 Each Place and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array), 50 MPH $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $23,500.58 $23,500.58 $11,000.00 $11,000.00

63 803-N0001 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $130,000.00 $130,000.00 $180,000.00 $180,000.00 $75,684.13 $75,684.13 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

$4,899,431.00 $5,616,000.00 $5,879,975.00 $6,373,402.35 $6,657,243.00
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