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1. 2013 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2EO7DR2858O1 T-2770 1 EA. $4,129.00
Mileage: 126,672 (#1 BAD TRANS RADIATOR-TOW OUT)

GRACE AUTO GROUP
2. 2015 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R2XFL128628 A-3270 1 EA. $2,500.00

Mileage: 125,157 (#2 BAD ENGINE-TOW OUT)

ALYSSA WHITE
3. 2013 Chevrolet Tahoe, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2EO6DR285711 T-2766 1 EA. $ 1,818.00

Mileage: 150,708 (#3 BAD TRANS-TOW OUT)

LIBERTY MOTORS
4. 2016 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R26FL128576 A-3264 1 EA. Minimum Bid

$4,500.00 $ 4,853.00
Mileage: 136,238

LIBERTY MOTORS
5. 2016 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6GN3NS5R20FL128590 A-3265 1 EA. Minimum Bid

$4,500.00 $4,516.00Mileage: 155,607

LIBERTY MOTORS
6. 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2EC9FR685422 T-3107 1 EA. $3,029.00

Mileage: 122,392 (#6 TOTAL WRECK-TOW OUT)

ECONOMY AUTO
7. 2017 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC5HR319812 T-3493 1 EA. $6,829.00

Mileage: 137,272 (#7 BAD ENGINE, NO TRANS-TOW OUT)

GRACE AUTO GROUP
8. 2017 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC8HR316144 T-3492 1 EA. Minimum Bid

$8,500.00 $ 11,029.00
Mileage: 103,887

GRACE AUTO GROUP
9. 2018 Dodge Charger, AWD, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #2C3CDXKT1JH323881 A-3371 1 EA. $ 2,755.00

Mileage: 21,764 (#9 INCOMPLETE BODY, TOW OUT)

JULIAN TORRES
10. 2012 GMC Sierra 2500 HD, 2WD, Pick-Up, Crew Cab, Serial #1GT11ZCG3CF111061 T-2425 1 EA. $ 1,313.00

Mileage: 115,181 (#10 TOW OUT)

LIBERTY MOTORS
11. 2012 GMC Canyon, 4WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1GTJ6LFE2C8152021 T-2634 1 EA. $4,001.00

Mileage: 175,415

GREGORIO LAJARA
12. 2013 Ford F-150XL, Ext. Cab, 4WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1FTFX1EF4DKF28174 T-2825 1 EA. $ 2,831.00

Mileage: 125,525 (#12 BAD FRAME, TOW OUT)

LIBERTY MOTORS
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13. 2014 Ford F-150XL, Ext. Cab, 4WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1FTFX1EF6EKE48O36 T-2914 1 EA. $ 3,326.00
Mileage: 154,684 (#13 BODY DAMAGE, BAD FRAME, TOW OUT)

PETER WHITE
14. 2017 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC4HR317579 T-3486 1 EA. Minimum Bid

$8,500.00 $ 10,929.00
Mileage: 123,965

GRACE AUTO GROUP
15. 2014 Ford F-l 50XL, Ext. Cab, 4WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1FTFX1EF9EKE48O29 T-2909 1 EA. $ 6,429.00

Mileage: 115,185 (#15 BAD TRANS, TOW OUT)

GRACE AUTO GROUP
16. 2012 Chevrolet Express 3500 Cargo Van, Serial #1GCZGTCG9C1113179 T-2542 1 EA. Minimum Bid

$3,500.00 $7,651.00
Mileage: 104,617

A BETTER DEAL
17. 2016 Chevrolet Colorado, 4WD, Crew Cab, Pick-Up, Serial #1GCGTBE33G1108685, T-3138 1 EA. Minimum Bid

$7,500.00 $ 9,429.00
Mileage: 119,282 (#17 BAD TRANS, TOW OUT)

GRACE AUTO GROUP
18. 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC4GR4O92O8 T-3307 1 EA. Minimum Bid 

$7,500.00 $ 8,913.00
Mileage: 155,202

LIBERTY MOTORS
19. 2017 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC5HR316909 T-3489 1 EA. Minimum Bid

$8,500.00 $ 9,329.00
Mileage: 126,529 (#19 BODY DAMAGE)

GRACE AUTO GROUP
20. 2009 Chevrolet Express 2500 Passenger Van, Serial #1GAGG25KO91172304 T-2113 1 EA. Minimum Bid 

$2,500.00 $ 3,675.00Mileage: 114,219 (#20 BAD TRANS, NO SEATS, TOW OUT)

PREMIUM AUTOS NY
21. 2014 Ford F-150XL, Ext. Cab, 4WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1FTFX1EF4EKE48O35 T-2907 1 EA. $ 3,715.00

Mileage: 220,917 (#21 BAD FRAME, BODY DAMAGE, TOW OUT)

VINCENT MARTINI
22. 2014 Ford F-150XL, Ext. Cab, 4WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1FTFX1EFXEKE48O24 T-2903 1 EA. $ 2,885.00

Mileage: 179,100

BENJAMIN BEYLIN
23. 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSK2EC7FR684669 T-3125 1 EA. $ 8,429.00

Mileage: 111,358 (#23 INCOMPLETE BODY)

GRACE AUTO GROUP
24. 2017 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC4HR318389 T-3514 1 EA. $ 3,661.00

Mileage: 158,157 (#24 INCOMPLETE BODY, TOW OUT)

JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
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25. 2011 Chevrolet Tahoe, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2EO6BR3 82663 T-2380 1 EA. Minimum Bid
$5,500.00 $0.00

Mileage: 106,158

NO BID

26. 2017 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC1HR318298 T-3495 1 EA. $5,251.00

Mileage: 134,139 (#26 INCOMPLETE BODY, TOW OUT)

JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES

27. 2009 Chevrolet Silverado 1500,4WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1GCEK14C39Z285327 T-2146 1 EA. $ 1,680.00

Mileage: 249,310 (#27 STEERING PROBLEM, TOW OUT)

FRANK BATTIATTO

28. 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSK2EC9FR684754 T-3126 1 EA. Minimum Bid 
$5,500.00 $ 6,909.00

Mileage: 185,747

ALLEN RAIMI

29. 2013 Ford F-150XL, Ext. Cab, 4WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1FTFX1EF8DKFO626O T-2820 1 EA. $ 5,255.00

Mileage: 87,134 (#29 BAD FRAME, TOW OUT)

HENRY DOHGAERTY

30. 2012 GMC Siem 2500 HD, Crew Cab, 2WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1GT11ZCG1CF111O6O T-2426 1 EA. $4,166.00
Mileage: 100,435 (#30 BODY DAMAGE)

VIVIA AMALFITANO

31. 2014 Ford F-150XL, Ext. Cab, 4WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1FTEX1EM6EFB48645 T-2882 1 EA. $ 3,033.00

Mileage: 179,084 (#31 BODY DAMAGE)

JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES

32. 2011 GMC Sierra 2500 HD, Crew Cab, 2WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1GT11ZCG3BF16O758 T-2320 1 EA. $ 2,333.00
Mileage: 108,452 (#32 BODY DAMAGE)

LIBERTY MOTORS

33. 2011 GMC Sierra 2500 HD, Crew Cab, 2WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1GT11ZCG5BF160759 T-2321 1 EA. $ 2,832.00
Mileage: 144,628 (#33 BODY DAMAGE)

LIBERTY MOTORS

34. 2016 Chevrolet Express 3500, Cargo Van, Seiral #1GCZGGFGOG1117162 T-3029 1 EA. Minimum Bid
$4,500.00 $ 6,359.00

Mileage: 167,305 (#34 BAD REAR DIFFERENTIAL)

ECONOMY AUTO

35. 2011 GMC Siem 2500 HD, Crew Cab, 2WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1GT11ZCGXBF160756 T-2319 1 EA. $ 1,616.00

Mileage: 79,568 (#35 BAD TRANS, TOW OUT)

LIBERTY MOTORS

36. 2012 Chevrolet Express 3500, Cargo Van, Serial #1GCZGTCG8C1125355 T-2590 1 EA. $ 4,429.00
Mileage: 114,266 (#36 BAD TRANS, TOW OUT)

GRACE AUTO GROUP
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37. 2012 Chevrolet Silverado 1500, 2WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1GCNCPEX9CZ163726 T-2513 1 EA. $ 1,410.00
Mileage: 109,174

FRANK BATTIATTO
38. 2010 Chevrolet Colorado, 4WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1GCJTBDE6A8116562 T-2256 1 EA. $4,601.00

Mileage: 138,331

A BETTER DEAL
39. 2017 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC7HR321O58 T-3510 1 EA. Minimum Bid 

$6,500.00 $ 8,529.00
Mileage: 112,762 (#39 INCOMPLETE BODY)

GRACE AUTO GROUP
40. 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2EC7FR6867O1 T-3094 1 EA. Minimum Bid

$7,500.00 $ 0.00
Mileage: 161,253

NO BID
41. 2012 Chevrolet Silverado 1500, 2WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1GCNCPEX2CZ165O88 T-2530 1 EA. $ 867.00

Mileage: 141,742 (#41 BAD TRANS, BODY DAMAGE, TOW OUT)

JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
42. 2018 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC5JR364O3O T-3657 1 EA. Minimum Bid

$4,500.00 $ 5,759.00
Mileage: 113,877 (#42 MISSING ENGINE PARTS, TOW OUT)

ECONOMY AUTO
43. 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC9GR4O7437 T-3306 1 EA. $4,700.00

Mileage: 121,385 (#43 TOTAL WRECK, TOW OUT)

MARK PAJOR
44. 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC3GR411659 T-3302 1 EA. Minimum Bid 

$8,500.00 $ 8,787.00
Mileage: 163,087

LIBERTY MOTORS
45. 2014 Ford Focus, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #1FADP3E29EL112865 A-3187 1 EA. Minimum Bid 

$4,500.00 $ 6,602.00
Mileage: 57,763

RAYMOND WEBER
46. 2014 Ford Focus, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #1FADP3E2XEL112860 A-3186 1 EA. Minimum Bid 

$4,500.00 $5,185.00
Mileage: 54,831

JUSTIN GURAL
47. 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC6GR4O7864 T-3299 1 EA. Minimum Bid

$7,500.00 $ 8,929.00
Mileage: 135,860

GRACE AUTO GROUP
48. 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC8GR41169O T-3294 1 EA. $ 1,811.00

Mileage: 161,166 (#48 INCOMPLETE BODY, NO TRANS, TOW OUT)

LIBERTY MOTORS

i
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49. 2016 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R23GL235442 A-3308 EA. Minimum Bid 
$3,500.00 $0.00

Mileage: 151,668 (#49 BAD STARTER, TOW OUT)

NO BID
50. 2014 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R21EL982289 A-3211 1 EA. $ 1,899.00

Mileage: 128,122 (#50 INCOMPLETE BODY, BAD STARTER, TOW OUT)

MARK REDDICK
51. 2018 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDECXJR365481 T-3661 1 EA. $ 9,229.00

Mileage: 116,330 (#51 INCOMPLETE BODY, MISSING ENGINE PARTS, TOW OUT)

GRACE AUTO GROUP
52. 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2EC6FR686849 T-3095 1 EA. $ 1,613.00

Mileage: 149,916 (#52 TOTAL WRECK, TOW OUT)

LIBERTY MOTORS
53. 2008 Ford E-350, Cargo Van, Serial #1FTSE34P78DA38431 T-2067 1 EA. $681.00

Mileage: 999,999 (#53 INOPERABLE, NO POWER, TOW OUT)

LIBERTY MOTORS
54. 2012 Ford F-150, 4WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1FTFX1EF6CKE1O514 T-2659 1 EA. $ 1,613.00

Mileage: 157,724 (#54 INOPERABLE, BAD STARTER, BAD FRAME, TOW OUT)

LIBERTY MOTORS
55. 2014 Ford F-150, 4WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1FTFX1EF2EKE48O34 T-2911 1 EA. $ 1,613.00

Mileage: 186,290 (#55 INOPERABLE, NO DRIVE BELT, TOW OUT)

LIBERTY MOTORS
56. 2013 Ford F-150, 4WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1FTFX1EFXDKFO6258 T-2830 1 EA. $ 2,300.00

Mileage: 137,411 (#56 INOPERABLE, NO DRIVE BELT, BAD FRAME, TOW OUT)

MICHAEL MUSTO
57. 2014 Ford F-150, 4WD, Pick-Up, W/Toolbox Serial #1FTFX1EF9EKE48O32 T-2912 1 EA. $2,001.01

Mileage: 211,734 (#57 INOPERABLE, NO DRIVE BELT, BAD FRAME, TOW OUT) R-6956

GREGORIO LAJARA
58. 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDECXGR4O5891 T-3284 1 EA. $ 1,501.00

Mileage: 154,634 (#58 TOTAL WRECK, TOW OUT)

MARK PAJOR
59. 2017 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC5HR319O17 T-3498 1 EA. $ 5,858.00

Mileage: 151,469 (#59 INOPERABLE, BAD STARTER, TOW OUT)

LIBERTY MOTORS
60. 2013 Chevrolet Express 3500, Cargo Van, Serial #1GCZGTCG1D1102968 T-2697 1 EA. $ 1,300.00

Mileage: 999,999 (#60 TOTAL WRECK - TOW OUT)

MARK PAJOR
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61. 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC8GR4O64O8 T-3282 1 EA. $ 1,800.00
Mileage: 999,999 (#61 INCOMPLETE BODY, TOW OUT)

MARK PAJOR
62. 2017 Dodge Charger, AWD, Serial #2C3CDXKT3HH621407 A-3333 1 EA $ 2,255.00

Mileage: 999,999 (#62 TOTAL WRECK, TOW OUT)

JULIAN TORRES
63. 2014 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R28EL982323 A-3217 1 EA $ 1,899.00

Mileage: 114,115 (#63 INOPERABLE, BAD FRAME, TOW OUT)

MARK REDDICK
64. 2014 Chevrolet Express 3500, Cargo Van, Serial #1GCZGTCG6E1125924 T-2873 1 EA $ 811.00

Mileage: 999,999 (#64 INOPERABLE, INCOMPLETE BODY, TOW OUT)

LIBERTY MOTORS
65. 2014 Chevrolet Express 3500, Cargo Van, Serial #1GCZGTCGOE1125126 T-2876 1 EA Minimum Bid

$3,500.00 $ 3,775.00
Mileage: 159,002 (#65 INOPERABLE, BAD STARTER, TOW OUT)

PREMIUM AUTOS NY
66. 2015 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R23FL128566 A-3262 1 EA Minimum Bid 

$2,500.00 $ 2,626.00
Mileage: 139,308 (#66 INOPERABLE, NO DRIVE BELT, TOW OUT)

LIBERTY MOTORS
67. 2016 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R25GL237466 A-3316 1 EA Minimum Bid

$3,500.00 $ 0.00Mileage: 114,002 (#67 INOPERABLE, BAD STARTER, TOW OUT)

NO BID
68. 2016 Chevrolet Express 3500, Cargo Van, Serial #1GCZGGFG4G1121764 T-3035 1 EA Minimum Bid 

$4,500.00 $ 5,880.00
Mileage: 164,385 (#68 INOPERABLE, BAD STARTER, TOW OUT)

ECONOMY AUTO
69. 2009 Chevrolet Silverado 1500, 4WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1GCEK14C79Z287419 T-2151 1 EA $ 1,410.00

Mileage: 160,847 (#69 INOPERABLE, BAD STARTER, TOW OUT)

FRANK BATTIATTO
70. 2017 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC9HR318212 T-3520 1 EA $ 1,200.00

Mileage: 999,999 (#70 INOPERABLE, INCOMPLETE BODY, NO POWER, TOW OUT)

MARK PAJOR
71. 2005 International 7400 3YD Dump w/Valk 9' Power Angle Plow T-l 911 1 EA $ 2,879.00

Serial #1HTWDAZR95JO1O6O3 Mileage: 65,883 Hours: 5256 R-6526

(#71 INOPERABLE, BAD FRAME, TOW OUT)

RUDOPLH WOBITO
72. 2004 International 7400 6YD Dump Serial #1HTWDADRO4JO85812 T-1812 1 EA $2,100.00

Mileage: 89,840 Hours: 6,921 (#72 INOPERABLE, TOW OUT)

MIDWAY AUTO



91-PC-32 (REV.2T) SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY
Page Of 13

INVITATION NO.:

23-S-1
DUE DATE:

April 5,2023 QUOTATION FORM
NAME OF BIDDER:

ITEM 
NO.

ARTICLES FOR SALE
NUMBER 

OF 
UNITS

UNIT 
OF 

MEAS.

PRICE BID 
PER 
UNIT

TOTAL 
PRICE 

BID

73. 2010 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNUKAEO8AR265683 T-2309 1 EA Minimum Bid
$4,500.00 $ 5,751.00

Mileage: 132,235

JOHN TAMBURINI
74. 2014 Ford F-150, 4WD, Pick-Up w/Toolbox Serial #1FTFX1EF5EKE48O27 T-2904 1 EA $ 3,131.00

Mileage: 171,771 (#74 BAD FRAME, TOW OUT) R-6960

LIBERTY MOTORS
75. 2012 CMC Sierra 2500 HD, Crew Cab, 2WD, Pick-Up T-2428 1 EA $ 3,131.00

Serial #1GT11ZCG2CF113626 Mileage: 103,096

LIBERTY MOTORS
76. 2013 Ford F-150, 2WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1FTNF1CFXDKF3876O T-2810 1 EA. $ 1,616.00

Mileage: 101,775 (#76 INOPERABLE, BAD STARTER, TOW OUT)

TIMOTHY MOTORS
77. 2004 International 7400 6YD Dump, Serial #1HTWDADR24JO85794 T-l795 1 EA. $ 2,274.00

Mileage: 999,999 (#77 INOPERABLE, NO IGNITION, NO KEY, TOW OUT)

ALPINE DEERE
78. 2010 International 7400 7yd. Dump w/Tailgate Spreader T-2200 1 EA. WITHDRAWN

Serial #1HTWDAZR6AJ278499 Mileage: 66,955 Hours: 6,722 R-7271 FROM SALE
(#78 INOPERABLE, TOW OUT)

WITHDRAWN PRIOR TO SALE
79. 1995 Ford F-8000 Fuel Flatbed, Serial #1FDYF8OE4SVA73949 103096 1 EA. $ 777.00

Mileage: 30,813 Hours: 889

JOHN TAMBURINI
80. 2019 Ford F-150,4WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1FTEX1EB2KKD651O9 T-3797 1 EA. $ 6,851.00

Mileage: 999,999 (#80 TOTAL WRECK, INCOMPLETE BODY, NO KEY, TOW OUT)

MIDWAY AUTO
81. 2013 Ford F-150, 4WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1FTEX1EM3DKFO6239 T-2732 1 EA. Minimum Bid

$2,500.00 $ 2,688.00Mileage: 184,927 (#81 INOPERABLE, TOW OUT)

BENJAMIN BEYLIN
82. 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC1GR4O7299 T-3279 1 EA. $ 2,505.00

Mileage: 127,022 (#82 TOTAL WRECK, INCOMPLETE BODY, TOW OUT)

MARK PAJOR
83. 2016 Dodge Caravan SE, Serial #2C4RDGBG6GR383019 T-3320 1 EA. Minimum Bid 

$3,500.00 $ 4,777.00Mileage: 134,907 (#83 INOPERABLE, TOW OUT)

JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
84. 2017 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC7HR32O461 T-3512 1 EA. $2,100.00

Mileage: 103,603 (#84 INOPERABLE, INCOMPLETE BODY, NO TRANS, TOW OUT)

MARK PAJOR
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85. 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSK2ECXFR6846O3 T-3129 1 EA. $ 5,858.00
Mileage: 175,062 (#85 - INCOMPLETE BODY, TOW OUT)

LIBERTY MOTORS
86. 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC2GR4O6372 T-3286 1 EA. Minimum Bid 

$3,500.00 $4,313.00
Mileage: 158,681 (#86 - INCOMPLETE BODY, TOW OUT)

LIBERTY MOTORS
87. 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2EC3FR688784 T-3093 1 EA. Minimum Bid

$6^00.00 $6,913.00
Mileage: 157,569 (#87 - BODY DAMAGE)

LIBERTY MOTORS
88. 2011 GMC Sierra 2500 HD, Crew Cab, 2WD, Pick-Up, Serial #1GT11ZCG1BF16O757 T-2327 1 EA. $ 2,362.00

Mileage: 107,159

JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
89. 2004 Deere 624J Wheel Loader w/Bucket & Forks Serial #1DW624JH59364O R-6089 1 EA. Minimum Bid

$10,500.00 $42,791.00
Hours: 3411

HAZELTON EQUIPMENT
90. 2010 Deere 624K Wheel Loader w/Bucket & Forks Serial #1DW624KHJAO633297 R-7652 1 EA. Minimum Bid 

$15,500.00 $ 40,752.00
Hours: 4774 R-7659

ALPINE DEERE
91. 2000 Deere 270 Wheel Skid Steer w/Bucket & CP24 Planer Attachment R-5541 1 EA. $ 9,150.00

Serial #KV0270E270883 Hours: 3396 (#91 - INOPERABLE) R-5637

SHAUN GURAL
92. 2010 Deere 624K Wheel Loader w/Bucket Serial #1DW624KHPAO633295 R-7655 1 EA. Minimum Bid 

$15,500.00 $ 32,668.00
Hours: 5741

PEAK EQUIPMENT
93. 1998 Deere 486E 3-Ton 4WD AT Forklift Serial #T0486EX844770 R-5281 1 EA. Minimum Bid 

$3,500.00 $7,100.00
Hours: 3831

JAMES CATALANO
94. 1998 Deere 486E 3-Ton 4WD AT Forklift Serial #T0486EX844768 R-5280 1 EA. Minimum Bid

$3,500.00 $ 9,600.00
Hours: 2652

JOHN CATALANO
95. 2002 McCormick C70 2WD Tractor w/3pt. Flail Mower Serial #JJE2002102 TP-70991 1 EA. $ 3,657.00

Hours: 999,999 (#95 - INOPERABLE, TOW OUT) R-6978

JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
96. 2004 New Holland T4.85 2WD Tractor Serial #ZEJT51782 R-8674 1 EA. $ 1,357.00

Hours: 999,999 (#96 - INCOMPLETE, INOPERABLE, TOW OUT)

JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES i------------------------- 1----------------------- —

1
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97. 2002 McCormick C70 2WD Tractor w/3pt. Flail Mower Serial #JJE2002128 TP-70988 1 EA. $ 3,857.00
Hours: 999,999 R-8153

JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
98. 2000 Case C80 2WD Tractor Serial #C080RN3JJE 1014829 R-5571 1 EA. $ 470.00

Hours: 999,999 (#98 - INCOMPLETE, INOPERABLE, TOW OUT)

JAMES CATALANO
99. 2001 Case C80 2WD Tractor Serial #CO8ORN3JJE 1019254 R-5687 1 EA. $ 509.00

Hours: 999,999 (#99 - INOPERABLE)

ALLEN RAIMI
100. 2007 Toro Z-Master Model #74272 60" w/28hp Kawasaki Serial #270002071 R-6945 1 EA. $ 509.00

Hours: 1163 (#100 - INOPERABLE)

ALLEN RAIMI
101. 2006 Toro Z-Master Model #74255 60" w/28hp Kohler Serial #250000219 R-6707 1 EA. $ 1,291.00

Hours: 819 (#101 - INOPERABLE)

HAZELTON EQUIPMENT
102. 2013 Kubota F3080 72" Mower 4WD 3cyl. Kubota Serial #11534 R-8301 1 EA. $5.00

Hours: 616 (#102 - INCOMPLETE, INOPERABLE)

JACOB CZARNOWSKI
103. 2018 Stepp 4-Ton Roadway Reclaimer Model #SPH-OJ-3.0 R-10000 1 EA. $ 7,500.00

Serial #4S9PH3OY1JS127O57 Hours: 1140

MARLIN CONSTRUCTION SERVICES
104. 2011 Cimline Magma 230 Crack Sealer Serial #1C92M1528BM119126 R-7838 1 EA. $ 3,257.00

Hours: 759

JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
105. 2015 Bagela Asphalt Recycler Model #BA10000 Serial #W09A10205EKB13502 R-9004 1 EA. $ 511.00

Hours: 2674

LIBERTY MOTORS
106. 2011 Stone 9 Cu. Ft. Mortar Mixer (Honda 8hp) Model 955M Serial #402011148 R-7941 1 EA. $ 509.00

ALLEN RAIMI
107. 1997 Stow 9 Cu. Ft. Mixer (B & S lOhp) Model CM9B10 Serial 9710436 R-5084 1 EA. $ 509.00

ALLEN RAIMI
108. 2008 Stone 9 Cu. Ft. Cement Mixer (Honda 8hp) Model 950M Serial #472007079 R-7056 1 EA. $ 650.00

NOLIANNE CANNON
109. 2011 Stone 9 Cu. Ft. Mortar Mixer (Honda 8hp) Model 955M Serial #402011149 R-7940 1 EA. $ 509.00

ALLEN RAIMI
HO. 2011 Stone 9 Cu. Ft. Mortar Mixer (Honda 8hp) Model 955M Serial #402011147 R-7935 1 EA. $ 509.00

ALLEN RAIMI
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111. 2004 Stone Mixer (Honda 8hp) Model ST095CM Serial #282004342 TP-71284 1 EA. $510.00

JAMES CATALANO
112. 2000 Elliott Magnetek 180kw Geenerator Model 180RD Serial #BU04J223 G-14610 1 EA. $ 680.00

FRANK BATTIATTO
113. 2000 Elliott Magnetek 50kw Generator Model 50RD Serial #BT12J864 G-14615 1 EA. $ 2,009.00

ALLEN RAIMI
114. 2000 Elliot Magnetek 150kw Generator Model 150RD Serial #BU04J222 G-14633 1 EA. $211.00

LIBERTY MOTORS
115. 2000 Elliott Magnetek 180kw Geenerator Model 180RD Serial #BT01 J959 G-14595 1 EA. $211.00

LIBERTY MOTORS
116. 1991 Stephan Greene Flatbed Landscape Trailer Serial #00232791THTCAA003 TP-19818 1 EA. $ 262.00

(#116 - INOPERABLE, MISSING WHEEL, TOW OUT)

JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
117. 1992 Centreville 2-Ton Trailer Model #TA-685M Serial #1C9ST1429N1193228 R-4598 1 EA. $ 462.00

JERSEY ONE AUTO SALES
118. 2003 Howard 3 PT. Rote-Tiller Model HR20-80 Serial #020360243 R-5863 1 EA. $ 283.00

FRANK ESPOSITO
119. 2004 Tennant Scrubber Model 5700-800D Serial #23815 R-6191 1 EA. $0.00

(#119 - INOPERABLE, MISSING PARTS)

NO BID
120. 2004 Tennant Scrubber Model 5700-ES Serial #22644 R-6055 1 EA. $ 65.00

(#120 - INOPERABLE, MISSING PARTS)

PETER WHITE
121. 2000 Hotsy 16hp Pressure Washer Model 1260SS Serial #H499790500 G-14739 1 EA. $ 100.00

(#121 - INOPERABLE)

JACHIN DECK
122. 2010 Mobile Electric Pallet Jack Model RSPT44-R Serial #108062 G-24878 1 EA. $ 27.00

(#122 - INOPERABLE)

JOHN VAN NESS
123. Blue Point 120psi Filter Crusher Model Crush 2 Serial #010040 G-14568 1 EA. $ 27.00

JOHN VAN NESS
124. Nu Star Battery Powered Car Pusher (#124 - INOPERABLE) 1 EA. $ 269.00

HENRY MARTER
125. 2007 Toro 26" Self-Propelled Snow Blower Model 38622 Serial #270009920 R-6981 1 EA. $ 33.00

(#125 - INOPERABLE)

JOHN TAMBURINI
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126. 2008 Toro 16" 2-cycle Snow Blower Model 3 8182CCR Serial #290002628 R-7132 1 EA. $ 17.00
(#126 - INOPERABLE)

JOHN TAMBURINI
127. 1998 Giant Vac Wheeled Blower Model 80BP-1C Serial #97-263628 R-5222 1 EA. $ 17.00

(#127 - INOPERABLE)

JOHN TAMBURINI
128. 2008 Teel 2” Water Pump Model 3P958A Serial #2626413628 G-13797 1 EA. $ 75.00

ROBERT FIORE
129. Snap-On Truck Wheel Balancer Model WB-410 Serial #G41FU015 G-l 5520 1 EA. $ 115.00

VINCENT MARTINI
130. Miller Plasma Cutter Model 701 Serial #KK121164 G-14415 1 EA. $ 509.00

ALLEN RAIMI
131. Snap-On Oil Drain Model YA777 G-l 3344 1 EA. $ 50.00

JACHIN DECK
132. VanNonnan Brake Lathe w/bench Model 868030 Serial #1356R G-14905 1 EA. $ 59.00

BENJAMIN BEYLIN
133. Snap On Emission Tester Model EELD302B and cart Serial #T33738 G-24616 1 EA. $ 1.00

G-24979

PARK AUTO AND PERFORMANCE
134. 2004 Stihl Cut-Off Saw Model TS510 Serial #360009239 G-l 6028 1 EA. $ 85.00

(#134 - INOPERABLE, MISSING PARTS)

FRANK ESPOSITO
135. 2008 Stihl Loop Handle Weed Trimmer Model FS11 OR Serial #276566220 R-7122 1 EA. $7.11

(#135 - INOPERABLE)

KEVIN URBAN
136. 2012 Stihl Bike Handle Weed Trimmer Model FS250 Serial #290263062 R-8199 1 EA. $0.00

(#136 - INOPERABLE)

NO BID
137. 2017 Stihl Bike Handle Weed Trimmer Model FS240 Serial #181910443 R-9691 1 EA. $0.00

(#137 - INOPERABLE)

NO BID
138. 2010 Stihl Loop Handle Weed Trimmer Model FS250R Serial #284664750 R-7772 1 EA. $ 31.00

(#138 - INOPERABLE)

FRANK ESPOSITO
139. 2015 Stihl Bike Handle Weed Trimmer Model FS240 Serial #178090610 R-9294 1 EA. $31.00

(#139 - INOPERABLE)

FRANK ESPOSITO
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140. 2015 Stihl Loop Handle Weed Trimmer Model FS240R Serial #178194438 R-9270 1 EA. $31.00

(#140 - INOPERABLE)

FRANK ESPOSITO
141. 2008 Stihl Loop Handle Weed Trimmer Model FS11 OR Serial #276566216 R-7124 1 EA. $ 31.00

(#141 - INOPERABLE)

FRANK ESPOSITO
142. 2009 Stihl Loop Handle Weed Trimmer Model FS250R Serial #280151834 R-7443 1 EA. $ 50.00

(#142 - INOPERABLE)

DONALD PRICE

143. 2009 Stihl 20” Long Reach Hedge Trimmer Model HL100 Serial #276179555 R-7149 1 EA. $ 79.00
(#143 - INOPERABLE)

FRANK ESPOSITO

144. 2005 Stihl Hand Held Blower Model BG65 Serial #264743122 R-6539 1 EA. $ 33.00
(#144 - INOPERABLE)

JOHN TAMBURINI

145. 2005 Stihl 20" Chain Saw Model MS361 Serial #264591273 R-6498 1 EA. $ 50.00
(#145 - INOPERABLE)

DONALD PRICE
146. 2007 Stihl 14” Chain Saw Model MS200T Serial #166026954 R-6880 1 EA. $ 75.00

(#146 - INOPERABLE)

DONALD PRICE
147. (1) Pallet CAT-6 Direct Burial Wire (#147 - LUMP SUM BED ONLY) 1 EA. $ 225.00

PREMIUM AUTOS NY
148. (1) Pallet Federal Signal Amber Rotator Lights model #SY12SPA 1 EA. $ 117.00

(#148 - LUMP SUM BID ONLY)

JOHN VAN NESS

149. (1) Pallet Misc. Toro Tires & Wheels (#149 - LUMP SUM BID ONLY) 1 EA $ 109.00
ALLEN RAIMI

150. (2) Pallets Misc. Mower Parts (#150 - LUMP SUM BID ONLY) 1 EA. $ 250.00
SHAUN GURAL

151. (5) Pallets Misc. Snow Plow Parts & Equipment (#151 - LUMP SUM BID ONLY) 1 EA. $ 1,291.00
HAZELTON EQUIPMENT

152. (1) Pallets Misc. Air Filters (#152 - LUMP SUM BID ONLY) 1 EA. $ 27.00
JOHN VAN NESS

153. (2) Pallets Misc. Light Bulbs (#153 - LUMP SUM BID ONLY) 1 EA. $ 40.00
FRANK ESPOSITO
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154. (1) Pallet Misc. Auto Parts (#154 - LUMP SUM BID ONLY) 1 EA. $ 85.00

FRANK ESPOSITO
155. (1) Pallet Misc. Hardware (#155 - LUMP SUM BID ONLY) 1 EA. $ 45.00

FRANK ESPOSITO
156. (3) Pallets Misc Auto, Track & Tractor Tires (#156 - LUMP SUM BID ONLY) 1 EA. $201.00

VINCENT MARTINI
157. (4) Pcs. Offset Press Plate Making Equipment C-10715 1 EA. $ 100.00

(#157 - LUMP SUM BID ONLY) F-18685, F-22147

JOHN VAN NESS

1


