New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaseLine Item Detail

Contract No. P500.725

Hall Building Corp.

Shorelands Construction Inc.

Nacom Companies, Inc.

J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Inc.

Item No.

Unit Code
1 104-0001
2 104-0002
3 107-0001
4 108-0001
5 201-0002
6 202-0002
7 202-0009
8 205-0001
9 205-0002
10 208-0008
11 208-0022
12 213-0002
13 302-0073
14 302-N0007
15 303-N0002
16 304-0001
17 305-0002
18 506-0001
19 511-0006
20 511-N0023
21 511-N0029
22 516-0009
23 516-0011
24 517-0003
25 517-0009
26 522-0001
27 599-N0003
28 599-N0022
29 599-N0175
30 601-0005
31 601-0006
32 601-0015
33 601-0021
34 601-0031
35 601-0038
36 601-0042
37 601-0071
38 601-0246
39 703-0001
40 704-0003
41 706-0001
42 2000-NO09
43 2000-N015
44 2000-N025
45 2000-N030
46 2000-N047

Qty uom
1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.

1,000.00 USD
1.00 L.S.
113.00 C.Y.
5,000.00 USD
186.00 C.Y.
45.00 C.Y.
259.00 L.F.
1.00 Each
265.00 Ton
122.00 Ton
104.00 GAL
65 S.Y.
44.00 S.Y.
1,039.00 S.V.
30.00 L.F.
133.00 L.F.
1.00 Each
1 Each
468 L.F.
72 L.F.
1LS.
13.00 Mnth
3 Each
75,000.00 USD
6 Each
120 L.F.
100 L.F.
330 L.F.
2.00 Each
640 L.F.
330 L.F.
160 L.F.
160.00 L.F.
100.00 L.F.
400 L.F.
144 S.Y.
144.00 S.Y.
87.00 S.Y.
1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
25,000.00 USD
1LS.

Description

Construction Layout

Mobilization

Progress Schedule

Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

Clearing and Grubbing

Roadway Excavation, Earth

Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid)
Foundation Excavation

Coarse Aggregate Layer

Heavy Duty Silt Fence

Inlet Filter, Type 2

Disposal of Regulated Material

Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M64 Surface Course
Trackless Tack Coat

Berm Surfacing, Crushed Stone, 6 in Thick
Portland Cement Concrete Pavement

Surface Milling, 2in Average Depth

Concrete Curb, Type A

Chain Link Fence, Type Il, 72in High

Pedestrian Gate, Type Il, 72in High, 4ft Wide
Motorized Vehicular Gate System

Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic

Traffic Markings, Lines, Long-Life, Thermoplastic
Furnish Field Office, Type C

Maintain Field Office, Type C

Test Pits

Project Allowances (No-Bid)

Bollards

1-1/4\" Plastic Gas Main

3in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40)
2in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40)
Junction Box, Type C

#10 A.W.G. Ground Wire

Multi-Mode Fiber Optic Cable, 12- Fibers

#10 A.W.G. Power Cable

1in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit PVC Schedule 40
#4 A.W.G. Ground Wire

#250 KCMIL A.W.G. Power Cable

Topsoil

Seeding, Type C

Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting

Building Electric Work - Location No. 1

Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1
Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1
NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (No-Bid)
Building Structural Work - Location No. 1

Unit Price Line Total Unit Price
$25,000.00 $25,000.00 $16,000.00
$98,000.00 $98,000.00 $133,000.00

$8,000.00 $8,000.00 $18,000.00
$1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00
$7,000.00 $7,000.00 $12,000.00
$50.00 $5,650.00 $34.00
$1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00
$50.00 $9,300.00 $28.00
$75.00 $3,375.00 $35.00
$10.00 $2,590.00 $7.00
$350.00 $350.00 $375.00
$110.00 $29,150.00 $25.00
$187.00 $22,814.00 $240.00
$10.00 $1,040.00 $6.00
$61.00 $3,965.00 $40.00
$138.00 $6,072.00 $150.00
$11.00 $11,429.00 $16.45
$60.00 $1,800.00 $135.00
$94.00 $12,502.00 $260.00
$952.00 $952.00 $2,000.00
$39,424.00 $39,424.00 $43,600.00
$4.50 $2,106.00 $4.40
$5.00 $360.00 $4.25
$26,000.00 $26,000.00 $24,000.00
$1,700.00 $22,100.00 $1,200.00
$650.00 $1,950.00 $750.00
$1.00 $75,000.00 $1.00
$1,000.00 $6,000.00 $800.00
$20.00 $2,400.00 $75.00
$35.00 $3,500.00 $18.00
$20.00 $6,600.00 $7.00
$4,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,400.00
$1.40 $896.00 $3.00
$20.00 $6,600.00 $12.00
$2.00 $320.00 $2.50
$20.00 $3,200.00 $7.00
$3.80 $380.00 $3.50
$13.00 $5,200.00 $14.00
$10.00 $1,440.00 $25.00
$6.00 $864.00 $6.00
$20.00 $1,740.00 $15.00
$177,000.00 $177,000.00 $202,000.00
$252,000.00 $252,000.00 $250,000.00
$330,000.00 $330,000.00 $285,000.00
$1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00
$127,800.00 $127,800.00 $213,000.00

$1,380,869.00
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Line Total

$16,000.00
$133,000.00
$18,000.00
$1,000.00
$12,000.00
$3,842.00
$5,000.00
$5,208.00
$1,575.00
$1,813.00
$375.00
$6,625.00
$29,280.00
$624.00
$2,600.00
$6,600.00
$17,091.55
$4,050.00
$34,580.00
$2,000.00
$43,600.00
$2,059.20
$306.00
$24,000.00
$15,600.00
$2,250.00
$75,000.00
$4,800.00
$9,000.00
$1,800.00
$2,310.00
$4,800.00
$1,920.00
$3,960.00
$400.00
$1,120.00
$350.00
$5,600.00
$3,600.00
$864.00
$1,305.00
$202,000.00
$250,000.00
$285,000.00
$25,000.00
$213,000.00
$1,480,907.75

Unit Price

$3,134.00
$21,505.00
$15,484.00
$1.00
$7,836.00
$81.00
$1.00
$48.00
$96.00
$7.00
$653.00
$26.00
$191.00
$13.00
$86.00
$205.00
$7.00
$33.00
$111.00
$1,130.00
$46,805.00
$3.00
$7.00
$21,935.00
$596.00
$914.00
$1.00
$1,045.00
$82.00
$30.00
$18.00
$5,420.00
$2.00
$10.00
$2.00
$16.00
$6.00
$16.00
$13.00
$2.00
$7.00
$257,273.00
$300,370.00
$359,082.00
$1.00
$284,444.00

Line Total

$3,134.00
$21,505.00
$15,484.00
$1,000.00
$7,836.00
$9,153.00
$5,000.00
$8,928.00
$4,320.00
$1,813.00
$653.00
$6,890.00
$23,302.00
$1,352.00
$5,590.00
$9,020.00
$7,273.00
$990.00
$14,763.00
$1,130.00
$46,805.00
$1,404.00
$504.00
$21,935.00
$7,748.00
$2,742.00
$75,000.00
$6,270.00
$9,840.00
$3,000.00
$5,940.00
$10,840.00
$1,280.00
$3,300.00
$320.00
$2,560.00
$600.00
$6,400.00
$1,872.00
$288.00
$609.00
$257,273.00
$300,370.00
$359,082.00
$25,000.00
$284,444.00
$1,584,562.00

Unit Price
$15,000.00
$125,000.00
$5,000.00
$1.00
$70,000.00
$204.00
$1.00
$60.00
$55.00
$4.50
$240.00
$60.00
$250.00
$11.50
$30.00
$525.00
$6.50
$54.00
$89.00
$900.00
$37,500.00
$4.00
$4.00
$42,400.00
$2,100.00
$1,400.00
$1.00
$1,650.00
$112.00
$58.00
$49.00
$2,000.00
$5.00
$52.00
$4.50
$20.00
$5.25
$17.00
$8.50
$1.00
$9.00
$175,000.00
$324,000.00
$127,000.00
$1.00
$596,100.00

Line Total
$15,000.00
$125,000.00
$5,000.00
$1,000.00
$70,000.00
$23,052.00
$5,000.00
$11,160.00
$2,475.00
$1,165.50
$240.00
$15,900.00
$30,500.00
$1,196.00
$1,950.00
$23,100.00
$6,753.50
$1,620.00
$11,837.00
$900.00
$37,500.00
$1,872.00
$288.00
$42,400.00
$27,300.00
$4,200.00
$75,000.00
$9,900.00
$13,440.00
$5,800.00
$16,170.00
$4,000.00
$3,200.00
$17,160.00
$720.00
$3,200.00
$525.00
$6,800.00
$1,224.00
$144.00
$783.00
$175,000.00
$324,000.00
$127,000.00
$25,000.00
$596,100.00
$1,871,575.00

Letting Date: 02/01/2023



