
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. A500.722 Letting Date: 11/17/2022

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $454,201.00 $454,201.00

2 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $227,101.00 $227,101.00

3 517-0009 20.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $0.00 $0.00

4 599-N0003 75,000.00 USD Project Allowances (No-Bid) $1.00 $75,000.00

5 2000-N006 10,000.00 USD Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report and Monitoring (NO-BID) $1.00 $10,000.00

6 2000-N007 15,000.00 USD Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $1.00 $15,000.00

7 2000-N008 5,000.00 USD Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID) $1.00 $5,000.00

8 2000-N009 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $152,829.00 $152,829.00

9 2000-N015 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $24,612.00 $24,612.00

10 2000-N025 1.00 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1 $34,314.00 $34,314.00

11 2000-N030 25,000.00 USD NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (No-Bid) $1.00 $25,000.00

12 2000-N070 1.00 L.S. Building Elevator Work - Location No. 1 $1,589,704.00 $1,589,704.00

13 2000-N071 1.00 L.S. Building Elevator Maintenance - Location No. 1 $116,561.07 $116,561.07

14 2000-N072 1.00 L.S. Building Plumbing/Fire Protection Work - Location No. 1 $92,526.00 $92,526.00

$2,821,848.07

BaseLine Item Detail Champion Elevator Corp.
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