New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T200.711 Letting Date: 11/22/2022

BaseLine Item Detail South State, Inc. Earle Asphalt Company D'Annunzio & Sons, Inc. Stavola Contracting Co., Inc. Crisdel Group, Inc.
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Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0002 1.00 LS.  Mobilization $840,000.00 $840,000.00 $892,827.13 $892,827.13  $1,043,160.00 $1,043,160.00  $1,268,784.25 $1,268,784.25 $822,907.00 $822,907.00
2 108-0001 450000 USD  Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $450,000.00 $1.00 $450,000.00 $1.00 $450,000.00 $1.00 $450,000.00 $1.00 $450,000.00
3 202-0002 9400 C.Y.  Roadway Excavation, Earth $0.01 $94.00 $25.00 $235,000.00 $50.00 $470,000.00 $52.88 $497,072.00 $109.25 $1,026,950.00
4 202-0009 100000 USD  Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00
5 213-0002 1,700.00 Ton  Disposal of Regulated Material $0.01 $17.00 $1.00 $1,700.00 $60.00 $102,000.00 $28.48 $48,416.00 $36.00 $61,200.00
6 301-0002 38,000.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6in Thick $1.00 $38,000.00 $10.00 $380,000.00 $16.00 $608,000.00 $7.71 $292,980.00 $11.30 $429,400.00
7 302-0063 605000 USD  Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $605,000.00 $1.00 $605,000.00 $1.00 $605,000.00 $1.00 $605,000.00 $1.00 $605,000.00
8 302-0071 419000 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $6.00 $2,514,000.00 $0.17 $71,230.00 $0.32 $134,080.00 $0.35 $146,650.00 $0.54 $226,260.00
9 302-0072 120.00 Each  Bituminous Core Samples $10.00 $1,200.00 $50.00 $6,000.00 $110.00 $13,200.00 $80.00 $9,600.00 $85.00 $10,200.00
10 302-NO004 124000 Ton Warm Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course $90.00 $11,160,000.00 $98.77 $12,247,480.00 $95.00 $11,780,000.00 $103.10 $12,784,400.00 $100.50 $12,462,000.00
11 302-N0007 76000 GAL  Trackless Tack Coat $0.01 $760.00 $3.50 $266,000.00 $3.40 $258,400.00 $3.35 $254,600.00 $3.40 $258,400.00
12 305-0003 721000 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2 1/2in Depth $0.01 $7,210.00 $2.22 $1,600,620.00 $2.70 $1,946,700.00 $3.22 $2,321,620.00 $3.90 $2,811,900.00
13 305-0004 38,000.00 S.Y.  Pavement Removal, 3in Depth $0.01 $380.00 $2.45 $93,100.00 $4.00 $152,000.00 $7.28 $276,640.00 $5.00 $190,000.00
14 306-0001 268,000.00 L.F. Milled Rumble Strip $0.20 $53,600.00 $0.20 $53,600.00 $0.35 $93,800.00 $0.19 $50,920.00 $0.35 $93,800.00
15 503-0002 5 Each Reset Frame, Various Types with Extensions $250.00 $1,250.00 $200.00 $1,000.00 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $350.00 $1,750.00 $550.00 $2,750.00
16 503-0009 10 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D1, Using Existing Grate and Frame $250.00 $2,500.00 $850.00 $8,500.00 $2,500.00 $25,000.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $2,477.00 $24,770.00
17 503-0293 5.00 Each Reset Frames $250.00 $1,250.00 $400.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $1,360.00 $6,800.00
18 505-0001 5000 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $0.01 $50.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $7.00 $35,000.00 $6.00 $30,000.00 $0.01 $50.00
19 516-0009 351000 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $1.22 $428,220.00 $1.15 $403,650.00 $1.25 $438,750.00 $1.22 $428,220.00 $1.22 $428,220.00
20 516-0011 53000 L.F.  Traffic Markings, Lines, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $0.05 $2,650.00 $0.40 $21,200.00 $0.10 $5,300.00 $0.05 $2,650.00 $0.05 $2,650.00
21 516-0013 175.00 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $7.00 $1,225.00 $10.00 $1,750.00 $10.00 $1,750.00 $7.00 $1,225.00 $7.00 $1,225.00
22 517-0002 1.00 LS.  Furnish Field Office, Type B $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00
23 517-0008 13 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $100.00 $1,300.00 $2,200.00 $28,600.00 $3,600.00 $46,800.00 $3,000.00 $39,000.00 $2,000.00 $26,000.00
24 517-0013 15000 USD  Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00
25 530-0001 500.00 Each Raised Pavement Markers $25.00 $12,500.00 $34.50 $17,250.00 $27.00 $13,500.00 $25.00 $12,500.00 $25.00 $12,500.00
26 605-0023 90 Each In-pavement Wireless Sensor $1,000.00 $90,000.00 $1,200.00 $108,000.00 $1,800.00 $162,000.00 $1,100.00 $99,000.00 $1,410.00 $126,900.00
27 801-0001 1LS. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $515,000.00 $515,000.00 $275,000.00 $275,000.00 $2,270,000.00 $2,270,000.00 $1,105,583.07 $1,105,583.07 $710,982.00 $710,982.00
28 801-0007 300 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol, Part-Time $100.00 $30,000.00 $0.01 $3.00 $0.10 $30.00 $1.00 $300.00 $0.01 $3.00
29 801-0008 300 M.H. Flaggers $0.01 $3.00 $0.01 $3.00 $0.10 $30.00 $1.00 $300.00 $0.01 $3.00
$16,891,209.00 $17,899,513.13 $20,817,000.00 $20,869,710.32 $20,917,870.00
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