New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T500.448 Letting Date: 8/30/2022

BaseLine Item Detail A.P.S. Contracting Inc. Hall Building Corp.

$4,436,287.00
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Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $255,000.00 $255,000.00

3 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00

4 108-0001 2,000.00 USD  Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $2,000.00 $1.00 $2,000.00

5 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

6 202-0002 1,572.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $40.00 $62,880.00 $18.00 $28,296.00

7 202-0007 172.00 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $50.00 $8,600.00 $12.00 $2,064.00

8 203-0001 3,748.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $40.00 $149,920.00 $42.00 $157,416.00

9 208-0008 1,754.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence $20.00 $35,080.00 $15.00 $26,310.00
10 208-0022 33.00 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $500.00 $16,500.00 $330.00 $10,890.00
11 213-0001 500.00 Ton Disposal of Acid Producing Soil $100.00 $50,000.00 $50.00 $25,000.00
12 213-0002 500.00 Ton  Disposal of Regulated Material $100.00 $50,000.00 $85.00 $42,500.00
13 301-0002 7,901.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6in Thick $15.00 $118,515.00 $16.00 $126,416.00
14 302-0004 1,862.00 Ton  Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course $140.00 $260,680.00 $150.00 $279,300.00
15 302-N0007 791 GAL Trackless Tack Coat $3.00 $2,373.00 $8.00 $6,328.00
16 302-0073 931.00 Ton  Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M64 Surface Course $140.00 $130,340.00 $180.00 $167,580.00
17 501-0001 63 L.F. 8-Inch Pipe Underdrain $150.00 $9,450.00 $82.00 $5,166.00
18 502-0007 130.00 L.F. 12 In Reinforced Concrete Pipe $200.00 $26,000.00 $98.00 $12,740.00
19 502-0008 70.00 L.F. 15 In Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class V $220.00 $15,400.00 $110.00 $7,700.00
20 502-0009 643.00 L.F. 15 Inch HDPE Pipe $100.00 $64,300.00 $80.00 $51,440.00
21 502-0251 4,865.00 L.F.  Cleaning Existing Storm Drains $5.00 $24,325.00 $9.00 $43,785.00
22 503-0008 8 Each Inlet, Type D1 $5,000.00 $40,000.00 $3,900.00 $31,200.00
23 503-0009 1 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D1, Using Existing Grate and Frame $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
24 503-0293 1 Each Reset Frames $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00
25 506-0001 145.00 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $50.00 $7,250.00 $50.00 $7,250.00
26 511-N0011 2,000.00 L.F. Temporary Fencing, 96In High $15.00 $30,000.00 $19.00 $38,000.00
27 517-0003 1LS. Furnish Field Office, Type C $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00
28 517-0009 13 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $2,000.00 $26,000.00 $1,800.00 $23,400.00
29 517-0013 5,000.00 USD  Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00
30 522-0001 15 Each Test Pits $2,000.00 $30,000.00 $650.00 $9,750.00
31 528-0001 5 Each Reset Junction Box $3,000.00 $15,000.00 $4,000.00 $20,000.00
32 599-N0003 100,000.00 USD  Project Allowances (No-Bid) $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00
33 703-0001 3,883.00 S.Y. Topsoil $10.00 $38,830.00 $10.00 $38,830.00
34 704-0003 3,883.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type C $18.00 $69,894.00 $3.00 $11,649.00
35 706-0001 1,745.00 S.Y. Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting $10.00 $17,450.00 $15.00 $26,175.00
36 2000-N005 1.00 L.S. Asbestos Removal, Disposal and Air Monitoring $1,500,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,875,000.00 $1,875,000.00
37 2000-NO08 40,000.00 USD  Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID) $1.00 $40,000.00 $1.00 $40,000.00
38 2000-N029 1LS. Demolition of Buildings (1) $1,100,000.00 $1,100,000.00 $870,000.00 $870,000.00
39 2000-N030 25,000.00 USD  NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (No-Bid) $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00
40 2000-N032 25,000.00 USD  Mold Remediation (No-Bid) $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00
41 2000-N033 1.00 L.S. Universal Waste Removal $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $325,000.00 $325,000.00

$4,837,785.00



