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Page 1_ of i

INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: ‘ ‘ NAME OF BIDDER:
22-S-1 ay27,202  QUOTATION FORM |
— | |
NUMBER UNIT PRICE BID TOTAL
ITEM ARTICLES FOR SALE OF OF PER PRICE
NO = LNITS MEAS,
1.|2014 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R2XEL982341, A-3204 | 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
Mileage: 123,685 (#1 BAD FRONT-END SUSPENSION, BODY DAMAGE - TOW-OUT) i
Unusual Imports LLC
2.| 2015 Chevrolet Caprice, 4Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NSSR2XF1128628, A-3270 | 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
T §2,000.00 $0.00
Mileage: 125,157 (#2 BAD ENGINE- TOW-0OUT)
NO BID
3. 2014 Ford Focus, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #1FADP3E2XEL336971, A-3194| 1 EA. | Minimum Bid $2.799.00
Mileage: 102,699 (#3 ACCIDENT DAMAGE - TOW-OUT) $2,500.00 ¥ 7
_ John Tamburini ) '
4.| 2014 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R21EL982275, A-3207 1 EA. $621 .00
Mileage: 102,553 (#4 INOPERABLE, BODY DAMAGE - TOW-OUT) |
Jersey One Auto Sales
5.| 2015 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NSSR29FL 128569, A-3263| 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
: 5 §2,500.00 |$3,659.00
Mileage: 125,107 (#5 BAD BRAKES - TOW-OUT) .
Economy Auto
6.|2013 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1 GNC2EO4DR284332, T-2750 1 EA. $858.00
Mileage: 119,270 (#6 INOPERABLE / BODY DAMAGE - TOW-OUT)
Jersey One Auto Sales .
7. | 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe,4 Door, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC8GR411673, T-3308 | 1 EA. $4,810.00
'Mileage: 149,540 (#7 BODY PARTS MISSING - TOW-OUT)
Edwin Ribot 4
8. | 2012 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 4WD, Serial #1GNSK4E07CR137625, T-2570 | 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
-' a—— $3,000.00 [$5,152.00
Mileage: 109,062 (#8 BAD TRANSMISSION - TOW-OUT) ’
Elias Rached :
9. 12005 GMC Sierra 1500 1/2 Ton Pick-Up, Serial #1GTEC14V857283503, T-1931 1 EA. $1,656.00
Mileage: 171,443 (#9 BRAKES LOW)
Henry Marter
10. | 2014 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NSSR25EL983963, Mileage: 105,094 A-3228 | 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
5,250.00
Economy Auto $5,000.00 |55,
11. | 2015 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R23FL128549, A-3273 1 EA. | Minimum Bid 5 899 50
; 5 = $5,000.00 $ J '
Mileage: 141,655 (#11 ENGINE NOISE, RADIATOR LEAK) =
Mark Reddick
12.1 2015 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NSSR27FL.228635, A-3272 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
: : $2,500.00 |$3,299.50
Mileage: 96,363 (#12 BAD STARTER,TRANSMISSION- TOW-OUT)
Dana West
13.]2012 Chevrolet 1500 1/2 Ton Pick-Up, Serial #1GCNCPEX2CPEX2CZ165088, T-2530 | 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
T e =7 . = $2,500.00 $0.00
'Mileage: 141,745 (#13 BAD TRANSMISSION, BODY DAMAGE, TOW-OUT)  NO|BID
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14.] 2012 Ford F-150 1/2 Ton Pick-Up, Serial #] FTNFICF3CKE25599, T-2683 1 | EA. | Minimum Bid
Mileage: 128,407 (#14 BAD ALTERNATOR, TOW-OUT)
Timothy Motors o
15. 2012 Chevrolet Express 1 Ton Cargo Van, Serial #1 GCSGAFX5C1121426, T-2561 I | EA. | Minimum Bid $9.500.00
: $6,000.00 phd
Mileage: 122,225
. Tadeusz Czapla
_11))__!_2013 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2E07DR285801, T-2770 1 | EA. | Minimum Bid
_ $4,000.00 $0.00
Mileage: 126,699 (#16 BAD TRANSMISSION, TOW-OUT) =
NO BID
17. | 2012 Chevrolet Silverado Pickup, 2wd, 1/2 Ton, Serial #/ GCNCPEXXCZ164917, T-2501 1 EA. | Minimum Bid 2 316.00
; $2,00000 |$2,316.
Mileage: 100,116 (#17 BODY DAMAGE) - -
_' Timothy Motors
8. | 2014 Chevrolet Express 1Ton Cargo Van,Serial #1GCZGTCGOE1126955, T-2861 | 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
| $4,000.00 |$5,100.00
Mileage: 175,695 (#18 BAD TRANSMISSION, BAD ALTERNATOR, TOW-OUT)
Premium Autos NY
19. | 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door.4wd, Serial #1 GNSKDECOGR407715, T-3285| 1 EA. $3,382.00
Mileage: 133,172 ( #19 MISSING BODY PARTS, TOW-OUT) | '
Julian Torres !
20.| 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door,4wd, Serial #] GNSKDEC1GR405942, T-3277| 1 | EA. ~1$2,300.00
| Last Available Mileage: 112,284 (#20 INOPERABLE, MISSING BODY PARTS TOW-OUT)
~Economy Auto B
21.| 2017 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 4wd, Serial #] GNSKDEC1HR319631, T-3501 | 1 EA. 1$4,520.00
| Mileage: 126,619 (#21 INOPERABLE, MISSING BODY PARTS, TOW-OUT) |
i Economy Auto _ ‘
22.|2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door,4wd, Serial #1GNSK2EC3FR684720, T-3124 | 1 EA. $4,264.00
| Mileage: 128,975 (#22 INOPERABLE, MISSING BODY PARTS TOW-OUT)
] Unusual Imports LLC S S
23. 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door,2wd, Serial #] GNLC2EC2FR690395, T-3114 | 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
. T $4,000.00 [$4,810.00
Mileage: 133,403 (#23 INOPERABLE TOW-OUT) - B i
Edwin Ribot
| 24. 2017 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door,4wd, Serial #1GNSKDEC4HR316030, T3481| 1 | EA. $5,326.00
Mileage: 119,062 (#24 INOPERABLE MISSING BODY& ENGINE PARTS TOW-OUT)
Unusual Imports LLC |
25.|2014 Chevrolet Express 1 Ton Cargo Van Serial #1GCZGTCGXE1125649, ~ T-2859 | 1 | EA. | $1 ,20000

Mileage: 999,999 (#25 INOPERABLE, MISSING BODY PARTS TOW-OUT) |

' Premium Autos NY
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26. | 2013 Chevrolet Express 1 Ton Cargo Van Serial #1GCZGTCGXD1101723, T-2702| 1 EA. $1,875.00
Mileage: 144,370 (#26 BAD TRANSMISSION, MISSING BODY PARTS TOW-OUT)
Premium Autos NY Inc
27. 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 4wd, Serial #1 GNSKDECXGR409195, 13297 | 1 EA. | Minimum Bid 5 650.00
_ $4,000.00 [35,650.
Mileage: 120,385 (#27 NO DRIVE BELT, TOW-OUT)
Economy Auto
28. | 2012 Chevrolet Express 1 Ton Cargo Van, Serial #1GCSGAFX3C1119870, T2557 | 1 EA. |Minimum Bid
;- $2,500.00 |$6,123.00
Mileage: 125,327 (#28 BRAKES LOW) ‘
Timothy Motors
29. 12012 Chevrolet Express 1 Ton Cargo Van,Serial #1GCZGTCG8C1127669, T-2596 | 1 EA. M;I;ilgglal ‘]}3{1? $5.100.00
Mileage: 136,199 (#29 BAD FUEL PUMP TOW-OUT) s
Premium Autos NY Inc |
30. | 2012 Chevrolet Express 1/2Ton Cargo Van,Serial #1GCSGAFX8C1120156, T2554| 1 | EA. | Minimum Bid
| I p Ca"g $2,500|0“ $3,15000
Mileage: 121443 (#30 BAD TRANSMISSION TOW-OUT)
Premium Autos NY Inc
i s
31. | 2012 Chevrolet Silverado Pick-Up, 2WD, 1/2 TonSerial #1 GCNCPEX7CZ165541, T2511] 1 EA. | Minimum Bid | 345 0
$2,00000 |$2.315.
Mileage: 145,776 (#31 DOOR REMOVED TOW-OUT)
Timothy Motors
2150 Pick- i ial # ileage: 225,016 T-2814 | 1 EA. |Minimum Bid
32. | 2013 Ford F-150 Pick-Up, 4WD. 1/2Ton, S.ena] #1FTFX1EFSDKF28183, Mileage ecs |$3,716.00
Timothy Motors
33.| 1996 Ford F-800 Digger Derrick Truck, Serial #IFDXF80COTVA06422, TP-103224 | 1 EA. $2,626.00
| Mileage: 63,556 Hours: 4553 o .
A&A Truck Parts - ) _ B
34. | 2004 International 7400 6Yard Dump Truck w/Plow, T-1814 & R-6077 | 1 EA. |Minimum Bid
$4,000.00 |37,571.00
' Serial #lHTWDADR44J085814, Mileage: 52,329 (#34 BAD STARTER TOW-OUT)
' Joseph DeFino Trucking
35. | 1992 Intemational 2554 Chassis Cab Serial ¥l HTGBPBRXNH416131, T-1266 | 1 EA. $1,226.00
Mileage: 106,667, Hours: 6,808
A&A Truck Parts
36. | 2015 International 7400 6 Yard Dump Truck W/Plow, T-1840 & R-7326 | 1 EA. $4,326.00
' Serial ¥lIHTWDADR45J036050, Mileage: 999,999, Hourss NNA
(#36 INOPERABLE, BODY, ENGINE PARTS MISSING TOW-OUT)
A&A Truck Parts
37.| 2004 International Sweeper Truck Serial #1IHTMMAAN94H655967, TP-071161 | 1 EA. M;;-r;;;t'l:‘-]d $3.501.00

| Mileage: 143,198, Hours: 5,279

Alpine Deere Landscaping Contractors
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38. | 2003 International 7400 6 Yard Dump Truck W/Plow, T-1766 & R-6149 | 1 EA. ~ 1$4,326.00
Serial #]HTWDADR73J063045, Mileage: 76,129 Hours: 6,131 (#38 INOPERABLE, TOW-OUT
- A&A Truck Parts
39.12004 GMC 3500 1 Ton Mason Dump Truck, Serial #1GDJC34U24E247275, TP-104100 | 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
‘ $2,500.00 |$2,501.00
Mileage: 136,359 '
A Better Deal Inc
40. 2004 GMC 3500 1 Ton Mason Dump Truck, Serial #1GDJC34U84E247555, TP-104104 | 1 EA. | Minimum Bid [¢n a8 0
“" T $3,500.00 $3, ’
| Mileage: 139,588
Henry Marter _ |
41.12016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 4wd, Serial #1 GNSKDEC9GR405249, T-3273 | 1 EA. $3,359_.00
I Mileage: 118,594 (#41 BAD ENGINE, MISSING BODY PARTS, TOW-OUT)
| _ Economy Auto
42.|2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 2wd, Serial #1 GNLC2EC6FR684762, T-3097 | 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
$4,000.00 $7,202.00
Mileage: 115,349 (#42 BAD TRANSMISSION, TOW-OUT) e
Edwin Ribot |
43.| 2016 Chevrolet Caprice,4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NSSR22GL237456, A-3312| 1 EA. | Minimum Bid | ¢ 454 50
$2,500.00 $3, ;
|| Mileage: 103,802 (#43 MISSING ENGINE PARTS, TOW-OUT) .
Dana West
44. | 2015 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R21FL128565, A-3261| 1 EA. | Minimum Bid $3.101.50
$2,500.00 et
Mileage: 138,207 (#44 INOPERABLE, BAD FRAME, TOW-OUT) ; '
Dana West | |
45. | 2018 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 4wd, Serial #1 GNSKDECXJR359812, T-3668 | 1 EA. $3,200.00
 Mileage: 999,999 (#45 TOTAL WRECK, TOW-OUT)
, Mark Pajor
46.| 2017 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 4wd, Serial #1 GNSKDEC4HR318408, T-3508 | 1 EA. $2,700.00
Mileage: 63,733 (#46 TOTAL WRECK, MISSING BODY PARTS, TOW-OUT)
Mark Pajor
47.|2014 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6GNSSR28FL.982323, A3217| 1 EA. | Minimum Bid $0.00
. 2,500,00 -
Mileage: 114,115 (#47 INOPERABLE, BAD FRAME, TOW-OUT) 32
NO BID ]
48. | 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 2wd, Serial #1GNLC2ECOFR685406, T-3089 | 1 EA. $2,100.00
Mileage: 114,073 (#48 MISSING BODY, ENGINE PARTS, TOW-OUT)
i =7 Mark Pajor
49. 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 4wd, Serial #1 GNSKKDEC8GR407798, T-3281 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
| $7,50000 |$10,333.00
'Mileage: 122,814 | !
' Liberty Motors |
|
|
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50.1 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 4wd, Serial #1GNSKDEC8GR409180, T-3290 1 EA. |Minimum Bid $5 555.00
Mileage: 133,037 (#50 BAD TRANSMISSION, TOW-OUT) $4,500.00 ' :
L Liberty Motors
51.12016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 4wd, Serial #1GNSKDECXGR406443, T-3276 | 1 EA. |Minimum Bid
$7,500.00 $8,888.00
| |Mileage: 135,614
i Liberty Motors
52.|2013 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 2wd, Serial #1 GNLC2E06DR285711, T-2766 | 1 EA. |Minimum Bid
L s : o $4,500.00 $0.00
Mileage: 150,707 (#52 BAD TRANSMISSION, TOW-OUT)
_ NO BID
53.1 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 4wd, Serial #1GNSKDEC7GR405377, T-3287 1 EA. | Minimum Bid $5.133.00
; I $4,500.00 ! ’
| Mileage: 183,725 (#53 MISSING BODY PARTS, TOW-OUT)
' _ - Liberty Motors -
54,2010 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 4wd, Serial #1 GNUKAE03AR265543, T-2307 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
: $4,500.00 |$6,807.00
Mileage: 103,286 -
Luckana Stone
55.12016 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 4wd, Serial #]1 GNSKDEC5GR408665, T-3301 1 EA. | Minimum Bid $6.636.00
; $4,500.00 ! ’
Mileage: 124,887 (#55 BAD ENGINE, TOW-OUT)
] Liberty Motors
56.| 2013 Ford F-150 Pick-Up, 2wd, 1/2 ton, Serial #1FTNFICF1DKF38761, T-2797 1 EA. | Minimum Bid $3.216.00
: T ' $2,500.00 ' :
Mileage: 154,039 (#56 BAD FRAME) o
Timothy Motors _
57.12013 Ford F-150 Pick-Up, 2wd, 1/2 ton, Serial #] FTNF1CF4DKF38771, T-2796 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
7 ] §2,500.00 |$3,665.00
Mileage: 74,847 (#57 BAD FRAME) !
Peter J. Benigno
58.12013 Ford F-150 Pick-Up, 2wd, 1/2 ton, Serial #1 FTNFICF6DKF38769, T-2802 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
a $2,500.00 $3,263.00
__ Mileage: 97,385 (#58 BAD FRAME) N !
Timothy Motors _ _
59.12013 Ford F-150 Pick-Up, 2wd, 1/2 ton, Serial #] FTNF1CF7DKF38764, T-2801 ] EA. | Minimum Bid
: $2,500.00 |$3,665.00
Mileage: 129,153 (#59 BAD FRAME)
_ Peter J. Benigno -
60. | 2013 Ford F-150 Pick-Up, 2wd, 1/2 ton, Serial #1FTNF1CF3DKF38759, T-2803 1 EA. $1,555.00
Mileage: 94,729 (#60 TOTAL WRECK - TOW OUT) _ o
Airport Auto Sale LLC |
61. 2001 Ford F-550 1-ton Utility Body, Serial #I FDAFS6F61EA92372, T-1650 | 1 EA. $751.00
| Mileage: 166,829 (#61 INOPERABLE, TOW-OUT) J
A Better Deal Inc
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62.|2012 Chevy Express 1-ton Cargo Van, Serial #1GCZGTCG2C112845, T-2594 1 EA | Minimum Bid
'_ $3,500.00 [99,551.00
Mileage: 123,011 '
A Better Deal Inc
_63 2015 Chevrolet Caprice, 4-door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R26FL128576., A-3264 1 EA | Minimum Bid $0.00
Mileage: 136,240 15,000.00 '
NO BID __
64. 2015 Chevrolet Caprice, 4-door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R20FL128590, A-3265 1 EA | Minimum Bid
5 r $5,000.00 $0.00
Mileage: 155,609 *
NO BID
65.] 2016 Chevrolet Caprice, 4-door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R27GL235444, A-3311 1 EA Minimum Bid
; : : $6,000.00 |$6/650.50
Mileage: 71,692
Mark Reddick |
66.| 2015 Chevrolet Caprice 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R22FL 128591, A-3275 1 EA | Minimum Bid
- $5,000.00 [99.999.50
Mileage: 113,822  (#66 BAD ENGINE, TOW-OUT) ’
Dana West :
67.| 2006 International 7300 w/18' Rack Body Serial #lHTZZAAR16J289587, T-1970 | 1 EA | Minimim Bid
— $11.500.00 |$14.010.00
Mileage: 56481, Hours 2445 ’
Edwin Ribot
68. 2014 Wanco, Solar Arrowboard, Trailer Mounted, Model#WTSP, R-8624 1 EA $100.00
Serial# SF11S1018E1002253 (#68 INOPERABLE)
Mark Pajor
69.|2015 Wanco, Solar Arrowboard, Trailer Mounted, Model#WTSP, R-8967 | 1 EA ) $5_Q.00
Serial#5F1151013F1001044 (#69 INOPERABLE)
Mark Pajor
70.1 2016 Wanco, Solar Arrowboard, Trailer Mounted, Model#WTSP, R-9392 | 1 EA $0.00
Serial# 5F11S1011G1006261 (#70 INOPERABLE)
NO BID
71.|2014 Wanco, Solar Arrowboard, Trailer Mounted, Model#W TSP, R-8634 | 1 EA $0.00
Serial# SF11S1010E1002246 (#71 INOPERABLE)
NO BID
72.|2015 Wanco, Solar Arrowboard, Trailer Mounted, Model#WTSP, R-8972| 1 EA $0.00
Serial# SF11S1015F1001028 (#72 INOPERABLE) _
NO BID ’
73.|2010 Wanco, Solar Arrowboard, Trailer Mounted, Model#WTSP, R-7715| 1 EA $0.00
Serial# SF11S1016A1003749 (#73 INOPERABLE) 'g
NO BID




91-PC-32 (REV.2T) Page 7 of 8

SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY

INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: | ‘ NAME OF BIDDER:
2251 | gyzr,2022 | QUOTATION FORM |
B NUMBER l Unim PRICE BID TOTAL
_ILEM ARTICLES FOR SALE UEI%S ME;S PER s -PElIgE
74.| 1989 Massey Ferguson, 2WD Tractor w/bucket loader, Model#375, TP-19433 1 EA $2,000.00
Serial# 5006N 14145, 502 hrs. (#74 INOPERABLE)
Salvatore Eadicicco B
75.12015 Stihl 14" Chainsaw, Model# MS193ce R-8885 | 1 EA $126.00
| Neil Hansen
76. | 2015 Stihl 20" Chainsaw, Model#MS391 (#76 INOPERABLE) R-8894| 1 | EA. i $8?.9_Q_‘_
_ Vincent M)};rs Jr _
77. | 2016 Stihl 20" Chainsaw, Model#MS362CM (#77 INOPERABLE) R-9428 1 EA. $110.00
Baren Baldwin
78. | 2015 Stihl 20" Chainéa—»\;; Model#MS391 (#78 INOPERAi;LE) R-8893 | 1 EA. ol $108.00
Vincent Myers Jr
| 79.| 2009 stihi 14" Chainsaw, Model#MS200T (#79 INOPERABLE) R-7420 | 1 EA. $257.00
—Neil Hansen
80. | Stihl Hedge Trimmer, Model#MS85 TP-07199 | 1 EA. $56.00
' Vincent Myers Jr
81.|2015 Stihl Hand Held Blower, Model#BG8 R-9301 | 1 EA. $56.00
B Vincent Myers Jr
82. ' 2019 Stihl Backpack Blower, Model#BR600 (#82 INOPERABLE) R-10320| 1 EA. $275.00
Baren Baldwin '
83. | Echo Backpack Blower, Model#PB-7555t Unnumbered | 1 EA. $228.00
Baren Baldwin
84. | Echo Backpack Blower, Model#PB-580t Unnumbered | 1 EA. $149.00
i Vincent Myers Jr.
85. | 2008 Stihl Line Trimmer, Model4FS110R (#85 INOPERABLE) R-7114 | 1 EA. $120.00
! Gregorio Lajara
86. 2006 Stihl Line Trimmer, Model#FS110R (#86 INOPERABLE) R-6672| 1 EA. | $60.00
' Elias Rached
87. | 2012 Cimline Magma 230 Crack Sealer, Serial #1C92M1528CM119113 R-8211| 1 EA. $3,303.00
Edwin Ribot
88.| Hamilton 3 Tier Flat Plan File, Model #6J5, ~ F-7617,F-4175,F-4188,F-4178,F-8829 | 1 EA. $52.00
Edwin Ribot |
89. | Hamilton 3 Tier Flat Plan File, Model #6J5, F-2709,F-4517,F-4518 F-4516,F-2707 | 1 EA. $52.00
il Edwin Ribot
90.| Hamilton 3 Tier Flat Plan File, Model #6J5, F-2716,F-4184,F-4174,F-4177,F-2727 | 1 EA. i $25.00
Mark Pajor |
91.| Hamilton 3 Tier Flat Plan File, Model #6J5, F-2715,F-4189,F-4176,F-4179,F-7611 | 1 | EA. $75.00
Premium Autos NY Inc
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92. | OCE Large Format Copier, Model #7055 F-22163| 1 EA. $20.00
Airport Auto Sale LLC
93. | OCE Large Format Printer Model #Colorwave 300 1 EA. $20.00
Airport Auto Sale LLC
94. | Canon Large Format Printer Model #IPF765 1 EA. $20.00
, Airport Auto Sale LLC
95. | Panasonic 103" Interactive Plasma Display Model #TH-103PBIU 1 EA. $33.00
_J ohn Tamburini
96. | Miscellaneous Parts (#96 - LUMP SUM BID ONLY) 4 | Pallets $112.00
Edwin Ribot
97. | Miscellaneous Tires (#97 - LUMP SUM BID ONLY) 2 | Pallets $0.00

NO BID




