
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. A100.614 Letting Date: 6/14/2022

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0002 1 L.S. Mobilization $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00

2 107-0001 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

3 108-0001 5,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00

4 108-N0002 100000 USD Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid) $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00

5 201-0001 1 Acre Clearing and Grubbing $135,000.00 $135,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

6 301-0002 76 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6in Thick $15.00 $1,140.00 $156.92 $11,925.92

7 406-0002 74 C.Y. Concrete Foundations for Ground Mounted Signs $3,500.00 $259,000.00 $10,504.52 $777,334.48

8 406-N0001 9765 LB Aluminum Posts For Parapet-Mounted Signs $15.00 $146,475.00 $59.67 $582,677.55

9 406-N0002 109 Each Parapet Sign Post Mounting Assembly, Type A $5,200.00 $566,800.00 $5,585.82 $608,854.38

10 406-N0003 4.00 Each Parapet Sign Post Mounting Assembly, Type B $55,000.00 $220,000.00 $50,587.81 $202,351.24

11 406-N0105 42.00 Each Parapet Sign Post Mounting Assembly, Type C $7,000.00 $294,000.00 $6,431.29 $270,114.18

12 406-N0106 5 Each Parapet Sign Post Mounting Assembly, Type D $7,800.00 $39,000.00 $5,184.79 $25,923.95

13 406-N0107 10 Each Parapet Sign Post Mounting Assembly, Type E $6,900.00 $69,000.00 $4,381.60 $43,816.00

14 406-N0109 50 Each Removal of Existing Parapet Sign Post Mounting Assembly $2,500.00 $125,000.00 $1,080.36 $54,018.00

15 406-N0110 750 LB Stainless Steel Posts For Parapet-Mounted Signs $20.00 $15,000.00 $24.57 $18,427.50

16 412-N0003 100 Each Weld Existing Inlet Grate $800.00 $80,000.00 $2,109.34 $210,934.00

17 417-0033 100 S.F. Repair Underdeck Spalls (Clean and Coat) $750.00 $75,000.00 $98.60 $9,860.00

18 417-0081 100 S.F. Sidewalk, Parapet and Curb Surface Repairs $750.00 $75,000.00 $245.91 $24,591.00

19 417-0082 100.00 S.F. Vertical Spall Repair $750.00 $75,000.00 $245.91 $24,591.00

20 509-0001 3441 S.F. Sign Panels $25.00 $86,025.00 $149.06 $512,915.46

21 509-0002 70 L.F. U-channel Post $20.00 $1,400.00 $127.33 $8,913.10

22 509-0003 117 Each Removal of Existing Ground-Mounted Sign $250.00 $29,250.00 $1,968.91 $230,362.47

23 509-0004 27 Each Remove Signs $250.00 $6,750.00 $1,080.35 $29,169.45

24 509-0008 2753 L.F. Timber Posts $35.00 $96,355.00 $155.93 $429,275.29

25 510-0005 500 L.F. Beam Guide Rail Element $20.00 $10,000.00 $39.67 $19,835.00

26 515-0016 50.00 Each Delineator, Type LDS-FY $70.00 $3,500.00 $116.69 $5,834.50

27 515-0017 50.00 Each Delineator, Type LDS-W $70.00 $3,500.00 $116.69 $5,834.50

28 517-0003 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type C $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $52,581.44 $52,581.44

29 517-0009 15 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $4,000.00 $60,000.00 $4,814.37 $72,215.55

30 517-0013 20000 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00

31 522-0001 25 Each Test Pits $600.00 $15,000.00 $4,396.33 $109,908.25

32 532-0001 250000 USD Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid) $1.00 $250,000.00 $1.00 $250,000.00

33 601-0001 1 L.S. Remove and Salvage Existing Facilities $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $77,541.30 $77,541.30

34 601-0019 2100 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Ground Wire $5.10 $10,710.00 $7.58 $15,918.00

35 601-0067 4,200.00 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Power Cable $6.35 $26,670.00 $7.58 $31,836.00

36 601-0083 100 L.F. 2in Rigid Metallic Conduit, PVC Coated, Exposed $151.00 $15,100.00 $211.20 $21,120.00

37 601-N0005 100000 USD Miscellaneous Electrical Work (No-Bid) $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00

38 699-N0075 3 Each Flashing Warning Beacon System $20,000.00 $60,000.00 $3,821.46 $11,464.38

39 801-0001 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $1,300,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $1,350,000.00 $1,350,000.00

40 801-0009 5 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $10,000.00 $50,000.00 $12,485.40 $62,427.00

41 801-0013 9 Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $100.00 $900.00 $6,242.70 $56,184.30

42 801-0015 5.00 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $100.00 $500.00 $0.01 $0.05

43 801-N0001 400.00 Each Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing $100.00 $40,000.00 $0.01 $4.00

44 801-N0003 10 Day Placing and Removing Portable Variable Message Sign $850.00 $8,500.00 $719.48 $7,194.80

45 803-0031 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices for State, County, and Local Roadways $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

46 803-0032 130000 USD Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid) $1.00 $130,000.00 $1.00 $130,000.00

47 803-N0001 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00

48 804-N0001 150000 USD Railroad Reimbursement Costs (No-Bid) $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00

$5,245,075.00 $7,450,954.04

BaseLine Item Detail IEW Construction Group Inc.J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Inc.
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