New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T500.620 Letting Date: 5/27/2022

$2,506,980.00
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BaseLine Item Detail HBC Company Inc PKF-Mark IIl, Inc.
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $345,461.00 $345,461.00

3 106-N0001 30,000.00 USD  Permit Fees (NO-BID) $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00

4 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00

5 108-N0002 110,000.00 USD  Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid) $1.00 $110,000.00 $1.00 $110,000.00

6 109-N0002 1.00 L.S. EGIS Survey $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00

7 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $39,500.00 $39,500.00 $37,000.00 $37,000.00

8 202-0009 15,000.00 USD  Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00

9 213-0002 300.00 Ton  Disposal of Regulated Material $125.00 $37,500.00 $62.00 $18,600.00
10 213-0004 1.00 L.S. Asbestos Survey $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00
11 213-N0O005 50,000.00 USD Disposal of Regulated Material, Hazardous, Asbestos (NO-BID) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00
12 517-0001 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type A $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00
13 517-0007 12.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type A $1,200.00 $14,400.00 $1,500.00 $18,000.00
14 517-0013 3,000.00 USD  Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $3,000.00 $1.00 $3,000.00
15 599-N0145 1LS. Utility Relocation, Sanitary Drain (NJTA) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
16 599-N0146 1.00 L.S. Utility Relocation, Electrical (PSE&G) $9,700.00 $9,700.00 $185,000.00 $185,000.00
17 601-0001 1 LS. Remove and Salvage Existing Facilities $95,000.00 $95,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00
18 601-0002 920.00 L.F.  2InRigid Metallic Conduit On Structures $50.00 $46,000.00 $34.00 $31,280.00
19 601-0005 530.00 L.F. 3in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40) $55.00 $29,150.00 $30.00 $15,900.00
20 601-0006 440.00 L.F. 2in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40) $85.00 $37,400.00 $19.00 $8,360.00
21 601-0008 310 L.F.  2in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 80) $60.00 $18,600.00 $55.00 $17,050.00
22 601-0010 360 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Ground Wire $3.00 $1,080.00 $4.00 $1,440.00
23 601-0019 480 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Ground Wire $5.00 $2,400.00 $3.25 $1,560.00
24 601-0030 250 L.F. 4in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-Schedule 40 $70.00 $17,500.00 $45.00 $11,250.00
25 601-0032 1,450.00 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Power Cable $3.00 $4,350.00 $4.30 $6,235.00
26 601-0039 1,700.00 L.F. #12 A.W.G. Power Cable $2.00 $3,400.00 $5.00 $8,500.00
27 601-0055 70 L.F. #2/0 A.W.G. Power Cable $12.00 $840.00 $38.00 $2,660.00
28 601-0058 870 L.F. 4in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-Schedule 80 $38.00 $33,060.00 $58.00 $50,460.00
29 601-0067 920 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Power Cable $5.00 $4,600.00 $6.00 $5,520.00
30 601-0083 870 L.F. 2in Rigid Metallic Conduit, PVC Coated, Exposed $75.00 $65,250.00 $65.00 $56,550.00
31 601-0092 4,800.00 L.F. #350 KCMIL A.W.G. POWER CABLE $25.00 $120,000.00 $22.00 $105,600.00
32 601-0104 300.00 L.F. #12 A.W.G. Ground Wire $2.00 $600.00 $7.00 $2,100.00
33 601-0134 140 L.F.  3in Rigid Metallic Conduit on Structures $75.00 $10,500.00 $55.00 $7,700.00
34 601-0135 1,700.00 L.F. #2/0 A.W.G. Ground Wire $10.00 $17,000.00 $9.00 $15,300.00
35 601-N0049 1,750.00 L.F. #600 KCMIL Service Cable $37.00 $64,750.00 $95.00 $166,250.00
36 601-N0061 90.00 L.F. 3in Rigid Metallic Conduit, PVC Coated, Exposed $85.00 $7,650.00 $168.00 $15,120.00
37 601-N0095 830.00 L.F. 4in Rigid Metallic Conduit, PVC Coated, Exposed $130.00 $107,900.00 $180.00 $149,400.00
38 601-N0096 230 L.F. 4in Rigid Metallic Conduit, On Structures $125.00 $28,750.00 $72.00 $16,560.00
39 602-N0012 1L.S. Electrical Studies $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00
40 602-N0019 1.00 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 1 $155,000.00 $155,000.00 $102,000.00 $102,000.00
41 602-N0020 1.00 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 2 $145,800.00 $145,800.00 $56,000.00 $56,000.00
42 602-N0030 1.00 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 3 $141,300.00 $141,300.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00
43 602-N0076 1.00 L.S. Load Center at Location No. 1 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $245,000.00 $245,000.00
44 602-N0077 1.00 L.S. Load Center at Location No. 2 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $110,000.00 $110,000.00
45 602-N0078 1.00 L.S. Load Center at Location No. 3 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $134,000.00 $134,000.00
46 602-N0079 1LS. Generator at Location No. 1 $262,500.00 $262,500.00 $419,000.00 $419,000.00
47 602-N0080 1L.S. Generator at Location No. 2 $195,000.00 $195,000.00 $331,000.00 $331,000.00
48 602-N0081 1LS. Generator at Location No. 3 $218,500.00 $218,500.00 $323,000.00 $323,000.00
49 604-N0007 3,900.00 L.F. Communication Cable $5.00 $19,500.00 $6.00 $23,400.00
50 801-0001 1LS. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00

$3,592,256.00



