New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaseLine Item Detail

Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc.

Contract No. P200.626

Mount Construction Co., Inc.

National Water Main Cleaning Company

Item No. Unit Code
1 104-0001
2 104-0002
3 107-0001
4 202-0009
5 213-0002
6 517-0002
7 517-0008
8 517-0013
9 523-0002

10 523-0003
11 523-0006
12 523-0021
13 523-N0001
14 531-0001
15 532-0001
16 801-0001
17 801-0007
18 801-0009
19 801-0013
20 801-0014
21 801-0015
22 803-0032
23 803-N0001

Qty
1.00
1.00
1.00
60,000.00

uom
LS.
LS.
LS.
usb

420.00 Ton

1.00

8.00
30,000.00
7,545.00
38,045.00
1,055.00
890.00
46,645.00
20,000.00
100,000.00
1.00
385.00
9.00

3.00
40.00
3.00
10,000.00
1.00

L.S.
Mnth
usD
L.F.
L.F.
L.F.
L.F.
L.F.
usD
UsD
L.S.
M.H.
Each
Each
M.H.
Each
UsD
L.S.

Description

Construction Layout

Mobilization

Progress Schedule

Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid)
Disposal of Regulated Material

Furnish Field Office, Type B

Maintain Field Office, Type B

Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid)

Clean Existing Storm Drain, 24 in. to 48 in. Diameter

Clean Existing Storm Drain, 12 in. to 24 in. Diameter

Clean Existing Storm Drain, 48 In. To 60 In. Diameter

Clean Existing Ditch

Video Inspection of Pipes

Force Account for Snow Removal (No-Bid)

Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid)
Furnishing Traffic Control Devices

Traffic Protection Patrol, Part-Time

Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign

Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator

Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use
Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators

Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid)

Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways

Unit Price
$5,400.00
$100,000.00
$2,100.00
$1.00
$81.00
$36,000.00
$3,600.00
$1.00
$11.50
$10.30
$14.75
$15.00
$6.90
$1.00
$1.00
$83,000.00
$77.00
$3,800.00
$2,300.00
$126.00
$320.00
$1.00
$44,000.00

Line Total Unit Price
$5,400.00 $15,000.00
$100,000.00 $145,000.00
$2,100.00 $5,000.00
$60,000.00 $1.00
$34,020.00 $65.00
$36,000.00 $30,000.00
$28,800.00 $3,000.00
$30,000.00 $1.00
$86,767.50 $12.00
$391,863.50 $8.00
$15,561.25 $15.00
$13,350.00 $28.00
$321,850.50 $1.00
$20,000.00 $1.00
$100,000.00 $1.00
$83,000.00 $393,691.00
$29,645.00 $90.00
$34,200.00 $2,000.00
$6,900.00 $10,000.00
$5,040.00 $100.00
$960.00 $1,500.00
$10,000.00 $1.00
$44,000.00 $30,000.00

$1,459,457.75

Page 1 of 1

Line Total
$15,000.00
$145,000.00
$5,000.00
$60,000.00
$27,300.00
$30,000.00
$24,000.00
$30,000.00
$90,540.00
$304,360.00
$15,825.00
$24,920.00
$46,645.00
$20,000.00
$100,000.00
$393,691.00
$34,650.00
$18,000.00
$30,000.00
$4,000.00
$4,500.00
$10,000.00
$30,000.00
$1,463,431.00

Unit Price
$41,650.00
$2,500.00
$29,000.00
$1.00
$125.00
$20,000.00
$3,000.00
$1.00
$26.15
$10.75
$413.00
$270.00
$17.75
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00
$2,000.00
$250.00
$5.00
$1.00
$3,000.00

Line Total
$41,650.00
$2,500.00
$29,000.00
$60,000.00
$52,500.00
$20,000.00
$24,000.00
$30,000.00
$197,301.75
$408,983.75
$435,715.00
$240,300.00
$827,948.75
$20,000.00
$100,000.00
$1.00
$385.00
$9.00
$6,000.00
$10,000.00
$15.00
$10,000.00
$3,000.00
$2,519,309.25

Letting Date: 3/23/2022
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