New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaselLine Item Detail

Daidone Electric, Inc.

Contract No. T200.575

PKF-Mark Ill, Inc.

HBC Company Inc

Item No. Unit Code

1 104-0001
2 104-0002
3 107-0001
4 108-N0002
5 201-0002
6 202-0009
7 203-0001
8 208-0007
9 208-0022
10 208-0024
11 211-0001
12 213-0002
13 213-0003
14 303-0001
15 417-0082
16 417-0083
17 510-0001
18 510-0011
19 517-0002
20 517-0008
21 517-0013
22 522-0001
23 599-N0103
24 601-0001
25 601-0003
26 601-0009
27 601-0012
28 601-0013
29 601-0014
30 601-0015
31 601-0019
33 601-0050
34 601-0147
35 601-N0001
36 601-N0061
37 602-N0019
38 602-N0020
39 602-N0030
40 602-N0031
41 602-N0035
42 602-N0052
43 603-0006
44 603-0007
45 603-0008
46 603-0009
47 603-0010
48 603-0014
49 603-0017
50 603-0020
51 603-0022
52 603-0040
53 603-0041
54 603-0042
55 603-0051
56 603-0058
57 603-0062
58 603-0063
59 603-0064
60 603-0078
61 603-0080

Qty uom
1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
400,000.00 USD
1.00 L.S.
8,000.00 USD
150.00 C.Y.
5,530.00 L.F.
40.00 Each
37.00 Ton
1,010.00 L.F.
250.00 Ton
470.00 Ton
247.00 S.Y.
125 S.F.
55.00 L.F.
760.00 L.F.

1 Each
1.00 L.S.

19 Mnth
5,000.00 USD
60 Each
1,800.00 L.F.
1LS.
87,600.00 L.F.
13,870.00 L.F.
100 L.F.
61,000.00 L.F.
5 Each

2 Each
73,000.00 L.F.
15,635.00 L.F.
11,000.00 L.F.
395,000.00 L.F.
1,200.00 L.F.
1LS.
1.00 L.S.
1LS.
1L.S.
1.00 L.S.

1.00 Each

10 Each

14 Each

45 Each

21.00 Each

9 Each
1.00 L.S.

1 Each

105.00 Each

5 Each

2.00 Each
60.00 Each
104.00 Each
316.00 Each
1L.S.
1.00 L.S.
1LS.
1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
1LS.

Description

Construction Layout

Mobilization

Progress Schedule

Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid)
Clearing and Grubbing

Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid)
Embankment, Common

Silt Fence

Inlet Filter, Type 2

Construction Driveway

Temporary Orange Plastic Fence

Disposal of Regulated Material

Disposal of Regulated Material, Hazardous
Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick

Vertical Spall Repair

Concrete Parapet Repair

Beam Guide Rail

Beam Guide Rail Anchorage

Furnish Field Office, Type B

Maintain Field Office, Type B

Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid)

Test Pits

Transite Duct Removal

Remove and Salvage Existing Facilities

#2 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable

3in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40)
3in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 80)
#2/0 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable
Junction Box Foundation, Type 1

Junction Box, Type C

#4 A.W.G. Ground Wire

#2 A.W.G. Ground Wire

#2/0 A.W.G. Ground Wire

#4 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable

3in Rigid Metallic Conduit, PVC Coated, Exposed
Electrical Work at Location No. 1

Electrical Work at Location No. 2

Electrical Work at Location No. 3

Electrical Work at Location No. 4

Electrical Work at Location No. 5

Manual Transfer Switch, 100A (480Y/277V, 3-Phase, 4-Wire)
Type LP4 Luminaire

Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-40

Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-26

Type LP5 Luminaire

Type LP6 Luminaire

Temporary Lighting Systems

Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-40-SB

Type LP3 Luminaire, 113W

Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-26-SB

Type LP7 Luminaire

Type LP8 Luminaire

Type LP9 Luminaire

Type LP1 Luminaire, 59W

Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 1
Underbridge Lighting Installation Str. No. 2
Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 3
Underbridge Lighting Installation Str. No. 3
Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 5
Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 6

Unit Price
$0.01
$890,000.00
$0.01
$1.00
$0.01
$1.00
$0.01
$11.00
$210.00
$0.01
$11.00
$25.00
$82.00
$58.00
$250.00
$650.00
$48.00
$9,100.00
$18,042.63
$2,500.00
$1.00
$0.01
$81.00
$367,100.00
$5.50
$35.00
$59.00
$8.20
$6,500.00
$6,300.00
$4.30
$5.30
$7.90
$4.50
$220.00
$26,100.00
$6,500.00
$6,500.00
$0.01
$10,900.00
$20,800.00
$2,700.00
$4,100.00
$3,300.00
$2,800.00
$2,900.00
$582,500.00
$14,600.00
$2,700.00
$14,100.00
$3,100.00
$3,200.00
$2,800.00
$2,500.00
$12,500.00
$6,200.00
$7,000.00
$7,000.00
$10,500.00
$10,500.00

Line Total

$0.01
$890,000.00
$0.01
$400,000.00
$0.01
$8,000.00
$1.50
$60,830.00
$8,400.00
$0.37
$11,110.00
$6,250.00
$38,540.00
$14,326.00
$31,250.00
$35,750.00
$36,480.00
$9,100.00
$18,042.63
$47,500.00
$5,000.00
$0.60
$145,800.00
$367,100.00
$481,800.00
$485,450.00
$5,900.00
$500,200.00
$32,500.00
$12,600.00
$313,900.00
$82,865.50
$86,900.00
$1,777,500.00
$264,000.00
$26,100.00
$6,500.00
$6,500.00
$0.01
$10,900.00
$20,800.00
$27,000.00
$57,400.00
$148,500.00
$58,800.00
$26,100.00
$582,500.00
$14,600.00
$283,500.00
$70,500.00
$6,200.00
$192,000.00
$291,200.00
$790,000.00
$12,500.00
$6,200.00
$7,000.00
$7,000.00
$10,500.00

$10,500.00
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Unit Price

$45,000.00
$502,183.50
$8,500.00
$1.00
$25,000.00
$1.00
$95.00
$7.00
$100.00
$120.00
$6.50
$20.00
$75.00
$60.00
$170.00
$240.00
$50.00
$4,000.00
$20,000.00
$4,000.00
$1.00
$550.00
$56.00
$980,000.00
$4.35
$19.50
$30.00
$7.00
$4,800.00
$3,800.00
$3.50
$4.70
$7.20
$3.50
$150.00
$29,000.00
$3,800.00
$8,000.00
$30,000.00
$18,500.00
$16,000.00
$3,000.00
$4,700.00
$3,800.00
$3,000.00
$3,200.00
$685,000.00
$14,000.00
$2,900.00
$13,500.00
$3,400.00
$3,600.00
$3,200.00
$2,800.00
$11,500.00
$13,500.00
$12,000.00
$26,500.00
$17,000.00
$18,000.00

Line Total

$45,000.00
$502,183.50
$8,500.00
$400,000.00
$25,000.00
$8,000.00
$14,250.00
$38,710.00
$4,000.00
$4,440.00
$6,565.00
$5,000.00
$35,250.00
$14,820.00
$21,250.00
$13,200.00
$38,000.00
$4,000.00
$20,000.00
$76,000.00
$5,000.00
$33,000.00
$100,800.00
$980,000.00
$381,060.00
$270,465.00
$3,000.00
$427,000.00
$24,000.00
$7,600.00
$255,500.00
$73,484.50
$79,200.00
$1,382,500.00
$180,000.00
$29,000.00
$3,800.00
$8,000.00
$30,000.00
$18,500.00
$16,000.00
$30,000.00
$65,800.00
$171,000.00
$63,000.00
$28,800.00
$685,000.00
$14,000.00
$304,500.00
$67,500.00
$6,800.00
$216,000.00
$332,800.00
$884,800.00
$11,500.00
$13,500.00
$12,000.00
$26,500.00
$17,000.00

$18,000.00

Unit Price
$1,000.00
$1,100,000.00
$35,000.00
$1.00
$5,000.00
$1.00
$110.00
$5.00
$120.00
$1.00
$4.00
$15.00
$150.00
$95.00
$45.00
$200.00
$110.00
$4,200.00
$35,000.00
$2,500.00
$1.00
$395.00
$95.00
$778,000.00
$6.00
$50.00
$75.00
$9.80
$9,500.00
$8,500.00
$4.50
$6.00
$8.00
$5.10
$325.00
$9,500.00
$5,900.00
$11,250.00
$5,500.00
$9,850.00
$11,250.00
$770.00
$1,250.00
$1,400.00
$800.00
$850.00
$185,000.00
$2,400.00
$450.00
$8,200.00
$2,500.00
$2,900.00
$2,600.00
$3,500.00
$10,100.00
$12,850.00
$12,950.00
$13,100.00
$19,500.00
$19,500.00

Line Total
$1,000.00
$1,100,000.00
$35,000.00
$400,000.00
$5,000.00
$8,000.00
$16,500.00
$27,650.00
$4,800.00
$37.00
$4,040.00
$3,750.00
$70,500.00
$23,465.00
$5,625.00
$11,000.00
$83,600.00
$4,200.00
$35,000.00
$47,500.00
$5,000.00
$23,700.00
$171,000.00
$778,000.00
$525,600.00
$693,500.00
$7,500.00
$597,800.00
$47,500.00
$17,000.00
$328,500.00
$93,810.00
$88,000.00
$2,014,500.00
$390,000.00
$9,500.00
$5,900.00
$11,250.00
$5,500.00
$9,850.00
$11,250.00
$7,700.00
$17,500.00
$63,000.00
$16,800.00
$7,650.00
$185,000.00
$2,400.00
$47,250.00
$41,000.00
$5,000.00
$174,000.00
$270,400.00
$1,106,000.00
$10,100.00
$12,850.00
$12,950.00
$13,100.00
$19,500.00

$19,500.00

Letting Date: 9/21/2021



New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T200.575 Letting Date: 9/21/2021

BaseLine Item Detail Daidone Electric, Inc. PKF-Mark IIl, Inc. HBC Company Inc
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Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

62 603-0081 1L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 7 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $12,500.00 $12,500.00
63 603-0082 1L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 8 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $7,200.00 $7,200.00 $13,300.00 $13,300.00
64 603-0105 1L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 9 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $7,200.00 $7,200.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00
65 603-0106 1L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 10 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $7,200.00 $7,200.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00
66 603-0107 1L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 11 $34,800.00 $34,800.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00
67 801-0001 1L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $725,000.00 $725,000.00 $980,000.00 $980,000.00
68 801-0009 8 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $0.01 $0.08 $1,500.00 $12,000.00 $5,000.00 $40,000.00
69 801-0013 5 Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $0.01 $0.05 $38,000.00 $190,000.00 $40,000.00 $200,000.00
70 801-0014 304 M.H. Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use $0.01 $3.04 $20.00 $6,080.00 $65.00 $19,760.00
71 801-0015 19 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $0.01 $0.19 $1.00 $19.00 $1,000.00 $19,000.00
72 803-N0001 1 LS. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $47,000.00 $47,000.00
73 804-N0001 35,400.00 USD  Railroad Reimbursement Costs (No-Bid) $1.00 $35,400.00 $1.00 $35,400.00 $1.00 $35,400.00
74 603-0108 1 LS. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 12 (Int-13-Ramp NT) $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $7,200.00 $7,200.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00
75 603-0109 1L.S. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 13 (Int-13-Ramp TN) $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $7,200.00 $7,200.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
76 603-0110 1 LS. Underbridge Lighting Installation, Str. No. 14 (Int-13-Mainline NSO) $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00

$8,988,000.00 $9,661,577.00 $11,181,987.00



