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SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY
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INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
21-8-2 August 25, 2021 | QUOTATION FORM
NUMBER |  LNIT PRIGE BID TOTAL
{TEM ARTICLES FOR SALE OF oF PER PRICE
ND. UNITS | MEAS. UNIT BID
1.12016 Dodge Charger AWD, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #2C3CDXKT6GH268210 A-3297 1 EA. Julian $1,452.00
Mileage: 36,653 (#1 - TOTAL WRECK - TOW OUT) Torres
2.12014 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6GINSSR24EL982285, Mileage: 124,167 A-3210] 1 EA. Alexis $1,952.00
(#2 - MISSING BODY & MOTOR PARTS - INCOMPLETE - TOW OUT) Moody
3.12014 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Seriaf #6G3INSSU20EL944981, Mileage: 159,639 A-3206 1 EA. Liberty $ 738.00
(#3 - MISSING BODY & MOTOR PARTS - INCOMPLETE - TOW OUT) Motors
4. | 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD, 4 Door, Serial #1GNSKZEC3FR678903, Mileage: 122,257 T-3123 | EA. Econemy | $4,669.00
(#4 - MISSING BODY PARTS - ACCIDENT DAMAGE - INCOMPLETE UNIT - TOW OUT) Auto
5. 12015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 2WD, 4 Door, Serial #1 GNLC2ECIFR681042, Mileage: 118,519 T-3088 | EA. Economy $3,219.00
(#5 - MISSING BODY PARTS - INCOMPLETE UNIT - TOW OUT) Auto
6. | 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 2ZWD, 4 Door, Serial #1GNLC2EC9FR685341, T-3092 I EA. Mark $ 4,200,00
Mileage: 123,099 (#6 - MISSING BODY PARTS - INCOMPLETE UNIT - TOW QUT) Pajor
7.1 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, ZWD, 4 Door, Serial #IGNLC2EC2ZFR683391, Mileage: 106,360 T-3096 1 EA. Economy | $2,889.00
(#7 - MISSING BODY PARTS & MOTOR PARTS - INCOMPLETE UNIT - TOW OUT) Auto
8. | 2014 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5SRZ5EL982280, Mileage: 144,116 A-3209 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
. 3,853.
Liberty Motors $3,00000 |$ 3,853.00
|
9. | 2014 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6GINSSR2IEL982309, Mileage: 126,478 A-3215 1 EA. | Minimuem Bid
Liberty Motors $3,000.00 1% 4,348.00
T e —
10. | 2014 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R22EL982317, Mileage: 174,256 A-3216 I EA. | Minimum Bid
2,987.00
Jonny Castellanos 5200000 1$2,
11, | 20£5 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R27FL128554, A-3260F | EA. ] Minimum Bid
Mileage: 113,844 $4,00000 | $5,889.00
Guaranteed Auto Mall
12.] 2014 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R29ELY82301, A-3213 | EBA. Liberty $1,212.00
Mileage: }11,110 (#12 - BAD ENGINE, BODY DAMAGE - TOW OUT) Motors
13.12014 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Sertal #6G3NSSR29ELYE2279, A-3208 I EA., Jachin $3,205.00
Mileage: 110,115 (#13 - NO DRIVE BELT - TOW OUT) Deck
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INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
21-S8-2 August 25, 2021 QUOTAT'ON FORWM
NUMBER | UNT PRICE BID TOTAL
ITEM ARTICLES FOR SALE OF OF PER PRIGE
NO. . UNJTS | MEAS. UNET BID
14.1 2010 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 4WD, Serial #1GNUKAEOAR265631, T-2308 | EA. |1 Stop Aute | $2,300.00
Mileage: 131,801 (#14 - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT) Repair
15. 12016 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 4WD, Serial #1GNSKDEC5GR406379, T-3271 | EA. Julian % 4,200,060
Mileage: 110,745 (#15 - TOTAL WRECK - TOW OUT) Torres
16.| 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Dobr, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2ECIFR6874(7, T-3100 1 EA. Economy | $3,339.00
Mileage: 110,047 Auto
¢#16 - MISSING BODY PARTS & MOTOR PARTS - INCOMPLETT UNIT - TOW OUT)
17. 1 2009 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, ZWD, Serial #l GNECO3079R275518, T-2116 i EA. | Guaranteed] $1,788.00
Miteage: 151,043 (#17 - MISSING BODY PARTS - INCOMPLETE UNIT - TOW OUT) Auto Mall
18.] 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2EC2FRG85410, T3091 | 1 EA. Julian | $4,702.00
Mileage: 118,519  (#18 - TOTAL WRECK - TOW OUT) Torres
19, | 2014 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 4WD, Serial #1GNSK2E(2ER 186965, Mileage: 142,061 1-2943 1 EA. | Guaranteed| $ 2,888.00
{#19 - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT) Auto Mall
20.| 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD, 4 Deor, Serial #1GNSK2EC3FR681929, T-3118 ] | EA. | Minimum Bid
Mileage: 115,246 b
Guaranteed Auto Mall
21.{ 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2EC2FR690297, T-3105 1 EA. o ;
Minimum Bid $ 11.129.00
Mileage: 129,957 $7,000.00 ’
Grace Auto Group
22.| 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD, 4 Door, Serial #1 GNSKDECOGR409271, T-3300 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
Mileage: 107,257 PRI
Grace Aute Group
23, {2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1 GNLC2EC8FR688179, T-3111 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
Mileage: 121,734 {#23 - BODY DAMAGE) $4,500.00 | 6,858.00
Guaranteed Auto Mall
24.| 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD, 4 Door, Serial #1 GNSK2EC6FR631844, T3i21| | EA. | Minfmum Bid 6 12.129.00
Mileage: 117,268 $7,000.00 e
Grace Auto Group
25.12015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1 GNLC2ZECS5FR690259, T~§106 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
Mileage: 110,068 $7,000.00 |$11,129.00
Grace Auto Group
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Mileage: 91,624 (#39 - POWER STEERING LEAK)

INVITATION NO.. DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDSER:
21-S-2 august 25, 2021 | QUOTATION FORM
NUMBER | UMY PRICE BID TOTAL
ITEM: ARTICLES FOR SALE OF OF PER PRIGE
NO. o UNITS | MEAS, UNIT BID
26. | 2013 Chevrolet Tahos, 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2E04DR285867, Mileage: 113,023 T-2772 1 EA. | Minimum Bid $ 4.888.00
(#26 - TRANSMISSION LINE LEAK - TOW OUT) $2,500.00 |3 2,050
Guaranteed Auto Mall
27.1 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD, 4 Door, Serial #IGNSK2ECXFR680342, Mileage: 108,402 T-3117 I EA. | Grace Auto | $8,329.00
(#27 - BAD ENGINE - TOW OUT) Group
28.12016 Cﬁevro!et Tahoe 4WD, 4 Door, Seriaf #1 GNSKDEC8GR409258, Mikeage: 114,001 T-3296 l EA. | Grace Auto!| $11,129.00
(#28 - BAD ENGINE - TOW OUT) Group
29. | 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD, 4 Door, Serial # GNSK2ECOFR683265, Mileage: 107,322 T3120] | EA, | Grace Aute | $9,329.00
(#29 - BAD ENGINE - TOW OUT) Group
30.| 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD, 4 Door, Serial #1GNSK2ECIFR632559, Mileage: 102,587 T-3119 1 EA. Mark $8,111.00
(#30 - BAD REAR DIFFERENTIAL - BAD TRANSMISSION - BAD ENGINE MISFIRE - TOW QUT) Reddick
31.] 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNEC2ECIFRGE867S, Mileage: 111,917 T-3115 I EA. | Minimum Bid
$7.000.00 $11,229.00
Grace Auto Group P
TRy
32.| 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD, 4 Door, Serial #I GNSKDECOGRA07759, Mileage: 108,821 T-3305 I EA. | Minimum Bid
#32 - BODY DAMAGE) T
Grace Auto Group
33.| 2011 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2E09BR382623, Mileage: 106,259 T-2401 { EA. | Minimum Bid
$3.00000 |3 7,271.51
Lukana Stone P
34, | 2013 Chevrolet Tahoe, 4 Door, ZWD, Sertal #1 GNLCZE07DR284373, Mileage: 99,710 T-2751 i EA. | Minimuem Bid
$4.000.00 $6,929.00
Grace Auto Group o
35.| 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe 4W1), 4 Door, Serial #IGNSKDECYGR404957, Mileage: 107,453 T-3298 ] EA. | Minimum Bid $15,129.00
Grace Auto Group §8,000.00 e
—— |
36. | 2015 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NSSR27FL128621, Mileage: 123,630 A-3208 i EA. | Minimum Bid
. sa00000 |5 >»150.00
Charies Ervin OO
37.| 2014 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD Crew Cab Pickup, T-2842 i EA. §Minimum Bid
) . g4,50000 |% 6,888.00
Serial #1GCICVCGTEF106547, Mileage: 151,497
Guaranteed Auto Mall
38. 12012 GMC Sierra 2500HD Crew Cab Pickup, Serial #1GTI1ZCG6CF113628, T2420 1 EA. | Minimum Bid $9.429.00
Mileage: 126,419 $6,000.00 et
Grace Auto Group
39.| 2010 Chevrolet Express 3500 Cargo Van, Serial #1GC2GTBGXA1116933, T-2169 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
$3,000.00 |% 6,998.00

Guaranteed Auto Mall
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INVITATION NO.. DUE DA'fE: NAME OF BIDDER:
21-S-2 August 25, 2021 | QUOTATION FORM
) NUMBER |  UNIT PRICE BID TOTAL
ITEM ARTICLES FOR SALE OF OF PER PRIGE
NO. UNITS | MEAS, UNT BID
40.| 2012 GMC Canyon Pickup, 4WD, Serial #1GTJ6LFE3C8152786, T-2643 1 EA. | Minimum Bid

$5,750.00
Mileage: 148,487 $5,000.00 »

Amboy Auto Associates
41.| 2008 Ford F-250 Pickup, 3/4 Ton, Diesel, w/Tool Box, R-6967 & T-2086 ] EA. { Minimum Bid
- $3,000.00 $ 7,991.00
Serial #1FTSF20R18EC19596, Mileage: 90,470
Gregorio Lajara

42,2012 GMC Sierra 2500HD Piclaup, 4WD, Serial #1GTO2ZCGXCF228872, T-2653 i EA. }Minimum Bid
' $6,000.00 |9 8,999.00
Mileage: 76,458

Guaranteed Auto Mall )
43.1 2015 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD Crew Cab Pickup, T-2972 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
) . $5.000.00 |$ 5,888.00
Serial #1GCICUEGXFF141298, Mileage: 158,300 (#43 - BODY DAMAGE) !
Guaranteed Auto Mall
44. 12014 Ford F-150XL Pickup, 4WD, 1/2 Ton, w/Tool Box, R-5814 & T-2906 1 EA. 1 Minimom Bid 7.222.00
$4,000,00 $7, *
Serial #1IFTFX1EF8EKE48040, Mileage: 168,715 _ *
Guaranteed Auto Mall
45. | 2012 Chevrolet Express 3500 Cargo Van, Serial #1 GCZGTCGECEH 16641, T-2380 I EA. | Minimum Bid
. . $3,000.00 |$ 5,999.00
Mileage: 105,373 {#45 - BAD FUEL PUMP - TOW OUT)
Guaranteed Auto Mall
46. | 2015 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD Pickup, 4WD, 3/4 Ton, w/Plow, R-8612 & T-2962 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
) $7.000.00 |9 14,503.00
Serial #1 GCOKUEGS5FZ 138189, Mileage: 116,262 !
Kellogg B Auto Sales
47. 12013 Ford F-150 Pickup, (/2 Ton, Serial #IFTNFICFODKF38766, Mileage: 144,702 T-2798 | EA. | Amboy Auto | §4,500.00
{#47 - BODY DAMAGEK) Associates
48. | 2014 Ford F-150XL Pickup, 4WD, 1/2 Ton, Seriaf #1FTEX1EF1EKE4R039, Mileage: 141,268 T-2916 i EA. I Minimum Bid
sa,000.00 | $ 6,888.00
Guaranteed Auto Mall 4
—————————————————|
49,2011 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD Pickup, 4WD, 3/4 Ten, T-2414 l EA. | Minimum Bid
. . $2,500.00 | $2,715.00
Serinl #1GCOKVCGOBZ405628, Mileage: 132,964 (#49 - BODY DAMAGE)
Timothy Motors

50. | 2011 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD Pickup, 4WD, 3/4 Ton, w/Plow, R-7825 & T-2402 1 EA. | Minimum Bid

$ 9,503.00
Scrial #1GCOKVCGTBZ405237, Mileage: 102,623 $3,500.00 ’

Kellogg B Auto Sales
51.12012 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 Pickup, 1/2 Ton, T-2498 1 EA. | Minimam Bid
Serial #1 GCNCPEX4CZ 164430, Mileage: 146,600 $3,500.00 | 4,615.00
__Timothy Motors
52, 2009 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 Pickup, 4WD, 1/2 Ton, T-2147 1 EA. Vincent $ 3,106.00

Serial #1 GCEK 14C99Z7285364, Mileage: 185,036 Martini
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INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
21-8-2 August 25, 2021 | QUOTATION FORM
ITEM ARTICLES FOR SALE RUBPER | O P Fhice
NO. UNITS MEAS. UNIT BID
53.| 2012 GMC Sierra 2500HD Pickup, 4WD, 3/4 Ton, w/Plow, R-8080 & T-2657 1 EA. | Minimum Bid | -
Serial #1GT02ZCGICF228873, Mileage: 110,893 (#53 - BAD POWER STEERING) $3,000.00 38,121.00
Guaranteed Auto Mall
54. 2012 GMC Sierra 2500HD Pickup, 4WD, 3/4 Ton, w/Plow, R-8079 & T-2656 i EA. I Minimum Bid
Serial #1GT02ZCGYCF228877, Mileage: 94,716 (#54 - MINOR BODY DAMAGE) $3.000.00 % 8,222.00
Guaranteed Auto Mall
55.| 2004 International 7400 6 Yard Dump Truck, w/Plow, R-8863 & T-1802 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
Serial #1HTWDADRS41085802, Mileage: 78,418 Hours: 8,383 s400000 | §4,678.00
Devino Trucks & Parts
56.| 2005 International 7400 6 Yard Dump Truck, w/Plow, R-8859 & T-1831 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
Serial #1lHTWDADR351036041, Milcage: 72,881 Hours: N/A ss.00000 | ¥ 6,788.00
Guaranteed Auto Mall
57.| 2004 International 7400 6 Yard Dump Truck, w/Plow, R-6068 & T-1799 | 1 EA. Devino $ 1,788.00
Serial #IHTWDADR 14J085799, Mileage: 58,469 Hours: 5,390 Trucks & Parts
(#57 - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)
58.| 2005 International 7400 6 Yard Dump Truck, w/Plow, R-6216 & T-1836 | 1 EA, Devino $2,178.00
Serial #IHTWDADR25J036046, Mileage: 98,191 Hours: 7,425 Trucks & Parts
(#58 - INOPERABLE - TOW QUT)
59.] 2004 International 7400 6 Yard Dump Truck, w/Plow, R-7001 & T-1806 i EA. Devino $2,378.00
N Serial #IHTWDADRS43085806, Mileage: 96,483 Hours: N/A Trucks & Parts
(#59 - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)
60. | 2003 Internatienal 7400 6 Yard Dump Truck, T-1826 j EA. | Minimum Bid
| Serial #LHTWDADRXS51036036, Milcage: 70,994 Hours. 5,641 ss000.00 15 5,888.00
Guaranteed Auto Mall
61. 12005 International 7400 6 Yard Dump Truck, w/Plow, R-7542 & 'T-1832 1 EA. | Migimum Bid
Setial #IHTWDADR55J036042, Mileage: 64,486 Hours: 5,258 ssonoo |$ 0.00
NO BID
62. | 2005 International 7400 6 Yard Dump Truck, T-1837 i EA | Minimum Bid
Serial #1HITWDADRAST036047, Mileage: 52,394 Hours: 7,681 | sso0000 | $ 0.00
NO BID
63.12005 International 7400 6 Yard Dump Truck, w/Plow, R-6063 & T-1830 1 EA | Minimum Bid
| Serial #IHTWDADR151036040, Mileage: 73,135 Hours: 7,414 ssonoo | $ 0.00
NO BID
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SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY

INVITATION NO. DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
21-S.2 August 25, 2021 | QUOTATION FORM
g | o[ eagean [y
NO. UNIES MEAS, UNIT BID
04.] 2005 International 7400 6 Yard Dump Truck, w/Plow, R-6217 & T-1843 i EA | Minimum Bid
Serial # HTWDADRXS5J036053, Mileage: 63,329 Howrs: 4,921 $5,000.00 $6,150.00
Rudolph Wobito
65. 12005 International 7400 7 Yard Dump Truck, Serial #1IHTWDAZR351010614, T-1916 i EA Rudotph $5,150,00
Mileage: 22,672 Hours: 3,952  (#65 - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT) Wobito
66.| 2012 Ford F-150XL Pickup, 4WD, /2 Ton, w/2-Tool Boxé;; R-6365, R-6965 & T-2665 i EA | Minimum Bid
Serial # FTFX1EF9CKE10510, Mileage: 162,022 $4,000.00 |$5,188.00
Guaranteed Auto Mall
67.| 2008 Ford E-350 1 Ton Cargo Van, Diesel, Serial #I FTSE34P68DA38430, T-2071 i EA | Guaranteed | $ 2,888.00
Mileage: 83,995 Hours: 6,307 Aunto Mall
(#67 - WON'T STAY RUNNING - BAD BATTERIES - TOW OUT)
68. | 2004 GMC Sierra Pickup, 4WD, 1/2 Ton, w/Tool Box TP-104134 i EA Barren $2,377.00
Serial #1GTEK14XX47328069, Mileage: 165,974 Baldwin
69.1 2046 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6GINSSR27GL237467, A-3313 I EA Mark $ 3,899.00
Mileage: 116,191  (#69 - DASHBOARD DISMANTLED - NO GAUGES) Reddick
' 70.1 2010 Chevrolet Express 3500 Cargo Van, Serial #1GC2GTBGOA1117895, T-2174 I EA | Minimum Bid
Mileage: 101,208 $3,00000 1$9,389.00
Add On Pools
7112012 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 Pickup, 1/2 Ton, Serial #1GCNCPEX8CZ164611, T-2531 1 EA  } Minimum Bid
Mileage: 86,104 $3,500.00 |$5,315.00
Timothy Motors
72.12015 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NSSR20FL128623, A-3269 1 EA | Minimum Bid
Mileage: 137,628 $4,500.00 | $4,800.00
Guaranteed Auto Mall
73.1 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD, 4 Door, Serial #1 GNSKDEC2GR411717, T-3310 ] EA | Minimum Bid
Mileage: 128,325 $8,000.00 |$13,729.00
Grace Auto Group
74.1 2010 Chevrolet Express 1500 1/2 Ton Cargo Van, T-2178 I EA | Guaranteed | § 3,888.00
Serial #1GCUGAD41A 1116836, Mileage: 98,775 (#74 - BODY DAMAGE) Auto Mall
Guaranteed Aufo Mall
75.1 2014 Chevrolet Express 3500 1 Ton Cargo Van, 1-2877 1 EA ] Minimum Bid |
Serial #1GCZGTCGA4E] 126556, Mileage: 183,211 $3,500.00 |3 7,999.00
(#15 - TRANSMISSION LINE LEAK - TOW OQUT)
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INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDBER:
21-§-2 august 25, 2021 | QUOTATION FORM
ITEM ARTICLES FOR SALE NUI(\J,’EER UB\I'I:T PRI}E:EHBID I’g?\{ék
wo. | oo B - - UNITS | MEAS, UNIT BID
76, | 2016 Chevrolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R22GL236341, A-3306| 1 EA. Mark $ 3,500.00
Mileage: 104,935  (#76 - ENGINE MISFIRE - TOW OUT) Reddick
77, 2016 Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD, 4 15(;01, Serial #1 GNSKDEC2GR4] E734; Mileage: 139,307 T-3293 } EA. Mark $ 6,500.00
#77 - INOPERABLE - TOW QUT) Pajox
78. | 2009 Ford E-350 1 Ton Cargo Van, Serial #1FTSE34L19DA38732, Mileage: 91,582 T-2089 I EA. A Better | $5,151.00
{#78 - UNIT RUNS - NO DRIVE BELT - TOW OUT) Deal
79.1 2014 Cheviolet Caprice, 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NSSR23IELI82300, Mileage: 118,547 A-3225 1 EA. Liberty $2,626.00
#79 - BODY DAMAGE) Motors
80. | 2013 Dodge Grand Caravan, 7 Passenger, Serial #2CARDGBGYDR727159, Mileage: 117,090  T-2833 1 EA. [ Minimum Bid
Timothy Motors $4,000.00 | 5,375.00
81.11998 John Deere Backhoe/Loader, Model #410E, Diesel, R-5282 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
Serial #T0410EX848410, Howrs: 1,964 - $8,00000 13 8,800.00
Charles Keehn
82.1 2001 Case International C80 2WT) Utility Tractor, Serial #COBORN3IIIEI(19252 R-5688 | 1 EA. 1 Mintmum Bid
Jersey One Auto Sales $3,500.00 $3,778.00
83.| 2000 Elliott Magnetek 180RD Standby Generator, 180 KW, Diesel, Serial #8U033167  G-14627 I EA. | Minimum Bid
Devino Trucks & Parts §2,000.00 $3,888.00
84.12012 Gravely 36" Cut Self-Propelted Mower, Model #988151, Hours: 202 R-8125 1 EA. Vincent $612.00
Martini
85. | 2012 Gravely 36" Cut Self-Propelted Mower, Model #988151, Hours: 211 R-8124 1 EA. Vincent $ 612,00
Martini
86.1 2012 Gravely 36" Cut Self-Propelled Mower, Meodel #988151, Hours: 242 R-8132 1 EA. Vincent $ 612,00
Martini
87.1 1998 Lely Tractor Mounted Spreader, Model #HR R-5263 I EA. | - NOBID $0.00
88.1 2012 Stihl Line Trimmer, Model #F$250 R-8198 | 1 EA. | NOBID $0.00
(#38 - INOPERABLE)
89.| 2017 Stihl Line Trimmer, Model #F5240 R-9696 | EA. NO BID $0.00
(#89 - INOPERABLE)
90. 12012 Stihl Line Trimmer, Model #FS250 R-8195 I EA, Mike $67.77
(#90 - INOPERABLE) Mulrain
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ITEM: ARTICLES FOR SALE OF CF PER PRICE
NQ. 1INIES MEAS, UNIF BED
91. | 2005 Stihf Ling Trimmer, Model #FS550 R-6545 i EA. Michael $25.00
(#91 - INOPERABLE) Richards
92.| 2012 Stih] Line Trimmet, Model #FS250 R-8190 | 1 EA. Mike $67.77
(#92 - INOPERABLE) Mulrain
93, | 2001 Stihl Line Trimmer, Mode! #FS350 TP-070658 | | EA. Michael $25.00
(#93 - INOPERABLE) Richards
94. : 2001 Stihl Line Trimmer, Modet #F8350 TP-070662 | 1 EA. | Michael $25.00
(#94 - INOPERABLE) Richards
95, | 2006 Stih] Line Trimmer, Model #ES550 R-6729 | 1 EA. NO BID $0.00
{#95 - INOPERABLE)
96. | 2001 Stihl Line Trintmer, Model #5350 TP-070663 { EA. Michael $25.00
(#96 - INOPERABLE) Richards
97.| 2004 Stihl Line Trimmer, Mode! #FS350 TP-071263 | EA. NO BID $0.00
(#97 - INOPERABLE)
98.| 2010 Stiht Line Trimmer, Model #FS250R R-7774 | | EA. | NOBID $0.00
(#98 - INOPERABLE)
99. | 2015 Stihi Line Trimmer, Model #FS240 R-9284 | i EA. | 1Stop Aute |  $ 50,00
(#99 - INOPERABLE) Repair
100. [ 2015 Stihl Telescoping Pole Saw. 12" Cut, Model #HT101 R9I191| 1 EA. Barren $ 275.00
Baldwin
101. | 2015 Stihl Telescoping Pole Saw. 12" Cut, Model #HT101 R-9108| 1 EA. | BarrenBuldwin| § 255,00
102. 12005 Stihl Telescoping Pole Saw. 12" Cut, Mode! #HT101 R-6478 | 1 EA. Jacob $ 40.00
(#102 - INOPERABLE) Czarnowski
103.1 2003 Stitd Telescoping Pole Saw. 12 Cut, Model #1775 R-5977 ! EA. NO BID $ 0.00
(#103 - INOPERABLE)
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INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
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104. 2018 Stihl Backpack Blower, Mode! #BR000 R-10013 i EA. Michael $25.00
(#104 - INOPERABLY) Richards
105. | 2008 Stih! Backpack Blower, Model #BR550 R-7092 | I EA. Barren $ 167.00
(#105 - INOPERABLE) Baldwin
106. | 2010 Stihl Backpack Blower, Model #BR600 R-7720 1 EA. Mark $175.00
(#106 - INOPERABLE) Reddick
107.| 2015 Stihl Backpack Blower, Model #BR600 R-R910 | 1 EA. Michael $ 25.00
(#107 - INOPERABLE) Richards
108. | 1998 Stih] Hand Held Blower, Model #BG75 R-5363 | 1 EA. | NOBID $0.00
(#108 - INOPERABLE)
109. | 2005 Stikl Hand Held Blower, Model #BG85C R-6431 i EA. | Cape Tree $35.00
Service
110. | 1992 Jacobsen Push Mower, Modet #32017 TP-070076 | 1 EA. Barren $47.60
Baldwin
111. | 1990 Jacobsen Push Mower, Model #32017 TP-019615 | 1 EA. | Gregorio $ 150,00
Lajara
£12.12015 Stiht 14" Chainsaw, Model #MS201T R-9206 | 1 EA. Vincent $ 35.00
(#112 - INOPERABLE) Myers Jr.
113.] 2014 Stih! 20" Chainsaw, Model #MS362 R-8578 1 EA. Vincent $45.00
(#113 - INOPERABLE) Myers Jr.
114. 2015 Stihl 20" Chainsaw, Model #MS$S362CM R-9217| 1 EA. Vincent $ 75.00
(#114 - INOPERABLE) Myers Jr.
115.] 2015 Stihl 20" Chainsaw, Modcl #MS362CM R9216| 1 EA. Barren $ 110.00
(#115 - INOPERABLE) Baldwin
116, ] 2016 Stihl 16" Chainsaw, Model #MS261CM R-O418 | I EA. | Vincent $ 85.00
Myers Jr. ‘
117.12015 Stihl 14" Chainsaw, Model #MS201T R-9203 | | EA. Kevin $51.00
(#117 - INOPERABLE) Urban
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[18.] 1998 Stihl Hedge Trimmer 30", Model #HS85 R-5189 1 EA. Barren $45.00
(#118 - INOPERABLI) Baldwin
[19.) 2015 Stihi Long Reach Hedge Trimmer 20", Model #HL 00K R-9099 i EA. Barren $ 175.00
(#119 - INOPERABLE) Baldwin
120, | 1993 Snap-On End Lift Jack, 2 1/2 Ton Capacity, Pneumatic, Mode] #YAG96 G-11496 1 EA. | Guaranteed | $222.00
Auto Mall
121. | Miscellancous Electrical Parts  (#121 - LUMP SUM BID ONLY) 4 rALLETS| Vincent $201.00
Martini '
122. ] Miscellaneous Parts  (#122 - LUMP SUM BID ONLY) 3 raLLETs|  Add On $624.00
Pools
123} Miscellaneous Tires, Various Sizes  (#123 - LUMP SUM BID ONLY) 4 PALLETS|  Airport $ 105.00
Auto Sales
124.| Loader Tire w/Rim, 17.5-25, Goodyear I EA. Hillside $100.00
Estates
125.] 1969 Barrel/Drum Hand Truck, 4 wheel, Harper F-8875| | EA. NO BID $0.00




