NJTA Board Meeting AQBANISIGNMEETING DATE: August 31, RBENDA ITEM NO.: 187-08-2021

Vendor Name (& Location}: Number: RM-165581/165582/165584/165587
Multiple Vendors
Total Amount: $ 181,772.50
Description: Budget Code:
Asphaltic Concrete and Tack Oil Various

Contract Term (Including Options, if any):
One-year contract with the option to extend for two
additional one-year terms at the discretion of the Authority
and with the concurrence of the vendor.

Funding Source: X Operating Capital
FS | Funding subject to F Funds are available In the
authorization appropriate operating/capital
through WRAF budgets for the referenced
approval process. procurements.
FF Future Funded FP | Subject to funding availability
) at the time of ordering.
X
- PROCinEMENT TYPE: Requesting Department:
X Competitive Non-Competitive Operations
Maintenance Division
SOLICITATION TYPE: Director/Manager:
X Bid RFP State Kevin Dunn, Director of Operations
) Contract
Sole Other Publicly advertised In the Star Ledger and posted on the Authority’s
Source and State’s websites on July 8, 2021,

Under this contract, awarded vendors will provide asphaltic concrete and tack oil for roadway maintenance on both
Roadways. To ensure delivery of heated concrete material to the Maintenance Districts, the bid was divided by
mileposts into 18 areas (“Areas”), eight on the New Jersey Turnptke and ten on the Garden State Parkway. Bidders
were required to quote per ton prices for estimated quantities of hot asphalt and per gallon prices for estimated
guantities of tack oil. Bidders were permitted to bid on one or multiple areas and awards are based on the total bid
amount per area. However, the vendor's facilities must be located within 25 miles of the applicable Maintenance
Districts. The bid was fully advertised and the 14 vendors listed in the Authority’s database for the referenced
commodity were notified of the procurement. On July 21, 2021, bids were received from five Bidders as follows: Unit
prices are available from the Procurement Department.

New Jersey Turnpike:

AREA A AREAB AREA C AREA D AREAE AREAF AREAG - AREAH
MP 67.2- MP 90.- MP 105.0- MP 0.0-8.2 MP 0.0-27.5 MP 27.5- MP 50.0- Mp 0.0-6.5
90.0 105.0 122.0 HUDSON 50.0 67.2 PEARL
Vendor BAY HARBOR
AE. Stone, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Egg Harbor Twp, NJ
Brickwell, Gorporation No Bid No Bld Bid Bid No Bid Bid Bid No Bid
Atalntic Highlands, NJ ‘ ° No No o Bl No No Bt o Bl
Stavola Asphait Company, | 421 995,00 | $21,995.00 | No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid NoBid |° NoBid
Inc. - Tinton Falls, NJ
Tilcon New York Inc. No Bid NoBld | $6,475.00 | $6,475.00 No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid
Parsippany, NJ
Trap Rock Industries, : ‘
LLC $21,525.00 | $21,525.00 | No Bid No Bid $7,025.00 | $4,900.00 | $4,900.00 | $4,900.00
Kingston, NJ -

August 3, 2021 Page |1 of 2



NJTA Board Meeting August 31, 2021 AGENDA ITEM NO.: 187-08-2021
Garden State Parkway:

AREA AREA ) AREA K AREA L AREA M AREA N AREA O

MP §.0- MP 27.0- P 48.0- MP 55.0- MP 194.0- MP 120.0- MP 134.0-
Vendor 27.0 48.0 558.0 940 120.0 134.0 143.0
A.E. Stone, inc. . R . ;
Ega Harbor Twp, NJ $4,110.00 | $4,110.00 $4,110.00 No Bid No Bid .| NoBid No 8id
Brickwell, Corporation No Bid No Bid No Bid ;
Atalntic Highlands, NJ $7,717.50 | NoBid Mo Bid No Bid
Stavola Asphalt Company, . . .
o, ~ Tinton Falls, NJ No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid $21,995.00 | $21,995.00 | $21,995.00
Tilcon New York Inc. . . . . ,
Parsippany, NJ ) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Trap Rock Industries, LLC . . . .
Kingston, NJ i | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21,525.00 | $21,525.00 $2.1'525.00-

AREAP AREA Q AREA R
MP 143.0- MP 153.0- MP 158.0-

Vendor 153.0 158.0 172.0
A.E. Stone, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Egg Harbor Twp, NJ
Brickwetl, Corporation No Bid Na Bid No Bid
Atalntic Highlands, NJ
Stavola Asphalt Company, | No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
Inc. — Tinton Falls, NJ
Tilcon New York Inc. $6,475.00 $6,475.00 $6,475.00
Parsippany, NJ
Trap Rock Industries, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kingston, NJ

Departmental Estimate: $195,000.00

Bids were procured, and authorization is being sought to award this contract in accordance with N.LS.A. 27:23-1 et
seq., the Authority’s enabling legislation, N.J.A.C. 19:9-2.2, promulgated pursuant thereto, and Executive Order No. 37
(Corzine 2006). These awards are contingent upon the Treasurer of the State of New Jersey completing the review of
all documents submitted by the selected awardee pursuant to Public Law 2005, Chapter 51 and Executive Order No.
117 {Corzine 2008), and having no objection to same.

Accordingly, authorization is requested to award one-year contracts to supply asphaltic concrete and tack oil to the
following vendors:

1. A.E. Stone, Inc. for Areas i, J and K for an amount not to exceed $12,330.00

2. Brickwall Corporation for Area L for an amount not to exceed $7,717.50

3. Tilcon New York, Inc. for Areas D, D, P, Q and R for an amount not to exceed $32,375.00

4. Trap Rock Industries LLC for Areas A, B, E, F, G, H, M, N and O for an amount not to exceed $129,350,00

For a total amount not to exceed $181,772.50 all subject to availability of funding at the time of ordering.

Authorization Is further requested for the Executive Director to approve each of the two, one-year extensions upon
satisfactory performance by the vendor.
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