
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. A500.592 Letting Date: 6/22/2021

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0002 1 L.S. Mobilization $177,881.00 $177,881.00 $0.00 $0.00 $10,812.00 $10,812.00

2 2000-N006 50,000.00 USD Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report and Monitoring (NO-BID) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

3 2000-N007 50000 USD Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

4 2000-N008 30000 USD Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID) $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00

5 2000-N009 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $52,486.00 $52,486.00 $18,600.00 $18,600.00 $66,127.00 $66,127.00

6 2000-N010 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 2 $22,803.00 $22,803.00 $26,800.00 $26,800.00 $32,015.00 $32,015.00

7 2000-N011 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 3 $26,356.00 $26,356.00 $31,400.00 $31,400.00 $39,853.00 $39,853.00

8 2000-N012 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 4 $33,521.00 $33,521.00 $76,900.00 $76,900.00 $44,178.00 $44,178.00

9 2000-N014 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 6 $31,673.00 $31,673.00 $22,200.00 $22,200.00 $55,801.00 $55,801.00

10 2000-N034 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 7 $20,067.00 $20,067.00 $39,600.00 $39,600.00 $55,801.00 $55,801.00

11 2000-N035 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 8 $31,576.00 $31,576.00 $45,400.00 $45,400.00 $51,206.00 $51,206.00

12 2000-N036 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 9 $40,459.00 $40,459.00 $52,400.00 $52,400.00 $57,423.00 $57,423.00

13 2000-N037 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 10 $34,331.00 $34,331.00 $54,800.00 $54,800.00 $63,370.00 $63,370.00

14 2000-N015 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $525,277.00 $525,277.00 $551,400.00 $551,400.00 $553,628.00 $553,628.00

15 2000-N016 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 2 $268,972.00 $268,972.00 $147,900.00 $147,900.00 $249,920.00 $249,920.00

16 2000-N017 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 3 $303,603.00 $303,603.00 $339,400.00 $339,400.00 $339,799.00 $339,799.00

17 2000-N018 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 4 $228,710.00 $228,710.00 $288,400.00 $288,400.00 $268,210.00 $268,210.00

18 2000-N019 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 5 $8,925.00 $8,925.00 $168,600.00 $168,600.00 $60,734.00 $60,734.00

19 2000-N020 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 6 $340,345.00 $340,345.00 $368,800.00 $368,800.00 $406,758.00 $406,758.00

20 2000-N039 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 7 $33,975.00 $33,975.00 $35,900.00 $35,900.00 $43,244.00 $43,244.00

21 2000-N040 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 8 $245,602.00 $245,602.00 $272,200.00 $272,200.00 $294,702.00 $294,702.00

22 2000-N041 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 9 $251,630.00 $251,630.00 $351,600.00 $351,600.00 $337,829.00 $337,829.00

23 2000-N042 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 10 $309,427.00 $309,427.00 $451,400.00 $451,400.00 $482,035.00 $482,035.00

24 2000-N048 10 Each Generator BMS Integration (Power Failure, Operation Status, Transfer Status) $3,900.00 $39,000.00 $3,600.00 $36,000.00 $3,459.90 $34,599.00

25 2000-N050 10 Each Sump Pump High Water Alarm BMS Integration $6,100.00 $61,000.00 $2,190.00 $21,900.00 $2,108.40 $21,084.00

26 2000-N052 10.00 Each Glycol Make-up Low Water BMS Integration $2,300.00 $23,000.00 $5,660.00 $56,600.00 $5,406.00 $54,060.00

27 801-N0004 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $10,812.00 $10,812.00

28 2000-N051 500000 USD Force Account for Controls Work and Retro-Commissioning (NO-BID) $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00

29 2000-N023 100000 USD Force Account for Building Mechanical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00

30 2000-N024 100,000.00 USD Force Account for Temporary Heating Allowance (NO-BID) $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00

$3,955,619.00 $4,292,200.00 $4,464,000.00 

BaseLine Item Detail Gaudelli Bros Inc. H & S Construction and MechanicalACP Contracting Inc.
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