
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P100.520 Letting Date: 11/13/2020

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0002 1 L.S. Mobilization $359,400.00 $359,400.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $445,000.00 $445,000.00

2 107-0001 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

3 108-0001 5,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00

4 203-0002 56 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $110.00 $6,160.00 $150.00 $8,400.00 $81.39 $4,557.84

5 302-0062 2,250.00 S.Y. Membrane Waterproofing $25.00 $56,250.00 $35.00 $78,750.00 $35.72 $80,370.00

6 302-0063 5000 USD Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00

7 302-0064 110 GAL Tack Coat $10.00 $1,100.00 $20.00 $2,200.00 $11.16 $1,227.60

8 302-0065 200 L.F. Cleaning Inside Shoulders $1.00 $200.00 $1.00 $200.00 $1.12 $224.00

9 302-0066 200.00 L.F. Cleaning Outside Shoulders $1.00 $200.00 $1.00 $200.00 $1.12 $224.00

10 302-0068 20 Ton High Performance Cold Patch $540.00 $10,800.00 $500.00 $10,000.00 $1,250.92 $25,018.40

11 302-0070 200.00 L.F. Crack Spanning Membrane $16.00 $3,200.00 $16.00 $3,200.00 $17.86 $3,572.00

12 302-0071 690 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $4.00 $2,760.00 $10.00 $6,900.00 $4.47 $3,084.30

13 302-0073 700 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M64 Surface Course $484.00 $338,800.00 $800.00 $560,000.00 $592.74 $414,918.00

14 302-N0002 25 Ton Temporary Surfacing $2,000.00 $50,000.00 $2,200.00 $55,000.00 $703.15 $17,578.75

15 305-0031 700.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Variable Depth $55.00 $38,500.00 $150.00 $105,000.00 $35.72 $25,004.00

16 306-0001 100 L.F. Milled Rumble Strip $35.00 $3,500.00 $65.00 $6,500.00 $69.77 $6,977.00

17 312-0001 100.00 L.F. Sawing and Sealing Joints in Asphalt Concrete Overlay $5.00 $500.00 $20.00 $2,000.00 $14.17 $1,417.00

18 401-0035 300 Each Drill and Grout Reinforcement Bars $35.00 $10,500.00 $40.00 $12,000.00 $60.46 $18,138.00

19 401-0067 600 LB Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated $5.00 $3,000.00 $4.00 $2,400.00 $3.35 $2,010.00

20 401-0070 1200 S.F. Concrete Penetrating Sealer Treatment $1.00 $1,200.00 $3.50 $4,200.00 $7.18 $8,616.00

21 408-0001 11.00 Each Laminated Elastomeric Bearing, 8in x 12in $14,000.00 $154,000.00 $11,000.00 $121,000.00 $11,263.73 $123,901.03

22 408-0003 2 Each Laminated Elastomeric Bearing 8inX12in, Guided $15,000.00 $30,000.00 $11,500.00 $23,000.00 $12,004.01 $24,008.02

23 408-0004 8.00 Each Laminated Elastomeric Bearing 10inX14in, Guided $15,000.00 $120,000.00 $11,500.00 $92,000.00 $11,386.16 $91,089.28

24 408-0005 24 Each Laminated Elastomeric Bearing, 10inx14in $14,000.00 $336,000.00 $11,000.00 $264,000.00 $10,980.12 $263,522.88

25 408-0046 13 Each Laminated Elastomeric Bearing, 14in X 20in $16,000.00 $208,000.00 $16,000.00 $208,000.00 $12,173.26 $158,252.38

26 408-0047 2 Each Laminated Elastomeric Bearing, 16in X 20in $17,000.00 $34,000.00 $20,000.00 $40,000.00 $14,184.07 $28,368.14

27 411-N0001 2,400.00 S.F. Painting Existing Steelwork $160.00 $384,000.00 $100.00 $240,000.00 $93.77 $225,048.00

28 412-N0016 550 L.F. Removal of Drainage Trough $30.00 $16,500.00 $70.00 $38,500.00 $51.16 $28,138.00

29 417-0001 1.00 L.S. Concrete Repair Material $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $23,447.16 $23,447.16

30 417-0009 2250 S.Y. Removal of Existing Surfacing $55.00 $123,750.00 $90.00 $202,500.00 $35.72 $80,370.00

31 417-0014 50 S.F. Spall Repair, Type 2 $105.00 $5,250.00 $135.00 $6,750.00 $129.54 $6,477.00

32 417-0015 50 S.F. Spall Repair, Type 4 $125.00 $6,250.00 $160.00 $8,000.00 $271.77 $13,588.50

33 417-0016 2,500.00 S.F. Spall Repair, Type 5 $72.00 $180,000.00 $30.00 $75,000.00 $100.03 $250,075.00

34 417-0018 50 S.F. Spall Repair, Type 6 $108.00 $5,400.00 $210.00 $10,500.00 $392.38 $19,619.00

35 417-0020 20.00 L.F. Joint Reconstruction, Type 1 $350.00 $7,000.00 $425.00 $8,500.00 $445.13 $8,902.60

36 417-0021 30 L.F. Joint Seal Replacement, Type 1 $120.00 $3,600.00 $45.00 $1,350.00 $124.34 $3,730.20

37 417-0033 100 S.F. Repair Underdeck Spalls (Clean and Coat) $75.00 $7,500.00 $100.00 $10,000.00 $57.56 $5,756.00

38 417-0044 480 L.F. Joint Replacement, Type 1P $320.00 $153,600.00 $325.00 $156,000.00 $206.52 $99,129.60

39 417-0066 100.00 C.F. Additional 1P Deck Joint Material $330.00 $33,000.00 $100.00 $10,000.00 $370.62 $37,062.00

40 417-0067 50 L.F. Silicone Joint Seal $35.00 $1,750.00 $25.00 $1,250.00 $301.76 $15,088.00

41 417-0070 195.00 L.F. Headblock Repair, Type 1 $325.00 $63,375.00 $225.00 $43,875.00 $280.26 $54,650.70

42 417-0073 60 S.F. Spall Repair, Type U $285.00 $17,100.00 $500.00 $30,000.00 $373.72 $22,423.20

43 417-0081 900 S.F. Sidewalk, Parapet and Curb Surface Repairs $120.00 $108,000.00 $150.00 $135,000.00 $171.59 $154,431.00

44 417-0082 100 S.F. Vertical Spall Repair $225.00 $22,500.00 $175.00 $17,500.00 $221.90 $22,190.00

45 417-0108 100,000.00 USD Force Account for Emergency and Routine Bridge Repairs (No-Bid) $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00

46 417-N0003 500 L.F. Reinforcement Steel, Field Anti-Corrosion Coating $1.00 $500.00 $2.50 $1,250.00 $5.50 $2,750.00

47 418-0001 650.00 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 1 - Abutment $300.00 $195,000.00 $475.00 $308,750.00 $323.16 $210,054.00

48 418-0002 50 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 2 - Abutment $380.00 $19,000.00 $510.00 $25,500.00 $415.16 $20,758.00

49 418-0003 150 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 2 - Pier $350.00 $52,500.00 $510.00 $76,500.00 $415.16 $62,274.00

50 418-0004 90 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type A $4,500.00 $405,000.00 $5,000.00 $450,000.00 $7,000.00 $630,000.00

51 418-0005 50.00 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type B $4,800.00 $240,000.00 $7,500.00 $375,000.00 $5,335.44 $266,772.00

52 418-0006 35 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type C $4,600.00 $161,000.00 $5,700.00 $199,500.00 $4,824.89 $168,871.15

53 418-0007 10.00 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type D $3,000.00 $30,000.00 $4,000.00 $40,000.00 $2,942.05 $29,420.50

54 418-0008 3 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type E $8,500.00 $25,500.00 $7,500.00 $22,500.00 $9,571.48 $28,714.44

55 418-0009 3 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type F $5,100.00 $15,300.00 $4,500.00 $13,500.00 $7,327.87 $21,983.61

56 418-0010 2 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type G $13,000.00 $26,000.00 $13,000.00 $26,000.00 $23,745.43 $47,490.86

57 418-0011 1,450.00 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 1 - Pier $325.00 $471,250.00 $475.00 $688,750.00 $343.16 $497,582.00

58 418-0012 3 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type H $16,000.00 $48,000.00 $8,000.00 $24,000.00 $16,535.61 $49,606.83

59 418-0013 2.00 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type I $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $7,800.00 $15,600.00 $11,810.52 $23,621.04

60 418-0014 3 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type L $8,500.00 $25,500.00 $9,000.00 $27,000.00 $13,449.18 $40,347.54

BaseLine Item Detail Ferreira Construction Co. Inc. IEW Construction Group Inc.Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc.
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P100.520 Letting Date: 11/13/2020

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

BaseLine Item Detail Ferreira Construction Co. Inc. IEW Construction Group Inc.Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc.

61 418-0015 3 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type M $14,000.00 $42,000.00 $15,000.00 $45,000.00 $27,146.39 $81,439.17

62 418-0016 6 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type N $6,100.00 $36,600.00 $7,000.00 $42,000.00 $14,119.76 $84,718.56

63 418-0017 2.00 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type O $5,200.00 $10,400.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00 $7,589.88 $15,179.76

64 418-0018 5 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type P $7,200.00 $36,000.00 $12,000.00 $60,000.00 $15,490.91 $77,454.55

65 418-0019 2.00 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type Q $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $5,500.00 $11,000.00 $6,077.72 $12,155.44

66 418-0024 850 S.F. Substructure Waterproofing $19.00 $16,150.00 $16.00 $13,600.00 $13.40 $11,390.00

67 418-0025 3800 S.F. Substructure Membrane Waterproofing $18.00 $68,400.00 $17.00 $64,600.00 $16.74 $63,612.00

68 418-0028 5 Each Reconstruct Bearing Area $3,500.00 $17,500.00 $4,000.00 $20,000.00 $6,198.41 $30,992.05

69 418-0040 100.00 L.F. Clean Bridge Seat $20.00 $2,000.00 $2.00 $200.00 $71.22 $7,122.00

70 418-0051 5 Each Replace Structural Steel Diaphragm $8,500.00 $42,500.00 $7,000.00 $35,000.00 $5,404.19 $27,020.95

71 418-0053 4.00 Each Temporary Support $12,000.00 $48,000.00 $12,000.00 $48,000.00 $13,262.56 $53,050.24

72 418-0054 100 Each Replace Bolt $150.00 $15,000.00 $150.00 $15,000.00 $134.52 $13,452.00

73 418-0055 50 Each Replace Rivets with High Strength Bolts $200.00 $10,000.00 $250.00 $12,500.00 $134.52 $6,726.00

74 499-N0001 1 L.S. Picking Up and Returning Authority Steel Protection Plates $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $500.00 $500.00 $4,974.81 $4,974.81

75 499-N0003 2.00 Each Install, Maintain and Remove Steel Protection Plate $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $6,995.52 $13,991.04

76 499-N0004 100 S.F. Repair Prestressed Concrete Stringer, Type 1 $700.00 $70,000.00 $750.00 $75,000.00 $817.67 $81,767.00

77 499-N0005 10.00 S.F. Repair Prestressed Concrete Stringer, Type 2 $750.00 $7,500.00 $800.00 $8,000.00 $1,016.32 $10,163.20

78 499-N0048 1 L.S. Construction Access $225,000.00 $225,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $444,000.00 $444,000.00

79 503-N0003 3 Each Cleaning Existing Drainage Structures $450.00 $1,350.00 $600.00 $1,800.00 $1,116.27 $3,348.81

80 504-0011 10 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $1,200.00 $12,000.00 $2,500.00 $25,000.00 $7,077.41 $70,774.10

81 506-0001 30.00 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $28.00 $840.00 $150.00 $4,500.00 $146.49 $4,394.70

82 514-0001 10 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4in Thick $77.00 $770.00 $350.00 $3,500.00 $373.18 $3,731.80

83 516-0007 2,000.00 L.F. Temporary Pavement Striping $4.00 $8,000.00 $3.00 $6,000.00 $3.95 $7,900.00

84 516-0009 2000 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $6.00 $12,000.00 $4.00 $8,000.00 $5.95 $11,900.00

85 517-0003 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type C $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $62,722.93 $62,722.93

86 517-0009 13 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $2,800.00 $36,400.00 $3,100.00 $40,300.00 $3,909.19 $50,819.47

87 530-0001 100.00 Each Raised Pavement Markers $40.00 $4,000.00 $30.00 $3,000.00 $78.14 $7,814.00

88 599-N0007 100 Each Furnish and Install Raised Pavement Marker Reflective Lens $40.00 $4,000.00 $30.00 $3,000.00 $27.91 $2,791.00

89 601-N0005 50,000.00 USD Miscellaneous Electrical Work (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

90 801-0001 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $395,000.00 $395,000.00

91 801-0002 500 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $10.00 $5,000.00 $10.00 $5,000.00 $18.81 $9,405.00

92 801-0003 300 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $40.00 $12,000.00 $25.00 $7,500.00 $55.41 $16,623.00

93 801-0010 1.00 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator $100.00 $100.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $11,095.25 $11,095.25

94 801-0011 1 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $3,290.90 $3,290.90

95 801-0014 100.00 M.H. Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use $77.00 $7,700.00 $25.00 $2,500.00 $112.28 $11,228.00

96 801-N0001 140 Each Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing $100.00 $14,000.00 $2,200.00 $308,000.00 $1,991.27 $278,777.80

97 801-N0003 20 Day Placing and Removing Portable Variable Message Sign $100.00 $2,000.00 $200.00 $4,000.00 $415.26 $8,305.20

98 803-0001 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 1 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00

99 803-0002 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 2 $34,000.00 $34,000.00 $49,000.00 $49,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00

100 803-0003 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 3 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $86,000.00 $86,000.00

101 803-0004 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 4 $26,000.00 $26,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00

103 803-0006 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 6 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00

104 803-0007 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 7 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00

105 803-0008 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 8 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00

106 803-0032 150,000.00 USD Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid) $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00

107 804-N0001 80000 USD Railroad Reimbursement Costs (No-Bid) $1.00 $80,000.00 $1.00 $80,000.00 $1.00 $80,000.00

108 418-0020 4.00 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type R $54,000.00 $216,000.00 $16,000.00 $64,000.00 $55,976.54 $223,906.16

109 418-0056 1 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type S $56,000.00 $56,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $70,654.90 $70,654.90

110 418-0057 9 Each Repair of Structural Steel, Type T $29,000.00 $261,000.00 $20,000.00 $180,000.00 $41,114.08 $370,026.72

111 803-0009 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 9 $34,000.00 $34,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00

$6,618,255.00 $8,269,525.00 $8,354,169.06
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