
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T500.554 Letting Date: 10/21/2020

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $8,560.00 $8,560.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $23,000.00 $23,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $34,170.00 $34,170.00 $234,000.00 $234,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $158,000.00 $158,000.00

3 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $5,617.00 $5,617.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

4 108-0001 10,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00

5 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $38,400.00 $38,400.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00

6 202-0002 4,866.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $18.20 $88,561.20 $22.00 $107,052.00 $13.50 $65,691.00 $21.00 $102,186.00

7 202-0007 320.00 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $5.67 $1,814.40 $25.00 $8,000.00 $18.40 $5,888.00 $16.00 $5,120.00

8 202-0009 10,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00

9 203-0001 2,828.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $20.33 $57,493.24 $9.00 $25,452.00 $8.00 $22,624.00 $28.00 $79,184.00

10 203-N0003 95.00 C.Y. Sand Blanket $32.10 $3,049.50 $55.00 $5,225.00 $82.00 $7,790.00 $40.00 $3,800.00

11 205-0001 289.00 C.Y. Foundation Excavation $50.29 $14,533.81 $80.00 $23,120.00 $172.00 $49,708.00 $30.00 $8,670.00

12 207-0001 242.00 Ton Riprap Stone Slope Protection, 12in Thick, (D50=6in) $74.90 $18,125.80 $65.00 $15,730.00 $89.00 $21,538.00 $80.00 $19,360.00

13 207-0004 9.00 Ton RipRap Stone Aprons, 12in Thick(D50=6in) $158.36 $1,425.24 $80.00 $720.00 $184.00 $1,656.00 $220.00 $1,980.00

14 207-N0006 12.00 Ton Riprap Stone Scour Hole, 12in Thick (D50-6in) $196.88 $2,362.56 $80.00 $960.00 $256.00 $3,072.00 $220.00 $2,640.00

15 208-0001 7,300.00 S.Y. Temporary Seeding $2.94 $21,462.00 $1.00 $7,300.00 $2.50 $18,250.00 $1.00 $7,300.00

16 208-0006 8.00 C.Y. Hay Bales $107.00 $856.00 $55.00 $440.00 $62.00 $496.00 $250.00 $2,000.00

17 208-0008 2,900.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence $4.28 $12,412.00 $4.00 $11,600.00 $8.00 $23,200.00 $6.00 $17,400.00

18 208-0022 4.00 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $112.35 $449.40 $200.00 $800.00 $300.00 $1,200.00 $250.00 $1,000.00

19 208-0024 58.00 Ton Construction Driveway $39.59 $2,296.22 $55.00 $3,190.00 $63.00 $3,654.00 $110.00 $6,380.00

20 208-N0001 1.00 Each Concrete Washout Facility $642.00 $642.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00

21 208-N0003 628.00 S.Y. Geotextile Filter Fabric $2.68 $1,683.04 $1.00 $628.00 $2.00 $1,256.00 $10.00 $6,280.00

22 213-0002 500.00 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $54.57 $27,285.00 $35.00 $17,500.00 $50.00 $25,000.00 $60.00 $30,000.00

23 301-0002 2,090.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6in Thick $17.60 $36,784.00 $10.00 $20,900.00 $14.00 $29,260.00 $16.00 $33,440.00

24 302-0004 490.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course $114.50 $56,105.00 $100.00 $49,000.00 $132.00 $64,680.00 $135.00 $66,150.00

25 302-0064 190.00 GAL Tack Coat $10.00 $1,900.00 $7.00 $1,330.00 $11.50 $2,185.00 $11.00 $2,090.00

26 302-0073 275.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M64 Surface Course $161.57 $44,431.75 $140.00 $38,500.00 $186.00 $51,150.00 $140.00 $38,500.00

27 304-0001 50.00 S.Y. Portland Cement Concrete Pavement $223.63 $11,181.50 $650.00 $32,500.00 $44.00 $2,200.00 $200.00 $10,000.00

28 305-0007 545.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2In Depth $5.35 $2,915.75 $25.00 $13,625.00 $20.00 $10,900.00 $25.00 $13,625.00

29 401-0066 585.00 LB Reinforcement Steel $4.00 $2,340.00 $2.00 $1,170.00 $4.00 $2,340.00 $6.00 $3,510.00

30 502-0001 60.00 L.F. 12 Inch HDPE Pipe, Drainage $77.00 $4,620.00 $50.00 $3,000.00 $58.00 $3,480.00 $110.00 $6,600.00

31 502-0005 35.00 L.F. 15 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class III $88.81 $3,108.35 $55.00 $1,925.00 $105.00 $3,675.00 $135.00 $4,725.00

32 502-0010 550.00 L.F. 24 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class III $148.73 $81,801.50 $115.00 $63,250.00 $106.00 $58,300.00 $220.00 $121,000.00

33 502-0201 1.00 Each 12 Inch HDPE Flared End Section $4,178.00 $4,178.00 $170.00 $170.00 $222.00 $222.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00

34 503-0003 1.00 Each Inlet, Type D2 $4,876.00 $4,876.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

35 503-0011 3.00 Each Manhole, Type P-1 $4,642.00 $13,926.00 $7,000.00 $21,000.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $11,000.00 $33,000.00

36 503-N0030 1.00 Each Outlet Control Structure 1 $10,325.00 $10,325.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $4,600.00 $4,600.00 $7,700.00 $7,700.00

37 504-N0002 1.00 Each Precast Concrete Headwall, 15 IN RCP $4,275.00 $4,275.00 $3,750.00 $3,750.00 $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $4,400.00 $4,400.00

38 504-N0003 1.00 Each Precast Concrete Headwall, 24 IN RCP $6,353.00 $6,353.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $3,400.00 $3,400.00 $6,600.00 $6,600.00

39 504-0011 4.00 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $960.00 $3,840.00 $550.00 $2,200.00 $1,050.00 $4,200.00 $1,200.00 $4,800.00

40 505-0001 191.00 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $54.57 $10,422.87 $32.00 $6,112.00 $63.00 $12,033.00 $45.00 $8,595.00

41 505-0002 1.00 Each Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb Inlet $2,338.00 $2,338.00 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00

42 506-0003 90.00 L.F. 9in X 18in Concrete Vertical Curb $35.31 $3,177.90 $42.00 $3,780.00 $80.20 $7,218.00 $35.00 $3,150.00

43 510-0001 172.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $23.54 $4,048.88 $26.00 $4,472.00 $64.50 $11,094.00 $25.00 $4,300.00

44 510-0011 4.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $2,115.00 $8,460.00 $1,200.00 $4,800.00 $1,900.00 $7,600.00 $2,150.00 $8,600.00

45 511-0006 680.00 L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type II, 72in High $30.68 $20,862.40 $35.00 $23,800.00 $60.00 $40,800.00 $31.00 $21,080.00

46 511-N0022 1.00 Each Sliding Vehicular Gate, Type II, 72in High, 30ft Wide $6,955.00 $6,955.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $12,820.00 $12,820.00 $7,100.00 $7,100.00

47 511-N0023 1.00 Each Pedestrian Gate, Type II, 72in High, 4ft Wide $1,070.00 $1,070.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,603.00 $1,603.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00

48 514-0001 3.00 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4in Thick $300.00 $900.00 $90.00 $270.00 $1,290.00 $3,870.00 $200.00 $600.00

49 516-0009 1,124.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $2.78 $3,124.72 $2.00 $2,248.00 $3.00 $3,372.00 $2.50 $2,810.00

50 517-0003 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type C $1,980.00 $1,980.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $61,700.00 $61,700.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

51 517-0009 8.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $342.00 $2,736.00 $2,200.00 $17,600.00 $1,233.00 $9,864.00 $2,000.00 $16,000.00

52 522-0001 5.00 Each Test Pits $107.00 $535.00 $750.00 $3,750.00 $611.00 $3,055.00 $1,100.00 $5,500.00

53 523-0003 220.00 L.F. Clean Existing Storm Drain, 12 in. to 24 in. Diameter $11.77 $2,589.40 $20.00 $4,400.00 $16.00 $3,520.00 $45.00 $9,900.00

54 599-N0003 50,000.00 USD Project Allowances (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

55 599-N0018 267.00 L.F. 2in Plastic Gas Main $40.13 $10,714.71 $120.00 $32,040.00 $240.00 $64,080.00 $115.00 $30,705.00

56 599-N0022 22.00 Each Bollards $528.00 $11,616.00 $1,250.00 $27,500.00 $840.00 $18,480.00 $1,050.00 $23,100.00

57 703-0001 7,100.00 S.Y. Topsoil $5.46 $38,766.00 $2.75 $19,525.00 $11.00 $78,100.00 $4.00 $28,400.00

58 704-0001 4,300.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $3.05 $13,115.00 $1.00 $4,300.00 $4.00 $17,200.00 $3.10 $13,330.00

59 704-0004 2,800.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type L $2.94 $8,232.00 $1.25 $3,500.00 $4.00 $11,200.00 $3.10 $8,680.00
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60 704-0051 3,900.00 S.F. Sodding $1.03 $4,017.00 $2.00 $7,800.00 $14.00 $54,600.00 $1.10 $4,290.00

61 704-0052 445.00 M.G. Watering for Seeding or Sodding $107.00 $47,615.00 $60.00 $26,700.00 $15.00 $6,675.00 $70.00 $31,150.00

62 706-0001 67.00 S.Y. Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting $13.80 $924.60 $9.00 $603.00 $7.00 $469.00 $15.00 $1,005.00

63 706-0002 3,070.00 S.Y. Temporary Soil Stabilization Matting $3.12 $9,578.40 $9.00 $27,630.00 $2.30 $7,061.00 $3.50 $10,745.00

64 801-N0004 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic $24,585.00 $24,585.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00

65 2000-N009 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $80,490.00 $80,490.00 $166,000.00 $166,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00

66 2000-N015 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $71,690.00 $71,690.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $84,000.00 $84,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00

67 2000-N025 1.00 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1 $648,821.00 $648,821.00 $556,480.00 $556,480.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $298,520.00 $298,520.00

68 2000-N028 1.00 L.S. Site Electrical Work $72,410.00 $72,410.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $37,000.00 $37,000.00 $43,000.00 $43,000.00

69 2000-N030 50,000.00 USD NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

70 2000-N047 1.00 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 1 $214,000.00 $214,000.00 $325,000.00 $325,000.00 $365,000.00 $365,000.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00

$2,076,534.14 $2,368,997.00 $2,498,429.00 $2,593,000.00

Page 2 of 2


