
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T500.551 Letting Date: 6/19/2020

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 2000-N001 1 L.S. Roof Replacement at Location No. 1 $555,130.00 $555,130.00 $611,000.00 $611,000.00 $652,196.00 $652,196.00 $769,540.00 $769,540.00 $915,000.00 $915,000.00 $964,200.00 $964,200.00

2 2000-N002 180 S.F. Decking Replacement $25.00 $4,500.00 $20.00 $3,600.00 $50.00 $9,000.00 $110.00 $19,800.00 $5.40 $972.00 $64.00 $11,520.00

3 2000-N003 1 L.S. Replacement of Lightning Protection System $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $34,000.00 $34,000.00 $24,995.00 $24,995.00 $50,944.00 $50,944.00

4 2000-N007 20000 USD Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00

5 2000-N008 20000 USD Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID) $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00

6 2000-N030 20000 USD NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (No-Bid) $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00

7 2000-N044 15000 USD Project Allowances (NO-BID) $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00

$664,630.00 $724,600.00 $786,196.00 $898,340.00 $1,015,967.00 $1,101,664.00

JDS Industrial Roofing Badger RoofingIntegrity Roofing, Inc.BaseLine Item Detail Northeast Roof Maintenance, Inc. Pravco, Inc. Munn Roofing Corp
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T500.551 Letting Date: 6/19/2020

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description

1 2000-N001 1 L.S. Roof Replacement at Location No. 1

2 2000-N002 180 S.F. Decking Replacement

3 2000-N003 1 L.S. Replacement of Lightning Protection System

4 2000-N007 20000 USD Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID)

5 2000-N008 20000 USD Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID)

6 2000-N030 20000 USD NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (No-Bid)

7 2000-N044 15000 USD Project Allowances (NO-BID)

BaseLine Item Detail

Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
$1,023,000.00 $1,023,000.00 $1,164,918.00 $1,164,918.00 $716,000.00 $716,000.00 

$100.00 $18,000.00 $25.00 $4,500.00 $3,600.00 $648,000.00 

$48,000.00 $48,000.00 $43,370.00 $43,370.00 $47,000.00 $47,000.00 

$1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 

$1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 

$1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 

$1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 

$1,164,000.00 $1,287,788.00 $1,486,000.00

USA General Contractors CorpD.A. NoltDetwiler Roofing, LLC
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