
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. A500.565 Letting Date:  6/16/2020

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0002 1 L.S. Mobilization $104,711.00 $104,711.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

2 2000-N006 50000 USD Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report and Monitoring (NO-BID) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

3 2000-N007 50000 USD Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

4 2000-N008 30000 USD Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID) $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00

5 2000-N009 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $22,712.00 $22,712.00 $17,354.00 $17,354.00 $45,279.00 $45,279.00

6 2000-N010 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 2 $5,841.00 $5,841.00 $12,786.00 $12,786.00 $46,566.00 $46,566.00

7 2000-N011 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 3 $15,027.00 $15,027.00 $23,955.00 $23,955.00 $43,202.00 $43,202.00

8 2000-N012 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 4 $19,594.00 $19,594.00 $23,955.00 $23,955.00 $75,851.00 $75,851.00

9 2000-N013 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 5 $22,698.00 $22,698.00 $29,105.00 $29,105.00 $106,002.00 $106,002.00

10 2000-N014 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 6 $18,017.00 $18,017.00 $23,251.00 $23,251.00 $93,506.00 $93,506.00

11 2000-N034 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 7 $12,002.00 $12,002.00 $13,307.00 $13,307.00 $95,004.00 $95,004.00

12 2000-N035 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 8 $25,992.00 $25,992.00 $21,854.00 $21,854.00 $29,016.00 $29,016.00

13 2000-N036 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 9 $25,497.00 $25,497.00 $19,445.00 $19,445.00 $67,158.00 $67,158.00

14 2000-N037 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 10 $37,266.00 $37,266.00 $28,054.00 $28,054.00 $87,282.00 $87,282.00

15 2000-N038 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 11 $23,621.00 $23,621.00 $13,016.00 $13,016.00 $105,651.00 $105,651.00

16 2000-N015 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $242,147.00 $242,147.00 $325,458.00 $325,458.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00

17 2000-N016 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 2 $59,904.00 $59,904.00 $103,422.00 $103,422.00 $249,000.00 $249,000.00

18 2000-N017 1.00 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 3 $114,444.00 $114,444.00 $169,454.00 $169,454.00 $420,000.00 $420,000.00

19 2000-N018 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 4 $160,929.00 $160,929.00 $249,784.00 $249,784.00 $169,000.00 $169,000.00

20 2000-N019 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 5 $234,378.00 $234,378.00 $295,253.00 $295,253.00 $434,000.00 $434,000.00

21 2000-N020 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 6 $98,352.00 $98,352.00 $160,756.00 $160,756.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00

22 2000-N039 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 7 $47,796.00 $47,796.00 $88,337.00 $88,337.00 $342,000.00 $342,000.00

23 2000-N040 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 8 $217,908.00 $217,908.00 $260,244.00 $260,244.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00

24 2000-N041 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 9 $171,631.00 $171,631.00 $170,937.00 $170,937.00 $185,000.00 $185,000.00

25 2000-N042 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 10 $316,695.00 $316,695.00 $398,964.00 $398,964.00 $272,000.00 $272,000.00

26 2000-N043 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 11 $97,054.00 $97,054.00 $140,596.00 $140,596.00 $147,000.00 $147,000.00

27 2000-N044 10 Each Generator BMS Integration (Power Failure, Operation Status, Transfer Status) $3,000.00 $30,000.00 $3,600.00 $36,000.00 $4,800.00 $48,000.00

28 2000-N045 10 Each Sump Pump High Water Alarm BMS Integration $1,800.00 $18,000.00 $2,300.00 $23,000.00 $2,880.00 $28,800.00

29 2000-N046 10.00 Each Glycol Make-up Low Water BMS Integration $1,800.00 $18,000.00 $2,300.00 $23,000.00 $2,880.00 $28,800.00

30 801-N0004 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic $59,160.00 $59,160.00 $73,500.00 $73,500.00 $33,000.00 $33,000.00

31 2000-N023 500000 USD Force Account for Building Mechanical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00

32 2000-N024 100000 USD Force Account for Temporary Heating Allowance (NO-BID) $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00

$2,949,376.00 $3,485,787.00 $4,326,117.00

ACP Contracting Inc.BaseLine Item Detail H & S Construction and Mechanical Epic Mechanical Inc.
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