
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T200.497 Letting Date: 4/1/2030

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1 L.S. Construction Layout $38,380.39 $38,380.39 $19,100.00 $19,100.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 

2 104-0002 1 L.S. Mobilization $519,000.00 $519,000.00 $601,250.00 $601,250.00 $900,000.00 $900,000.00 

3 108-0001 25,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 

4 108-N0002 250,000.00 USD Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid) $1.00 $250,000.00 $1.00 $250,000.00 $1.00 $250,000.00 

5 202-0002 250 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $48.00 $12,000.00 $100.00 $25,000.00 $200.00 $50,000.00 

6 208-0007 4,000.00 L.F. Silt Fence $5.03 $20,120.00 $7.00 $28,000.00 $8.00 $32,000.00 

7 208-0022 100 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $115.18 $11,518.00 $91.00 $9,100.00 $250.00 $25,000.00 

8 208-0024 130 Ton Construction Driveway $25.00 $3,250.00 $120.00 $15,600.00 $100.00 $13,000.00 

9 209-N0001 21,400.00 S.Y. Geogrid $2.15 $46,010.00 $0.95 $20,330.00 $4.00 $85,600.00 

10 212-0001 250 C.Y. Subbase $42.00 $10,500.00 $67.00 $16,750.00 $100.00 $25,000.00 

11 302-N0005 7,700.00 Ton Warm Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course $96.59 $743,743.00 $130.40 $1,004,080.00 $140.00 $1,078,000.00 

12 302-N0006 11,700.00 Ton Warm Mix Asphalt 9.5M76 Surface Course $104.54 $1,223,118.00 $184.30 $2,156,310.00 $180.00 $2,106,000.00 

13 302-0063 50,000.00 USD Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 

14 302-N0007 14,500.00 GAL Trackless Tack Coat $3.32 $48,140.00 $5.00 $72,500.00 $3.00 $43,500.00 

15 302-0071 30,000.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $1.31 $39,300.00 $2.45 $73,500.00 $2.25 $67,500.00 

16 302-0072 30 Each Bituminous Core Samples $308.60 $9,258.00 $470.00 $14,100.00 $250.00 $7,500.00 

17 305-N0003 71,000.00 S.Y. Concrete Milling $5.43 $385,530.00 $12.05 $855,550.00 $11.00 $781,000.00 

18 305-0009 60,500.00 S.Y. Surface Milling, 1.5 in Average Depth $5.62 $340,010.00 $6.20 $375,100.00 $8.00 $484,000.00 

19 305-0010 21,400.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 6 in Depth $24.60 $526,440.00 $15.85 $339,190.00 $20.00 $428,000.00 

20 306-0001 12,000.00 L.F. Milled Rumble Strip $1.02 $12,240.00 $1.60 $19,200.00 $3.00 $36,000.00 

21 308-0001 3,000.00 S.F. Concrete Pavement Spall Repair $20.00 $60,000.00 $10.00 $30,000.00 $130.00 $390,000.00 

22 312-0001 35,000.00 L.F. Sawing and Sealing Joints in Asphalt Concrete Overlay $1.68 $58,800.00 $2.15 $75,250.00 $2.00 $70,000.00 

23 399-N0004 9,800.00 S.Y. Warm Mix Asphalt Pavement Repair $326.20 $3,196,760.00 $251.10 $2,460,780.00 $530.00 $5,194,000.00 

24 399-N0005 35,000.00 L.F. Sealing Existing Joints in Concrete Pavement $1.00 $35,000.00 $1.25 $43,750.00 $3.40 $119,000.00 

25 406-0002 17 C.Y. Concrete Foundations for Ground Mounted Signs $2,550.00 $43,350.00 $3,330.00 $56,610.00 $2,100.00 $35,700.00 

26 502-0251 5,000.00 L.F. Cleaning Existing Storm Drains $18.46 $92,300.00 $5.40 $27,000.00 $18.00 $90,000.00 

27 503-0021 1 Each New Inlet Frame & Grate, Type G3 $2,699.55 $2,699.55 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 

28 503-0026 1 Each New Inlet Frame & Grate, Type G2 $2,765.85 $2,765.85 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 

29 503-N0001 80 Each Replace Existing Inlet Grate $304.47 $24,357.60 $600.00 $48,000.00 $700.00 $56,000.00 

30 506-0001 400 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $64.01 $25,604.00 $83.60 $33,440.00 $160.00 $64,000.00 

31 509-0001 500 S.F. Sign Panels $40.80 $20,400.00 $53.25 $26,625.00 $85.00 $42,500.00 

32 509-0003 3 Each Removal of Existing Ground-Mounted Sign $306.00 $918.00 $400.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 

33 509-0005 2 Each Relocate Existing Ground-Mounted Sign Assembly $5,100.00 $10,200.00 $6,655.00 $13,310.00 $12,000.00 $24,000.00 

34 509-0007 1 Each Removal of Existing Overhead and Ground-Mounted Sign Panels $2,040.00 $2,040.00 $2,665.00 $2,665.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 

35 509-0008 300 L.F. Timber Posts $45.90 $13,770.00 $60.00 $18,000.00 $140.00 $42,000.00 

36 510-0001 250 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $35.70 $8,925.00 $46.60 $11,650.00 $45.00 $11,250.00 

37 510-0018 2 Each Tangent Guide Rail Terminal $4,845.00 $9,690.00 $6,325.00 $12,650.00 $5,500.00 $11,000.00 

38 510-0031 250 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide Rail $10.20 $2,550.00 $13.50 $3,375.00 $10.00 $2,500.00 

39 514-0031 50 S.Y. Concrete Island, 4in Thick $384.18 $19,209.00 $502.00 $25,100.00 $140.00 $7,000.00 

40 516-0005 4,000.00 L.F. Striping and Marking Removal, Hydromilling $0.90 $3,600.00 $2.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $4,000.00 

41 516-0008 26,500.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Epoxy Resin $1.02 $27,030.00 $1.30 $34,450.00 $1.20 $31,800.00 

42 516-0009 77,000.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $1.11 $85,470.00 $1.60 $123,200.00 $1.20 $92,400.00 

43 517-0002 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type B $14,483.11 $14,483.11 $13,310.00 $13,310.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 

44 517-0008 23 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $2,626.50 $60,409.50 $4,660.00 $107,180.00 $2,800.00 $64,400.00 

45 517-0013 10,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 

46 530-0001 320 Each Raised Pavement Markers $32.10 $10,272.00 $46.60 $14,912.00 $35.00 $11,200.00 

47 703-0001 100 S.Y. Topsoil $45.45 $4,545.00 $40.00 $4,000.00 $15.00 $1,500.00 

48 704-0001 100 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $2.55 $255.00 $27.00 $2,700.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 

49 704-0002 100 S.Y. Seeding, Type B $2.55 $255.00 $27.00 $2,700.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 

50 801-N0004 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic $1,625,784.00 $1,625,784.00 $805,000.00 $805,000.00 $4,049,050.00 $4,049,050.00 

$9,785,000.00 $9,992,517.00 $17,168,000.00

Crisdel Group, Inc.BaseLine Item Detail Della Pello Paving, Inc. D'Annunzio & Sons, Inc.
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