New Jersey Turnpike Authority

Contract No. P200.529

Letting Date: 12/17/19

BaseLine Item Detail Sparwick Contracting, Inc. Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Inc. Rencor, Inc. Northeast Remsco Construction, Inc. Mount Constru
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price
1 104-0001 1 LS. Construction Layout $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
2 104-0002 1 LS. Mobilization $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $115,000.00 $115,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $152,000.00 $152,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $266,000.00
3 107-0001 1 LS. Progress Schedule $1.00 $1.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,500.00
4 201-0002 1 LS. Clearing and Grubbing $95,000.00 $95,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $44,500.00 $44,500.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $45,000.00
5 202-0002 140 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $24.00 $3,360.00 $35.00 $4,900.00 $150.00 $21,000.00 $75.00 $10,500.00 $100.00 $14,000.00 $50.00
6 202-0007 100 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $32.00 $3,200.00 $26.00 $2,600.00 $25.00 $2,500.00 $120.00 $12,000.00 $140.00 $14,000.00 $70.00
7 202-0009 25,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00
8 203-0001 15 C.Y. Embankment, Common $100.00 $1,500.00 $70.00 $1,050.00 $300.00 $4,500.00 $200.00 $3,000.00 $100.00 $1,500.00 $60.00
9 207-0003 86 Ton Riprap Stone Slope Protection, 24in Thick, D50=12in $60.00 $5,160.00 $75.00 $6,450.00 $125.00 $10,750.00 $81.00 $6,966.00 $175.00 $15,050.00 $145.00
10 207-0005 125 Ton Riprap Stone Aprons, 24in Thick (D50=12in) $60.00 $7,500.00 $85.00 $10,625.00 $125.00 $15,625.00 $100.00 $12,500.00 $175.00 $21,875.00 $145.00
11 208-0008 700 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence $5.00 $3,500.00 $8.00 $5,600.00 $12.00 $8,400.00 $7.00 $4,900.00 $40.00 $28,000.00 $12.00
12 208-0010 10 C.Y. Temporary Stone Check Dam $200.00 $2,000.00 $400.00 $4,000.00 $275.00 $2,750.00 $250.00 $2,500.00 $150.00 $1,500.00 $250.00
13 208-0024 394 Ton Construction Driveway $35.00 $13,790.00 $65.00 $25,610.00 $95.00 $37,430.00 $100.00 $39,400.00 $200.00 $78,800.00 $190.00
14 208-N0001 1 Each Concrete Washout Facility $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $4,000.00
15 208-N0002 3 Each Sediment Control Bags $500.00 $1,500.00 $100.00 $300.00 $200.00 $600.00 $650.00 $1,950.00 $750.00 $2,250.00 $200.00
16 208-N0008 1 LS. Stream Diversion $130,000.00 $130,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $97,500.00 $97,500.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $193,945.00 $193,945.00 $100,000.00
17 208-N0009 2 Each Oil-Only Emergency Spill Kit, Type 1 $175.00 $350.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $100.00 $200.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $500.00
18 213-0002 227 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $75.00 $17,025.00 $55.00 $12,485.00 $100.00 $22,700.00 $28.00 $6,356.00 $100.00 $22,700.00 $200.00
19 401-NO006 4,200.00 C.F. Grout $28.00 $117,600.00 $80.00 $336,000.00 $1.00 $4,200.00 $30.00 $126,000.00 $11.00 $46,200.00 $20.00
20 418-0023 50 L.F. Epoxy Resin Injection $50.00 $2,500.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $170.00 $8,500.00 $65.00 $3,250.00 $150.00 $7,500.00 $55.00
21 418-0080 3 GAL Furnish Epoxy Resin $150.00 $450.00 $2,230.00 $6,690.00 $300.00 $900.00 $75.00 $225.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 $225.00
22 418-N0054 100 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 1 - Headwall $150.00 $15,000.00 $200.00 $20,000.00 $275.00 $27,500.00 $200.00 $20,000.00 $400.00 $40,000.00 $200.00
23 418-N0055 25 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 2 - Headwall $250.00 $6,250.00 $235.00 $5,875.00 $450.00 $11,250.00 $300.00 $7,500.00 $250.00 $6,250.00 $325.00
24 499-N0062 357,000.00 USD Furnish Steel Arch Pipe Liner, MP 158.1 (No-Bid) $1.00 $357,000.00 $1.00 $357,000.00 $1.00 $357,000.00 $1.00 $357,000.00 $1.00 $357,000.00 $1.00
25 499-N0063 249 L.F. Install Steel Arch Pipe Liner, MP 158.1 $1,280.00 $318,720.00 $1,350.00 $336,150.00 $2,000.00 $498,000.00 $2,150.00 $535,350.00 $1,500.00 $373,500.00 $1,900.00
26 504-0011 5 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $850.00 $4,250.00 $2,000.00 $10,000.00 $815.00 $4,075.00 $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $925.00
27 511-0032 40 L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type Il, 84in High $85.00 $3,400.00 $65.00 $2,600.00 $100.00 $4,000.00 $75.00 $3,000.00 $125.00 $5,000.00 $90.00
28 517-0002 1 LS. Furnish Field Office, Type B $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $30,000.00
29 517-0008 12 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $1,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,500.00 $30,000.00 $2,300.00 $27,600.00 $600.00 $7,200.00 $3,200.00 $38,400.00 $2,500.00
30 517-0013 7,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $7,000.00 $1.00 $7,000.00 $1.00 $7,000.00 $1.00 $7,000.00 $1.00 $7,000.00 $1.00
31 522-0001 10 Each Test Pits $300.00 $3,000.00 $150.00 $1,500.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $400.00 $4,000.00 $2,500.00 $25,000.00 $800.00
32 532-0001 250,000.00 USD Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid) $1.00  $250,000.00 $1.00  $250,000.00 $1.00  $250,000.00 $1.00  $250,000.00 $1.00  $250,000.00 $1.00
33 703-0001 983 S.Y. Topsoil $6.00 $5,898.00 $5.00 $4,915.00 $8.00 $7,864.00 $9.00 $8,847.00 $25.00 $24,575.00 $9.00
34 704-0001 983 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $1.00 $983.00 $3.00 $2,949.00 $2.00 $1,966.00 $4.00 $3,932.00 $4.00 $3,932.00 $2.00
35 706-0001 983 S.Y. Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting $2.00 $1,966.00 $5.00 $4,915.00 $8.00 $7,864.00 $8.00 $7,864.00 $7.00 $6,881.00 $14.00
36 803-N0003 1 LS. Maintenance And Protection Of Traffic On State, County, And Local Roadways $33,000.00 $33,000.00 $43,536.00 $43,536.00 $119,000.00 $119,000.00 $98,000.00 $98,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $50,000.00

$1,639,153.00
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$1,785,000.00

$1,828,599.00

$1,897,315.00

$1,964,358.00



New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaseLine Item Detail

iction Co., Inc.

Contract No. P200.529

Ferreira Construction Co. Inc.

Merco, Inc. D/B/A Merco Of New

New Prince Concrete Construction

Jersey, Inc. Co., Inc.
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1 LS. Construction Layout $25,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $10,140.00 $10,140.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00
2 104-0002 1 LS. Mobilization $266,000.00 $135,000.00 $135,000.00 $144,000.00 $144,000.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00
3 107-0001 1 LS. Progress Schedule $2,500.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $500.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
4 201-0002 1 LS. Clearing and Grubbing $45,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00
5 202-0002 140 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $7,000.00 $127.00 $17,780.00 $290.00 $40,600.00 $50.00 $7,000.00
6 202-0007 100 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $7,000.00 $40.00 $4,000.00 $200.00 $20,000.00 $50.00 $5,000.00
7 202-0009 25,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00
8 203-0001 15 C.Y. Embankment, Common $900.00 $132.00 $1,980.00 $500.00 $7,500.00 $65.00 $975.00
9 207-0003 86 Ton Riprap Stone Slope Protection, 24in Thick, D50=12in $12,470.00 $70.00 $6,020.00 $260.00 $22,360.00 $285.00 $24,510.00
10 207-0005 125 Ton Riprap Stone Aprons, 24in Thick (D50=12in) $18,125.00 $80.00 $10,000.00 $180.00 $22,500.00 $285.00 $35,625.00
11 208-0008 700 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence $8,400.00 $10.00 $7,000.00 $55.00 $38,500.00 $15.00 $10,500.00
12 208-0010 10 C.Y. Temporary Stone Check Dam $2,500.00 $275.00 $2,750.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $100.00 $1,000.00
13 208-0024 394 Ton Construction Driveway $74,860.00 $125.00 $49,250.00 $230.00 $90,620.00 $90.00 $35,460.00
14 208-N0001 1 Each Concrete Washout Facility $4,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
15 208-N0002 3 Each Sediment Control Bags $600.00 $375.00 $1,125.00 $200.00 $600.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00
16 208-N0008 1 LS. Stream Diversion $100,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $75,834.00 $75,834.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
17 208-N0009 2 Each Oil-Only Emergency Spill Kit, Type 1 $1,000.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $800.00 $1,600.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00
18 213-0002 227 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $45,400.00 $84.00 $19,068.00 $150.00 $34,050.00 $100.00 $22,700.00
19 401-N0006 4,200.00 C.F. Grout $84,000.00 $13.00 $54,600.00 $12.00 $50,400.00 $30.00 $126,000.00
20 418-0023 50 L.F. Epoxy Resin Injection $2,750.00 $180.00 $9,000.00 $250.00 $12,500.00 $150.00 $7,500.00
21 418-0080 3 GAL Furnish Epoxy Resin $675.00 $128.00 $384.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $230.00 $690.00
22 418-N0054 100 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 1 - Headwall $20,000.00 $225.00 $22,500.00 $1,100.00 $110,000.00 $350.00 $35,000.00
23 418-N0055 25 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 2 - Headwall $8,125.00 $480.00 $12,000.00 $1,100.00 $27,500.00 $350.00 $8,750.00
24 499-N0062 357,000.00 USD Furnish Steel Arch Pipe Liner, MP 158.1 (No-Bid) $357,000.00 $1.00 $357,000.00 $1.00 $357,000.00 $1.00 $357,000.00
25 499-N0063 249 L.F. Install Steel Arch Pipe Liner, MP 158.1 $473,100.00 $3,050.00 $759,450.00 $3,000.00 $747,000.00 $2,500.00 $622,500.00
26 504-0011 5 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $4,625.00 $400.00 $2,000.00 $3,500.00 $17,500.00 $5,000.00 $25,000.00
27  511-0032 40 L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type II, 84in High $3,600.00 $98.00 $3,920.00 $150.00 $6,000.00 $125.00 $5,000.00
28 517-0002 1 LS. Furnish Field Office, Type B $30,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00
29 517-0008 12 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $30,000.00 $3,000.00 $36,000.00 $2,000.00 $24,000.00 $4,000.00 $48,000.00
30 517-0013 7,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $7,000.00 $1.00 $7,000.00 $1.00 $7,000.00 $1.00 $7,000.00
31 522-0001 10 Each Test Pits $8,000.00 $420.00 $4,200.00 $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $500.00 $5,000.00
32 532-0001 250,000.00 USD Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid) $250,000.00 $1.00  $250,000.00 $1.00  $250,000.00 $1.00  $250,000.00
33 703-0001 983 S.Y. Topsoil $8,847.00 $9.75 $9,584.25 $5.00 $4,915.00 $6.00 $5,898.00
34 704-0001 983 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $1,966.00 $4.50 $4,423.50 $2.00 $1,966.00 $1.00 $983.00
35 706-0001 983 S.Y. Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting $13,762.00 $7.25 $7,126.75 $5.00 $4,915.00 $10.00 $9,830.00
36 803-N0003 1 LS. Maintenance And Protection Of Traffic On State, County, And Local Roadways $50,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $78,000.00 $78,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00

$1,999,205.00 $2,124,661.50 $2,291,500.00 $2,572,921.00
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Letting Date: 12/17/19



