New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaseLine Item Detail

Contract No. P200.532

H.B.C. Company, Inc

Daidone Electric, Inc.

Item No. Unit Code

1 104-0001
2 104-0002
3 107-0001
4 201-0002
5 202-0009
6 208-0007
7 208-0022
8 208-0024
9 211-0001
10 213-0002
11 510-0001
12 510-0019
13 517-0002
14 517-0008
15 517-0013
16 522-0001
17 601-N0004
18 601-N0005
19 601-N0010
20 601-N0038
21 601-N0049
22 601-0001
23 601-0009
24 601-0014
25 601-0015
26 601-0026
27 601-0055
28 601-0056
29 601-0085
30 601-0086
31 601-0103
32 602-NOO11
33 602-N0012
34 603-0005
35 603-0006
36 603-0007
37 603-0008
38 603-0009
39 603-0012
40 603-0020
41 603-0040
42 603-0041
43 603-0042
44 603-0043
45 801-N0001
46 801-0001
47 801-0002
48 801-0003
49 801-0009
50 801-0013
51 801-0014
52 801-0015
53 803-N0001
54 803-0032

Qty uoMm

1L.S.
1 LS.
1L.S.
1LS.
5,000.00 USD
9,465.00 L.F.
6 Each
22 Ton
855 L.F.
350 Ton
500 L.F.
35 Each
1L.S.
9 Mnth
2,500.00 USD
10 Each
90,000.00 L.F.
25,000.00 USD
2 Each
1L.S.
200 L.F.
1L.S.
20,250.00 L.F.
63 Each
16 Each
2 Each
100 L.F.
16,000.00 L.F.
495 L.F.
200 L.F.
250 L.F.
2 Each
1 LS.
3 Each
7 Each
42 Each
14 Each
7 Each
4 Each
39 Each
2 Each
5 Each
22 Each
25 Each
134 Each
1L.S.
340 L.F.
760 L.F.
5 Each
4 Each
100 M.H.
4 Each
1 LS.
8,400.00 USD

Description

Construction Layout

Mobilization

Progress Schedule

Clearing and Grubbing

Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid)
Silt Fence

Inlet Filter, Type 2

Construction Driveway

Temporary Orange Plastic Fence

Disposal of Regulated Material

Beam Guide Rail

Beam Guide Rail Post

Furnish Field Office, Type B

Maintain Field Office, Type B

Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid)

Test Pits

#6 A.W.G. Multiple Lighting Cable

Miscellaneous Electrical Work (No-Bid)

Load Center Cabinet, Type F, Voltage 277/480V
Temporary Lighting System

#600 KCMIL Service Cable

Remove and Salvage Existing Facilities

3in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40)
Junction Box Foundation, Type 1

Junction Box, Type C

Concrete Base, Type |

#2/0 A.W.G. Power Cable

#6 A.W.G. Ground Wire

3-Way Duct Bank, 3in HDPE Conduits Directional Drilled
#3 A.W.G. Ground Wire

3in Rigid Metallic Conduit, Underground
Transformer, Type 112.5 KVA

Electrical Studies

Lighting Standard, Type L-MG2-26

Type LP4 Luminaire

Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-40

Lighting Standard, Type L-MG-26

Type LP5 Luminaire

Lighting Standard, Type L-MG2-40

Type LP3 Luminaire, 113W

Type LP7 Luminaire

Type LP8 Luminaire

Type LP9 Luminaire

Type LP1 Luminaire

Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing
Furnishing Traffic Control Devices

Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier
Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier
Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign
Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator
Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use
Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators

Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways

Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid)

Unit Price
$25,000.00 $25,000.00
$325,000.00 $325,000.00

$9,500.00 $9,500.00
$4,500.00 $4,500.00
$1.00 $5,000.00
$4.00 $37,860.00
$330.00 $1,980.00
$80.00 $1,760.00
$4.00 $3,420.00

$140.00 $49,000.00
$70.00 $35,000.00
$75.00 $2,625.00
$32,000.00 $32,000.00
$2,100.00 $18,900.00
$1.00 $2,500.00
$320.00 $3,200.00
$3.00  $270,000.00
$1.00 $25,000.00
$28,000.00 $56,000.00
$55,000.00 $55,000.00
$25.00 $5,000.00
$138,000.00  $138,000.00
$20.00  $405,000.00
$3,875.00  $244,125.00
$3,650.00 $58,400.00
$2,800.00 $5,600.00
$7.50 $750.00
$3.00 $48,000.00
$160.00 $79,200.00
$5.00 $1,000.00
$45.00 $11,250.00
$17,500.00 $35,000.00
$9,500.00 $9,500.00
$3,100.00 $9,300.00
$1,600.00 $11,200.00
$3,100.00  $130,200.00
$2,600.00 $36,400.00
$1,500.00 $10,500.00
$4,000.00 $16,000.00
$1,650.00 $64,350.00
$2,150.00 $4,300.00
$1,980.00 $9,900.00
$1,680.00 $36,960.00
$1,350.00 $33,750.00
$2,100.00  $281,400.00
$45,000.00 $45,000.00
$40.00 $13,600.00
$60.00 $45,600.00
$25,600.00  $128,000.00
$7,500.00 $30,000.00
$250.00 $25,000.00
$10,100.00 $40,400.00
$7,500.00 $7,500.00
$1.00 $8,400.00
$2,991,830.00

Unit Price
$25,000.00
$420,000.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00
$11.25
$240.00
$52.00
$10.00
$35.00
$30.00
$60.00
$10,000.00
$1,000.00
$1.00
$1.00
$3.60
$1.00
$32,000.00
$234,000.00
$31.40
$229,000.00
$23.00
$5,300.00
$3,900.00
$2,600.00
$9.60
$3.00
$189.00
$2.70
$44.00
$8,600.00
$4,200.00
$2,700.00
$2,300.00
$3,100.00
$2,600.00
$2,400.00
$3,300.00
$2,300.00
$2,700.00
$2,700.00
$2,400.00
$2,100.00
$5,400.00
$48,013.75
$48.00
$37.50
$7,000.00
$7,000.00
$100.00
$1.00
$22,000.00
$1.00
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Line Total
$25,000.00
$420,000.00
$1.00
$1.00
$5,000.00
$106,481.25
$1,440.00
$1,144.00
$8,550.00
$12,250.00
$15,000.00
$2,100.00
$10,000.00
$9,000.00
$2,500.00
$10.00
$324,000.00
$25,000.00
$64,000.00
$234,000.00
$6,280.00
$229,000.00
$465,750.00
$333,900.00
$62,400.00
$5,200.00
$960.00
$48,000.00
$93,555.00
$540.00
$11,000.00
$17,200.00
$4,200.00
$8,100.00
$16,100.00
$130,200.00
$36,400.00
$16,800.00
$13,200.00
$89,700.00
$5,400.00
$13,500.00
$52,800.00
$52,500.00
$723,600.00
$48,013.75
$16,320.00
$28,500.00
$35,000.00
$28,000.00
$10,000.00
$4.00
$22,000.00
$8,400.00
$3,898,000.00

Letting Date: 10/18/19



