
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T100.513 Letting Date: 10/9/19

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1 L.S. Construction Layout $90,000.00 $90,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $199,363.00 $199,363.00 $207,000.00 $207,000.00 $357,760.08 $357,760.08 $781,503.41 $781,503.41 $360,000.00 $360,000.00 $577,697.00 $577,697.00

3 107-0001 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

4 108-0001 5,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00

5 302-0003 1,090.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 19M64 Intermediate Course $113.00 $123,170.00 $165.00 $179,850.00 $93.69 $102,122.10 $100.00 $109,000.00 $100.00 $109,000.00 $114.00 $124,260.00

6 302-0063 5,000.00 USD Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00

7 302-0064 1,735.00 GAL Tack Coat $10.00 $17,350.00 $10.00 $17,350.00 $0.01 $17.35 $1.00 $1,735.00 $9.00 $15,615.00 $10.72 $18,599.20

8 302-0068 5 Ton High Performance Cold Patch $88.00 $440.00 $650.00 $3,250.00 $285.00 $1,425.00 $200.00 $1,000.00 $300.00 $1,500.00 $595.79 $2,978.95

9 302-0071 15,237.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $0.11 $1,676.07 $0.20 $3,047.40 $0.01 $152.37 $0.55 $8,380.35 $0.10 $1,523.70 $0.12 $1,828.44

10 302-0070 87 L.F. Crack Spanning Membrane $20.00 $1,740.00 $19.00 $1,653.00 $27.20 $2,366.40 $45.00 $3,915.00 $16.00 $1,392.00 $19.07 $1,659.09

11 302-0073 1,910.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M64 Surface Course $120.00 $229,200.00 $165.00 $315,150.00 $92.20 $176,102.00 $95.00 $181,450.00 $110.00 $210,100.00 $113.20 $216,212.00

12 302-N0001 100.00 L.F. Sealing Cracks in Bituminous Surface $11.00 $1,100.00 $3.00 $300.00 $45.00 $4,500.00 $30.00 $3,000.00 $20.00 $2,000.00 $10.00 $1,000.00

13 302-N0002 20.00 Ton Temporary Surfacing $110.00 $2,200.00 $1,300.00 $26,000.00 $350.00 $7,000.00 $150.00 $3,000.00 $200.00 $4,000.00 $250.00 $5,000.00

14 303-0001 660 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick $39.20 $25,872.00 $37.00 $24,420.00 $32.00 $21,120.00 $35.00 $23,100.00 $30.00 $19,800.00 $43.19 $28,505.40

15 304-N0001 25 S.F. Approach Slab Spall Repair, Type 1 $60.00 $1,500.00 $65.00 $1,625.00 $300.00 $7,500.00 $250.00 $6,250.00 $225.00 $5,625.00 $100.00 $2,500.00

16 304-N0002 25 S.F. Approach Slab Spall Repair, Type 2 $65.00 $1,625.00 $70.00 $1,750.00 $300.00 $7,500.00 $300.00 $7,500.00 $325.00 $8,125.00 $150.00 $3,750.00

17 305-0001 5,800.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 5in Depth $20.00 $116,000.00 $20.00 $116,000.00 $6.00 $34,800.00 $12.00 $69,600.00 $14.00 $81,200.00 $16.38 $95,004.00

18 305-0006 8,640.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2in Depth $10.00 $86,400.00 $11.00 $95,040.00 $4.25 $36,720.00 $8.00 $69,120.00 $9.00 $77,760.00 $10.72 $92,620.80

19 305-0031 220.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Variable Depth $10.00 $2,200.00 $11.00 $2,420.00 $4.25 $935.00 $15.00 $3,300.00 $9.00 $1,980.00 $10.72 $2,358.40

20 306-0001 3,640.00 L.F. Milled Rumble Strip $4.00 $14,560.00 $5.00 $18,200.00 $4.50 $16,380.00 $3.00 $10,920.00 $2.00 $7,280.00 $6.04 $21,985.60

21 401-0004 52,770.00 LB Reinforcement Steel, Galvanized $2.50 $131,925.00 $2.40 $126,648.00 $3.35 $176,779.50 $2.00 $105,540.00 $2.50 $131,925.00 $2.06 $108,706.20

22 401-N0009 1,227.00 Each Reinforcement Bar Coupler, Galvanized $15.00 $18,405.00 $25.00 $30,675.00 $35.00 $42,945.00 $35.00 $42,945.00 $16.00 $19,632.00 $29.16 $35,779.32

23 401-0035 100 Each Drill and Grout Reinforcement Bars $32.55 $3,255.00 $34.00 $3,400.00 $5.00 $500.00 $70.00 $7,000.00 $40.00 $4,000.00 $50.00 $5,000.00

24 401-0068 128 L.F. Strip Seal Expansion Joints $575.00 $73,600.00 $425.00 $54,400.00 $630.00 $80,640.00 $500.00 $64,000.00 $525.00 $67,200.00 $860.53 $110,147.84

25 401-0072 877.00 S.Y. Sawcut Grooved Deck Surface $25.00 $21,925.00 $22.00 $19,294.00 $50.00 $43,850.00 $20.00 $17,540.00 $20.00 $17,540.00 $21.73 $19,057.21

26 403-0001 3,780.00 Each Shear Connectors $10.00 $37,800.00 $8.00 $30,240.00 $7.00 $26,460.00 $5.00 $18,900.00 $11.00 $41,580.00 $8.78 $33,188.40

27 411-N0001 1,090.00 S.F. Painting Existing Steelwork $36.00 $39,240.00 $35.00 $38,150.00 $40.00 $43,600.00 $25.00 $27,250.00 $35.00 $38,150.00 $38.27 $41,714.30

28 412-N0003 12 Each Weld Existing Inlet Grate $664.00 $7,968.00 $2,500.00 $30,000.00 $250.00 $3,000.00 $800.00 $9,600.00 $800.00 $9,600.00 $1,505.37 $18,064.44

29 417-0001 1 L.S. Concrete Repair Material $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $1.00 $1.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

30 417-0002 877 S.Y. Removal of Existing Concrete Deck $400.00 $350,800.00 $300.00 $263,100.00 $539.50 $473,141.50 $500.00 $438,500.00 $675.00 $591,975.00 $750.00 $657,750.00

31 417-0009 877 S.Y. Removal of Existing Surfacing $30.00 $26,310.00 $70.00 $61,390.00 $25.00 $21,925.00 $40.00 $35,080.00 $18.00 $15,786.00 $92.76 $81,350.52

32 417-0036 128 L.F. Joint Reconstruction, Type FJ $150.00 $19,200.00 $125.00 $16,000.00 $65.00 $8,320.00 $135.00 $17,280.00 $30.00 $3,840.00 $192.07 $24,584.96

33 417-0067 127 L.F. Silicone Joint Seal $70.00 $8,890.00 $50.00 $6,350.00 $20.00 $2,540.00 $20.00 $2,540.00 $15.00 $1,905.00 $76.27 $9,686.29

34 417-0070 128 L.F. Headblock Repair, Type 1 $500.00 $64,000.00 $175.00 $22,400.00 $600.00 $76,800.00 $350.00 $44,800.00 $250.00 $32,000.00 $1,035.95 $132,601.60

35 417-0104 937 S.Y. Catches $170.00 $159,290.00 $190.00 $178,030.00 $100.00 $93,700.00 $100.00 $93,700.00 $575.00 $538,775.00 $400.00 $374,800.00

36 417-0108 200,000.00 USD Force Account for Emergency and Routine Bridge Repairs (No-Bid) $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00

37 418-N0051 9.00 Each Tie Plate Replacement $3,000.00 $27,000.00 $7,500.00 $67,500.00 $3,500.00 $31,500.00 $1,500.00 $13,500.00 $7,500.00 $67,500.00 $4,200.00 $37,800.00

38 428-0001 230 C.Y. Concrete in Deck, HPC $1,700.00 $391,000.00 $2,410.00 $554,300.00 $2,118.50 $487,255.00 $2,500.00 $575,000.00 $2,650.00 $609,500.00 $1,700.00 $391,000.00

39 428-0004 20 C.Y. Concrete in Parapet, HPC $2,500.00 $50,000.00 $2,000.00 $40,000.00 $1,800.00 $36,000.00 $2,000.00 $40,000.00 $2,950.00 $59,000.00 $3,039.49 $60,789.80

40 503-0293 17.00 Each Reset Frames $700.00 $11,900.00 $500.00 $8,500.00 $450.00 $7,650.00 $800.00 $13,600.00 $600.00 $10,200.00 $1,168.47 $19,863.99

41 503-N0003 14.00 Each Cleaning Existing Drainage Structures $400.00 $5,600.00 $1,000.00 $14,000.00 $625.00 $8,750.00 $100.00 $1,400.00 $800.00 $11,200.00 $1,200.08 $16,801.12

42 509-0006 1 Each Relocate Sign Panels $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $500.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,161.79 $1,161.79

43 510-0001 738 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $28.12 $20,752.56 $28.00 $20,664.00 $28.00 $20,664.00 $25.00 $18,450.00 $25.00 $18,450.00 $30.98 $22,863.24

44 510-0002 638 L.F. Beam Guide Rail, Dual-Faced $43.25 $27,593.50 $34.00 $21,692.00 $33.00 $21,054.00 $38.00 $24,244.00 $30.00 $19,140.00 $47.66 $30,407.08

45 510-0008 100.00 L.F. Reset Beam Guide Rail $10.81 $1,081.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 $16.00 $1,600.00 $20.00 $2,000.00 $11.92 $1,192.00

46 510-0010 35 Each Beam Guide Rail Blockout $41.09 $1,438.15 $10.00 $350.00 $10.00 $350.00 $16.00 $560.00 $10.00 $350.00 $45.28 $1,584.80

47 510-0011 1 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $1,378.72 $1,378.72 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00 $1,519.26 $1,519.26

48 510-0019 30 Each Beam Guide Rail Post $145.98 $4,379.40 $50.00 $1,500.00 $62.50 $1,875.00 $70.00 $2,100.00 $50.00 $1,500.00 $160.86 $4,825.80

49 510-0014 3 Each Parapet Connection, Type A $4,325.40 $12,976.20 $2,600.00 $7,800.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $4,766.30 $14,298.90

50 510-0015 2 Each Parapet Connection, Type B $1,054.32 $2,108.64 $650.00 $1,300.00 $800.00 $1,600.00 $260.00 $520.00 $600.00 $1,200.00 $1,161.79 $2,323.58

51 510-0031 2,000.00 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide Rail $3.78 $7,560.00 $1.00 $2,000.00 $1.00 $2,000.00 $4.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $2,000.00 $4.17 $8,340.00

52 515-0003 2 Each Delineator, Type PA-W $250.88 $501.76 $55.00 $110.00 $50.00 $100.00 $240.00 $480.00 $50.00 $100.00 $276.45 $552.90

53 515-0007 3 Each Delineator, Type GA-W $248.71 $746.13 $55.00 $165.00 $50.00 $150.00 $240.00 $720.00 $50.00 $150.00 $274.06 $822.18

54 516-0001 2,350.00 L.F. Removable Wet Weather Pavement Marking Tape $3.19 $7,496.50 $6.50 $15,275.00 $3.00 $7,050.00 $3.00 $7,050.00 $3.00 $7,050.00 $3.34 $7,849.00

55 516-0002 150 L.F. Diamond Grinding $11.00 $1,650.00 $11.00 $1,650.00 $11.00 $1,650.00 $11.00 $1,650.00 $21.00 $3,150.00 $24.25 $3,637.50

56 516-0003 150 L.F. Preformed Contrast Marking Tape $10.81 $1,621.50 $11.00 $1,650.00 $11.00 $1,650.00 $11.00 $1,650.00 $21.00 $3,150.00 $24.25 $3,637.50

57 516-0005 26,105.00 L.F. Striping and Marking Removal, Hydromilling $1.00 $26,105.00 $1.00 $26,105.00 $0.75 $19,578.75 $0.80 $20,884.00 $1.00 $26,105.00 $1.01 $26,366.05

58 516-0007 19,030.00 L.F. Temporary Pavement Striping $0.30 $5,709.00 $0.50 $9,515.00 $0.30 $5,709.00 $0.30 $5,709.00 $1.00 $19,030.00 $1.01 $19,220.30

59 516-0008 254.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Epoxy Resin $10.60 $2,692.40 $11.00 $2,794.00 $11.00 $2,794.00 $10.00 $2,540.00 $6.00 $1,524.00 $7.15 $1,816.10

IEW Construction Group Inc.Ferreira Construction Co. Inc. Ritacco Construction, Inc.BaseLine Item Detail Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. Earle Asphalt Company Kyle Conti Construction, LLC
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Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

IEW Construction Group Inc.Ferreira Construction Co. Inc. Ritacco Construction, Inc.BaseLine Item Detail Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. Earle Asphalt Company Kyle Conti Construction, LLC

60 516-0009 6,880.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $1.03 $7,086.40 $1.00 $6,880.00 $1.10 $7,568.00 $1.00 $6,880.00 $1.00 $6,880.00 $1.25 $8,600.00

61 517-0001 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type A $26,000.00 $26,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $29,789.38 $29,789.38

62 517-0007 11 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type A $3,000.00 $33,000.00 $2,800.00 $30,800.00 $3,000.00 $33,000.00 $1,000.00 $11,000.00 $2,000.00 $22,000.00 $2,978.94 $32,768.34

63 524-N0057 1 Each Impact Attenuator (Cartridge), 8 Bays, 30in Wide $56,000.00 $56,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $92,823.72 $92,823.72

64 599-N0001 1 L.S. Ride Quality Testing for Micro-Milled Deck Surfaces $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $11,915.75 $11,915.75

65 599-N0002 877 S.Y. Micro-Milling Deck Surface $48.00 $42,096.00 $37.00 $32,449.00 $50.00 $43,850.00 $70.00 $61,390.00 $50.00 $43,850.00 $52.07 $45,665.39

66 801-0001 1.00 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $204,421.31 $204,421.31 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $362,652.00 $362,652.00 $28,000.00 $28,000.00 $91,182.30 $91,182.30 $500,000.00 $500,000.00

67 801-0002 2,080.00 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $6.00 $12,480.00 $12.00 $24,960.00 $45.00 $93,600.00 $50.00 $104,000.00 $50.00 $104,000.00 $38.06 $79,164.80

68 801-0003 2,560.00 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $26.74 $68,454.40 $45.00 $115,200.00 $14.00 $35,840.00 $28.00 $71,680.00 $18.00 $46,080.00 $44.94 $115,046.40

69 801-0004 1,880.00 L.F. Resetting Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $10.07 $18,931.60 $25.00 $47,000.00 $14.00 $26,320.00 $25.00 $47,000.00 $25.00 $47,000.00 $40.14 $75,463.20

70 801-0005 580 L.F. Modular Glare Screen System $20.80 $12,064.00 $20.00 $11,600.00 $15.00 $8,700.00 $20.00 $11,600.00 $25.00 $14,500.00 $19.12 $11,089.60

71 801-0007 500 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol, Part-Time $0.50 $250.00 $120.00 $60,000.00 $1.00 $500.00 $85.00 $42,500.00 $120.00 $60,000.00 $95.00 $47,500.00

72 801-0009 2 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $15,000.00 $30,000.00 $17,500.00 $35,000.00 $16,000.00 $32,000.00

73 801-0010 2 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,100.00 $4,200.00 $12,000.00 $24,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00

74 801-0011 3 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator $4,200.00 $12,600.00 $4,500.00 $13,500.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $7,500.00 $22,500.00 $11,915.75 $35,747.25

75 801-0013 2 Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $10,045.38 $20,090.76 $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $68,000.00 $136,000.00 $20,000.00 $40,000.00 $30,000.00 $60,000.00 $25,000.00 $50,000.00

76 801-0014 100 M.H. Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use $1.00 $100.00 $125.00 $12,500.00 $15.00 $1,500.00 $85.00 $8,500.00 $150.00 $15,000.00 $100.00 $10,000.00

77 801-0015 2 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $600.00 $1,200.00 $1.00 $2.00 $0.01 $0.02 $1.00 $2.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $100.00 $200.00

78 801-0017 22 Barr Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators $600.00 $13,200.00 $250.00 $5,500.00 $0.01 $0.22 $1.00 $22.00 $250.00 $5,500.00 $100.00 $2,200.00

79 801-N0001 84 Each Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing $1,000.00 $84,000.00 $100.00 $8,400.00 $0.01 $0.84 $1,000.00 $84,000.00 $2,500.00 $210,000.00 $1,681.00 $141,204.00

80 803-0001 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on Location No. 1 $26,000.00 $26,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00

81 803-0032 20,000.00 USD Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid) $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00

$3,387,269.00 $3,539,993.40 $3,688,013.13 $3,976,679.76 $4,666,000.00 $5,308,240.68
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