

SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY

INVITATION NO.: 19-S-2		DUE DATE: August 5, 2019		QUOTATION FORM		NAME OF BIDDER:	
ITEM NO.	ARTICLES FOR SALE			NUMBER OF UNITS	UNIT OF MEAS.	PRICE BID PER UNIT	TOTAL PRICE BID
1.	2014 Chevrolet Caprice 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R24EL982335, A-3220 Mileage: 108,442			1	EA.	Minimum Bid \$4,000.00	\$ 4,770.00
	Economy Auto						
2.	2015 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2EC6FR689699, Mileage: 102,120 T-3110 (#2 - WON'T START - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Liberty Motors	\$ 8,889.00
3.	2015 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2ECXFR689639, Mileage: 120,737 T-3104 (#3 - BAD ENGINE - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Liberty Motors	\$ 7,913.00
4.	2013 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2E00DR283355, Mileage: 95,115 T-2748 (#4 - COOLANT LEAK - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Mr. Auto LLC LLC	\$ 3,166.00
5.	2009 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNEC03029R274504, Mileage: 172,556 T-2117 (#5 - BAD ENGINE - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Mr. Auto LLC LLC	\$ 1,066.00
6.	2015 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2EC0FR689746, Mileage: 119,969 T-3113 (#6 - BAD TRANSMISSION - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Liberty Motors	\$ 8,181.00
7.	2010 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 4WD, Serial #1GNUKAE0XAR266981, Mileage: 150,204 T-2310 (#7 - BAD FUEL LEAK - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Mr. Auto LLC LLC	\$ 2,168.00
8.	2013 Ford F-150 Pickup, 1/2 Ton, 4WD, Serial #1FTFX1EF9DKF28185, Mileage: 185,939 T-2815 (#8 - WON'T START - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Gregorio LaJara	\$ 3,501.00
9.	2012 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 4WD, Serial #1GNSK4E06CR141889, Mileage: 153,315 T-2574 (#9 - BAD TRANSMISSION - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Mark Reddick	\$ 3,250.00
10.	2007 Ford F-150 Pickup, 1/2 Ton, 4WD, Serial #1FTRF14W37KC98133, T-2040 Mileage: 104,844 (#10 - WON'T START - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	4 Below Auto Sales	\$ 889.00
11.	2011 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2E06BR382386, T-2379 Mileage: 121,470 (#11 - BAD TRANSMISSION - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Liberty Motors	\$ 1,511.00
12.	2013 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2E07DR284468, T-2753 Mileage: 96,448 (#12 - WON'T START - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Liberty Motors	\$ 1,616.00

SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY

INVITATION NO.: 19-S-2		DUE DATE: August 5, 2019		QUOTATION FORM		NAME OF BIDDER:	
ITEM NO.	ARTICLES FOR SALE			NUMBER OF UNITS	UNIT OF MEAS.	PRICE BID PER UNIT	TOTAL PRICE BID
13.	2014 Chevrolet Caprice 4 Door Sedan, Serial #6G3NS5R23EL982357, A-3223 Mileage: 106,775			1	EA.	Minimum Bid \$4,000.00	\$ 4,865.00
	Mark Reddick						
14.	2006 Ford Crown Victoria 4 Door Sedan, Serial #2FAHP71W26X102491, A-2760 Mileage: 103,336			1	EA.	James Beslanovitz	\$ 469.13
15.	2009 Chevrolet Impala 4 Door Sedan, Serial #2G1WS57M491315209, A-2952 Mileage: 155,648 (#15 - OVERHEATING ISSUE - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Mr. Auto LLC LLC	\$ 355.00
16.	2012 Chevrolet Impala 4 Door Sedan, Serial #2G1WD5E36C1184229, A-3166 Mileage: 159,259 (#16 - CHARGING SYSTEM INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Nicholas Ertle	\$ 1,502.00
17.	2013 Dodge Charger 4 Door Sedan, Serial #2C3CDXATXDH521963, A-3179 Mileage: 118,774			1	EA.	Minimum Bid \$3,000.00	\$ 4,600.00
	Brian Bogie						
18.	2013 Dodge Charger 4 Door Sedan, Serial #2C3CDXAT5DH521966, A-3182 Mileage: 139,311 (#18 - ACCIDENT DAMAGE - MISSING PARTS)			1	EA.	Liberty Motors	\$ 2,121.00
19.	2009 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 4WD, Serial #1GNFK03029R272162, Mileage: 188,532 T-2123 (#19 - ACCIDENT DAMAGE)			1	EA.	Liberty Motors	\$ 1,713.00
20.	2010 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNMCAE01AR261309, T-2275 Mileage: 142,495			1	EA.	Mr. Auto LLC LLC	\$ 2,114.00
21.	2013 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2E06DR284591, T-2757 Mileage: 99,389 (#21 - FRONT BUMPER DAMAGE)			1	EA.	Minimum Bid \$3,500.00	\$ 5,500.00
	Tad Czapl						
22.	2012 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 4WD, Serial #1GNSK4E09CR141286, T-2573 Mileage: 170,995 (#22 - MINOR BODY DAMAGE)			1	EA.	Kathleen Timmons	\$ 5,150.00
23.	2014 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 4WD, Serial #1GNSK2E09ER188373, T-2944 Mileage: 114,608			1	EA.	Minimum Bid \$5,000.00	\$ 5,600.00
	Phillip Goldman						
24.	2012 Chevrolet Express 3500 1 Ton Cargo Van, Serial #1GCZGTCG0C1112468, T-2544 Mileage: 113,495 (#24 - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Minimum Bid \$2,500.00	\$ 4,750.00
	Vincent Myers						

SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY

INVITATION NO.: 19-S-2		DUE DATE: August 5, 2019		QUOTATION FORM		NAME OF BIDDER:	
ITEM NO.	ARTICLES FOR SALE			NUMBER OF UNITS	UNIT OF MEAS.	PRICE BID PER UNIT	TOTAL PRICE BID
25.	2012 Chevrolet Express 3500 1 Ton Cargo Van, Serial #1GCZGTCG8C1113531, T-2541 Mileage: 152,104			1	EA.	Minimum Bid \$2,500.00	\$ 4,100.00
	Premium Auto's NY						
26.	2012 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 1/2 Ton 2WD Pickup, Serial #1GCNCPEX6CZ163604, T-2484 Mileage: 167,137 (#26 - CHARGING SYSTEM INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Vincent Martini	\$ 1,610.00
27.	2013 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2E06DR285630, T-2761 Mileage: 106,375 (#27 - TOTAL WRECK - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Julian Torres	\$ 1,762.00
28.	2014 Ford F-150 Pickup, 1/2 Ton, 4WD, Serial #1FTEX1EM3EFB48652, Mileage: 47,667 T-2893 (#28 - TOTAL WRECK - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Economy Auto	\$ 2,759.00
29.	2018 Ford F-150 Pickup, 1/2 Ton, 4WD, Serial #1FTEX1EB9JKE96276, Mileage: 8,918 T-3581 (#29 - TOTAL WRECK - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Economy Auto	\$ 2,329.00
30.	2013 Chevrolet Tahoe 4 Door, 2WD, Serial #1GNLC2E08DR285676, Mileage: 105,305 T-2763 (#30 - INCOMPLETE UNIT - PARTS MISSING - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Julian Torres	\$ 1,762.00
31.	2006 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 1/2 Ton Pickup, Serial #1GCEC14X76Z213106, T-1977 Mileage: 127,285 (#31 - BAD BRAKES - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Vincent Myers	\$ 3,150.00
32.	2012 Ford F-150 Pickup, 1/2 Ton, 4WD, Serial #1FTFX1EF2CKE10512, T-2672 Mileage: 175,697 (#32 - WON'T START - BODY DAMAGE - MISSING PARTS - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Aquilina Nejia	\$ 2,501.00
33.	2004 International 4200 12' Rack Body, Diesel, w/Lightbar, R-6023 & T-1824 Serial #1HTMPAFM64H662754, Mileage: 132,596 Hours: 9,013 (#33 - BAD BRAKES - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	Mr. Auto LLC LLC	\$ 2,187.00
34.	2003 Ford F-550 SD 37' Aerial Bucket Truck, Serial #1FDAF56FX3EB14571, T-1785 Mileage: 130,342			1	EA.	A Better Deal	\$ 4,501.00
35.	1999 Ford F-550 SD Shop Truck, w/Miller Welder, G-25464, G-25416, G-24852 & T-1566 Speedaire Air Compressor & Toolbox, Serial #1FDAF56F7XEC49237, Mileage: 245,372 Hours: 5,942			1	EA.	A Better Deal	\$ 1,851.00
36.	2002 GMC 3500 Sierra Hi-Body Utility Truck, Diesel, TP-103826 Serial #1GDJC34142E161503, Mileage: 109,567 (#36 - BAD BRAKES - TOW OUT)			1	EA.	A Better Deal	\$ 2,651.00

SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY

INVITATION NO.: 19-S-2		DUE DATE: August 5, 2019		QUOTATION FORM		NAME OF BIDDER:		
ITEM NO.	ARTICLES FOR SALE				NUMBER OF UNITS	UNIT OF MEAS.	PRICE BID PER UNIT	TOTAL PRICE BID
37.	2004 International 7400 Dump Truck, Serial #IHTWDADR64J085796, T-1797 Mileage: 65,124 Hours: 5,122 (#37 - INOPERABLE - TOW OUT)				1	EA.	A&A Truck Parts	\$ 4,381.00
38.	2004 International 4200 12' Rack Body, Diesel, w/Lightbar, R-6024 & T-1825 Serial #IHTMPAFM8411662755, Mileage: 182,131 Hours: 6,056 (#38 - BAD BRAKES - TOW OUT)				1	EA.	Florin Lupu	\$ 4,165.00
39.	2002 GMC/Isuzu W4500 14' Box Truck, Serial #J8DC4B14727011522, TP-103844 Mileage: 107,109				1	EA.	Robert Fiore	\$ 2,750.00
40.	2001 International 4900 Shop Truck, w/Belco Welder, G-15111, G-15372, R-5701 & T-1674 6" Vice & Lightbar, Serial #IHTSDAAR81H396197, Mileage: 109,049 Hours: 5,402				1	EA.	Jersey One Auto Sales	\$ 869.00
41.	1991 International 2554 18' Rack Body w/Attenuator R-6940, R-6944 & T-1232 & Arrowboard, Diesel, Serial #IHTGBNHR6MH335749, Mileage: 175,507 Hours: 7,843				1	EA.	Mr. Auto LLC LLC	\$ 3,266.00
42.	2006 Sterling SC8000 14' Box Truck, Serial #49HACKBV66DW49320, T-1973 Mileage: 71,595 (#42 - BAD STARTER)				1	EA.	Mr. Auto LLC LLC	\$ 2,254.00
43.	2016 Ford 350 Transit High Roof Cargo Van, Serial #IFTBW3XM3GKA88851, T-3145 Mileage: 28,415 (#43 - SEVERE REAR ACCIDENT DAMAGE - TOW OUT)				1	EA.	Economy Auto	\$ 4,769.00
44.	2009 Dodge Sprinter 3500 High Roof Cargo Van, Diesel, Serial #WD0PF1AC395422086, T-2266 Mileage: 41,563 (#44 - TOTAL WRECK - TOW OUT)				1	EA.	Robert Fiore	\$ 3,120.00
45.	1986 Centreville 3 Ton Trailer, Model #TA714-6M, Serial #1C98T1827G1193077 TP-018664				1	EA.	Jan Walesa	\$ 502.00
46.	1987 Hudson 4 Ton Trailer, Model #HSE14, Serial #10HHSE143J1000037 R-3788				1	EA.	Vincent Martini	\$ 501.00
47.	1991 Centreville 3 Ton Trailer, Model #TA0817-6M, Serial #1C9ST2222M1193076 R-4197				1	EA.	A Better Deal	\$ 351.00
48.	2001 Stephan Green 3 Ton Trailer, Model #3T SPECIAL, Serial #IS9E122S011489001 R-5404				1	EA.	Robert Fiore	\$ 550.00
49.	2006 Toro Groundsmaster Mower, Diesel, Model #328D-30627, R-6631 Serial #260000104, Hours: 1,277 (#49 - INOPERABLE)				1	EA.	NO BID	\$ 0.00

SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY

INVITATION NO.: 19-S-2		DUE DATE: August 5, 2019		QUOTATION FORM		NAME OF BIDDER:	
ITEM NO.	ARTICLES FOR SALE			NUMBER OF UNITS	UNIT OF MEAS.	PRICE BID PER UNIT	TOTAL PRICE BID
50.	2006 Toro Groundsmaster Mower, Diesel, Model #328D-30627, Serial #260000107, Hours: 1,245 (#50 - INOPERABLE)			R-6632	1	EA.	NO BID \$ 0.00
51.	2006 Toro Zero Turn Mower, Model #74255, Serial #240000534 (#51 - INOPERABLE)			R-6706	1	EA.	Florin \$ 869.00 Lupu
52.	2007 Toro Zero Turn Mower, Model #74255, Serial #260000199 (#52 - INOPERABLE)			R-6927	1	EA.	Florin \$ 969.00 Lupu
53.	2005 Toro 36" Walk Behind Self-Propelled Mower, Pro Line Model #30317, Serial #250000167 (#53 - INCOMPLETE - INOPERABLE)			R-6573	1	EA.	NO BID \$ 0.00
54.	2013 Hotsy Pressure Washer, Model #1260SS, Serial #11105330-162940 (#54 - INOPERABLE)			R-8439	1	EA.	Robert \$ 375.00 Fiore
55.	2004 Gledhill 10' Snow Plow, Power Reversing			R-6146	1	EA.	Joseph DeFino \$ 501.00 Trucking
56.	1999 Valk 10' Snow Plow, Power Reversing			R-5507	1	EA.	Joseph DeFino \$ 501.00 Trucking
57.	2000 Valk 11' Snow Plow, Manual Reversing			R-5481	1	EA.	Joseph DeFino \$ 501.00 Trucking
58.	2000 Valk 11' Snow Plow, Manual Reversing			R-5478	1	EA.	Joseph DeFino \$ 501.00 Trucking
59.	1996 Valk 11' Snow Plow, Manual Reversing			R-4931	1	EA.	Joseph DeFino \$ 501.00 Trucking
60.	1996 Valk 11' Snow Plow, Manual Reversing			R-4950	1	EA.	A&A Truck \$ 851.00 Parts
61.	1996 Valk 11' Snow Plow, Manual Reversing			R-4902	1	EA.	A&A Truck \$ 851.00 Parts
62.	2000 Valk 11' Snow Plow, Manual Reversing			R-5479	1	EA.	A&A Truck \$ 851.00 Parts
63.	1996 Valk 11' Snow Plow, Manual Reversing			R-4949	1	EA.	A&A Truck \$ 851.00 Parts
64.	1996 Valk 11' Snow Plow, Manual Reversing			R-4941	1	EA.	A&A Truck \$ 851.00 Parts
65.	1996 Valk 11' Snow Plow, Manual Reversing			R-4943	1	EA.	A&A Truck \$ 851.00 Parts

SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY

INVITATION NO.: 19-S-2		DUE DATE: August 5, 2019		QUOTATION FORM		NAME OF BIDDER:		
ITEM NO.	ARTICLES FOR SALE			NUMBER OF UNITS	UNIT OF MEAS.	PRICE BID PER UNIT	TOTAL PRICE BID	
66.	2007 Valk 11' Snow Plow, Power Reversing			R-6993	1	EA.	William Blair	\$ 1,126.00
67.	2006 Valk 11' Snow Plow, Power Reversing			R-6809	1	EA.	Joseph DeFino Trucking	\$ 1,101.00
68.	2007 Valk 11' Snow Plow, Power Reversing			R-6997	1	EA.	William Blair	\$ 1,126.00
69.	1995 Valk 11' Snow Plow, Manual Reversing			R-4864	1	EA.	Joseph DeFino Trucking	\$ 501.00
70.	1991 Valk 11' Snow Plow, Manual Reversing			R-4140	1	EA.	A&A Truck Parts	\$ 300.00
71.	1995 Valk 11' Snow Plow, Manual Reversing			R-4840	1	EA.	Joseph DeFino Trucking	\$ 501.00
72.	1999 Valk 10' Snow Plow, Power Reversing			R-5502	1	EA.	Joseph DeFino Trucking	\$ 501.00
73.	2005 Sullivan Air Compressor, Tow Type, Model #D0250Q10JD, Serial #24604, Hours: 1,590 (#73 - INOPERABLE)			R-6358	1	EA.	Quality Elec. Construction	\$ 957.00
74.	2003 Generac Standby Generator, 50 KW, Diesel, Model #2303620100, Serial #2066769 (#74 - INOPERABLE)			G-15771	1	EA.	Devino Trucks	\$ 1,689.00
75.	1998 Kohler Standby Generator, 100 KW, Natural Gas, Model #100RZ82, Serial #604361			G-13833	1	EA.	Devino Trucks	\$ 2,189.00
76.	2000 Elliott Magnetek Standby Generator, 125 KW, Diesel, Model #125RD, Serial #BUO4J234			G-14631	1	EA.	Devino Trucks	\$ 3,678.00
77.	1998 Kohler Standby Generator, 100 KW, Natural Gas, Model #100RZ82, Serial #604360			G-13832	1	EA.	Devino Trucks	\$ 1,721.00
78.	2000 Elliott Magnetek Standby Generator, 40 KW, Diesel, Model #40RD, Serial #BT11J829			G-14635	1	EA.	Devino Trucks	\$ 1,569.00
79.	2000 Elliott Magnetek Standby Generator, 40 KW, Diesel, Model #40RD, Serial #BT11J828			G-14636	1	EA.	Devino Trucks	\$ 1,329.00
80.	2003 Generac Standby Generator, 50 KW, Diesel, Model #2303620100, Serial #2066768			G-15770	1	EA.	Devino Trucks	\$ 2,527.00

SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY

INVITATION NO.: 19-S-2		DUE DATE: August 5, 2019		QUOTATION FORM		NAME OF BIDDER:		
ITEM NO.	ARTICLES FOR SALE			NUMBER OF UNITS	UNIT OF MEAS.	PRICE BID PER UNIT	TOTAL PRICE BID	
81.	2006 Coats Light Duty Tire Changer, Model #6065EX, Serial #0601104749			G-20175	1	EA.	Robert Foster	\$ 634.83
82.	2008 Toro Push Mower 21" (#82 - INOPERABLE)			R-7084	1	EA.	Vincent Martini	\$ 10.05
83.	2008 Toro Push Mower 21" (#83 - INOPERABLE)			R-7110	1	EA.	Vincent Martini	\$ 10.05
84.	2005 Stihl FS550 Line Trimmer, 16" Swath,			R-6548	1	EA.	Florin Lupu	\$ 127.00
85.	2012 Stihl FS250 Line Trimmer, 16" Swath,			R-8194	1	EA.	Steve Wolk	\$ 55.27
86.	2007 Stihl FS350 Line Trimmer, 16" Swath, (#86 - INOPERABLE)			R-6914	1	EA.	NO BID	\$ 0.00
87.	2003 Stihl FS350 Line Trimmer, 16" Swath, (#87 - INOPERABLE)			TP-071038	1	EA.	NO BID	\$ 0.00
88.	2010 Stihl FS250R Line Trimmer, 16" Swath, (#88 - INOPERABLE)			R-7480	1	EA.	Steve Wolk	\$ 5.00
89.	2007 Stihl FS350 Line Trimmer, 16" Swath, (#89 - INOPERABLE)			R-6915	1	EA.	Peter White	\$ 17.00
90.	2006 Stihl FS550 Line Trimmer, 16" Swath,			R-6738	1	EA.	Florin Lupu	\$ 100.00
91.	2010 Stihl FS250R Line Trimmer, 16" Swath, (#91 - INOPERABLE)			R-7775	1	EA.	Vincent Myers	\$ 20.00
92.	2010 Stihl FS250R Line Trimmer, 16" Swath, (#92 - INOPERABLE)			R-7770	1	EA.	Vincent Myers	\$ 25.00
93.	2006 Stihl FS110R Line Trimmer, 16" Swath, (#93 - INOPERABLE)			R-6675	1	EA.	Vincent Myers	\$ 25.00
94.	2015 Stihl FS240 Line Trimmer, 16" Swath, (#94 - INOPERABLE)			R-8916	1	EA.	Vincent Myers	\$ 20.00
95.	2015 Stihl FS240 Line Trimmer, 16" Swath, (#95 - INOPERABLE)			R-8914	1	EA.	Vincent Myers	\$ 20.00
96.	1997 Stihl Cut-Off Saw, 14", Model #TS510, (#96 - INOPERABLE)			G-13323	1	EA.	Neal Hansen	\$ 36.00
97.	2009 Makita Cut-Off Saw, 14", Model #DPC7331X1, (#97 - INOPERABLE)			G-24843	1	EA.	Vincent Myers	\$ 50.00
98.	2012 Stihl Chain Saw, 20", Model #MS362, (#98 - INOPERABLE)			R-8248	1	EA.	Florin Lupu	\$ 180.00
99.	2011 Tanaka Chain Saw, 14", Model #TCS-3351PFS, (#99 - INOPERABLE)			R-7984	1	EA.	Vincent Myers	\$ 25.00

