
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P500.505 Letting Date: 3/22/19

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1 L.S. Construction Layout $500.00 $500.00 $19,312.00 $19,312.00 $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $500.00 $500.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00

2 104-0002 1 L.S. Mobilization $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $139,126.00 $139,126.00 $220,000.00 $220,000.00 $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $203,000.00 $203,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00

3 107-0001 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,575.00 $1,575.00 $6,600.00 $6,600.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

4 202-0009 5,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00

5 203-0001 50 C.Y. Embankment, Common $150.00 $7,500.00 $26.25 $1,312.50 $58.00 $2,900.00 $84.00 $4,200.00 $60.00 $3,000.00 $20.00 $1,000.00

6 208-0008 85 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence $25.00 $2,125.00 $4.20 $357.00 $7.00 $595.00 $21.18 $1,800.30 $10.00 $850.00 $6.00 $510.00

7 208-0021 30 S.F. Inlet Filter, Type 1 $10.00 $300.00 $4.20 $126.00 $30.00 $900.00 $20.40 $612.00 $17.00 $510.00 $25.00 $750.00

8 208-0022 1 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $300.00 $300.00 $126.00 $126.00 $132.00 $132.00 $312.00 $312.00 $189.00 $189.00 $250.00 $250.00

9 511-0006 40 L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type II, 72in High $125.00 $5,000.00 $131.12 $5,244.80 $150.00 $6,000.00 $30.00 $1,200.00 $40.00 $1,600.00 $35.00 $1,400.00

10 514-0001 40 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4in Thick $75.00 $3,000.00 $208.00 $8,320.00 $82.00 $3,280.00 $255.00 $10,200.00 $77.76 $3,110.40 $70.00 $2,800.00

11 517-0003 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type C $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $33,180.00 $33,180.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $2,040.00 $2,040.00 $27,000.00 $27,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00

12 517-0009 4 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $2,300.00 $9,200.00 $1,260.00 $5,040.00 $600.00 $2,400.00 $660.00 $2,640.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,300.00 $5,200.00

13 599-0104 2 Each 4in Sanitary Sewer Cleanout $550.00 $1,100.00 $666.25 $1,332.50 $900.00 $1,800.00 $960.00 $1,920.00 $1,600.00 $3,200.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00

14 599-N0105 85 L.F. 4in Polyvinyl Chloride Sewer Pipe $120.00 $10,200.00 $33.60 $2,856.00 $57.00 $4,845.00 $48.00 $4,080.00 $7,500.00 $637,500.00 $50.00 $4,250.00

15 599-N0106 1 L.S. Relocation of Existing Equipment and Furnishings $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $13,650.00 $13,650.00 $14,500.00 $14,500.00 $14,400.00 $14,400.00 $20,240.00 $20,240.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00

16 599-N0003 100,000.00 USD Project Allowances (No-Bid) $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00

17 703-0001 36 S.Y. Topsoil $54.00 $1,944.00 $50.00 $1,800.00 $10.00 $360.00 $12.00 $432.00 $50.00 $1,800.00 $7.00 $252.00

18 704-0003 36 S.Y. Seeding, Type C $50.00 $1,800.00 $3.15 $113.40 $5.00 $180.00 $2.40 $86.40 $12.00 $432.00 $2.00 $72.00

19 2000-N007 8,000.00 USD Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00

20 2000-N015 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $370,000.00 $370,000.00 $414,750.00 $414,750.00 $440,000.00 $440,000.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00 $220,000.00 $220,000.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00

21 2000-N025 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1 $1,332,301.00 $1,332,301.00 $1,040,329.00 $1,040,329.00 $1,175,000.00 $1,175,000.00 $1,380,000.00 $1,380,000.00 $1,173,000.00 $1,173,000.00 $2,650,000.00 $2,650,000.00

22 2000-N026 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 1 $55,430.00 $55,430.00 $56,385.00 $56,385.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00 $83,940.00 $83,940.00 $74,000.00 $74,000.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00

23 531-N0001 1 L.S. Building Electrical Work, Location No. 1 $324,300.00 $324,300.00 $525,000.00 $525,000.00 $276,000.00 $276,000.00 $511,000.00 $511,000.00 $390,000.00 $390,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00

24 531-N0002 1 L.S. Building Structural Work, Location No. 1 $32,500.00 $32,500.00 $56,700.00 $56,700.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $35,750.00 $35,750.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00

25 2000-N030 50,000.00 USD NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

26 2000-N028 1 L.S. Site Electrical Work $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $26,250.00 $26,250.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $18,200.00 $18,200.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

$2,370,000.00 $2,515,885.20 $2,519,992.00 $2,851,062.70 $2,988,681.40 $4,880,484.00

Dobco Inc.Santorini Construction IncBaseLine Item Detail John O'Hara Co., Inc. Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. M&M Construction Company Shorelands Construction Inc.
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