BID QUOTATION SHEET

AREA A - NORTHERN SECTION OF THE NJ TURNPIKE - MILE POST 67.2 TO %0.0

ITEM | QTY. UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL
OF PRICE DOLLAR
MEAS. AMOUNT
HOT ASPHALT [-2 |
i 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $85.00 |$425.00
HOT ASPHALT 1-4 _ _
2 10 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $85.00 % 850.00
HOT ASPHALT |5
3 150 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $85.00 ($12,750.00
~ | TACK OILIN 5 GALLON CANS
4 100 | GALLON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $75.00 18 7,500.00
TOTAL OF LINES 1 THROUGH 4 | $ 21,525.00

PLEASE LIST THE FACILITY*S ADDRESS (25 MILES OF AREA BID AS PER BID SPECIFECAT_IONS.)

Kingston - 4415 Route 27, Kingston, NJ
Edison - 26 Montrose Rd, Edison, NJ L e
Keasbey - Foot of Crows Mil Rd, Keasbey, NJ




BID QUOTATION SHEET CON'T

AREA B - NORTHERN SECTION OF THE NJ TURNPIKE - MILE POST 90.0 to 105,0

ITEM | QTY. UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL
OF ‘ PRICE DOLLAR
MEAS. AMOUNT
“THOT ASPHALT 1-2
I 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ 85.00 s 425.00
~ [ 'HOT ASPHALT I-4
2 10 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ 8500 1% 850.00
HOT ASPHALT I-5 _
3 150 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ 85.00 $12,750.00
| TACKOIL IN 5 GALLON CANS _ -
4 100 | GALLON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $75.00 |37,500.00
TOTAL OF LINES 1 THROUGH 4 | $§21 525 00

PLEASE LIST THE FACILITY’S ADDRISS (25 MILES OF AREA BID AS PR BID SPEC]FICAT!ONS.)
__Keashey- Foot of Crows Mill Rd, Keasbey, NJ

_ South River - 369 Whitehead Ave, South River, NJ
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BID QUOTATION SHEET CON’T

AREA C - NORTHERN SECTION OF THE NJ TURNPIKE - MILE POST 145.0 to 122.0

FEEM | QTY.. UNFIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL
oF PRICE DOLLAR
MEAS. AMOUNT
HOTASPRALT 2
z 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ $
HOTASPHALT 14
2 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ $
HOT ASPHALT 16
3 50 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ $
TACK OIL IN 5 GALLON CANS
4 25 | GALLON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ $

TOTAL OF LINES 1 THROUGH 4 | §

PLEASE LIST THE FACILITY'S ADDRESS (25 MILES OF AREA BID AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS.)

NO BID

RM-138680




BID QUOTATION SHEET CON'T

AREA D - NORTHERN SECTION OFTHE NJ TURNPIKE - MILE POST 0.6 TO 8.2 HUDSON BAY

EXTENSION WHICH INCLUDES BASTERLY AND WESTERLY ALIGNMENTS

TTEM | QTY. | UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL
OF PRICE DOLLAR
MEAS. AMOUNT
HOT ASPHALT 12
| 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS
HOT AGPHALT 14
2 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS .
HOT ASPHALT 15
3 50 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS
TACK OIL IN 5 GALLON CANS
4 25 | GALLON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS

TOTAL OF LINES 1 THROUGH 4

PLEASE LIST THE FACILITY'S ABDRESS (25 MILES OF AREA BID AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS.)

NO BID




BID QUOTATION SHEET CON'T

AREA E - SOUTHERN SECTION OF THE NJ TURNPIKE - MILE POST 0.0 TO 27.5 CAMDEN
COUNTY '

ITEM [ QTY. [ UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL
or PRICE DOLLAR
MEAS, AMOUNT
HOT ASPHALT -2 -
1 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ 85.00 |3 42500
| HOT ASPHALT 14 -
2 10 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ 85.00 |% 850.00
HOT ASPHALT -5 N N
3 50 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ 85.00 |3$4,250.00
TACK OIL IN 5 GALLON CANS |
4 20 | GALLON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ 75.00 }%1,500.00

TOTAL OF LINES 1 THROUGH 4 | $7 025.00

PLEASE LIST THE FACILITY'S ADDRESS (25 MILES OF AREA BID AS PER BID SPECIRICATIONS.)
. Mount Holly - 7 Maple Ave, Lumberton, NJ
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BID QUOTATION SHEET CON’T

AREA F - SOUTHERN SECTION OF 'THE NJ TURNPIKE - MILE POST 27.5 TO 50.0
MMW%_‘—“MM

BURLINGTON COUNTY
ITEM | QTY. | UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL
or ’ PRICE DOLLAR
MEAS. AMOUNT
HOT ASPHALT -2
! 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $8500 |$ 42500
HOT ASPHALT 4 T
2 10 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ 85.00 |3 850.00 _
HOT ASPHALT 15 | _
3 25 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS  ~ |$ 85.00 |s 2,125.00
TACK OIL IN 5 GALLON CANS |
4 20 GALLON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ 75.00 {$1,500.00
TOTAL OF LINES { THROUGH 4 | $ 4 900.00

PLEASE LIST THE FACILITY’S ADDRESS (25 MILES OF AREA BID AS PER BID SEECIFICATIONS,)
Mt Holly - 7 Maple Ave, Lumberton, NJ
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BID QUOTATION SHEET CON’T

AREA G - SOUTHERN SECTION OF THE NJ TURNPIKE - MILE POST 50.0 TO 67.2
BURLINGTON COUNTY & MERCER COUNTY '

ITEM | QTV. | UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL
OF PRICE DOLLAR
MEAS. | AMOUNT
HOT ASPHALT I-2
1 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ 85.00 |$425.00
HOT ASPHALT -4 |
2 10 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $85.00 |¢ 850.00
HOT ASPHALT -5
3 25 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $85.00 |$2,125.00
' TACK OIL IN 5 GALLON CANS: |
4 20 GALLON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ 75.00 |%1,500.00
TOTAL OF LINES 1 THROUGH 4 | $4 900.00

PLEASE LIST THE FACILITY!S ADDRISS (25 MILES OF AREA BID AS PRR BID SPECIFICATIONS.)
Mt Holly - 7 Maple Ave, Lumberton, NJ -
Florence - 5205 Route 130 South, E__:Io'rence, N.J

__Kingston - 4415 Route 27, Kingston, NJ

Fi ~138680




BID QUOTATION SHEELT CON'T

AREA H - SOUTHERN SECTION OF THE NJ TURNPIKE ~ MILE POST 0.0 TO 6.5 PEARL
HARBOR EXTENSION BURLINGTON COUNTY

ITEM | QTY. | UNIT | DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL ;

- OF PRICE | DOLLAR ;

MEAS. | AMOUNT

HOT ASPHALT 12 | |

| 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $85.00 |5425.00

- HOT ASPHALT 1-4 | |

2 10 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $85.00 | 850.00 !

| HOT ASPHALT 6 |

3 25 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS 585,00 [$2,125.00 ;

| - |

| TACK OIL. IN 5 GALLON CANS |
4 20 GALLON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $75.00 |%1,500.00
TOTAL OF LINES 1 THROUGH 4 | $4 900.00

PLEASE LIST THE FACILITY’S ADDRESS (25 MILES OF AREA BID AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS.)
Mt Holly - 7 Maple Ave, Lumberton, NJ

Florence - 5205 Route 130 South, Florence, NJ
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BID QUOTATION SHEET CON'T

AREA 1 - THE GARDEN STATE PARKWAY MILE MARKER 94.0 TO 120.0

ITEM | QTY. | UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL
or PRICE DOLLAR
MEAS. AMOUNT
HOT ASPHALT 12
l 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFIGATIONS 1$85.00 |%425.00
T [HOT ASPHALT 14
2 0 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ 85.00 |s 850.00
HOT ASPHALT 15 _
3 150 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $85.00 [%12,750.00
| TACK OIL IN 5 GALLON GANS ,
4 100 | GALLON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $75,00 |$7,500.00

TOTAL OF LINES 1 THROUGH 4 | $24 525,00

PLEASE LIST THE FACILITY’S ADDRESS (26 MILES OF AREA BID AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS.)
Keasbey- Foot of Crows Mill Road, Keasbey, NJ

South River - 369 Whitehead Ave, South River, NJ

Pge 15




BID QUOTATION SHEET CONT

AREA J - THE GARDEN STATE PARKWAY MILE MARKER 120.0 TO 134.0

ITEM | QTY. UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL
OF PRICE DOLLAR
MEAS. AMOUNT
HOT ASPHALT i-2 |
I 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ 85.00 1% 425.00
HOT ASPHALT -4
2 10 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $85.00 |$% 850.00
T THOT ASPHALT -5 \ |
3 150 TON [ PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $85.00 |3812,750.00
| TACK OIL iN 5 GALLON CANS _
4 100 | GALLON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS ~ |$ 75.00 |$7.500.00
TOTAL OF LINES { THROUGH 4 | $ 21 525 00

PLEASE LIST THE FAGILITY'S ADDRESS (25 MILES OF AREA BID AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS,)

Keasbey - Foot of Crows Mill Road, Keasbey, NJ
_South River - 369 Whitehead Ave, South River, N

RM-138680 B Page 16




BID QUOTATION SHEET CON’T

AREA K - THE GARDEN STATE PARKWAY MILE MARKER 134.0 TO 143.0

ITEM | QTY. | UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL
OF PRICE DOLLAR
MEAS. _ AMOUNT
HOT ASPHALT I-2
R TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ 85.00 % 42500
HOT ASPHALT |4 '
2 10 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ 85.00 |% 850,00
HOT ASPHALT I-5
3 150 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $g500 |$12,750.00
TACK OIL IN 5 GALLON CANS
4 100 | GALLON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $75.00 |s7,500.00
TOTAL OF LINES 1 THROUGH 4 | $ 54 £o& (30

PLEASE LIST THE FACILITY'S ADDRESS (25 MILES OF AREA BID ASPER BIP SPEC]FICAT!ONS.}
Keasbey - Foot of Crows Mill Rd, Keasbey, NJ e

Edison - 25 Montrose Rd, Edison, NJ

RM-138680




BID QUOTATION SHEEYT CON’T

AREA L - THE GARDEN STATE PARKWAY MILE MARKER 143.0 TO 153.0

TTEM | TV, | UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL
OFr ' PRICE DOLLAR
| MEAS. AMOUNT
HOT ASPHALT -2 |
; 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ $
HOT ASPHALT 14
2 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $§ $ |
HOT ASPHALT 15 ' o
3 50 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ $
- TACK OIL IN § GALLON CANS
4 25 | GALLON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ $
TOTAL OF LINES 1 THROUGH 4 | §

PLEASE LIST THE FACILITY'S ADDRESS (25 MILES OF AREA BID AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS.)

NO BID
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BID QUOTATION SHEET CON’T

AREA M - THE GARDEN STATE PARKWAY MILE MARKER 153.0 TO 158.0

. ITEM | QTV, UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL
OF PRICE DOLLAR
MEAS, : AMOUNT
ROT ASPHALT 12
E 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFIGATIONS $ $
HOT ASPHALT 1-4
2 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ $
HOT ASPHALT 16
3 50 TON | PER ATTACHED SPEGIFICATIONS $ $

TACK Oil IN 5 GALLON CANS:
4 25 GALLON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ $

TOTAL OF LINES 1 THROUGH 4 | $

PLEASE LIST THE FACILYTY'S ADDRESS (25 MILES OF AREA BID AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS.)

RM-1 38680




BID QUOTATION SHEET CON’T

AREA N - THE GARDEN STATE PARKWAY MILE MARKER 158.0 TO 172.0

ITEM | QTY, | UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL
OF PRICE DOLLAR
MEAS. AMOUNT
HOT ASPHALT -2 |
! 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ $
HOT ASPHALT 1-4 |
2 5 TON | PER ATTACHED SPEGIFICATIONS 3 $
| HOT ASPHALT 15
3 50 TON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ $
o TACK OIL IN'5 GALLON CANS
4 25 | GALLON | PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS $ $
NO BID TOTAL OF LINES 1 THROUGH 4 | §

PLEASELIST THE FACILITY'S ADDRESS (25 MILES:OF AREA BID AS PER BID SPECIFICATIONS.)

ANY INQUIRIES CONCERNING ‘THIS BID MUST BE SENT VI

NOBLE@TURNPIKE.STATE.NJ.US

PURSUANT. TO N.J.A.C. 19:9-2.2 (a)(3), Addenda will be distributed and posted on the Authority’s
website at least three days prior to the bid opening,

NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY

Very truly yours,

hnd wea.. o
Andrea E. Ward, Director
Purchasing Department

Trap Rock Industries LLC , /{M &//f

Name of Company / afﬁuﬂm_l‘i_zéd&gnamr Bidder
Michael, J CroWley, Vice President

RH-138680




