
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. A900.485 Letting Date: 3/1/19

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1 L.S. Construction Layout $0.01 $0.01 $39,000.00 $39,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

2 104-0002 1 L.S. Mobilization $251,000.00 $251,000.00 $165,000.00 $165,000.00 $295,000.00 $295,000.00

3 107-0001 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $0.01 $0.01 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

4 108-0001 2,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $2,000.00 $1.00 $2,000.00 $1.00 $2,000.00

5 108-N0002 150,000.00 USD Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid) $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00

6 202-0002 110 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $50.00 $5,500.00 $30.00 $3,300.00 $85.00 $9,350.00

7 202-0007 770 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $0.01 $7.70 $1.00 $770.00 $35.00 $26,950.00

8 202-0009 50,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

9 203-0001 240 C.Y. Embankment, Common $50.00 $12,000.00 $75.00 $18,000.00 $25.00 $6,000.00

10 208-0008 1,345.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence $22.00 $29,590.00 $41.00 $55,145.00 $10.00 $13,450.00

11 208-0022 14 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $50.00 $700.00 $195.00 $2,730.00 $220.00 $3,080.00

12 213-0001 240 Ton Disposal of Acid Producing Soil $38.00 $9,120.00 $31.00 $7,440.00 $95.00 $22,800.00

13 213-0002 485 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $28.00 $13,580.00 $51.00 $24,735.00 $110.00 $53,350.00

14 303-0001 435 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick $154.00 $66,990.00 $48.00 $20,880.00 $95.00 $41,325.00

15 429-0007 23 L.F. 30in Diameter Drilled Shaft $2,300.00 $52,900.00 $1,585.00 $36,455.00 $2,100.00 $48,300.00

16 499-N0053 1 Each Elevated Work Platform $29,000.00 $29,000.00 $39,600.00 $39,600.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00

17 506-0012 20 L.F. Drop Curb $374.00 $7,480.00 $121.00 $2,420.00 $250.00 $5,000.00

18 509-0001 14 S.F. Sign Panels $53.00 $742.00 $79.00 $1,106.00 $65.00 $910.00

19 509-0008 50 L.F. Timber Posts $16.00 $800.00 $12.00 $600.00 $75.00 $3,750.00

20 510-0001 885 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $94.00 $83,190.00 $45.00 $39,825.00 $55.00 $48,675.00

21 510-0011 8 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $3,036.00 $24,288.00 $2,300.00 $18,400.00 $2,500.00 $20,000.00

22 510-0017 4 Each Flared Guide Rail Terminal $4,674.00 $18,696.00 $4,400.00 $17,600.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00

23 510-0031 120 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide Rail $1.00 $120.00 $10.00 $1,200.00 $12.00 $1,440.00

24 510-0032 45 L.F. Rub Rail $120.00 $5,400.00 $22.00 $990.00 $30.00 $1,350.00

25 517-0003 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type C $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $19,800.00 $19,800.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

26 517-0009 8 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $2,500.00 $20,000.00 $3,000.00 $24,000.00 $2,100.00 $16,800.00

27 517-0013 7,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $7,000.00 $1.00 $7,000.00 $1.00 $7,000.00

28 522-0001 120 Each Test Pits $0.01 $1.20 $400.00 $48,000.00 $450.00 $54,000.00

29 532-0001 150,000.00 USD Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid) $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00

30 601-0001 750 L.F. #6 A.W.G. Power Cable $8.10 $6,075.00 $3.00 $2,250.00 $3.00 $2,250.00

31 601-0005 3,950.00 L.F. 3in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40) $30.00 $118,500.00 $39.00 $154,050.00 $75.00 $296,250.00

32 601-0007 625 L.F. #1/0 A.W.G. Ground Wire $7.20 $4,500.00 $12.00 $7,500.00 $7.00 $4,375.00

33 601-0015 10 Each Junction Box, Type C $4,300.00 $43,000.00 $5,720.00 $57,200.00 $4,500.00 $45,000.00

34 601-0016 4 Each Junction Box, Type PS $7,900.00 $31,600.00 $6,870.00 $27,480.00 $5,500.00 $22,000.00

35 601-0019 765 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Ground Wire $5.90 $4,513.50 $4.00 $3,060.00 $4.00 $3,060.00

36 601-0020 385 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Ground Wire $10.40 $4,004.00 $2.00 $770.00 $3.00 $1,155.00

37 601-0021 1,105.00 L.F. #10 A.W.G. Ground Wire $12.50 $13,812.50 $2.00 $2,210.00 $2.00 $2,210.00

38 601-0023 305 L.F. 3in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 80) $30.00 $9,150.00 $78.00 $23,790.00 $55.00 $16,775.00

39 601-0032 760 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Power Cable $11.00 $8,360.00 $3.00 $2,280.00 $2.50 $1,900.00

40 601-0033 1,240.00 L.F. #1/0 A.W.G. Power Cable $9.20 $11,408.00 $5.00 $6,200.00 $8.00 $9,920.00

41 601-0038 2,155.00 L.F. #10 A.W.G. Power Cable $13.00 $28,015.00 $2.00 $4,310.00 $2.00 $4,310.00

42 601-0074 825 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Power Cable $8.70 $7,177.50 $4.00 $3,300.00 $5.00 $4,125.00

43 601-0050 415 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Ground Wire $7.50 $3,112.50 $4.00 $1,660.00 $5.00 $2,075.00

44 601-0056 375 L.F. #6 A.W.G. Ground Wire $7.40 $2,775.00 $4.00 $1,500.00 $4.00 $1,500.00

45 601-0067 1,525.00 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Power Cable $6.90 $10,522.50 $3.00 $4,575.00 $4.50 $6,862.50

46 601-0073 25 Each Junction Box Foundation, Type 2 $5,400.00 $135,000.00 $7,280.00 $182,000.00 $5,500.00 $137,500.00

47 601-0069 155 L.F. 2-Way Duct Bank, 3in HDPE Conduits Directional Drilled $199.00 $30,845.00 $197.00 $30,535.00 $230.00 $35,650.00

48 602-N0005 1 Each Transformer 1PH, 480-120/240V, 5KVA $13,700.00 $13,700.00 $2,760.00 $2,760.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00

49 602-N0006 24 Each Power Cabinet Modification $300.00 $7,200.00 $930.00 $22,320.00 $1,200.00 $28,800.00

50 604-0001 3 Each End Node Radio $8,700.00 $26,100.00 $4,400.00 $13,200.00 $28,500.00 $85,500.00

51 604-0104 1,065.00 L.F. Outdoor Network Cable $12.50 $13,312.50 $5.00 $5,325.00 $9.00 $9,585.00

52 604-N0003 3 Each Base Station Radio Equipment $4,800.00 $14,400.00 $2,240.00 $6,720.00 $9,500.00 $28,500.00

53 605-N0005 24 Each Roadway Weather Information System Standard $20,900.00 $501,600.00 $34,600.00 $830,400.00 $19,500.00 $468,000.00

54 605-N0006 5 Each RPU Cabinet Modification, Type 1 $600.00 $3,000.00 $4,600.00 $23,000.00 $6,000.00 $30,000.00

55 605-N0007 5 Each RPU Cabinet Modification, Type 2 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,920.00 $39,600.00 $5,700.00 $28,500.00

56 605-N0008 1 Each Structure Mounted RWIS $24,300.00 $24,300.00 $31,600.00 $31,600.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00

57 605-N0009 2 Each Supplemental RWIS Sensor $35,300.00 $70,600.00 $33,400.00 $66,800.00 $36,000.00 $72,000.00

58 703-0001 5,150.00 S.Y. Topsoil $0.01 $51.50 $4.00 $20,600.00 $12.00 $61,800.00

59 704-0001 5,050.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $0.01 $50.50 $4.00 $20,200.00 $2.00 $10,100.00

BaseLine Item Detail Daidone Electric, Inc. PKF-Mark III, Inc. H.B.C. Company, Inc
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60 704-0004 100 S.Y. Seeding, Type L $0.01 $1.00 $11.00 $1,100.00 $2.00 $200.00

61 706-0001 100 S.Y. Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting $5.00 $500.00 $12.00 $1,200.00 $50.00 $5,000.00

62 709-N0001 330 S.Y. Turf Pavers $220.00 $72,600.00 $200.00 $66,000.00 $395.00 $130,350.00

63 801-N0004 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic $211,609.08 $211,609.08 $164,500.00 $164,500.00 $236,000.00 $236,000.00

$2,454,000.00 $2,796,991.00 $2,999,282.50
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