New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T500.501 Letting Date: 1/23/18

$2,589,339.00

$2,916,560.00

Page 1 of 1

$2,931,800.00

BaseLine Item Detail ACP Contracting Inc. Amco Enterprises Inc Gaudelli Bros Inc. EACM CORP
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
1 104-0002 1 LS. Mobilization $105,367.00 $105,367.00 $96,000.00 $96,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00
2 2000-NO0O6 50,000.00 USD Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report and Monitoring (NO-BID) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00
3 2000-N0O07  50,000.00 USD  Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00
4 2000-N008 30,000.00 USD  Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID) $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00
5 2000-N009 1 LS.  Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $15,087.00 $15,087.00 $18,120.00 $18,120.00 $25,900.00 $25,900.00 $17,365.00 $17,365.00
6 2000-NO10 1LS. Building Electric Work - Location No. 2 $9,026.00 $9,026.00 $17,280.00 $17,280.00 $23,200.00 $23,200.00 $16,560.00 $16,560.00
7 2000-N011 1 LS.  Building Electric Work - Location No. 3 $15,759.00 $15,759.00 $29,160.00 $29,160.00 $39,800.00 $39,800.00 $27,945.00 $27,945.00
8 2000-N012 1LS. Building Electric Work - Location No. 4 $19,636.00 $19,636.00 $27,600.00 $27,600.00 $21,700.00 $21,700.00 $26,450.00 $26,450.00
9 2000-N013 1 LS.  Building Electric Work - Location No. 5 $25,058.00 $25,058.00 $34,600.00 $34,600.00 $46,700.00 $46,700.00 $33,120.00 $33,120.00
10 2000-N014 1LS. Building Electric Work - Location No. 6 $7,728.00 $7,728.00 $13,800.00 $13,800.00 $29,200.00 $29,200.00 $13,225.00 $13,225.00
11 2000-N0O15 1 LS.  Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $184,239.00 $184,239.00 $248,000.00 $248,000.00 $269,200.00 $269,200.00 $310,500.00 $310,500.00
12 2000-N016 1LS. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 2 $186,374.00 $186,374.00 $209,000.00 $209,000.00 $249,800.00 $249,800.00 $258,000.00 $258,000.00
13 2000-N0O17 1 LS.  Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 3 $131,326.00 $131,326.00 $181,000.00 $181,000.00 $162,400.00 $162,400.00 $205,000.00 $205,000.00
14 2000-N018 1LS. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 4 $399,251.00 $399,251.00 $461,000.00 $461,000.00 $474,500.00 $474,500.00 $717,500.00 $717,500.00
15 2000-N019 1 LS.  Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 5 $475,627.00 $475,627.00 $565,000.00 $565,000.00 $557,200.00 $557,200.00 $595,500.00 $595,500.00
16 2000-N020 1LS. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 6 $209,861.00 $209,861.00 $211,000.00 $211,000.00 $202,200.00 $202,200.00 $282,000.00 $282,000.00
17 2000-N0O21 50,000.00 USD  Force Account for Building Architectural Work Allowances (NO- $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00
18 2000-N022 25,000.00 USD  Force Account for Building Electrical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00
19 2000-N023  500,000.00 USD  Force Account for Building Mechanical Work Allowances (NO-B $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00
20 2000-N024 100,000.00 USD  Force Account for Temporary Heating Allowance (NO-BID) $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00

$3,368,165.00



