
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P500.495 Letting Date: 8/28/2018

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0002 1 L.S. Mobilization $78,500.00 $78,500.00 $8,200.00 $8,200.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $76,875.00 $76,875.00

2 599-N0003 100,000.00 USD Project Allowances (No-Bid) $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00

3 599-N0027 1,700.00 L.F. 8in Ductile Iron Water Pipe $75.00 $127,500.00 $129.42 $220,014.00 $108.00 $183,600.00 $165.00 $280,500.00 $235.30 $400,010.00

4 599-N0028 7 Each 8in Water Valve $2,200.00 $15,400.00 $2,114.29 $14,800.03 $2,400.00 $16,800.00 $5,000.00 $35,000.00 $2,875.00 $20,125.00

5 2000-N006 30,000.00 USD Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report and Monitoring (NO-BID) $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00

6 2000-N007 30,000.00 USD Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00

7 2000-N008 15,000.00 USD Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID) $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00

8 2000-N009 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $54,000.00 $54,000.00 $59,000.00 $59,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00

9 2000-N015 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $298,500.00 $298,500.00 $314,300.00 $314,300.00 $268,500.00 $268,500.00 $330,000.00 $330,000.00 $365,000.00 $365,000.00

10 2000-N025 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $63,200.00 $63,200.00 $69,000.00 $69,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00

11 2000-N026 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 1 $191,000.00 $191,000.00 $212,000.00 $212,000.00 $229,800.00 $229,800.00 $240,000.00 $240,000.00 $385,000.00 $385,000.00

12 2000-N024 30,000.00 USD Force Account for Temporary Heating Allowance (NO-BID) $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00

13 2000-N030 30,000.00 USD NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (No-Bid) $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00

14 2000-N031 10,000.00 USD Universal Waste Removal (No-Bid) $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00

$1,045,900.00 $1,131,514.03 $1,271,700.00 $1,315,500.00 $1,667,010.00

EACM CORPHall Building Corp. Kappa Construction Corp.BaseLine Item Detail Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. Gaudelli Bros Inc.
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