BID SUMMARY
RM-139274 TREATED AND UNTREATED ROCK SALT

PRIVMARY SUPPLIER BIDS
ioees rhe DetrotSat || mononsat,nc. | [ avaniesaw,me, || Corstoeking | | chemica quipment | | sikkemp Conret,
Line Delivery Location El::::‘i!:-::’nf::‘ Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location
Item (Tons) Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton
SOUTHERN
1 Interchange 1 - Penns Grove 1,000 $99.50 $81.82 7-369.90 . . No Bid $86.90 $81.75
2 District 1- Swedesboro 2,000 $98.00 $79.60 ‘_ ) ;6_9.65“ No Bid $87.95 £81.75
3 District 2 — Moorestown 2,000 §95.00 $76.24 .“‘.S‘lll.GS No Bid $86.70 $84.85
4 District 3 - Crosswicks (Bordentown) 3,000 $92.00 $74.70 S'fz.ss No Bid $86.70 $84.85
5 District 3 A - PA Ext. Florence Twp. 3,000 $93.00 $74.40 ‘S'I.lv_-,l!_ﬁ No Bid $86.70 $84.85
6 District | - Cape May Court House 2,000 $106.00 $87.39 375.15 No Bid $97.19 $85.46
7 Great Egg Tolls - Marmora 1,000 $105.00 $83.91 . .$76.15 No Bid $97.19 $83.10
8 District 2 - Absecon 3,000 $105.00 $81.13 $74.65 No Bid $97.19 $85.84
9 Bass River Sub Yard — New Gretna 2.000 £99.00 $81.39 : S‘ls.ls . Na Rid $94.19 £89.15
10 District 3 - Ocean/Bamegat 2,000 $97.00 $79.79 ‘ '$75.18 No Bid $94.19 $87.38
CENTRAL
11 District 4 - Hightstown 3000 $86.00 $73.99 $69.73 No Bid $91.19 $83.28
12 District 5 — Milltown 3000 $83.00 $71.26 36&23._ No Bid $89.19 $83.28
13 District SA - Woodbridge 2000 $83.00 $69.98 567.54 No Bid $87.19 $83.28
14 District 6 - Elizabeth 2000 $81.00 $73.83 $67.31 No Bid $89.19 $83.99
15 Pleasant Plains Sub Yard 2000 $91.00 $72.59 a $68.29 . No Bid $93.19 $85.73
16 District 4 — Herbertsville/Brick 2000 $86.00 $78.49 $71.80 No Bid $94.19 £85.73
17 Asbury Sub Yard - Tinton Falls 2000 $93.00 $78.42 $69.04 No Bid $94.14 $85.73
18 District 5 - Holmdel 3000 $83.00 $76.38 $68.41 No Bid $92.11 $83.50
19 Chevalier Ave Sub Yard - Sayreville 2000 $82.00 $71.34 $68.23 No Bid $89.15 $84.83
20 District 6 - Clark 2000 £81.00 $74.47 $67.60 No Bid $89.13 $82.78
21 | UnionSub Yard NB - Glenwood Ave 300 $80.00 $73.83 $67.26 No Bid $87.19 $83.03
Hillside
22 Union Sub Yard SB - N. Union Ave 1000 $80.00 §71.25 $68.06 No Bid $87.19 $83.70




RM-139274 TREATED AND UNTREATED ROCK SALT

BID SUMMARY

PRIMARY SUPPLIER BIDS
miopens mepeonsolt 1| mononsamine. || avanucsa e, || Comvoeisng | fchemical qupment | | sixemp Concrte,
Line Delivery Location E;::;T:::;f::‘ Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location
Item (Tons) Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton
NORTHERN
23 District 8 - Secaucus 2000 $81.00 $79.40 $68,97 No Bid $91.19 $83.28
24 District 8A - Ridgefield Park 500 $86.00 $84.77 868.81 No Bid $90.19 $85.14
25 District 9 - Jersey City 2000 $80.00 $79.83 §70.19 No Bid $86.13 $84.25
26 District 10 - East Rutherford 3000 $80.00 $80.47 $68.52 No Bid $87.19 $84.25
27 Essex Sub Yard - Bloomfield 2000 $83.00 $84.77 $67.60 No Bid $87.19 $86.00
28 District 7 - Clifton 2700 $82.00 $77.26 $68.80 No Bid $87.63 $85.60
29 District 8 - Paramus 2000 $82.00 $81.44 $68.98 No Bid $88.19 $86.95
30 Montvale Service Arca Sub Yard 500 $85.00 $81.84 $65.56 No Bid $89.94 $89.58




RM-139274 TREATED AND UNTREATED ROCK SALT

BID SUMMARY

SECONDARY SUPPLIER BIDS

The Detroit Salt Cargil Deicing Chemical Equipment Sil-Kemp Concrete,
BIDDERS Company Morston Salt, Inc. Atlantic Salt, Inc. Technology Labs of DE, Inc. Inc.
Estimated Salt . .
Line Location Reaui at Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location
Item o ":,':_:::;e Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton
SOUTHERN
SS-1 Interchange | - Penns Grove 600 $99.50 $84.82 $69.90 No Bid $86.90 $83.75
ge | - renns ' 52 (INELIGIBLE) : :
L $69.65 ,
5S-2 District 1- Swedesboro 1200 $98.00 $82.60 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $87.95 $83.75
o $71.65 .
2-
§S-3 District 2 - Moorestown/Mt. Laurel 1200 $95.00 $79.24 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $86.70 $86.85
L . $72.58 .
- )
§8-4 District 3 - Crosswicks (Bordentown) 1800 $92.00 $71.70 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $£86.70 $86.85
L $£71.06 .
§S-5 District 3 A - PA Ext. Florence Twp. 1800 $93.00 $77.40 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $86.70 $86.85
L $75.15 .
- 2
§8-6 District 1 - Cape May Court House 1200 $106.00 $90.39 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid §97.19 §$87.46
- £76.15 .
S§-7 Great Egg Tolls - Marmora 600 $105.00 $£86.91 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $97.19 $85.10
o $74.65 .

R 2 i

$S-8 District 2 - Absecon (Whitchorse) 1800 $105.00 $84.13 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $97.19 $87.84
. $76.15 .

- - 2

SS9 Bass River Sub Yard - New Greina 1200 $99.00 $84.39 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $94.19 $91.15
- y $75.15 .
. - 2
SS-10 District 3 - Ocean/Bamegat 1200 $97.00 $82.79 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $94.19 $89.38
CENTRAL
SS-11 District 4 - Hightstown 1800 $86.00 $74.711 $69.73 No Bid $91.19 $85.28
) (INELIGIBLE) ' ’
L R $68.29 .
- - 2
SS-12 District 5 - Milllown 1800 $83.00 STL72 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $89.19 $85.28
. . $67.54 .
i - 2 2
§8-13 District 6A - Woodbridge 1200 $83.00 $70.26 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $87.19 $85.28
L . $67.31 .

. - 2

SS-14 District 6 - Elizabeth 1200 $81.00 $74.03 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $89.19 $85.99
. $68.29 .

. > 2

$S-15 Pleasant Plains Sub Yard 1200 $91.00 $75.59 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $93.19 $87.73
- . $71.80 .

- — .d

$S-16 District 4 — Hetbertsville 1200 $86.00 $7%.21 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $94.19 $87.73
. $69.04 .

. - 2

S8-17 Asbury Sub Yard - Tinton Falls 1200 $93.00 $79.25 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $94.14 $87.73
. $68.41

-18 - i i

SS. District 5 — Telegraph Hill/Holmde! 1800 $83.00 $76.93 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $£92.11 $85.50
. . $68.23 .

-19 -8 2 2 . .
SS. Chevalier Ave Sub Yard - Sayreville 1200 $82.00 $71.82 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $89.15 $86.83
$8-20 District 6 - Clark 1200 $81.00 $74.75 $67.60 No Bid $89.13 $84.78

) (INELIGIBLE) ) )
Union Sub Yard NB - Glenwood Ave $67.26 .
§8-21 X 19 .
Hillside 180 $80.00 $74.03 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $87.1 $85.03
. . $68.06
$S-22 58 - ‘ 9 :
SS Union Sub Yard $B -~ N Union Ave 600 $80.00 $74.28% (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $87 1 $85.70




BID SUMMARY
RM-139274 TREATED AND UNTREATED ROCK SALT

SECONDARY SUPPLIER BIDS

NORTHERN
The Detroit Saft Cargil Deicing Chemical Equipment Sil-Kemp Concrete,
BIDDERS Company Morton Salt, tnc. Atlantic Salt, Inc. Technology Labs of DE, Inc. Inc.
Line tion E;(im::led f::' Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location
Item eq(,':_;::; Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton
- " $68.97 .

- - 2

$8-23 District 8 - Secaucus 1200 $81.00 $80.17 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $91.19 $86.61
L . $68.87 .

SS-24 District 8A - Ridgefield Park 300 $86.00 5$80.97 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $90.19 $88.54
L . $70.19 .

%) . 2
SS-25 District 9 - Jersey City 1200 $80.00 $80.03 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $86.13 $87.62

- $68.52 .

o - 2

§S8-26 District 10 - East Rutherford 1800 $80.00 $80.75 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $87.19 $87.62
; $67.60 .

%) . 2 2
§§-27 Essex Sub Yard - Bloomfield 1200 $83.00 $80.26 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $87.19 $96.24
§S-28 District 7 - Clifton 1620 $82.00 $81.86 $68.8 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $87.63 $89.02
$5-29 District 8 - Paramus 1200 $82.60 $82.32 $68.98 No Bid $88.19 $90.43

T (INELIGIBLE) ' i
R $69.56 .

- o

$S-30 Montvale Service Area Sub Yard 300 $85.00 $83.39 (INELIGIBLE) No Bid $89.94 $94.20

(INELEGIBLE) - Bidders could bid the same Delivery Location as primary, sccondary and/or tertiary supplier, however, no bidder could be awarded the same Delivery Location for more than one category.




RM-139274 TREATED AND UNTREATED ROCK SALT

BID SUMMARY

TERTIARY SUPPLIER BIDS
BIDDERS mecl::;:::a " Morton Salt, tnc. Atlantic Salt, Inc. C:Z:r'::::;‘ C"f;";f:'f‘:g‘l’::m s""(e""l’nif’"“m'
Line Location Ei:::::::‘f::t Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location
Item (Tons) Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton
SOUTHERN
Ts-1 Interchange 1 - Penns Grove 400 $99.50 $87.82 (mgffé?gm No Bid | $86.90 (INEsl?l.,(:‘v-l’lsaLE)
Ts-2 District |- Swedesboro 800 £98.00 (mEs:xsd?gLs) (msfx;m $99.58 $87.95 $87.75.
TS-3 District 2 ~ Moorestown/Mt, Laurcl 800 $95.00 (INI§51262I4BLE) ([N!isl:,lld?lsiLE) $92.48 $86.70 ‘ $90.85
Ts4 |  District 3 - Crosswicks (Bordentown) 1200 $92.00 (INESEI%.I’OBLE) (1NE$L7|265|;LE) $92.36 © s8670. £90.85
TS-5 | District 3 A~ PA Ext. Florence Twp. 1200 $93.00 <m§f?c'1°m) (INESZIIG‘I)ZLE) $91.87 $86.70 $90.85
TS-6 District 1 - Cape May Court House 800 $106.00 $93.39 $75.15 No Bid $97.19 $91.46
. (INELIGIBLE) (INELIGIBLE)
57 Great Egg Tolls - Marmora 400 $105.00 $89.91 (mgzﬁ'}:;m No Bid $97.19 (méfféigw)
Ts-8 | District 2 - Absccon (Whitchorse) 1200 $105.00 (INS&:;LE) ([N;:'l‘(';‘;’gm No Bid $97.19 $91.84
189 |  Bass River Sub Yard — New Gretna #00 $9900 N :f@gm (lNngé"‘gw) No Bid $94.19 $95.15
TS-10 District 3 - Ocean/Bamegat 800 $97.00 (INgffG'szE) ([NIzSZISé:xS;LE) No Bid $94.19 $93.38
CENTRAL
511 District 4 - Hightstown 1200 $66.00 (lmzsz:d::m) (INSLG?G":;LE) $99.98 $91.19 $89.28
TS-12 District 5 - Milltown 1200 - $85.00 INBLGBLEY (mgffc'zl;w) $92.86 $89.19 $89.28
T5-13 District SA - Woodbridge 800 $85.00 (lNEstG'fgLE) (INES&SI;LE) $93.42 $87.19 $89.28
TS-14 District 6 - Elizabeth 800 $85.00 ( INESZEI);LE) (]N[ff;'cﬁ:}m $99.78 $89.19 $89.99
TS-15 Pleasant Plains Sub Yard 800 $91.00 (INIESZféSI;LE) (mlzsfg;m $105.89 $93.19 $91.73
TS-16 District 4 - Herbertsville 800 $89.00° (ms&fl';m (IN:ZI'(';:OBLE) $105.89 $94.19 £91.73
TS-17 Asbury Sub Yard - Tinton Falls 800 $95.00 (IN[f:é;’zlgLE) (IN;f;}(;‘BLE) $105.89 $94.14 HL73
1518 | District 5 - Telegraph Hill/Holmdel 1200 $85.00 (INF_SZ;"(‘;;LE) (INESEEII'}LE) $105.89 $92.11 $89.50
1519 | Chevalier Ave Sub Yard - Sayreville 800 $85.00 (INSZ;géLE) ( INESEIB(']ZI;LE) $93.52 $89.15 $90.83
T5-20 District 6 - Clark 800 $85.00 (IN;?G'.I'QLE) ( m;flggm $93.52 $89.13 $88.78
Ts21 | Union Sub Y“’melzd'eG"’"“""’d Ave 120 $85.00 (|N§L7176?3BLE) (INSE;'GZI;LE) $93.76 $87.19 $89.03
1522 | Union Sub Yard SB - N. Union Ave 100 $85.00 §77.25 56806 £95.51 $8719 $89.70

{INELIGIBLE)

(INELIGIBLE)




BID SUMMARY
RM-139274 TREATED AND UNTREATED ROCK SALT

TERTIARY SUPPLIER BIDS
BIDDERS WC:':;::"" Morton Satt,inc. || Attantic satt, inc. C:::::f:;“ c“i;";“::f::"f:f“' Sikiemp Concrete,
Line Location ';:::‘;?:::’nf:::' Delivery Location Delivery Lacation Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location Delivery Location
Item (Tons) Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton
NORTHERN

TS-23 District 8 - Secaucus 800 $85.00 ( IN[SSEI:;G:!:LE) (INESI‘.SIBG'?ZBLE) $100.84 $91.19 $89.94
TS24 District 8A - Ridgefield Park 200 $85.00 (INS&‘;’,LE) “Ns:fé':;w) $106.42 $90.19 $91.95
T5-25 District 9 - Jersey City 800 (mrzsflsd?gl_m $83.03 (]NSZ?G:ZLE) $100.67 $86.13 $90.99
TS-26 District 10 - East Rutherford 1200 (INEs:lz‘l)gLE) $83.75 (INIZsleéi;LE) $104.89 £87.19 $90.99
TS-27 Essex Sub Yard - Bloomfield 800 $85.00 (INESEIJG"‘;:;LE) (INEsfl-’(.i?gLE) $95.00 $87.19 §99.94
TS-28 District 7 - Clifion 1080 5.85.00' (INESI?CI;:‘SBLE) (INEESEISG?SLE) §97.33 $87.63 $92.45
TS-29 District 8 - Paramus 800 (INEsl'.;Is(.‘:‘I)OBLE) $85.32 (lNl?fdelsaLE) $105.89 $88.19 $93.91
1530 | Montvale Service Arca Sub Yard 200 $85.00 (lNéfg;w) (mc-s:?o'slgm) $95.62 $89.94 $97.82

(INELEGIBLE) = Bidders could bid the same Delivery Location as primary, secondary and/or tertiary supplier; however, no bidder could be awarded the same Delivery Location for more than one category.




BID SUMMARY
RM-139274 TREATED AND UNTREATED ROCK SALT

UNTREATED SUPPLIER BIDS

BIDDERS The Detroit Salt Morton Salt, Inc. Atlantic Salt, Inc. Cargil Deicing Chemical Equipment Sil-Kemp Concrete,
= Company Technology tabs of DE, Inc. inc.
Line Item Description Quantity (Tons) Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton
F-1 Untreated Rock Salt 20,000 $67.37 $69.30 $59.90 $78.60 $59.75 $56.97
(OPTIONAL) PICK-UP SUPPLIER QUOTES
NOTE: THIS OPTION DOES NOT FACTOR IN THE BASIS OF AWARD
The Detroit Salt Cargil Delcing Chemical Equipment Sil-Kemp Concrete,
BIDDERS Company Morton Salt, Inc. Atlantic Salt, Inc. Technology Labs of DE, nc. Inc.
G-1 Pick-Up Treated N/A NO QUOTE $84.00 $79.90 NO QUOTE $82.10 $80.00
G-2 Pick-Up Untreated N/A NO QUOTE $69.00 $59.90 NO QUOTE $55.00 $62.00




