
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T500.461 Letting Date: 7/19/18

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $182,000.00 $182,000.00 $190,000.00 $190,000.00 $262,798.01 $262,798.01

2 9A00074 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1 $17,386.60 $17,386.60 $23,000.00 $23,000.00 $53,550.00 $53,550.00 $86,000.00 $86,000.00

3 9A00075 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 2 $25,371.80 $25,371.80 $23,500.00 $23,500.00 $37,500.00 $37,500.00 $91,000.00 $91,000.00

4 9A00078 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $295,421.03 $295,421.03 $185,000.00 $185,000.00 $291,215.00 $291,215.00 $356,000.00 $356,000.00

5 9A00079 1 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 2 $484,200.08 $484,200.08 $308,500.00 $308,500.00 $470,500.00 $470,500.00 $454,000.00 $454,000.00

6 9A00080 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1 $11,560.76 $11,560.76 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $34,425.00 $34,425.00 $24,000.00 $24,000.00

7 9A00081 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 2 $20,741.30 $20,741.30 $14,300.00 $14,300.00 $43,000.00 $43,000.00 $24,000.00 $24,000.00

9 9AFAE0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Electrical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

10 9AFAM0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Mechanical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

11 9AFAA0B 1 C.P. Force Account for Building Architectural Work Allowances (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

12 9A00476 1 C.P. Force Account for Interchange Lighting Electrical Work Allowances (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

13 9A00477 459 Each Traffic Cone $22.57 $10,359.63 $1.00 $459.00 $1.00 $459.00 $0.01 $4.59

14 9A00478 791 Each Construction Signs $18.33 $14,499.03 $1.00 $791.00 $1.00 $791.00 $0.01 $7.91

15 9A00479 11 Each Flashing Arrow Board, 4' x 8' $1,312.00 $14,432.00 $200.00 $2,200.00 $1.00 $11.00 $0.01 $0.11

16 9A00480 11 Each Traffic Control Truck with Mounted Crash $7,478.30 $82,261.30 $500.00 $5,500.00 $1.00 $11.00 $0.01 $0.11

17 9A00481 47 Each Roadway Lighting Demolition - Location No. 1 (Interchange 14B) $473.23 $22,241.81 $500.00 $23,500.00 $1,400.00 $65,800.00 $1,300.00 $61,100.00

19 9A00483 16 Each Type C Junction Box  Location No. 1 (Interchange 14B) $4,088.28 $65,412.48 $3,100.00 $49,600.00 $2,750.00 $44,000.00 $2,110.00 $33,760.00

20 9A00484 51,066.00 L.F. #4 AWG Cable (RHW) Location No. 1 (Interchange  14B) $2.37 $121,026.42 $2.75 $140,431.50 $2.95 $150,644.70 $3.00 $153,198.00

21 9A00485 8,005.00 L.F. #4 AWG Cable (RHW) (GND) Location No. 1 (Interchange  14B) $2.12 $16,970.60 $2.75 $22,013.75 $2.95 $23,614.75 $3.00 $24,015.00

22 9A00486 50 L.F. Ground Rod (3/4" x 10') Location No. 1 (Interchange  14B) $206.55 $10,327.50 $185.00 $9,250.00 $100.00 $5,000.00 $50.00 $2,500.00

23 9A00487 1,030.00 L.F. 3" PVC SCH 80 Location No. 1 (Interchange  14B) $24.21 $24,936.30 $95.00 $97,850.00 $70.00 $72,100.00 $73.00 $75,190.00

24 9A00488 12,826.00 L.F. 3" PVC SCH 40 Location No. 1 (Interchange 14B) $18.10 $232,150.60 $10.00 $128,260.00 $20.00 $256,520.00 $18.00 $230,868.00

25 9A00489 1,386.00 L.F. 3" PVC Couplers Location No. 1 (Interchange  14B) $87.04 $120,637.44 $1.00 $1,386.00 $1.00 $1,386.00 $0.01 $13.86

26 9A00490 2,378.00 L.F. 3" PVC Coated RGS Location No. 1 (Interchange  14B) $56.77 $134,999.06 $76.00 $180,728.00 $105.00 $249,690.00 $79.00 $187,862.00

27 9A00491 3 L.F. 3" PVC Coated RGS Elbows Location No. 1 (Interchange  14B) $239.24 $717.72 $280.00 $840.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $0.01 $0.03

28 9A00492 238 L.F. 3" PVC Coated RGS Couplers Location No. 1 (Interchange  14B) $47.37 $11,274.06 $3.00 $714.00 $1.00 $238.00 $0.01 $2.38

29 9A00493 21 Each Roadway Light - LP3 Location No. 1 (Interchange  14B) $1,436.39 $30,164.19 $1,845.00 $38,745.00 $2,130.00 $44,730.00 $2,810.00 $59,010.00

30 9A00494 30 Each Roadway Light - LP4 Location No. 1 (Interchange  14B) $1,702.66 $51,079.80 $1,900.00 $57,000.00 $2,180.00 $65,400.00 $2,870.00 $86,100.00

31 9A00495 5 Each Roadway Light - LP5 Location No. 1 (Interchange  14B) $2,299.11 $11,495.55 $2,250.00 $11,250.00 $2,525.00 $12,625.00 $3,230.00 $16,150.00

32 9A00496 4 Each Roadway Light - LW2  Location No. 1 (Interchange  14B) $2,322.66 $9,290.64 $1,320.00 $5,280.00 $2,475.00 $9,900.00 $3,170.00 $12,680.00

33 9A00497 6 Each Pole - 26foot  Location No. 1 (Interchange  14B) $3,767.50 $22,605.00 $3,800.00 $22,800.00 $6,345.00 $38,070.00 $4,790.00 $28,740.00

34 9A00498 44 Each Pole - 40foot  Location No. 1 (Interchange  14B) $4,717.28 $207,560.32 $2,800.00 $123,200.00 $2,765.00 $121,660.00 $3,450.00 $151,800.00

35 9A00499 20 Each JBF Foundation (Interchange 14B) $420.73 $8,414.60 $3,600.00 $72,000.00 $3,525.00 $70,500.00 $2,440.00 $48,800.00

36 9A00500 30 Each Type III Concrete Foundation (Interchange 14B) $420.73 $12,621.90 $1,950.00 $58,500.00 $1,850.00 $55,500.00 $1,880.00 $56,400.00

$2,320,159.52 $1,952,598.25 $2,564,840.45 $2,676,000.00

Daidone Electric, Inc.BaseLine Item Detail NJTA Engineer Estimate H.B.C. Company, Inc FAI-GON Electric Inc.
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