New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaseLine Item Detail

J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Inc.

Contract No. T300.475

IEW Construction Group Inc.

Union Paving & Construction Co., Inc.

Item No. Unit Code

1 104-0001
2 104-0002
3 107-0001
4 108-0001
5 2000-N0001
6 201-0002
7 202-0002
8 202-0006
9 207-0003
10 208-0007
11 208-0022
12 208-N0001
13 210-0001
14 211-0001
15 214-0001
16 301-0002
17 302-0002
18 302-0003
19 303-N0004
20 304-0001
21 401-0002
22 401-0003
23 401-0066
24 401-0067
25 429-0003
26 503-0253
27 506-0001
28 506-0002
29 508-N0004
30 510-0014
31 510-0017
32 511-0002
33 514-0001
34 516-0008
35 517-0003
36 517-0009
37 521-0001
38 524-0002
39 531-0001
40 599-N0003
41 599-N0016
42 601-0021
43 601-0036
44 601-0038
45 601-0040
46 601-0041
47 601-0042
48 601-0043
49 601-0045
50 601-0046
51 601-0047
52 603-0016
53 604-N0002
54 699-N0040
55 709-0002
56 801-0001
57 801-0009
58 801-0013
59 801-N0004
60 803-0032

Qty uoMm

1LS.
1LS.
1LS.
1,000.00 USD
10,000.00 USD
1LS.
27 C.Y.
59 S.Y.
1 Ton
275 L.F.
3 Each
1 Each
1LS.
185 L.F.
1LS.
17 S.Y.
2 Ton
4 Ton
25 S.Y.
59 S.Y.
5 C.Y.
5 C..
1,300.00 LB
1,300.00 LB
140 L.F.
1 Each
233 L.F.
12 L.F.
100 L.F.
1 Each
1 Each
1 Each
22 S.Y.
800 L.F.
1LS.
8 Mnth
1LS.
1 Unit
20,000.00 USD
50,000.00 USD
30,000.00 USD
1,900.00 L.F.
900 L.F.
3,800.00 L.F.
250 L.F.
150 L.F.
80 L.F.
3 Each
8 Each
300 L.F.
130 L.F.
15 Each
1 Each
1,000.00 L.F.
125 S.Y.
1LS.
5 Each
3 Each
1LS.
70,000.00 USD

Description

Construction Layout

Mobilization

Progress Schedule

Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (NO-BID)
Clearing and Grubbing

Roadway Excavation, Earth

Removal of Concrete Pavement

Riprap Stone Slope Protection, 24in Thick, D50=12in
Silt Fence

Inlet Filter, Type 2

Concrete Washout Facility

Demolition of Existing Structures

Temporary Orange Plastic Fence

Vibration and Displacement Monitoring
Aggregate Base Course, 6in Thick

Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course

Hot Mix Asphalt 19M64 Intermediate Course
Berm Surfacing, Crushed Stone, 4In Thick
Portland Cement Concrete Pavement
Concrete in Canopy Pedestal

Concrete in Retaining Wall

Reinforcement Steel

Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated

42In Diameter Drilled Shaft

Reconstructed Inlet, Type D2, Using New Grate and Frame
Concrete Curb, Type A

Concrete Curb, Type B

Concrete Median Barrier, Modified, Type A
Parapet Connection, Type A

Flared Guide Rail Terminal

Pedestrian Gate, Type Il, 72in High, 6ft Wide
Concrete Sidewalk, 4in Thick

Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Epoxy Resin

Furnish Field Office, Type C

Maintain Field Office, Type C

Canopy

Quadguard Impact Attenuator, 3 Bays, 24in Wide
Force Account for Snow Removal (No-Bid)
Project Allowances (No-Bid)

Force Account for ETC Equipment Work Allowances (NO-BID)
#10 A.W.G. Ground Wire

1in Rigid Metallic Conduit, Exposed

#10 A.W.G. Power Cable

2-1/2in Rigid Metallic Conduit, Exposed

3in Rigid Metallic Conduit, Exposed

1in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit PVC Schedule 40
Junction Box Type Polymer 13in X 24in X 18in
Junction Box, Type 16in X 16in X 8in, NEMA 4X, Stainless Steel
1-1/2in Rigid Metallic Conduit, Exposed

2in Rigid Metallic Conduit, Exposed

Canopy Luminaire

CCTV Camera Relocation

Antenna Coax Cable

Gravel Paving

Furnishing Traffic Control Devices

Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign
Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator
Maintenance and Protection of Traffic

Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid)

Unit Price
$10,000.00
$100,000.00
$2,500.00
$1.00
$1.00
$10,000.00
$150.00
$75.00
$250.00
$5.00
$150.00
$500.00
$200,000.00
$10.00
$12,000.00
$85.00
$250.00
$250.00
$150.00
$40.00
$2,100.00
$2,100.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1,500.00
$2,900.00
$50.00
$50.00
$450.00
$3,500.00
$3,500.00
$1,600.00
$50.00
$5.00
$15,000.00
$2,000.00
$760,678.00
$17,500.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00
$2.00
$50.00
$3.00
$75.00
$85.00
$20.00
$3,200.00
$3,500.00
$55.00
$70.00
$4,000.00
$10,000.00
$6.00
$32.00
$25,000.00
$750.00
$3,000.00
$55,000.00
$1.00

Line Total

$10,000.00
$100,000.00
$2,500.00
$1,000.00
$10,000.00
$10,000.00
$4,050.00
$4,425.00
$250.00
$1,375.00
$450.00
$500.00
$200,000.00
$1,850.00
$12,000.00
$1,445.00
$500.00
$1,000.00
$3,750.00
$2,360.00
$10,500.00
$10,500.00
$1,300.00
$1,300.00
$210,000.00
$2,900.00
$11,650.00
$600.00
$45,000.00
$3,500.00
$3,500.00
$1,600.00
$1,100.00
$4,000.00
$15,000.00
$16,000.00
$760,678.00
$17,500.00
$20,000.00
$50,000.00
$30,000.00
$3,800.00
$45,000.00
$11,400.00
$18,750.00
$12,750.00
$1,600.00
$9,600.00
$28,000.00
$16,500.00
$9,100.00
$60,000.00
$10,000.00
$6,000.00
$4,000.00
$25,000.00
$3,750.00
$9,000.00
$55,000.00
$70,000.00
$1,983,333.00

Unit Price
$25,000.00
$130,000.00
$10,000.00
$1.00
$1.00
$8,914.08
$206.01
$250.87
$1,632.54
$14.68
$523.69
$6,288.29
$150,000.00
$9.03
$11,753.81
$158.75
$1,559.72
$1,395.18
$111.66
$230.69
$3,481.97
$3,178.72
$3.90
$4.05
$1,445.46
$5,721.74
$57.97
$156.42
$500.96
$9,167.97
$5,024.75
$3,867.00
$306.98
$5.82
$26,256.96
$1,607.33
$700,000.00
$47,015.24
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00
$2.35
$52.89
$2.35
$111.66
$129.29
$17.63
$2,115.69
$2,938.45
$64.65
$70.52
$2,703.38
$4,701.52
$3.53
$46.43
$25,870.13
$2,477.26
$6,288.29
$34,105.51
$1.00

Line Total
$25,000.00
$130,000.00
$10,000.00
$1,000.00
$10,000.00
$8,914.08
$5,562.27
$14,801.33
$1,632.54
$4,037.00
$1,571.07
$6,288.29
$150,000.00
$1,670.55
$11,753.81
$2,698.75
$3,119.44
$5,580.72
$2,791.50
$13,610.71
$17,409.85
$15,893.60
$5,070.00
$5,265.00
$202,364.40
$5,721.74
$13,507.01
$1,877.04
$50,096.00
$9,167.97
$5,024.75
$3,867.00
$6,753.56
$4,656.00
$26,256.96
$12,858.64
$700,000.00
$47,015.24
$20,000.00
$50,000.00
$30,000.00
$4,465.00
$47,601.00
$8,930.00
$27,915.00
$19,393.50
$1,410.40
$6,347.07
$23,507.60
$19,395.00
$9,167.60
$40,550.70
$4,701.52
$3,530.00
$5,803.75
$25,870.13
$12,386.30
$18,864.87
$34,105.51
$70,000.00
$2,026,781.77
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Unit Price
$25,000.00
$120,000.00
$7,000.00
$1.00
$1.00
$25,000.00
$125.00
$170.00
$500.00
$6.50
$250.00
$5,000.00
$305,000.00
$7.00
$15,000.00
$80.00
$550.00
$300.00
$35.00
$165.00
$2,600.00
$3,000.00
$2.25
$2.25
$1,800.00
$2,300.00
$88.00
$88.00
$880.00
$5,800.00
$3,800.00
$4,200.00
$145.00
$3.00
$8,000.00
$1,500.00
$1,274,000.00
$20,000.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00
$2.20
$50.00
$2.20
$100.00
$125.00
$16.00
$2,000.00
$2,700.00
$60.00
$70.00
$8,500.00
$4,400.00
$3.25
$20.00
$50,000.00
$9,500.00
$7,500.00
$20,000.00
$1.00

Line Total
$25,000.00
$120,000.00
$7,000.00
$1,000.00
$10,000.00
$25,000.00
$3,375.00
$10,030.00
$500.00
$1,787.50
$750.00
$5,000.00
$305,000.00
$1,295.00
$15,000.00
$1,360.00
$1,100.00
$1,200.00
$875.00
$9,735.00
$13,000.00
$15,000.00
$2,925.00
$2,925.00
$252,000.00
$2,300.00
$20,504.00
$1,056.00
$88,000.00
$5,800.00
$3,800.00
$4,200.00
$3,190.00
$2,400.00
$8,000.00
$12,000.00
$1,274,000.00
$20,000.00
$20,000.00
$50,000.00
$30,000.00
$4,180.00
$45,000.00
$8,360.00
$25,000.00
$18,750.00
$1,280.00
$6,000.00
$21,600.00
$18,000.00
$9,100.00
$127,500.00
$4,400.00
$3,250.00
$2,500.00
$50,000.00
$47,500.00
$22,500.00
$20,000.00
$70,000.00
$2,881,027.50

Letting Date: 7/17/18



