
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P200.478 Letting Date: 6/28/18

Item No.Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0002 1 L.S. Mobilization $900,000.00 $900,000.00 $1,284,987.45 $1,284,987.45 $1,450,000.00 $1,450,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,500,000.00

2 108-0001 350,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $350,000.00 $1.00 $350,000.00 $1.00 $350,000.00 $1.00 $350,000.00

3 201-0002 1 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00 $48,500.00 $48,500.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00

4 302-0002 101,000.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course $88.44 $8,932,440.00 $98.65 $9,963,650.00 $96.80 $9,776,800.00 $100.00 $10,100,000.00

5 302-0063 750,000.00 USD Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $750,000.00 $1.00 $750,000.00 $1.00 $750,000.00 $1.00 $750,000.00

6 302-0064 67,600.00 GAL Tack Coat $3.27 $221,052.00 $0.01 $676.00 $3.70 $250,120.00 $1.00 $67,600.00

7 302-0071 417,200.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $0.59 $246,148.00 $0.16 $66,752.00 $0.36 $150,192.00 $0.55 $229,460.00

8 302-0072 110 Each Bituminous Core Samples $300.47 $33,051.70 $265.00 $29,150.00 $100.00 $11,000.00 $400.00 $44,000.00

9 305-0003 365,300.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2 1/2in Depth $4.83 $1,764,399.00 $5.10 $1,863,030.00 $4.75 $1,735,175.00 $5.25 $1,917,825.00

10 305-0005 350,000.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Fine, 2 Inch Depth $3.90 $1,365,000.00 $2.90 $1,015,000.00 $4.50 $1,575,000.00 $6.00 $2,100,000.00

11 306-0001 163,900.00 L.F. Milled Rumble Strip $0.41 $67,199.00 $1.05 $172,095.00 $0.37 $60,643.00 $0.37 $60,643.00

12 312-0001 100,000.00 L.F. Sawing and Sealing Joints in Asphalt Concrete Overlay $3.40 $340,000.00 $3.25 $325,000.00 $1.85 $185,000.00 $6.00 $600,000.00

13 503-0002 10 Each Reset Frame, Various Types with Extensions $324.73 $3,247.30 $1,350.00 $13,500.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $500.00 $5,000.00

14 503-0293 10 Each Reset Frames $914.78 $9,147.80 $1,350.00 $13,500.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $750.00 $7,500.00

15 516-0009 340,600.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $1.05 $357,630.00 $1.05 $357,630.00 $2.40 $817,440.00 $1.05 $357,630.00

16 516-0011 67,200.00 L.F. Traffic Markings, Lines, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $1.05 $70,560.00 $1.05 $70,560.00 $1.80 $120,960.00 $1.05 $70,560.00

17 516-0013 700 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $6.25 $4,375.00 $6.30 $4,410.00 $12.10 $8,470.00 $6.27 $4,389.00

18 517-0002 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type B $20,041.50 $20,041.50 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $42,350.00 $42,350.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

19 517-0008 15 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $2,068.81 $31,032.15 $2,500.00 $37,500.00 $4,600.00 $69,000.00 $4,000.00 $60,000.00

20 517-0013 5,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00

21 530-0001 5,600.00 Each Raised Pavement Markers $23.70 $132,720.00 $23.85 $133,560.00 $42.30 $236,880.00 $23.76 $133,056.00

22 605-0023 45 Each In-pavement Wireless Sensor $1,059.27 $47,667.15 $1,385.00 $62,325.00 $1,800.00 $81,000.00 $1,554.00 $69,930.00

23 801-0001 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $1,357,102.52 $1,357,102.52 $685,870.00 $685,870.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $1,073,105.55 $1,073,105.55

24 801-0007 1,100.00 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol, Part-Time $0.01 $11.00 $1.00 $1,100.00 $95.00 $104,500.00 $1.00 $1,100.00

25 801-0008 1,100.00 M.H. Flaggers $0.01 $11.00 $1.00 $1,100.00 $95.00 $104,500.00 $1.00 $1,100.00

26 801-0009 6 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $8,480.56 $50,883.36 $1,060.00 $6,360.00 $10,000.00 $60,000.00 $10,000.00 $60,000.00

27 104-PS001 1 L.S. Construction Layout (136) $4,713.75 $4,713.75 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

28 104-PS002 1 L.S. Mobilization (136) $17,179.16 $17,179.16 $40,575.00 $40,575.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00

29 107-PS001 1 L.S. Progress Schedule (136) $2,351.57 $2,351.57 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00

30 108-PS001 600 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No Bid) (136) $1.00 $600.00 $1.00 $600.00 $1.00 $600.00 $1.00 $600.00

31 202-PS001 3,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No Bid) (136) $1.00 $3,000.00 $1.00 $3,000.00 $1.00 $3,000.00 $1.00 $3,000.00

32 202-PS002 1,000.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation and Embankment (136) $79.15 $79,150.00 $88.80 $88,800.00 $65.00 $65,000.00 $80.00 $80,000.00

33 202-PS003 150 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil (136) $24.62 $3,693.00 $68.60 $10,290.00 $35.00 $5,250.00 $30.00 $4,500.00

34 208-PS001 800 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence, Black (136) $6.86 $5,488.00 $11.05 $8,840.00 $15.00 $12,000.00 $11.00 $8,800.00

35 208-PS002 5 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 (136) $159.75 $798.75 $105.30 $526.50 $100.00 $500.00 $250.00 $1,250.00

36 208-PS003 2,200.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 8in Thick (136) $21.77 $47,894.00 $22.20 $48,840.00 $15.00 $33,000.00 $22.00 $48,400.00

37 302-PS001 540 GAL Tack Coat (136) $3.27 $1,765.80 $0.01 $5.40 $5.00 $2,700.00 $1.00 $540.00

38 302-PS002 900 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 19M76 Base Course (136) $106.25 $95,625.00 $152.00 $136,800.00 $96.00 $86,400.00 $125.00 $112,500.00

39 305-PS001 1,700.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2 1/2in Depth (136) $13.55 $23,035.00 $36.80 $62,560.00 $15.00 $25,500.00 $14.00 $23,800.00

40 305-PS002 1,500.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Fine, 2 Inch Depth (136) $13.93 $20,895.00 $20.90 $31,350.00 $15.00 $22,500.00 $13.50 $20,250.00

41 309-PS001 550 Ton Asphalt Rubber Open Graded Friction Course (136) $292.25 $160,737.50 $246.30 $135,465.00 $400.00 $220,000.00 $400.00 $220,000.00

42 503-PS001 1 Each Reset Frame (136) $1,304.81 $1,304.81 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00

43 509-PS001 1 Each Relocating Existing Ground-Mounted Sign Assembly (136) $1,564.51 $1,564.51 $250.00 $250.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,150.00 $1,150.00

44 515-PS001 10 Each Delineator, Type PA-W (136) $83.56 $835.60 $70.00 $700.00 $125.00 $1,250.00 $125.00 $1,250.00

45 516-PS001 3,000.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long Life, Thermoplastic (136) $1.30 $3,900.00 $1.30 $3,900.00 $3.65 $10,950.00 $1.30 $3,900.00

46 525-PS001 1 Each Relocate Tenth of Mile Marker and Post (136) $157.50 $157.50 $52.65 $52.65 $600.00 $600.00 $300.00 $300.00

47 530-PS021 30 Each Raised Pavement Markers (136) $29.52 $885.60 $30.00 $900.00 $241.00 $7,230.00 $29.59 $887.70

48 703-PS001 725 S.Y. Topsoil (136) $5.49 $3,980.25 $10.55 $7,648.75 $12.00 $8,700.00 $6.30 $4,567.50

49 704-PS001 725 S.Y. Seeding, Type W (136) $2.06 $1,493.50 $4.25 $3,081.25 $3.10 $2,247.50 $5.25 $3,806.25

50 801-PS001 1,080.00 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier (136) $41.48 $44,798.40 $55.50 $59,940.00 $35.00 $37,800.00 $50.00 $54,000.00

51 801-PS002 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices (136) $53,030.89 $53,030.89 $24,390.00 $24,390.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

52 801-PS003 1 Each Temporary Crash Cushion, Frangible Module Type (136) $7,980.41 $7,980.41 $7,010.00 $7,010.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

53 801-PS004 8 Barr Repair Temporary Impact Attenuator (136) $751.39 $6,011.12 $50.00 $400.00 $1,300.00 $10,400.00 $650.00 $5,200.00

54 801-PS005 1,080.00 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier (136) $23.53 $25,412.40 $29.00 $31,320.00 $50.00 $54,000.00 $30.00 $32,400.00

$17,777,000.00 $17,990,000.00 $18,802,157.50 $20,477,000.00

Della Pello Paving, Inc. Intercounty Paving Associates, LLCBaseLine Item Detail Crisdel Group, Inc. Stavola Contracting Co., Inc.
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